CODES AND STANDARDS COMMITTEE
2009 CODE CHANGE CYCLE - BOOK. 6

BOARD OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
FINAL REGULATION PACKAGE - 2009 CODE CHANGE CYCLE

For the July 26, 2010 Board of Housing and Community Development Meeting

OPENING STATEMENT
TAB1 ----- Carry-over Proposals from the June 7, 2010 Codes and Standards Committee Meeting
Proposal Number Description of Change Page
No.
C-308 0 Assisted Living Facilities 2
C-908.1. i Carbon Monoxide Groups R and I 5
C-1103. 2.7 s Accessibility Churches 7
C-1301(IECC 402.4.2 & IRCN1103.2.2.1)  Duct Testing 9
C-310.6(R313.1D(1). e Common Wall in Townhouses 11
C-310.6(R313.1)(2) . eeieiaieeeenenaerinae Exterior Walls 13
C-310.6(R313.D(3). e Fire Apparatus Access Roads 15
C-310.6(R313.DE@)XA). .. v ee e Fire Flow — Chapter 5 17
C-310.6(R313. D)D) e e Fire Flow — Appendix B 19
C-310.6(R313.1)(5)@). .o e e ercreereee Fire Hydrants — Chapter 5 21
C-310.6(R313.1)(5HD) oot Fire Hydrants — Appendix C 23
F-506.3. Elevator Service Keys 25
TAB 2 ~oe- Final Regulations - USBC, Part I, Virginia Construction Code 27
TAB 3 ----- Final Regulations - USBC, Part IIl, Virginia Maintenance Code 83
TAB4 - Final Regulations - Virginia Statewide Fire Prevention Code 86
TABS ----- Final Regulations — Virginia Industrialized Building Safety Regulations 99
TAB 6 ----- Final Regulations — Virginia Amusement Device Regulations 100



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

2009 Code Change Cycle — Code Change Evaluation Form

USBC - Virginia Construction Code
Code Change No. C-308.1

Nature of Change: Assisted Living Facilities

Codes and Standards Committee Action:

Disapprove.

Approve as presented.

Approve as modified (specify):

Carry over to next cycle. Other (specify):



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

Code Change Form for the 2009 Code Change Cycle
Code Change Number:
Proponent Information (Check one): [_Individual [_JGovernment Entity [_]Company

Name: State Fire Marshal's Office {with DHCD staff changes af the direction of the Codes and Standards Committee)

Email Address: Telephone Number:

Proposal Information

Code(s) and Section(s): USBC, VCC, Section 308.2 and 310.1

Proposed Change (including all relevant section numbers, if multiple sections):

Add the following exception to IBC Section 308.2 as shown:

308.2 Group I-1. This occupancy shall include buildings, structures or parts thereof housing more than 16 persons, on
a 24-hour basis, who because of age, mental disability or other reasons, live in a supervised residential environment
that provides personal care services. The occupants are capable of responding to an emergency situation without
physical assistance from staff. This group shall include, but not be limited to, the following:

Alcohol and drug centers

Assisted living facilities

Congregate care facilities
Convalescent facilities

Group homes

Halfway houses

Residential board and care facilities
Social rehabilitation facilities

Exception: In Group |-1 occupancies, not more than five of the residents may require physical assistance from

staff to respond fo an emergency situation when all residents that may require the physical assistance reside on a
single level of exit discharge.

A facility such as the above with five or fewer persons shall be classified as a Group R-3 or shall comply with the
International Residential Code in accordance with Section 101.2. A facility such as above, housing at least six and not
more than 16 persons, shall be classified as Group R-4.

Change the Group R-4 requirements in IBC Section 310.1 as follows:

R-4 Residential occupancies shall include buildings arranged for occupancy as residential carefassisted living facilities
including more than five but not more than 16 occupants, excluding staff.

Group R-4 occupancies shall meet the requirements for construction as defined for Group R-3, except as
otherwise provided for in this code or shall comply with the International Residential Code provided the building is
protected by an automatic sprinkler system instalied in accordance with Section 903.2.7.

{continued next page)




Exceptions:

1. Group homes licensed by the Virginia Department of Behavioral Health and Developmental Services that
house no more than eight persons with one or more resident counselors shall be classified as Group R-2,
R-3, R-4 or R-5. Not more than five of the persons may require physical assistance from siaff to respond
to an emergency situation.

2. In Group R-4 occupancies, not more than five of the residents may require physical assistance from staff
to respond to an emergency situation when all residents that may require the physical assistance from
staff reside on a single level of exit discharge of exit discharge and other than using a ramp, a change of
elevation using steps or stairs is not within the path of egress to an exit door.

3. Assisted living facilities licensed by the Virginia Department of Social Services that house no more than
eight persons, with one or more resident counselors, and all of the residents are capable of responding to

an emergency situation without physical assistance from staff, may be classified as Group R-2. R-3 or R-
5.

4. Assisted living facilities licensed by the Virginia Department of Social Services that house no more than
eight persons, with one or more resident counselors, may be classified as Group R-5 when in compliance
with all of the following:

4.1. The building is protected by an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3
or Section P2904 of the IRC.

4.2 Not more than five of the residents may require physical assistance from_staff to respond to an
emergency situation.

4.3, All residents that may require physical assistance from staff to respond to an emergency situation
reside on a single level of exit discharge and other than using a ramp, a change in elevation using

steps or stairs is not within the path of egress 1o an exit door.

Change the definition of “Residential care/assisted living facilities” in Section 310.2 to read as follows:

Residential care/assisted living facilities. Any congregate residential setting_that provides or coordinates personal and

health care services, 24-hour supervision and assistance for the maintenance or care of four or more adults who are

aged, infirm or disabled and who are cared for in a primarily residential setting. and provides for the protection, general
supervision and oversight of the physical and mental well-being of aged, infirmed or disabled individuals. Residents

are capable of self-evacuation.

Supporting Statement (including intent, need, and impact of the proposal):

Submittal Information

Date Submitted:

The proposal may be submitted by email as an attachment, by fax, by mail, or by hand delivery.
Please submit the proposal fo:
DHCD DBFR TASO (Technical Assistance and Services Office)

The Jackson Center Email Address: taso@dhcd.virginia.gov

501 N. 2nd Street Fax Number: (804) 371-7092

Richmond, VA 23219-1321 Phone Numbers: (804} 371-7140 or (804) 371-7150
‘g\!iksiﬁlﬂ
EH



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

2009 Code Change Cycle — Code Change Evaluation Form

USBC - Virginia Construction Code
Code Change No. C-908.1

Nature of Change: Carbon Monoxide Groups R and I

Codes and Standards Committee Action:
Approve as presented. Disapprove.

Approve as modified (specify):

Carry over to next cycle. Other (specify):



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

Code Change Form for the 2009 Code Change Cycle
Code Change Number:

Proponent Information (Check one): [ _]individual []Government Entity [ICompany

Name: Virginia Fire Chiefs Association, Inc. (with suggested revisions by DHCD Staff at the direction of the Codes and
Standards Committee)

Email Address: Telephone Number;

Proposal Information

Code(s) and Section(s): USBC (VCC and VMC) and SFPC

Proposed Change (including alf refevant section numbers, if multiple sections):

In the VCC, add the following new section to the IBC:

908.7 Carbon monoxide alarms. Carbon monoxide alarms shall be provided in new buildings and structures in

accordance with this section,

908.7.1 Alarm requirements. Carbon monoxide alarms shall be single station, hard wired, plug-in or batiery type,
listed as complying with UL 2034, and shall be installed in accordance with this code and the manufaciurer's
installation instructions.

908.7.2 Where required. Carbon monoxide alarms shall be installed outside of each separate sleeping area in the
immediate vicinity of the bedrooms in dwelling units and outside of, but in the immediate vicinity of, each sleeping

unit in all Group R occupancies [ocated within buildings containing fuel-fired appliances or where a dwelling unit or

sleeping unit in a Group R occupancy is attached fo a Group U private garage.
In the VMC, add the following new section to the IPMC:

305.7 Carbon monoxide alarms. Carbon monoxide alarms shall be maintained as approved.

[n the SFPC, add the following new section to the IFC:

908.7 Carbon monoxide alarms. Carbon monoxide alarms shall be maintained as approved.

Supporting Statement {including intent, need, and impact of the proposal):

Submittal Information

Date Submitted:

The proposal may be submitted by email as an attachment, by fax, by mail, or by hand delivery.




VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

2009 Code Change Cycle — Code Change Evaluation Form

USBC - Virginia Construction Code
Code Change No. C-1103.2.7

Nature of Change: Accessibility Churches

Codes and Standards Committee Action:

Approve as presented. Disapprove.

Approve as modified (specify):

Carry over to next cycle. Other (specify):



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

Code Change Form for the 2009 Code Change Cycle
Code Change Number:

Proponent Information (Check one):  [individual [1Government Entity ~ [_]Company

Name: DHCD Staff (at the direction of the Codes and Standards Committee)

Email Address: Telephone Number:

Proposal Information

Code(s) and Section(s): USBC, VCC, Section 1103.2.16

Proposed Change (including all relevant section numbers, if multiple sections):

Change the proposed regulation as follows (changes shown within brackets):

1103.2.16 Raised and lowered areas in places of religious worship. Raised or lowered areas in places of religious
worship_are not required to be accessible or to be served by an accessible route provided such areas are used

exclusively for the performance of religious ceremonies and are located within an accessible story or mezzanine. ]

Supporting Statement (including intent, need, and impact of the proposal):

The language above accomplishes the revision of Fairfax County’s consensus proposal to delete the 1000 square foot
limitation at the direction of the Codes and Standards Commitiee and place the language in its own section for
accessibility in places of religious worship. While Section 1103.2.7 is shown stricken, the end result is only to delete the
state amendment where the religious worship language was added in the proposed regulation. Section 1103.2.7 will still
be as written in the |BC for other types of raised areas.

Submittal Information

Date Submitied:

The proposal may be submitted by email as an attachment, by fax, by mail, or by hand delivery.
Please submit the proposal to:

DHCD DBFR TASO (Technical Assistance and Services Office)

The Jackson Center Email Address: taso@dhcd.virginia.gov

501 N. 2nd Street _ Fax Number: (804) 371-7092

Richmond, VA 23219-1321 Phone Numbers: (804) 371-7140 or (804) 371-7150




VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

2009 Code Change Cycle — Code Change Evaluation Form

USBC - Virginia Construction Code
Code Change No. C-1301 (IECC 402.4.2 & IRC N1103.2.2.1)

Nature of Change: Duct Testing

Codes and Standards Committee Action:

Approve as presented. Disapprove.

Approve as modified (specify):

Carry over to next cycle. Other (specify):



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

Code Change Form for the 2009 Code Change Cycle
Code Change Number:
Proponent Information (Check one).  []Individual [Government Entity [ [Company

Name: DHCD Staff (at the direction of the Codes and Standards Committee}

Email Address: Telephone Number:

Proposal Information

Code(s) and Section(s): USBC, VCC, IECC Section 403.2.2 and IRC Section N1103.2.2

Proposed Change (including all relevant section numbers, if multiple sections):

Make the following change to the [ECC and IRC (IRC provisions shown in parentheses)

403.2.2 (N1103.2.2) Sealing. All ducts, air handlers, filter boxes and building cavities used as ducts shall be sealed.
Joints and seams shall comply with Section M1601.4.1 of the International Residential Code.

403.2.2.1 (N1103.2.2.1) Testing option. Duct tightness shall be verified by either of the following:

1. Postconstruction test: (no change to existing text)
2. Rough-in test: (no change to existing text)

Exceptions: Duct tightness test is not required if the air handler and all ducts are located within conditioned
space.

When this option is chosen. testing shall be performed by approved qualified individuals, testing agencies or
contractors. Testing and results shall be as prescribed in Section 403.2.2 (N1103.2.2) and approved recognized
industry standards.

403.2.2.2 {(N1103.2.2.2) Visual inspection option. In addition to the inspection of ducts otherwise required by this
code, when the air handler and all ducts are not within conditioned space and this option is chosen to verify duct
tightness, duct tightness shall be considered acceptable when the requirements of Section 403.2.2 (N1103.2.2)
are field verified.

Supporting Statemént (including intent, need, and impact of the proposal):

Submittal Information

Date Submitted:

The proposal may be submitted by email as an attachment, by fax, by mail, or by hand delivery.

Please submit the proposal to:

10



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

2009 Code Change Cycle — Code Change Evaluation Form

USBC - Virginia Construction Code
Code Change No. C-310.6 (R313.1)(1)

Nature of Change: Common Wall in Townhouses

Codes and Standards Committee Action:
Approve as presented. Disapprove.

Approve as modified (specify):

Carry over to next cycle. Other (specify):

11



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

Code Change Form for the 2009 Code Change Cycle
Code Change Number:
Proponent Information (Check ong): [ ]individual [_lGovernment Entity [ ]Company

Name: DHCD Staff (at the direction of the Codes and Standards Committee)

Email Address: Telephone Number:

Proposal Information

Code(s) and Section(s): USBC, VCC, IRC Section R302.2

Proposed Change (including all relevant section numbers, if multip]e sections):

Modify the language in the proposed 2009 USBC addressing the common wall in townhouses in the IRC as follows
{changes shown in brackets):

3, Change the exception in Section R302.2 to require a common two-hour fire-resistive-rated wall instead of a_one-
hour fire-resistive-rated wall [ . unless the townhouse development is fully sprinklered as provided for in Section
R313.1, in which case a commeon cne-hour fire-resistive-rated wall shall be permitted between townhouses | .

Supporting Statement (including intent, need, and impact of the proposal):

Submittal Information

Date Submitted:

The proposal may be submitted by email as an attachment, by fax, by mail, or by hand delivery.
Please submit the proposal to:
DHCD DBFR TASO (Technical Assistance and Services Office)

The Jackson Center Email Address: taso@dhcd.virginia.gov

501 N. 2nd Street Fax Number: (804) 371-7092

Richmond, VA 23219-1321 Phone Numbers: (804) 371-7140 or (804) 371-7150
‘. VIRGIMES,
-H

12



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

2009 Code Change Cycle — Code Change Evaluation Form

USBC - Virginia Construction Code
Code Change No. C-310.6 (R313.1)(2)

Nature of Change: Exterior Walls

Codes and Standards Committee Action:

Approve as presented. Disapprove.
Approve as modified (specify):
Carry over to next cycle. Other (specify):

13



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

Code Change Form for the 2009 Code Change Cycle
Code Change Number:

Proponent Information (Check one): [_]Individual [ |Government Entity []Company
Name: DHCD Staff (at the direction of the Codes and Standards Committee)
Email Address: Telephone Number:
Proposal Information
Code(s) and Section{s}): USBC, VCC, IRC Table R302.1
Proposed Change (including all relevant section numbers, if multiple sections):
Change Table R302.1 of the IRC as follows:
Table R302.1
EXTERIOR WALLS
MINIMUM FIRE- MINIMUM FIRE
EXTERIOR WALL ELEMENT RESISTANCE RATING SEPARATION DISTANCE
1 hour-tested in
Walls (Fire-resistance rated) accﬁga;fﬁthtngﬁ{r:‘n E < 5feet?
exposure from both sides
(Not fire-resistance rated) 0 hours =5 feet?
Proiections (Fire-resistance rated) 1 hour on the underside =2 feet to 5 feet®
) {Not fire-resistance rated) 0 hours 5 feet?
Not allowed N/A < 3 feet
Openings in walls 25% maximum of wall area 0 hours 3 feet
Unlimited 0 hours 5 feet?
Comply with Section a
Penetrations Al R317.3 < Sfeet”
None required 5 feet®

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm.
N/A = Not Applicable

a. The minimum fire separation distance shall be reduced to 3 feet in developments which are fully sprinklered as

provided for in Sections R313.1 or R313.2.

Supporting Statement (including intent, need, and impact of the proposal):

Submittal Information

Date Submitted:

The proposal may be submitted by email as an attachment, by fax, by mail, or by hand delivery.




VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

2009 Code Change Cycle — Code Change Evaluation Form

USBC - Virginia Construction Code
Code Change No. C-310.6 (R313.1)(3)

Nature of Change: Fire Apparatus Access Roads

Codes and Standards Committee Action:

Approve as presented. Disapprove.

Approve as modified (specify):

Carry over to next cycle. Other (specify):

15



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

Code Change Form for the 2009 Code Change Cycle
Code Change Number:

Proponent Information (Check one): [ ]individual [1Government Entity [_ICompany

Name: DHCD Staff (at the direction of the Codes and Standards Committee)

Email Address: Telephone Number:

Proposal Information

Code(s) and Section(s): SFPC Section 503.2.1

Proposed Change (including all relevant section numbers, if multiple sections):

Add new exception to Section 503.2.1 of the IFC as follows:

Exception: Fire apparatus access roads exclusively serving single family dwelling or townhouse developments which

are fully sprinklered as provided for in Sections R313.1 or R313.2 of the International Residential Code shall have an

uncbstructed width of not less than 18 feet (5486 mm), exclusive of shoulders.

Supporting Statement (including intent, need, and impact of the proposal):

Submittal information

Date Submitted:

The proposal may be submitted by email as an attachment, by fax, by mail, or by hand delivery.
Please submit the proposal to:
DHCD DBFR TASO (Technical Assistance and Services Office)

The Jackson Center Email Address: taso@dhed.virginia.gov
501 N. 2nd Street Fax Number: (804) 371-7092
Richmond, VA 23219-1321 Phone Numbers: {(804) 371-7140 or (804) 371-7150

N ]
=g VIRGINIA
=2 DHED

16



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

2009 Code Change Cycle — Code Change Evaluation Form

USBC - Virginia Construction Code
Code Change No. C-310.6 (R313.1)(4)(a)

Nature of Change: Fire Flow — Chapter 5

Codes and Standards Committee Action:
Approve as presented. Disapprove.

Approve as modified (specify):

Carry over to next cycle. Other (specify):

17



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

Code Change Form for the 2009 Code Change Cycle

Code Change Number. &= 10 La( le?);h("h (QD

Proponent Information {Check one): [JIndividual [ 1Government Entity [ ]Company

Name: DHCD Staff (at the direction of the Codes and Standards Committee)

Email Address: Telephone Number:

Proposal Information

Code(s) and Section(s): SFPC Sections 507.3.1 and 507.3.2

Proposed Change (including all relevant section numbers, if multiple sections):

Add new Section 507.3.1 and Table 507.3.1 to the IFC as follows:

507.3.1 Fire flow regquirements for fully sprinklered residential developments. The fire flow requirements in Table
507.3.1 shall be permitted to be used for determining fire flow in single family dwelling and townhouse developments

which are fully sprinklered as provided for in Sections R313.1 or R313.2 of the International Residential Code.

Table 507.3.1
Minimum Required Fire-flow and Flow Duration for Fully Sprinklered Single Family Dwelling and Townhouse
Developments
Fire-flow Calculation Area {square
feet)™ Fire-flow (gallons per minute)® Flow Duration (in hours)
0-5,000 1,000
5,001-7,200 1,250
7,201-8,200 1,500 2
8.201-9,500 1.750 =
9.501-11,300 2.000
11,301-13,000 2,250

For Sl: 1 sauare foot = 0.0929 m®, 1 gallon per minute = 3.785 L/m, 1 pound per sguare inch = 6.895 kPa.
a. The fire flow calculation area shall be the total floor area of all floor levels within the exterior walls, and under the
horizontal projections of the roof of a building.

b. Measured_at 20 psi residual pressure.
c. Fire-flow and duration requirements for calculation areas exceeding 13,000 square feet are subject to approval by

the fire code official.

Supporting Statement {including intent, need, and impact of the proposal):

Submittal Information

Date Submitted:

The proposal may be submitted by email as an attachment, by fax, by mail, or by hand delivery.

Please submit the proposal to:

18



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

2009 Code Change Cycle — Code Change Evaluation Form

USBC - Virginia Constraction Code
Code Change No. C-310.6 (R313.1)(4)(b)

Nature of Change: Fire Flow — Appendix B

Codes and Standards Committee Action:

Approve as presented. Disapprove.
Approve as modified (specify):
Carry over to next cycle. Other (specify):

19



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

Code Change Form for the 2009 Code Change Cycle

Code Change NumberC_-31O,.L (%L?).D LU‘) O:D

Proponent Information (Check one): [ lindividual [ 1Govermment Entity [ |Company

Name: DHCD Staff (at the direction of the Codes and Standards Committee)

Email Address: Telephone Number;

Proposal Information

Code(s) and Section(s): SFPC Sections 507.3.1 and 507.3.2

Proposed Change (including all relevant section numbers, if multiple sections):

Add new Sections 507.3.1 and 507.3.2 to the IFC as follows:

507.3.1 Fire flow requirements for fully sprinklered residential developments. Notwithstanding Section 103.1.2, the fire
flow requirements in Table B105.1 of Appendix B of the IFC, as modified by Section 507.3.2, shall be permitted to be

used for determining fire flow in single family dwelling and townhouse developments which are fully sprinklered as
provided for in Sections R313.1 or R313.2 of the International Resideniial Code,

507.3.2 Modifications to Table B105.1. The first six rows of columns five and six of Table B105.1 of Appendix B of the
JFC shall be modified as shown below for the use of Table B105.1 in Section 507.3.1:

FIRE-FLOW
Type 5-B (gallons per minute)

0-5,000 1,000
5,001-7.200 1,250
7,201-8,200 1,500
8,201-9,500 1,750
9,501-11,300 2,000
11,301-13.000 2,250

Supporting Statement (including intent, need, and impact of the proposal):

Submittal Information

Date Submifted:

The proposal may be submitted by email as an attachment, by fax, by mail, or by hand delivery.
Please submit the proposal to:

DHCD DBFR TASO (Technical Assistance and Services Office)
The Jackson Center Email Address: taso@dhcd.virginia.gov
501 N. 2nd Street Fax Number; (804) 371-7092



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

2009 Code Change Cycle — Code Change Evaluation Form

USBC - Virginia Construction Code
Code Change No. C-310.6 (R313.1)(5)(a)

Nature of Change: Fire Hydrants — Chapter 5

Codes and Standards Committee Action:

Approve as presented. Disapprove.

Approve as modified (specify):

Carry over to next cycle. Other (specify):

21



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

Code Change Form for the 2009 Code Change Cycle
Code Change Number:
Proponent Information (Check one):  [_]Individual []Government Enfity ~ [_|Company

Name: DHCD Staff (at the direction of the Codes and Standards Committee)

Email Address: Telephone Number:

Proposal Information

Code(s) and Section(s): SFPC Section 507.5.1.1 and Table 507.5.1.1

Proposed Change (including all relevant section numbers, if multiple sections):

Add new Section 507.5.1.1 and Table 507.5.1.1 to the IFC as follows:

507.5.1.1 Fire hydrant requirements for fully sprinklered residential developments. The number and distribution of fire

hydrants in Table 507.5.1.1 shall be permitted to be used in single family dwelling and townhouse developments which

are fully sprinklered as provided for in Sections R313.1 or R313.2 of the International Residential Code.

Table 507.5.1.1
Number and Distribution of Fire Hydrants in Fully Sprinklered Single Family Dwelling and Townhouse Developments

Maximum Distance From
Fire-flow Reguirements Minimum Number of Average Spacing Between Any Point on Sireet or
(gpm) Hydrants Hydrants®™ (feet) Road Frontage to a
Hydrant

1,750 or less 1 1,000 500
2.000-2,250 2 900 450
2,500 3 900 450
3.000 3 800 450
3.500-4,000 4 700 420
4,500-5,000 5 600 360
5,500 6 600 360
6,000 6 500 300
6.500-7,000 7 500 300
7.500 or more 8 or more® 400 240

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm_ 1 gallon per minute = 3.785 L/m

a. Reduce by 100 feet for dead-end streets or roads.

b. Where sireefs are provided with median dividers which cannot be crossed by fire fighters pulling hose lines, or
where arterial_sireets are provided_with four or more traffic lanes and have a traffic count or more than 30,000
vehicles per day, hydrant spacing shall average 500 feet on each side of the street and be arranged on an
alternating basis up to a fire-flow requirement of 7,000 gallons per minuie and 400 feet for higher fire-flow
reguirements.

c.  Where new water mains are extended along streets where hydrants are not needed for protection of structures or
similar fire problems, fire hydrants shall be provided at spacing not to exceed 1,000 square feet to provide for
transportation hazards.

d. Reduce by 50 feet for dead-end streets or roads,

e. One hydrant for each 1,000 gallons per minute or fraction thereof,

Supporting Statement {including intent, need, and impact of the proposal):

22



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

2009 Code Change Cycle — Code Change Evaluation Form

USBC - Virginia Construction Code
Code Change No. C-310.6 (R313.1)(5)(b)

Nature of Change: Fire Hydrants — Appendix C

Codes and Standards Committee Action:
Approve as presented. Disapprove.

Approve as modified (specify):

Carry over to next cycle. Other (specify):

23



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

Code Change Form for the 2009 Code Change Cycle
Code Change Number:

Proponent Information (Check one): [ individual [ |Government Entity ~ [_]Company

Name: DHCD Staff (at the direction of the Codes and Standards Committee)

Email Address: Telephone Number:

Proposal Information

Code(s) and Section(s): SFPC Section 507.5.1.1

Proposed Change (including all relevant section numbers, if multiple sections):

Add new Section 507.5.1.1 to the IFC as follows:

507.5.1.1 Fire hydrant requirements for fully sprinklered residential developments. Notwithstanding Seclion 103.1.2,
the number and distribution of fire hydrants in Table C105.1 of Appendix C of the IFC shall be permitted to be used in
single family dwelling and townhouse developments which are fully sprinklered as provided for in Sections R313.1 or
R313.2 of the International Residential Code, with the spacing and distances of fire hydrants indicated in Table C105.1
increased by 100%.

Supporting Statement (including intent, need, and impact of the proposal):

Submittal Information

Date Submitted:

The proposal may be submitted by email as an attachment, by fax, by mail, or by hand delivery.
Please submit the proposal to:
DHCD DBFR TASO (Technical Assistance and Services Office)

The Jackson Center Email Address: taso@dhcd.virginia.gov
501 N. 2nd Street Fax Number: (804) 371-7092
Richmond, VA 23219-1321 Phone Numbers: {804) 371-7140 or (804) 371-7150
N
“ VIRGINIA
s DHED

24



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

2009 Code Change Cycle — Code Change Evaluation Form

USBC - Virginia Construction Code
Code Change No. F-506.3

Nature of Change: Elevator Service Keys

Codes and Standards Committee Action:

Approve as presented. Disapprove.

Approve as modified (specify):

Carry over to next cycle. Other (specify):

25



VIRGINIA DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DIVISION OF BUILDING AND FIRE REGULATION

Code Change Form for the 2009 Code Change Cycle
Code Change Number:

Proponent Information (Check one):  [individual [_lGovernment Entity [ICompany

Name: DHCD Staff (at the direction of the Codes and Standards Committee)

Proposal Information

Code(s) and Section(s): SFPC Section 506 and USBC Section 3003.2.1

Proposed Change (including all relevant section numbers, if multiple sections):

Change the title of Section 5086 to the SFPC to read as follows:

KEY BOXES AND ELEVATOR FIRE SERVICE KEYS

Add new Section 506.3 to the SFPC to read as follows:

506.3 Standardized fire service elevator keys. All buildings with elevators equipped with Phase | emergency recall or

Phase |l emergency in-car operation, or buildings eguipped with fire service access or occupant evacuation elevators
shall be equipped to operate with a standardized fire service key approved by the fire code official.

Exception: Where providing a standardized key is not possible due to the existing non-standard elevator

equipment, the owner shall be permitted {o place the building's non-standardized fire service elevator keys in a

key box installed in accordance with Section 506.1.

506.3.1 Requirements for standardized fire service keys. Standardized fire service elevator keys shall comply with

all of the following:

1.

All fire service elevator keys within the jurisdiction shall be uniform and specific for the jurisdiction. Keys

2,

shall be cut to a uniform key code.

Fire service elevator keys shall be a patent protected design to prevent unauthorized duplication.

3.

Fire service elevator keys subiject fo these rules shall be engraved with the words “DO NOT DUPLICATE.”

506.3.2 Access to standardized fire service keys. Access to standardized fire service elevator keys shall be

restricted to the following persons or groups:

1.

Elevator owners or their authorized agents.

Elevator contractors.

Elevator inspectors of the Jurisdiction.

Fire code officials of the jurisdiction.

2
3.
4
5

The fire department and other emeragency response agencies designated by the fire code official and_the

code official responsible for the enforcement of Part 11, Maintenance. of the USBC.

506.3.3 Duplication_or distribution of keys. No person may duplicate a standardized fire service elevator key or

issue, give, or sell a duplicated key unless in accordance with this code.

e

5!

06.3.4 Responsibility fo provide keys. The building owner shall provide up to three standardized fire service
evator keys, if required by the fire code official, upon installation of a standardized fire service key switch or

switches in the building.
Add new Section 3003.2.1 to the USBC to read:

3003.2.1 Standardized fire service kevs. Where a key is required to operate the emergency function of an elevator, the
kev shall be a standardized fire service key in accordance with the Virginia Statewide Fire Prevention Code (13 VAC

5-51

26



Virginia Department of Housing and Community Development
Division of Building and Fire Regulation

2009 Code Change Cycle
Final Regulations for Review by the BHCD at the July 26, 2010 Meeting

UNIFORM STATEWIDE BUILDING CODE, PART [ — VIRGINIA CONSTRUCTION CODE

Note: Only those provisions having changes between proposed and final regulations are shown —
brackets are used to identify the changes comprising the final regulations.

Chapter 1 - Administration

102.3 Exemptions. The following are exempt from this code:

1.

Equipment and, related wiring, and poles and towers supporting the related wiring installed by
a provider of publicly regulated utility service or a franchised cable television operator and
electrical equipment and related wiring used for radio, broadcast or cable television,
telecommunications or information service transmission. The exemption shall apply only if
under applicable federal and state law the ownership and control of the equipment and wiring is
by the service provider or its affiliates. Such exempt equipment and wiring shall be located on
either [ publie ] rights-of-way or [ private | property for which the service provider has rights of
occupancy and entry; however, the structures, including their service equipment, housing or
supporting such exempt equipment and wiring shall be subject to the USBC. The installation of
equipment and wiring exempted by this section shall not create an unsafe condition prohibited
by the USBC.

Manufacturing and processing machines [ that do not produce or process hazardous materials
repulated by this code ], including all of the following service equipment associated with the
manufacturing or processing machines.

2.1.  Electrical equipment connected after the last disconnecting means.

2.2. Plumbing piping and equipment connected after the last shutoff valve or backflow
device and before the equipment drain trap.

2.3.  Gas piping and equipment connected after the outlet shutoff valve.
[ Manufacturing and processing machines that produce or process hazardous materials

regulated by this code are only required to comply with the code provisions regulating the
hazardous materials. ]

(Items 3-6 unchanged)

7. Federally owned buildings and structures unless federal law specifically requires a permit from

the locality. [ Underground storage tank installations. modifications and removals shall comply
with this code in accordance with federal law., ]

27



103.3 Change of occupancy. No change [ of occupancy ] shall be made in [ the-existing-occupanecy
classifieation—of | any structure when the current USBC requires a greater degree of accessibility,

structural strength, fire protection, means of egress, ventilation or sanitation. When such a greater
degree is required, the owner or the owner’s agent shall make written application to the local building
department for a new certificate of occupancy and shall obtain the new certificate of occupancy prior
to the [ new ] use of the structure [ under-the newoccupaney-elassification | . When impractical to
achieve compliance with this code for the new | eecupaney—elassifieation use | , the building official
shall consider modifications upon application and as provided for in Section 106.3.

Exception: This section shall not be construed to permit noncompliance with any applicable flood
load or flood-resistant construction requirements of this code.

103.10 Use of certain provisions of referenced codes. The following provisions of the IBC and of other
indicated codes or standards are to be considered valid provisions of this code. Where any such
provisions have been modified by the state amendments to the IBC, then the modified provisions

apply.
1. Special inspection requirements in Chapters 2 - 35.

2. Chapter 34, Existing Structures, except that Section 3410 3412, Compliance Alternatives, shall
not be used to comply with the retrofit requirements identified in Section 103.7 and shall not be
construed to permit noncompliance with any applicable flood load or flood-resistant
construction requirements of this code.

3. Testing requirements and requirements for the submittal of construction documents in any of
the ICC codes referenced in Chapter 35 [ and in the IRC ] .

(Items 4 and 5 unchanged)

[ 6. Section R101.2 of the IRC. ]

104.1 Scope of enforcement. This section establishes the requirements for enforcement of the USBC in
accordance with Section 36-105 of the Code of Virginia. Enforcement of the provisions of the USBC
for construction and rehabilitation shall be the responsibility of the local building department.
Whenever a county or municipality does not have such a building department, the local governing
body shall enter into an agreement with the local governing body of another county or municipality or
with some other agency, or a state agency approved by DHCD for such enforcement. For the purposes
of this section, towns with a population of less than 3,500 may elect to administer and enforce the
USBC; however, where the town does not elect to administer and enforce the code, the county in
which the town is situated shall administer and enforce the code for the town. In the event such town is
situated in two or more counties, those counties shall administer and enforce the USBC for that portion
of the town [ whieh-is ] situated within their respective boundaries.

107.2 Code academy fee levy. In accordance with subdivision 7 of Section 36-137 of the Code of
Virginia, the local building department shall collect a +:75% 2.0% levy of fees charged for [ building |
permits issued under this code and transmit it quarterly to DHCD to support trammg programs of the
Vlrglma Building Code Academy

84- Localities that maintain individual or regional

training academies accredited by DHCD shall retain such levy.
2

28



108.2 Exemptions from application for permit. Application for a permit shall be made to the building
official and a permit shall be obtained prior to the commencement of any of the following activities,
except that applications for emergency construction, alterations or equipment replacement shall be
submitted by the end of the first working day that follows the day such work commences. In addition,
the building official may authorize work to commence pending the receipt of an application or the
issuance of a permit.

(Item 1 unchanged) -

2. | DPetached One story detached ] accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds,
playhouses or similar uses, provided the floor area does not exceed [ +56 200 ] square feet [ @4

%) (18 m?) ] and the structures are not [ aceessery-te classified as ] a Group [ EF-1 Jor H
occupancy.

(Ttems 3-9 unchanged)
10. Ordinary repairs that include the following.

10.1. Replacement of windows and doors [ with windows and doors of similar operation and
opening dimensions that do not require changes to the existing framed opening and ]
that are not required to be fire rated in Group R-2 where serving a single dwelling unit
and in Groups R-3, R-4 and R-5.

116 4 Issuance of cert1f1cate for [ e*}s%mg gre USBC ] bu11d1ngs or structures. [ Hpeﬂ—wﬂtteﬂ—fequest

ate Dan h g g € s i g sided When abulldmg
or structure was constructed prior to belnE subject to the 1mt1a1 ed1t1on of the USBC and the local
building department does not have a certificate of occupancy for the building or structure, the owner or
owner’s agent may submit a written request for a certificate to be created. The building official, after
receipt of the request, shall issue a certificate provided a determination is made that ] there are no
current violations of the Virginia Maintenance Code or the Virginia Statewide Fire Prevention Code
(13 VAC 5 5 1) and the occupancy clasmﬁcatwn of the bulldmg or structure has not changed. [ A®

th ate-an k Such ] buildings and

structures shall not be prevented from contmued use.

[ Exception: When no_certificate exists, but the local building department has records indicating
that a certificate did exist, then the building official may either verify in writing that a certificate

did exist, or issue a certificate based upon the records. ]

119.5 nght of appeal ﬁlmg of appeal appllcatlon [ QFhe—ewnelLef—a-baﬂdﬂ%g—er—s{metafe—the—ewneH

deas*eﬁ—ef—the—b’cul-dmg—%ﬁeml—eeﬂeem}ﬁg—the Anv person aggneved by the Iocal bulldmg
department’s ] application of the USBC [ te-sueh-building-erstructure-and-may-also-appeala or the |

refusal [ by-the-building official ] to grant a modification to the provisions of the USBC pertaining-te
such-buildingorstrueture may appeal to the LBBCA ] . The applicant shall submit a written request

for appeal to the LBBCA within 30 calendar days of the receipt of the decision being appealed. The
application shall contain the name and address of the owner of the building or structure and in addition,
the name and address of the person appealing, when the applicant is not the owner. A copy of the

3

29



building official's decision shall be submitted along with the application for appeal and maintained as
part of the record. The application shall be marked by the LBBCA to indicate the date received. Failure
to submit an application for appeal within the time limit established by this section shall constitute
acceptance of a building official's decision.

Note: To the extent that a decision of a building official pertains to amusement devices there may be a
right of appeal under the VADR.

IBC Chapter 2 - Definitions
Add the following definitions to Section 202 of the IBC to read:

[ Aboveground liquid fertilizer storage tank (ALFST). A device that contains an accumulation of liquid
fertilizer (i)} constructed of nonearthen materials, such as concrete, steel or plastic, that provide
structural support, (ii) having a capacity of 100,000 gallons (378 500 L) or greater, and (iii) the volume
of which is more than 90 percent above the surface of the ground. The term does not include any
wastewater treatment or wastewater storage tank, utility or industry pollution control equipment. |

Building regulations. Any law, rule, resolution, regulation, ordinance or code, general or special, or
compilation thereof, heretofore or hereafter enacted or adopted by the Commonwealth or any county or
municipality, including departments, boards, bureaus, commissions, or other agencies thereof, relating
to construction, reconstruction, alteration, conversion, repair, maintenance, or use of structures and
buildings and installation of equipment therein. The term does not include zoning ordinances or other
land use controls that do not affect the manner of construction or materials to be used in the erection,
alteration or repair of a building or structure.

[ Change of occupancy. A change in the use or occupancy of any building or structure which would
place the building or structure in a different division of the same group of occupancies or in a different
group of occupancies; or a change in the purpose or level of activity within a building or structure that

involves a change in application of the requirements of this code. ]

Construction. The construction, reconstruction, alteration, repair, or conversion of buildings and
structures.

Day-night average sound level (Ldn). See Section 1202.1.

DHCD. The Virginia Department of Housing and Community Development.
Emergency communication equipment. See Section 902.1.

Emergency public safety personnel. See Section 902.1.

Equipment. Plumbing, heating, electrical, ventilating, air-conditioning and refrigeration equipment,
elevators, dumbwaiters, escalators, and other mechanical additions or installations.

Farm building or structure. A building or structure not used for residential purposes, located on
property where farming operations take place, and used primarily for any of the following uses or
combination thereof:



1. Storage, handling, production, display, sampling or sale of agricultural, horticultural,
floricultural or silvicultural products produced in the farm.

2. Sheltering, raising, handling, processing or sale of agricultural animals or agricultural animal
products.

3. Business or office uses relating to the farm operations.

4. Use of farm machinery or equipment or maintenance or storage of vehicles, machinery or
equipment on the farm.

5. Storage or use of supplies and materials used on the farm.

6. Implementation of best management practices associated with farm operations.

[ Hospice facility. See Section 308.3.1 ]

Industrialized building. A combination of one or more sections or modules, subject to state regulations
and including the necessary electrical, plumbing, heating, ventilating and other service systems,
manufactured off-site and transported to the point of use for installation or erection, with or without
other specified components, to comprise a finished building. Manufactured homes shall not be
considered industrialized buildings for the purpose of this code.

LBBCA. Local board of building code appeals{EBBCA)-See-Section HO-1.

[ Liquid fertilizer. A fluid in which a fertilizer is in true solution. This term does not include anhydrous
ammonia or a solution used in pollution control. ]

Local building department. The agency or agencies of any local governing body charged with the
administration, supervision, or enforcement of this code, approval of construction documents,
inspection of buildings or structures, or issuance of permits, licenses, certificates or similar documents.

Local governing body. The governing body of any city, county or town in this Commonwealth.
Locality. A city, county or town in this Commonwealth.

Manufactured home. A structure subject to federal regulation, which is transportable in one or more
sections; is eight body feet or more in width and 40 body feet or more in length in the traveling mode,
or is 320 or more square feet when erected on site; is built on a permanent chassis; is designed to be
used as a single-family dwelling, with or without a permanent foundation, when connected to the
required utilities; and includes the plumbing, heating, air-conditioning, and electrical systems
contained in the structure.

Night club. Any building in which the main use is a place of public assembly that provides exhibition,
performance or other forms of entertainment; serves alcoholic beverages; and provides music and
space for dancing.

Skirting. A weather-resistant material used to enclose the space from the bottom of the manufactured
~ home to grade.

31



Sound transmission class (STC) rating. See Section 1202.1,

State regulated care facility (SRCF). A building with an occupancy in Group R-2, R-3, R-4 or R-5
occupied by persons in the care of others where program oversight is provided by the Virginia
Department of Social Services, the Virginia Department of Mental Health:—Mental-Retardation-and
Substanee—Abuse Behavioral Health and Developmental Services, the Virginia Department of
Education or the Virginia Department of Juvenile Justice.

State Review Board. The Virginia State Building Code Technical Review Board as established under §
36-108 of the Code of Virginia.

Technical assistant. Any person employed by or under an extended contract to a local building
department or local enforcing agency for enforcing the USBC, including but not limited to inspectors
and plans reviewers. For the purpose of this definition, an extended confract shall be a contract with an
aggregate term of 18 months or longer.

[ Technical production area. See Section 410.2. ]

VADR. The Virginia Amusement Device Regulations (13VAC5-31).
VCS. The Virginia Certification Standards (13VAC5-21).
Working day. A day other than Saturday, Sunday or a legal local, state or national holiday.

Change the following definitions in Section 202 of the IBC to read:

[ Ambulatory health care facility. Buildings or portions thereof that are licensed by the Virginia
Department of Health as outpatient surgical hospitals. ]

(Remainder of definitions in this section unchanged)

Delete the following definitions from Section 202 of the IBC:

Agricultural, building,.

Existing building structure.

[ Fly gallery.

Gridiron. ]

IBC Chapter 3 — Use and Occupancy Classification

308.2 Group I-1. This occupancy shall include buildings, structures or parts thereof housing more than
16 persons, on a 24-hour basis, who because of age, mental disability or other reasons, live in a
supervised residential environment that provides personal care services. The occupants are capable of

responding to an emergency situation without physical assistance from staff. This group shall include,
but not be limited to, the following:



Alcohol and drug centers

Assisted living facilities
Congregate care facilities

[ Convalescentfacilities |

Group homes

Halfway houses

Residential board and care facilities
Social rehabilitation facilities

(Remainder of section unchanged)

308.3 Group I-2. This occupancy shall include buildings and structures vsed for medical, surgical,
psychiatric, nursing or custodial care for persons who are not capable of self-preservation. This group
shall include, but not be limited to, the following:

Child care facilities

[ Convalescent facilities ]
Detoxification facilities

[ Hospice facilities |
Hospitals

Mental hospitals

Nursing homes

[ Exception: Hospice facilities occupied by 16 or less occupants. excluding staff, are permitted to
be classified as Group R-4. |

308.3.1 Definitions. The following words and terms shall, for the purposes of this section and as used
elsewhere in this code, have the meanings shown herein.

Child care facilities. Facilities that provide care on a 24-hour basis to more than five children, 214
years of age or less.

Detoxification facilities. Facilities that serve patients who are provided treatment for substance
abuse on a 24-hour basis and who are incapable of self-preservation or who are harmful to
themselves or others.

[ Hospice facility. An institution, place, or building owned or operated by a hospice provider and
licensed by the Virginia Department of Health as a hospice facility to provide room, board. and

palliative and supportive medical and other health services to terminally ill patients and their
families, including respite and symptom management, on a 24-hour basis to individuals requiring
such care pursuant to the orders of a physician. ]

(Remainder of section unchanged)

Change occupancy classifications “R-1” and “R-4” and add new occupancy classification “R-5” to
Section 310 of the IBC to read:

33



R-1 Residential occupancies containing sleeping units where the occupants are primarily transient
in nature, including;

Boarding houses (transient)
Hotels (transient)
Motels (transient)

Congregate living facilities (transient) with 10 or fewer occupants are permitted to comply with

the construction requirements for Group R-3.

Exceptions:

1.

Nonproprietor occupied bed and breakfast and other transient boarding facilities not
more than three stories above grade plane in height with a maximum of 10 occupants
total are permitted to be classified as either Group R-3 or Group R-5 provided that
smoke alarms are installed in compliance with Section 907.2.10.1.2 for Group R-3 or
Section 313.1 of the International Residential Code for Group R-5.

Proprietor occupied bed and breakfast and other transient boarding facilities not more
than three stories above grade plane in height, that are also occupied as the residence of
the proprietor, with a maximum of five guest room sleeping units provided for the
transient occupants are permitted to be classified as either Group R-3 or R-5 provided
that smoke alarms are installed in compliance with Section 907.2.10.1.2 for Group R-3
or Section 313.1 of the International Residential Code for Group R-5.

R-4 Residential occupancies shall include buildings arranged for occupancy as residential
carc/assisted living facilities including more than five but not more than 16 occupants, excluding
staff [ and buildings arranged for occupancy as hospice facilities with not more than 16 occupants,
excluding staff | .

Group R-4 occupancies shall meet the requirements for construction as defined for Group R-3,

except as otherwise provided for in this code [ ;orshall-comply-with the | lntema&ena:l—l%es&deﬁ&a%

Code-with-the-additional-requirement-to-provide [ IRC providedthe building-is-protected-by-an
avtomaticsprinkler system-installed-in-accordanee-with-Seetion 90327 ] .

[ Exeeption Exceptions:

1.

Group R-4 residential care/assisted living facilities with any number of occupants

permitted and Group R-4 hospice facilities with five or fewer occupants are permitted to

comply with the IRC provided the building is protected by an automatic sprinkler
system in accordance with IRC Section P2904 or IBC Section 903.3.

2.]Group homes licensed by the Virginia Department of Mental Health;—Mental

Retardation-and-Substance-Abuse Behavioral Health and Developmental Services or |
assisted living facilities licensed by ] the Virginia Department of Social Services that
house no more than eight persons with one or more resident counselors shall be
classified as Group R-2, R-3, R-4 or R-5. Not more than five of the persons may require
physical assistance from staff to respond to an emergency situation.

34



R-5 Residential occupancies in detached one- and two-family dwellings, townhouses and accessory
structures within the scope of the International Residential Code, also referred to as the “IRC.”

[ Change the following definition in Section 310.2 to read:

Residential care/assisted living facilities. A building or part thereof housing persons, on a 24-hour
basis, who because of age, mental disability or other reasons, live in a supervised residential
environment which provides personal care services. The occupants are capable of responding to an
emergency situation without physical assistance from staff, This classification shall include, but not
be limited to, the following; residential board and care facilities, assisted living facilities, halfway
houses, group homes, congregate care facilities, social rehabilitation facilities, alcohol and drug
abuse centers. ]

IRC Changes

[ Change Section R301.2.2.1.1 to read:

R301.2.2.1.1 Alternate determination of seismic design category. The Seismic Design Categories
and corresponding Short Period Design Spectral Response Accelerations, Sps shown in Figure
R301.2(2) are based on soil Site Class D). as defined in Section 1613.5.2 of the International
Building Code. If soil conditions are other than Site Class D, the Short Period Design Spectral
Response Accelerations, Sps, for a site can be determined according to Section 1613.5 of the
International Building Code. The value of Sps determined according to Section 1613.5 of the
International Building Code is permitted to be used to set the seismic design category according to
Table R301.2.2.1.1, and to_interpolate between values in Tables R602.10.3(3). R603.7 and other
seismic design requirements of this code.

Delete Section R301.2.2.3 and all subsections.

Delete Section R301.2.2.4.

Change the exception to Item 1 of Section R301.3 to read.:

Exception: For wood framed wall buildings with bracing in accordance with Section R602.10, the
wall stud clear height used to determine the maximum permitted story height may be increased to

12 feet (3658 mm) without requiring an engineered design for the building wind and seismic force

resisting systems. ]

Change Section-R302-1toread: [ Add Exception 6 to Section R302.1 to read: |

35



[ 6. Decks and open porches. ]

Change Section R310.1 to read:
(No change to section)
Exceptions:

1. Dwelling units equipped throughout with an approved automatic sprinkler system
installed in accordance with NFPA 13, 13R [ ef, ] 13D [ or Section P2904 ] .

2. Basements used only to house mechanical equipment and not exceeding total floor area
of 200 square feet (18.58 m?).

[ Change Section R314.2 to read:

R314.2 Smoke detection systems. Houschold firc alarm systems installed in accordance with
NFPA 72 that include smoke alarms, or a combination of smoke detector and audible notification
device installed as required by this section for smoke alarms, shall be permitted. The household fire
alarm system shall provide the same level of smoke detection and alarm as required by this section
for smoke alarms. Where a household fire warning system is installed using a combination of
smoke detector and audible notification device(s), the system shall become a permanent fixture of

the dwelling unit.

Exception: Where smoke alarms are provided meeting the requirements of Section R314.4.

Delete Section R314.3.1.

Delete Section R315.2.

Change Section R315.3 to read:

R315.3 Alarm requirements. Single station carbon monoxide alarms shall be hard wired, plug-in or
batterv type, listed as complving with UL 2034, and shall be installed in accordance with this code
and the manufacturer’s installation instructions.

Add Section R328 Gray Water and Rain Water Recycling Systems.

Add Section R328.1 to read:

10

36



R328.1 Use of Appendix O for gray water and rain water recycling systems. In addition to other
applicable provisions of this code, gray water recycling systems and rain water recycling systems
shall comply with the provisions in Appendix O. In the use of Appendix O for rain water recycling
systems, the term “rain water” shall be substituted for the term “gray water.” Gray water recycling
systems and rain water recycling systems shall be separate systems and shall not be interconnected.

Add Section R329 Fire Extinguishers,

Add Section R329.1 to read:

R329.1 Kitchen areas. Other than where the dwelling is equipped with an approved sprinkler
system in accordance with Section R313, a fire extinguisher having a rating of 2-A:10-B:C or an

approved equivalent type of fire extinguisher shall be installed in the kitchen area.

Change Section R401.3 to read:

R401.3 Drainage. Surface drainage shall be diverted to a storm sewer conveyance or other

approved point of collection that does not create a hazard to the dwelling unit. Lots shall be graded
to drain surface water awayv from foundation walls. The grade shall fall a minimum of 6 inches

(152 mm)within the first 10 feet (3048 mm).

Exception: Where lot lines, walls, slopes or other physical barriers prohibit 6 inches (152 mm)
of fall within 10 feet (3048 mm), drains or swales shall be constructed to ensure drainage away
from the structure. Impervious surfaces within 10 feet (3048 mm)of the building foundation

shall be sloped a minimum of 2 percent away from the building.

Change Exceptions 2 and 3 in Section R403.1.6 to read:

2. Walls 24 inches (610 mm) total length or shorter connecting offset braced wall panels shall be

anchored to the foundation with a minimum of one anchor bolt located in the center third of the
plate section.

3. Connection of walls 12 inches (305 mm) total length or shorter connecting offset braced wall
panels to the foundation without anchor bolts shall be permitted.

Delete Item 5 of Section R403.1.6.1.

Add Section R408.3.1 to read:

R408.3.1 Termite inspection. Where an unvented crawl space is installed is installed and meets the
criteria in Section R408, the vertical face of the sill plate shall be clear and unobstructed and an
inspection gap shall be provided below the sill plate along the top of any interior foundation wall
covering, The gap shall be a minimum of | inch (25.4 mm) and a maximum of two inches (50.8

mm) in width and shall extend throughout all parts of any foundation that is enclosed. Joints

between the sill plate and the top of any interior wall covering may be sealed.

Exceptions:

1. In areas not subject to damage by termites as indicated by Table R301.2(1).
11

37



2. Where other approved means are provided to inspect for potential damage.

Where pier and curtain foundations are installed as depicted in Figure R404.1.5(1), the inside
face of the rim joist and sill plate shall be clear and unobstructed except for construction joints
which may be sealed.

Exception: Fiberglass or similar insulation may be installed if easily removable.

Change Section R502.2.1 to read:

R502.2.1 Framing at braced wall panels. A load path for lateral forces shall be provided between
floor framing and braced wall panels located above or below a floor, as specified in Sections
R602.3.5 and R602.10.8.

Modify Table R602.3(1) to change and add items as shown:

7 Built-up studs. face nail 10d (37 x 0.128") 24” o.c.
7a Abutting studs at intersecting wall corners, face nail | 16d (3" x 0.135%) 12” o.c.
26a | Rim joist or blocking to sill plate, toe nail 8d (2147 x 0.113™) 6” o.c.

Add Section R6(2.3.5 to read:

R602.3.5 Braced wall panel uplift load path. Braced wall panels located at exterior walls that

support roof rafters or trusses (including stories below top story) shall have the framing members
connected in accordance with one of the following:

1. Fastening in accordance with Table R602.3(1) where:

1.1.  The basic wind speed does not exceed 20 mph (40 m/s), the wind exposure category
is B. the roof pitch is 5:12 or greater, and the roof span is 32 feet (9754 mm) or less,
or

1.2.  The net uplift value at the top of a wall does not exceed 100 plf (146 N/mm). The

net uplift value shall be determined in accordance with Section R802.11 and shall be
permitted to be reduced by 60 pif (57 N/mm) for each full wall above.

2. Where the net uplift value at the top of a wall exceeds 100 plf (146 N/mm), installing

approved uplift framing connectors to provide a continuous load path from the top of the
wall to the foundation or to a point where the uplift force is 100 plf (146 N/mm) or less.

The net uplift value shall be as determined in Item 1.2 above,

3. Wall sheathing and fasteners designed in accordance with accepted engineering practice to
resist combined uplift and shear forces.

Change Section R602.9 to read:

12

38



R602.9 Cripple walls. Foundation cripple walls shall be framed of studs not smaller than the
studding above. When exceeding 4 feet (1219 mm) in height, such walls shall be framed of studs

having the size required for an additional story.

Cripple walls with a stud height less than 14 inches (356 mm) shall be continuously sheathed
on one side with wood structural panels fastened to both the top and bottom plates in accordance
with Table R602.3(1), or the cripple walls shall be constructed of solid blocking. Cripple walls
shall be supported on continuous foundations. ]

(Delete 2006 Section R602.10 and all subsections and replace with the following. Note: Figures are
not shown underlined, but are part of the new provisions)

[ R602.10 Wall bracing. Buildings shall be braced in accordance with this section, or, when
applicable, Section R602.12. Where a building, or portion thereof, does not comply with one or
more of the bracing requirements in this section, those portions shall be designed and constructed
in accordance with Section R301.1.

The building official may require the permit applicant to identify and locate on the construction
documents braced wall lines and braced wall panels as described herein.

R602.10.1 Braced wall lines. For the purpose of determining the amount and location of bracing

required in each story level of a building, braced wall lines shall be designated as straight lines in

the building plan placed in accordance with this section.

R602.10.1.1 Length of a braced wall line. The length of a braced wall line shall be the distance
between its ends. The end of a braced wall line shall be the intersection with a perpendicular braced
wall line, an angled braced wall line as permitted in Section R602.10.1.4 or an exterior wall as

shown in Figure R602.10.1.1.

SRACING

UL A JPOLD BULC BLA SPARING - BULE spaCms  BWLC
LA, SPACING PP spacmg, PR C : B
e < BETUEEN ol BETWEEN—n- : BETVIEEN: EIVIEEN
i BULAB [ i BWLB-C i i L AB i BULL B-C: i
I o - - ) ':?_.___'_i'i: »
— R -I—-—-d—* ----------- b -2 §—J’ : i I
ik p . 3K - ?
% N x

e A

NO.BRACED VUAIL LINE; -
ROGF AND FLOOR BEAR |
AT S¢E ELEVATION

— BRI AN
ENDGF BUl_l:‘DING":
I " -

SPACING BETWEEN

‘-

THL3

g
i

END.OF
BULDING

R A LA e Bl T TN Y

LNDTE: iN THE ABSENCE DF A
BRAGED WAL LINE, BALA B,

| € SRALLEND AT EXTERIOR

BvL2:4,

- SPACING

B
. pm——BETIEEN——pm——BETWE
JBVELZ.
§
o

s
puwL4.
-
i
1
1
1
1
1
1
i
)
L
1
1
1
1
i
1.
i
1
T
L.

o M —]

TYPICAL FIRST FLOOR BRAGED WALLPLAR FYPIGAL UPFER FLODH BRACED WAL PLAN.
ForST: | foot = 3048 s
Figure R602.10:1.T

Braced Wall Lines

13

39



R602.10.1.2 Offsets along a braced wall line. All exterior walls parallel to a braced wall line shall
be permitted to offset up to 4 feet (1219 mm) from the designated braced wall line location as
shown Figure R602.10.1.1. Interior walls used as bracing shall be permitted to offset up to 4 feet
(1219 mm) from a braced wall line through the interior of the building as shown in Figure
R602.10.1.1,

R602.10.1.3 Spacing of braced wall lines. There shall be a minimum of two braced wall lines in
both the longitudinal and transverse direction as shown in Figure R602.10.1.1. Intermediate braced

wall lines through the interior of the building shall be permitted. The spacing between parallel
braced wall lines shall be in accordance with Table R602.10.1.3.

Table R602.10.1.3
Braced Wall Line Spacing

BRACED WALL LINE SPACING CRITERIA
APPLICATION CONDITION BUILDING TYPE Maximum ] ) .
S Exception to Maximum Spacing
Spacing
. . 85 mph to <110 Detached
Wind bracing mph townhouse 60 feet None
SDCA-C Detached Use wind bracing
SDCA-B Townhouse Use wind bracing
Selsmic bracing Up to 50 feet when length of required bracing per Table
SDCC Townhouse 35 feet R602.10.3(3) is adjusted in accordance with Table
R602.10.3(4)

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm

R602.10.1.4 Angled walls. Any portion of a wall along a braced wall line shall be permitted to
angle out of plane for a maximum diagonal length of 8 feet (2438 mm). Where the angled wall
occurs at a corner, the length of the braced wall line shall be measured from the projected corner as
shown in Figure R602.10.1.4. Where the diagonal length is greater than 8 feet (2438 mm), it shall
be considered a separate braced wall line and shall be braced in accordance with Section
R602.10.1.

- BRACED WALL LINE-1, .

PROJECTED —
CORNER:

MOTE: IF, THE DIAGONKL WALL 1S GREATER.
"THAN 8FEET LONG, THEN IT MUST BE TREATED'
.AS ASEPARATE BRACED WRLL LINE.

|ee——BRACED WALL LINE 24—1/|

For 8L 1 foot = 304.8 fam.
Figure R602.10.1.4
Asigled Walls:

14




R602.10.2 Braced wall panels. Braced wall panels shall be full-height sections of wall that shall

have no vertical or horizontal offsets. Braced wall panels shall be constructed and placed along a
braced wall line in accordance with this section and the bracing methods specified in Section
R602.10.4.

R602.10.2.1 Braced wall panel uplift load path. The bracing lengths in Table R602.10.3(1) apply
only when uplift loads are resisted per Section R602.3.5.

R602.10.2.2 TLocations of braced wall panels. A braced wall panel shall begin within 10 feet (3810
mm) from each end of a braced wall line as determined in accordance with Section R602.10.1.1.
The distance between adjacent edges of braced wall panels along a braced wall line shall be no
ereater than 20 feet (6096 mm) as shown in Figure R602.10.2.2

HOTE: CONTINUOUS -
_SHEATHING METHODS
REQUIRES ALL FRAMED,

P ORTIGNS OF THE BRAGED

10t

20" MAX

10" wmax |

B > 16° REQ UIRES MINMUNM
- OF2 BRACED WALLPANELS

WALL'LINE TO BESHEATHED, |24

ForSk: { fool=3048 mm-

Figure R602.10:2,2
‘Location of Braced Wall Panels

R602.10.2.3 Minimum number of braced wall panels. Braced wall lines with a length of 16 feet
(4877 mm) or less shall have a minimum of two braced wall panels of any length or one braced
wall panel equal to 48 inches (1219 mm) or more. Braced wall lines greater than 16 feet (4877

mm) shall have a minimum of two braced wall panels.

R602.10.3 Required lensth of bracing. The required length of bracing along each braced wall line
shall be determined as follows.

1. All buildings in Seismic Design Categories A and B shall use Table R602.10.3(1) and the
applicable adjustment factors in Table R602.10.3(2).

2. Detached buildings in Seismic Design Category C shall use Table R602.10.3(1) and the
applicable adjustment factors in Table R602.10.3(2).

15

41



3. Townhouses in Seismic Design Category C shall usc the greater value determined from
Table R602.10.3(1) or R602.10.3(3) and the apnlicable adjustment factors in Table

R602.10.3(2) or R602.10.3(4) respectively.

Only braced wall panels parallel to the braced wall line within the 4 foot (1219 mm) offset
permitted by Section R602.10.1.2 shall contribute towards the required length of bracing of that

braced wall line. If a braced wall panel is located along an angled wall and meets the minimum
length requirements of Tables R602.10.5 or R602.10.5.2, it shall be permitted to contribute its
projected length towards the minimum required length of bracing for the braced wall line as shown

in Figure R602.10.1.4. If a braced wall panel is located along an angled wall at the end of a braced
wall line, it shall contribute its projected length for only one of the braced wall lines at the

projected corner.

(Remainder of page intentionally left blank to fit table on next two pages)

16

42



Table R602.10.3(1)
Bracing Requirements Based on Wind Speed

s EXPOSURE CATEGORY B
* 30FTMEAN ROOF HEIGHT MINIMUM TOTAL LENGTH (FEET) OF BRACED WALL PANELS REQUIRED ALONG
s+ 10 FT EAVETO RIDGE HEIGHT T T NI
» 10 FT WALL HEIGHT
+ 2 BRACED WALL LINES
?\Zﬂﬁ Braced Wall Line Methods Methods
Story Location Spacing b DWB. WSP. SFB fryre——.
smpe%d e Method LIB Method GB roe pone TR | Cs:WSP,CS:G

SFB © CS-PF




+  EXPOSURE CATEGORY B
* 0 FTMEAN ROOF HEIGHT MINIMUM TOTAL LENGTH (FEET) OF BRACED WALL PANELS REQUIRED ALONG
. 10 FT EAVE TO RIDGE HEIGHT EACH BRACED WALL LINE®
+ 10 FT WALL HEIGHT
+ 2 BRACED WALL LINES
3?;[; Braced Wall Line Methods Methods
Story Location oecs
Speed |  StonyLocation Spacing Method LIB " Method GB | o DSRSFR: | cswsp, csG
(mph) {feet) o CS-PF
60 215 215 155 135
<110°

For SI: 1 inch =25.4 mm, 1 foot= 305H1;1m. o -
a. Linear interpolation shall be permitted.

b. Method LIB shall have gypsum board fastened to at least one side with nails or screws per Table R602.3(1) for exterior sheathing or

Table R702.3.5 for interior gypsum board. Spacing of fasteners at panel edges shall not exceed 8 inches (203 mm).
¢. Method CS-SFB does not apply where the wind speed is greater than 100 mph.

(Remainder of page intentionally left blank to fit table on next page)

18 44



Table R602.10.3(2)
Wind Adjustment Factors to the Required Length of Wall Bracing

ADJUSTMENT
FACTOR **
STORY/ . APPLICABLE
ADJUSTMENT BASED ON SUPPORTING CONDITION ) “METHODS
= {multiply length from =
Table R602.10.3(1) by
this factor)
One story structure
Exposure category Two-story structure
Three-story
structure
Roof only
Roof eave-to-ridge height Roof + 1 floor All methods
Roof + 2 floors
Wall height adjustment Any story
Number of braced wall lines (per Any sto
plan direction)® Any story
Additional 800 b hold-down Festened fo the end studs of each DWB. WSP, SFB, PBS,
- Top story only | braced wall panel and to the 0.80
device . - PCP. HPS
foundation or framing below
. . . Lo DWB, WSP, SFB.PBS,
Inte-r:'o;-c : sum board finish {or Any sto Onlllxtted f;‘om inside face of braced 1.40 PCP. HPS. CS-WSP
equivalent) any stery wall panels CS.G. CS-SFB
4 in. g.c. at pane] edges. including top
Gypsum board fastening Any story and bottom plates, and all horizontal 0.7 GB
joints blocked

For SI: i foot=2305mm,1lb=448 N,
a. Linear Interpolation shall be permitted.
b. The total adjustment factor is the product of all applicable adjustment factors.

¢. The adjustment factor is permitted to be 1.0 when determining bracing amounts_of intermediate braced wall lines provided the
bracing amounts on adjacent braced wall lines are based on a spacing and number that neglects the intermediate braced wall line.

(Remainder of page intentionally left blank to fit tables on next page)

19



Table R602.10.3(3)

Bracing Requirements Based on Seismic Design Category

SOILCLASSD*®
WALL HEIGHT = 10 FT
10 PSF FLOOR DEAD LOAD

MINIMUM TOTAL LENGTH (FEET) OF BRACED WALL PANELS REQUIRED ALONG EACH

e a
15 PSF ROOF/CEILING DEAD LOAD ERACED WALL LINE "
BRACED WALL LINE SPACING <25 FT
Seismic Desian Braced Wall Line Methods
Seismic Design . Smeecwd e T
Story Location Length Method DWB, SFB, PBS. ethod Methods
Category @ LIB* Mefhod GB PCP_HPS wsp CS-WSP, CS-G
CS.8FB
C
{townhouses
only}

For SI: 1 foot 305 mm

a. Linear interpolation shall be permitted.

b. Wall bracing lengths are based on a soil site class “D.” Interpolation of bracing length between the S, values associated with the

Secismic Design Categories shall be permitted when a site-specific Sy, value is determined in accordance with Section 1613.5 of the

Internaticnal Building Code.

c. Method LIB shall have gypsum board fastened to at least one side with nails or screws per Table R602.3{1) for exterior sheathing or

Table R702.3.5 for interior gypsum board. Spacing of fasteners at panel edges shall not exceed 8 inches (203 mm).

Seismic Adjustment Factors to the Required Length of Wall Bracing

Table R602.10.3(4)

Walls with stone
Or MAasonry veneer

ADJUSTMENT
FACTOR *b
ADJUSTMENT STORY/ CONDITION {Multiply length APPLICABLE
BASED ON; SUPPORTING e — from Table R602.10.3(3) METHODS
by this factor}
Story height
(Section 301.3) Any story
Braced wall line spacing Any story
Wall dead load Any story
Roof/ceiling dead load for wall Any story -
supportin Lﬁw]
SUppOring Roof cnly
All methods

Interior gypsum board finish
or equivalent

1.0
1.5
13
Omitted from
Anv st inside face of braced wall 15
ANy SIory panels -

DWB, WSP, SFB, PBS
PCP. HPS
CS8-WSP. CS-G.

CS-SFB

For SI: | psf=47.8 N/m".

a. Linear interpolation shall be permitted.

b. The total length of bracing required for a given wall line is the product of all applicable adjustment factors.

20

46



¢. The length-to-width ratio for the floor/roof diaphragm shall not exceed 3:1. The top plate lap splice nailing shall be a minimum of

12-16d nails on each side of the splice.

d. Applies to stone or masonry veneer exceeding the first story height.
¢. The adjustment factor for stone or masonry veneer shall be applied to all exterior braced wall lines and all braced wall lines on the

interior of the building,

R602.10.4 Bracing methods for braced wall panels. Braced wall panels shall be constructed in

accordance with this section and the methods listed in Table R602.10.4,

Table R602.10.4

for maximum 16" stud

Bracing Methods
CONNECTION CRITERIA *
METHODS et
MINIMUM THICKNESS FIGURE
MATERIAL Fasteners Spacing
LB 1x4 wood or approved ) ﬂcﬁ%fgg_mngp_}}gw Wood: perstud and top and
LB metal straps at 45° to 60° 8d {2 14” Tong x 0.113” dia.) nails| bottom plates
Let-in-bracin angles for maximum 16" Metal: per manufacturer Metal: per manufacturer
_in- g n
stud spacing
un 2-8d (214" long x 0.113" dia.) Per stud
DWB £ nails
= (1" nominal) or
Diagonal wood boards @n%ﬂ»smd 2- 1%" long staples
wsp Exterior sheathing per Table 6" edges
- | R602.3(3) 12" field
Wood structural Mg
pancl ] Interior sheathing per Table Varics by fastener
(See Section R604) R602.3(1) or R602.3(2)
14" long x 0.12" dia. 3" edges
{for 4 * thick sheathing) 6" field
ﬂ?B. l.lt " or 25/ " .11/43” long x 0,127 dia.
for mﬁm’ﬁ,, stud (for 25/32” thick sheathing}
Structural fiberboard spacin galvanized roofing nails
sheathing spacing or
3 8d commeon (2%4" long x 0.131"
.§ dia.} nails
s Mails or screws per Table For all braced wall panel
o GB o R602.3(1) for exterior locations | locations: 7" edges
g == o bl (including top and bottom
Gypsum board DNatls Or SCIEWS per 1aple | plates)
2 — — R702.3.5 for interior locations 7 field
L]
‘é PBS . . For 3/8”, 6d common (27 long x |3" edges
5 = ditor A = 0.113" dia.) nails 6" field
El | Particleboard sheathin for maximum16" stud = For 5", 8d common (21" long X
. (See Section RGOS) spacimg R _...~ 0131 dla! nails
114" long, 11 gage, /1" dia. head|6" o.c. on all framing
PCP See Section R703.6 nails members

or

Alternate braced wall

Portland cement plaster spacing 7_;'3“ long, 16 page staples

0.092" dia., 0.225" dia, head nails| 4" edges
PS e with length to accommodate 114" | 8" field
for maximum 16" stud penetration into studs

Hardboard panel siding spacing

See Section R602.10.6.{ See Section R602.10.6.1
ABW ]
3_/52

PFH

Portal frame
with hold-downs

3/5

See Section R602.10.6.2

See Section R602.10.6.2

47



See Section R602.10.6.3

See Section R602.10.6.3

Continuously sheathed
wood structural panel

PFG
ird
Portal frame
at garape
CS-WSP Exterior sheathing per Table 6" edges
———— R602.3(3) 12" field

Interior sheathing per Table
R602.3(1) or R602.3(2)

Varies by fastener

Cs-G&© See Method CS-WSP See Method CS-WSP
E Continuonsly sheathed 30
&) wood structural panel -
= adjacent to garage
:E openings
g CS-PF See Section R602.10.64 See Seotion R602.10.64
rﬁ 7/ "
2l | Continuously sheathed —
E portal frame
§ 15" long x 0.12" dia. 3" edges

{for ¥ “ thick sheathing) 6" field
CS-SFB? o op 2 13/ long x 0.12” dia,
for mmﬂ stud {for /3, thick sheathing)
Continuously sheathed TS galvanized roofing nails
spacing

structural fiberboard or

8d common {2'%4" long x 0.131

dia.) nails

For 8I: 1 inch = 25.4 mm, | foot= 305 mm.

a. Adhesive attachment of wall sheathing, including Method GB, shall not be permitted in townhouses in Seismic Design Category C.

b. Applies to panels next to garage door opening when supporting gable end wall or roof load only. May only be used on one wall of the
parage.

c. Garage openings adjacent to a Method CS-G panel shall be provided with a header in accordance with Table R502.5(1). A full height
clear opening shall not be permitted adiacent to a Method CS-G panel.

d, Method CS-8FB does not apply in areas where the wind speed exceeds 100 mph.

R602.10.4.1 Mixing methods. Mixing of bracing methods shall be permitted as follows:

1. Mixing intermittent bracing and continuous sheathing methods from story to story shall be
permitted.

2. Mixing intermittent bracing methods from braced wall line to braced wall line within a

story shall be permitted. In regions where the basic wind speed is less than or equal to 100
mph, mixing of intermittent bracing and continuous sheathing methods from braced wall
line to braced wall line within a story shall be permitted.

3. Mixing intermittent bracing methods along a braced wall line shall be permitted in Seismic
Design Categories A and B, and detached dwellings in Seismic Design Category C
provided the length of required bracing in accordance with Table R602.10.3(1) or
R602.10.3(3) is the highest valuc of all intermittent bracing methods used.

4. Mixing of continuous sheathing methods CS-WSP. CS-G and CS-PF along a braced wall
line shall be permitted.

5. In Seismic Design Categories A and B, and for detached one- and two-family dwellings in
Seismic Design Category C, mixing of intermittent bracing methods along the interior

portion of a braced wall line with continuous sheathing methods CS-WSP, CS-G and CS-
PF along the exterior portion of the same braced wall line shall be permitted. The length of

required bracing shall be the highest value of all intermittent bracing methods used in
22

48



accordance with Table R602.10.3(1) or R602.10.3(3) as adjusted by Tables R602.10.3(2)
and R602.10.3(4), respectively. The requirements of Section R602.10.7 shall apply to each
end of the continuously sheathed portion of the braced wall line.

R602.10.4.2 Continuous sheathing methods. Continuous sheathing methods require structural panel
sheathing to be used on all sheathable surfaces on one side of a braced wall line including areas

above and below openings and gable end walls and shall meet the requirements of Section

R602.10.4.3 Braced wall panel interior finish material. Braced wall panels shall have gypsum wall
board installed on the side of the wall opposite the bracing material. Gypsum wall board shall be
not less than % inch (12.7 mm) in thickness and be fastened with nails or screws in accordance
with Table R602.3(1) for exterior sheathing or Table R702.3.5 for interior gypsum wall board.
Spacing of fasteners at panel edges for gypsum wall board opposite Method LIB bracing shall not
exceed 8 inches (203 mm). Interior finish material shall not be glued in townhouses in Seismic

Category C.

Exceptions:

1. Interior finish material is not required opposite wall panels that are braced in

accordance with Method GB, ABW, PFH, PFG and CS-PF, unless otherwise required
by Section R302.6.

2. An approved interior finish material with an in-plane shear resistance equivalent to
gypsum board shall be permitted to be substituted, unless otherwise required by Section
R302.6.

3. Except for Method LIB, gypsum wall board is permitted to be omitted provided the
required length of bracing in Tables R602.10.3(1) and R602.10.3(3) is multiplied by the
approvriate adjustment factor in Tables R602.10.3(2) and R602.10.3(4) respectively,
unless otherwise required by Section R302.6.

R602.10.5 Minimum length of a braced wall panel. The minimum length of a braced wall panel

shall comply with Table R602.10.5. For Methods CS-WSP and CS-SFB, the minimum panel

length shall be based on the vertical dimension of the adjacent opening in accordance with Table
R602.10.5 and Figure R602.10.5. When a panel has openings on either side of differing heights.

the larger vertical dimension shall be used to determine the minimum braced wall panel length.

R602.10.5.1 Contributing leneth. For purposes of complving with the reguired length of bracing in
Tables R602.10.3(1) and R602.10.3(3), the contributing length of each braced wall panel to the
total length of bracing shall be as specified in Table R602.10.5.

(Remainder of page intentionally left blank to fit table on next page)

23

49



Table R602.10.5

Minimum Length of Braced Wall Panels

METHOD
(See Table R602.10.4)

MINIMUM LENGTH *®

Wall Height

CONTRIBUTING LENGTH

10 ft 1

(in)

DWG, WSP, SFB, PBS.

b
PCP_HPS Actual_
Double sided = Actual
GB 18 48 4 2 A Sinele sided = 0.5 x Actual
LIB 55 Actual®
ABW 28 32 34 38 42 48
Supporting roof only
PFH 2
— Supporting one story and roof
PFG
CS-G
CS-PF
Adjacent cpening
vertical dimension
CS-WSp
CS-SFB

Actual ®

ForST: 1 inch=254 mm
NP = Not permitted
a. Linear interpolation shall be permitted.

b. Use the actual length provided it is preater than or

ual to the minimum length.

¢. Maximum header height for is 10'; however, wall height may be increased to 12 with a pony wall per Table R602.10.6.4.

S

BRS
il

=y

’/{% '

BEFER RS
FERTOAL
FERINE e

'g.*"*iﬁﬁ‘m E

Figure RE02.10.5.
Braced Will Patels with Contisuous Sheathing

f? Wf

24

50



R602.10.5.2 Partial credit. For Methods DWB. WSP. SFB. PBS, PCP and HPS panels between 36

inches and 48 inches in length shall be considered a braced wall panel and shall be permitted to
partially contribute towards the required length of bracing in Table R602.10.3(1) and R602.10.3(3).

and the contributing length shall be determined from Table R602.10.5.2.

Table R602.10.5.2
Partial Credit for Braced Wall Panels Less than 48 Inches in Actual Length

Actual Length of Braced Contributing Length of Braced Wall Panel (in)®
Wall Panel (in) 8 ft Wall Height 9 ft Wall Height
48 48 43
42 36 36
36 27 N/A

For SI: 1 inch=25.4mm

a Linear interpolation shall be permitted.

R602.10.6 Construction of Methods ABW. PFH., PEG and CS-PF. Methods ABW. PFH. PFG and
CS-PF shall be constructed as specified in Sections R602.10.6.1 through R602.10.6.4.

R602.10.6.1 Method ABW: Alternate braced wall panels. Method ABW braced wall panels shall
be constructed in accordance with Fisure R602.10.6.1.

{Remainder of page intentionally left blank to fit figure on next page)

25



_PANEL LENGTH PER
_ TABLE REOZIDS

ekl e | i ke
* -

ISl 1

MIN.3E OO D . il FO R F ANEL P LIGE (F NEEDEDY"

_ETRUGTURAL PANEL _ AOJOINING PANEL EDGESSHALL MEET

'SHEATHING. nunusFmK k OVER AND BE FASTENED TO GOMMNO N
T FRAMING

MK 200 FRAMING MK —
GOWELE STUDS AEGUIRED,

HOD COMMON O RGRLY. HOIHAILSEE'
057 AT PANEL EOG B, FORXINGLE .
mﬂ‘fﬁﬂﬂﬂ 0.0, PANEL. EHEB
FQ HTHEFIRSTUF!SWH]EE

-

@ HOLD-OOMN OR ) STRAP-TYPE—,
HFﬂHOﬂSHI’I’HHHIHI!UIGHFMI’W .
CIF:!.EN LEE@HEOF EACHEHOMN . -\
FUHGLHRI'I"?} lTRAF—T?PEAHGIﬂRS A
BHALL BE FERMITTEDN TO BE ATTAGHED
CIUEFLTHEIIOO [I ETHI.IGTIJHAL FIHEL .

‘ERAGED WALL PANEL HEG HT.

"Bl GOMMGN O K GALY. 6O X NAL g 1:

FANEL MUSTEEATTAGHED oL, HTIHTERBHSUPFOHE

TOGOHG RETE FOOTING, OH.
GO NGRETE FO LNDATION,
m LLco HTIHLIO UE OVER .

B RRCED IMALL LINE

Wi, FI.EIHFQ REING aF FOUHMTBH
OHE 1 HﬁﬂTOF ﬁﬂﬂ HD'I'FDH LAP
um 15" MINIMUN."

L STURZ UNEER HEADER A% REQUIAED

@ uT DINMETERANGHOR . * MINIMUM FOOTING BPE UNDER

BOLTS LOGATED EETAIEEN ORENING & 12'11? A TURKEC-DCNN

E AND 12' OF EAGH EAD OF j:r.?"?"lasu BE FERMITTED AT DOOR
THESEEMENT ™ of

ForSI: 1 inch = 254 . 1 foot = 305 nom
Fzgure R602.10. 8. 1
“Method: ABW Altﬂmate Bfac:ad Wall Panel

R602.10.6.2 Method PFH: Portal frame with hold-downs. Method PFH braced wall panels shall be
constructed in accordance with Figure R602.10.6.2.

(Remainder of page intentionally left blank to fit figure on next page)

26



mimsnnmmines o EXTERTEF HEADER WNITH 0 UELE PEATAL FRAMES (NG BAAS EX MMALL PANELE)
EI.TEITHF HEAD ERL WNITH BINONLE POATAL FAAME

VNP, [

ﬂlE!mEl WAL Fl.lEl)

< -1E FIREHEN WIETHGFR FERINCE

G FAABINLLES R EO-UBLE PO RTAL

TENHE § HTRAP PER
TAELE HED2I05.4 (L
UEFPFRAMERREDF -
B EXTHIND

P EYMALL [
S HEDNT

. X 19-104° BET ) EABE
EL H BRD ER PRA HIBITED.
¥ S EEIED, PATEL
| HPLEE RITERHALL
! HECUATVERAAND BE
: IH.!LEI ] :ﬂ MMD X
E!.ﬂ:xllll NiTHIE :
"1} ] !.Ezi-':lr'I'InLL'_
MIE- YEOINT. B NE
ROMRFXRE.
NAILING. W AR UTHER
1| BAZH PANEL EROE,

FETE EM'HIIIITH HEH.IEH.I‘IITH Ba .
-1 1 -1 ] o ROALUANZ ED BOX IH.ILE II! IIH.II
FH.'ITEH.I AHBHD N e

HEH.IEH.TH J.H.:K-BTHI BTMP FEH.TH-BLE
AER.i0E,4 B 0 B0 TH BIIEHHFHFEIIII]
HFFHHITEHIIEHFHHETHIIH

MIN BEUELEDGF R.HIIIIIEH\!EH.EI nrm MK,
e THEK DB B‘I‘H.HETH AAL PAN ELHH ammn
nimH EI TR [} R oAl AR PED BE X IAILHKT
FOE.INALL FAAM|ND (HTUDH, B KIND, AXE
HILLEY TY¥F.

ﬂPlEﬂ.L PH ATAL - .
FRMAM EEQ IBTRIJETH [

,‘\_ M1l 20 UALE 2 POAT:

CKINED AND Jﬂ: KETUR].
NUMBERBFJME KBTUNE.
.PER TAHLEH ASOES &
=2

12 MR THTAL WAL HER H T ————————————

EEEETEEnE

'_-Q-._-H_-t-i-ﬂ-t—ﬂ-i-‘%?fi‘f;‘i‘i‘? :

MIN. LENGITH BF PANEL FERL TRELE RENZADS

Il m Eﬂ! LH BTH.H-F T'C'FE HlLl IHIII.B
(EMBERR EQ 1578 EB NE REFEI.II IAILEI ETa
F RAM INFD-

ML AEIN U RE WO OF FRUAOATE B, R EENE DAR
TUFANE ECTTUMEF FOCTIID, LAP ELAE T
WO

NN 1 LE u:u nnm'_,
DEVKECEMBERRER MTH.-
ERIERETEANE EIRILER
1NTO FRAAMINE

© MK, FEBTIEKIEZEYSCERD PENIT EHTZ X 17. A TURNER:
IOVIY HiAN HE XLL'HE PEAMITTER ATODR AT FENINOE.

M2 (DSE" 3 AMETER XIEHEA SOLTIEETALLER FER
" EATEAE -¥¥TH Ta2xIF PLATEWARH B

FRONT ELEVATION:
Fcir;SI:: 1 inch'= 254 nim; 1 foot = 305 nwom
R Figure R602.10.6.2°
Mettiod PFH: Portal Franie with Hold-downs

\— FAHTEN TR P
PLATETR -
HEARER NITH
TR .

AANMERF 16D, .
HUKER IALBAT
THE TP

el

e, W, DO D
i BTRUE TURAL
FANEL
BHEH.THIII‘I B

SECTION"

R602.10.6.3 Method PFG: Portal frame at garage door openings. Where supporting a roof or one
story and a roof, a Method PFG braced wall panel constructed in accordance with Figure

R602.10.6.3 shall be permitted on either side of garage door openings.

(Remainder of page intentionally left blank to fit figure on next page)

27

93



.._atfra'irnr HEAE EH.Ii"}'H'Ii WHLE FRATAL f e G BRAE E8 IALLFAIELED.

. EI:I'EITEF iIEKI E.Ilﬂ'il HIII]LE H RTALE H.ME
GEIE ARACER WAL FHED [

Z-1F FICEKES IMATH 0 F 8 FEN NG
| -HILHAOLEDA BB UBLE PERATAL il |

- TEAEK N STAARF PER
' TAELEEIR.DE4:
FIRPPREMTEELE -
"O°F BH BATHIND-

ELEEXSER FAR HETER.

- FRETEN BAEXTRIED T HEADER MMTH BR 8
FOMMONDADGALUAIZER EOX IALE I DA : (¢ IEENED, PAEEL

R L FETEITRE

PLATETH. !

MTrEl Aamow - HPLE E ECOERBHALL Lo

: BEELKDVER ARE BE. el

. HEAIBLTD AEKHTYE WA FER TAILE N IAILED TO COMMO R ‘ROVMEEF 1EE:
- REC2.1064 0 1@ TH BE EOF B R ENiND- o . BLOE KINTHIUITH IR 24 'HEKER 1AL X
HPPHHTEBIIEHSI!!(E!.THIIH “HETHENALLME- EFOE.TYR.

REEIHT. B NE AR WA F —,
TOE. RALED HE

0. LT T

".h*%-- NN, PR ual.Emmmrln:nluanEu WTH M, - "REQUIRED IE BAE N M. ML REIBE
© INE THEXWAG DA BTRUSTURAL AANEL BH EATHINGD, PANEL EQEIE, Bl BTRUETU RAL
WNTH EX COMME N OA SAVANZES © XaAlBATT || ey PMIEL" "
0.2 1N FAAMINOETUEE AN 0 SILLE AEHANE, M TYFEM PORTAL BHEATH NG
- TYF, \\‘M FRAMECE EBTRUE TR N~
\\— llil'LElmn'rruELrE!(mnr.Eﬂmms" \'\“—"'l AEUBLE + PRI AT,

CEINE RN A K AU,
BUMBER G FIASK " :

IIHTALLED FER A4XTENTH T a¥E PLATE . —";HEI;‘I;TQELE

WREHEL ]

ML GH 1 DIRMETER XIEHA A BELTH
/’— @

FEEL LI i
EXEFrY Ty

"—-IITERI MTERT R EB
 WSALLEANEL PANEL

AESUIRED AOJACEHIT
0 PERIND FOA BINOLE;
" FERTAL FRAME.

iy : . ANEHO R EILTHFER-
FRONT ELEUATIDN BETO AE.TE SECTION

ForSI lmch 254mm,1fnot-3l35mm & F1gure Rﬁof} 10 63
‘Method PFG: Portal Franie at Garéige Door Openifigs
“in Seismie Design Categories A, B and C

R602.10.6.4 Method CS-PF: Continuously sheathed portal frame. Continuously sheathed portal
frame braced wall panels shall be constructed in accordance with Figure R602.10.6.4 and Table
R602.10.6.4. The number of continuously sheathed portal frame panels in a single braced wall line
shall not exceed four.

Table R602.10.6.4
Tension Strap Capacity Required for Resisting Wind Pressures
Perpendicular to Method PFH. PFG and CS-PF Braced Wall Panels

MINIM UM TENSION STRAP CAPACITY REQUIRED (Ib)*
WALL STUD MAXIMUM | MAXIMUM | MAXIMUM
FRAMING PONY TOTAL OPENING Basic Wind Speed (mph)
SIZE AND HEIGHT (ft) | HEIGHT (ft) (ft) — — — — — —
GRADE Exposure B Exposure C
9 10 I
1 10
2x4 No. 2 Grade 2 10
2 12
4 12
2x6 Stud Grade 2 12




4 12

1

ForSL linch=254mm,1 foot=305mm, 1 fh=445N
DR = design required

a. Strap shall be installed in accordance with mannfacturer’s recommendations.

B(TEATH § HEADEL IMTEHINOLE FERTALF: AME -
01 EBRAE EL MALL PARED

7o F WEHED MR THE § BFER D

g FO AMNOLEDR SCVELE FIRTAL® -

ECTENTOF HEADERL WiTH DO VBLE AYRATXL FRAM ERCTG B ARS E0 KRALL AAN ELR)

. EOMME § OATIALME FES B3 X EALE (83 GA10
J’.H.'I'I'EH.I Ml'llHﬂl'll

IlH.IElTﬂ -ﬂ:mlml’ FEH.TI.ELE
FUBCR. IS4 B3 ERTH BREEE f AR END
£ FFRATERREDF AHEVTHIND

MM, BEUBLE 4 F R (WD EBVEREE VMTH M.
~WIE THE K A0 B 0 HTRUETWAAL PANEL’
BEATH NN EX GOBMO T OR DALVRERER
ICX NALHATT OC, 1N ALL AL 10 HTUDH -
- BLOE KNI, AND EILLE TR,

'uti.Lélhﬁ g FAREL PEKT.HBLEHBR'II!S
MU G2 % BAMETER ANCHIA & LTH. .

-1IETALLED PEA A4 VEWITH T5Z'3'F, PLATE
WEHER

9 £ CONCRETE G MA IOHY BLOGK FOUNTIRTION

W D0 BTRUE TUAKC PAREL L R R '
o NRILEILEPLATE —

~BHEKH IO TE. TRFR'F BARD AR T EETFE
TAELERKOZXD

: HHBTHIII]I INTITE ﬂ.

CMEFI R&II E[:'.!I.Do[: FLODH FHAIIHG AHC:-IOFI QFTICH
ONAEN PARTAL A EXATH INE1 O ERID TLXF HVER BALE B R KMJEET

\\"\-\..— Mﬂ L] ml.l:TI.IH.HLFMEL'IIEIH.THIII]H“E{AP.FEIUE ‘FARROR AN JOET -

WEBD ETRUETURNS

- FANEL BHEATHIND SANEELE PurrE

EQETIFUO B OVER BANE 0 O ETHER

Ty E T TRELERERXT
e,

RAII ExinGoD FI.(XJFI WERL&F OFTDH L
WikE'rg H.THL!H ETHIH IJIFBHUEH. B-!II nn. H.I I RAK)

FRUNT ELEVATIDN
ForSL lmch 254mm,1fomt 305:11111,11‘0 445N

L MHI mu:wm PMELBRE‘I‘HIIHH\’ERAPFHHUE EHIIH. H.I_ HB'I' [

TElﬂI m.v FEH.
TARLEHR.10E.&

1 ﬂFHH‘I’EHIE
-1 EHRTHIIQ

BRAZ B KLLLLINE
:IITIIIIH}IBL"(HHWH =]
WETH NG B BTAUE T AAL
FASELR"

‘IF NEEREN PANEL
BPLEE EO0 B BHALL
'BEEUH ANN BE
ATTAEHED TR
CoMME § HLEEKED
IATHIE 2T F ML
MiD- HEEMT. REERD W
OFTOE. IALHOH
RS IRLEE | B
PAEEL B0 E"

o

- TYFEAL PERTAL )
F RAMEED THTRUETEN :

‘IUMBEROF JAEK
R EER AL
RS0 BGD-

I~ .
h“;"ﬁw_ MINTME YO ¢

[~ FARTES TOP PLATETE
'HERNERWTH iR

RO INEE F. 16 HlKER
BAIE AT BB, TYE.

" BTAVCTURAL PANEL
HHEATH/EE

.- ANEHGR BOLTH PER:
BEETOI AMWAE

£ F Ut ia AR Hﬂ
APPLIER ACAEEHH G

EAPAS[TYS F B0 LB L
THEHOREE L'TAL Al
lEH.TElL IIHETH | -

ATTXIH BHERTHIIO TS —,
EAND EA AMJOETITH "
O EEMMEE IULHATI
OE.THFASY EOTTOM-

"SECTION

o Figure R602.10.6.4. _
Method CS-PF: Continuously Sheathed Portal Frame Pane] Construction

'W"*?ﬁfﬁ:ﬁxﬁ'

WALBELE. .
FI.KI'ETHJHI!I'
_PERTABIE:
CRERTY.

. APRREVED BART
EH AMIRET

- EAILBGLE
-PLKTE T8 Ja@T"
PERTABLE: ",
MEE XD

- APEFARVE] BARD"
Ok AMJOET

29

55



R602.10.7 Ends of braced wall lines with continuous sheathing. Each end of a braced wall line
with continuous sheathing shall be in accordance with one of the end conditions shown in Figure

R602.10.7.

\.. | g CONTINUQUSLY. SHEATHED
J BR&CED'LI‘LF&LLLINE' b

| 7 ?;

T EGHTINGG UBLY SHESTHED - .. .

=N
I
l
l

NRReRE

N

\\\\\r~\“

TR :

b

R

NN

.

N

WY

Hoio N
. DOWH ] R
DEVICE —seef C DRACED WALLPANELAT

- ERACEDWALL PAHEL AT
. .. ENDEBRACEDWALL LINE “END oF BFW:EDWALL LINE

'END CONDITION 1 END CONDITION 2

: I*'mféﬂi@”fé%iéiﬁ“ﬂ!”“:ﬁ N _csgtt;ri'n‘gaf@kaﬁegrréﬁ”
N o i
® My
pﬂma. o ’ I S
=35 BINISUTY mﬁ.cEnwuL PANEL © "'—"‘] m'uqx | FIP“TEF.!-:ED
AT ENBf’iF IP!L.EU WALL LINE [ —_—' o= MLL PANEL
SEEREQURENEITS -
END CGHDH'ICI!N 3 B END CDNDITIGN 4
OC!NTIHU.-U?LYSHB&.THED - REQU'REMENTS

| amx

Return panel: 24" for braced wall lines she athe d'with
: wood structural panels,

\ ' 32" for braced wall [ines sheathed with

A . structiral fibemoard

Distance D:* 24" forbraced wall lings: shieathed with

- " N d I ' ER
////// ' ;ED‘Pf ers E?acégrdawpaaﬂn[i:s sh 8 ath ed Wlth

HDLD-DJW_N,—'*- "f- FIRGT BRECED structural fibevoard
DWPE <MALLPEHEL
'END COND‘T'GN 3 Hold-downB00 Ibs capacity fastenad to the Edge of the:

‘device: braced wall panel closeést to' the comer.and
to.the fouridation or floor franiing belov

For 81 1 inch =354 mm, | foot =305 mm, 11h = = A45N.
Figure R602.10.7

‘End Condihions for Braced Wall Lines with Centinuous Sheathing.

R602.10.8 Braced wall panel connections. Braced wall panels shall be connected to floor framing
or foundations as follows:

1. Where joists are perpendicular 1o a braced wall panel above or below, a rim joist, band joist

or blocking shall be provided along the entire length of the braced wall panel in accordance
with Figure R602.10.8(1). Fastening of top and bottom wall plates to framing, rim joist,

band joist and/or blocking shall be in accordance with Table R602.3(1).

30

56



2. Where joists_are parallel to a braced wall panel above or below, a rim joist, end joist or
other parallel framing member shall be provided directly above and below the braced wall
panel in accordance with Figure R602.10.8(2). Where a paralle]l framing member cannot be
located directly above and below the panel, full-depth blocking at 16 inch (406 mm)
spacing shall be provided between the parallel framing members to each side of the braced
wall panel in accordance with Figure R602.10.8(2). Fastening of blocking and wall plates
shall be in accordance with Table R602.3(1) and Figure R602.10.8(2).

3. Connections of braced wall panels to concrete or masonry shall be in accordance with
Section R403.1.6.

, CC'NTINL]CJLIS R||-.,1 FULL HEIGHT BLOCKING:: — ;
QF{ E]AND JOlST CONTINUOLIS .ﬂ-.I_ClNG LENGTH -
DF EIH.E.CED 'l.-“-.l'.&LL F'.B.NEL s

PERPENDICULAR FRAMING:

\=8d @ 6" 0.C, ALONG
N _Bd@ﬁ"DC ALONG o BH.&CE! W;&LL F’.L"-NEL
= BRACED VWALL P ANEL =
e BRACED WALL P ANEL
3160 @ 16" O £ ALONG ~3160.@ 15" 0.C: ALONC
" BRACED WALL PANEL /  BRACEDWALL P ANEL

PE HPENDICUL#‘-R FR.B-MING

CONTINUQUS RIM- FULL HEIGHT EILOCH}NG —\"L
QR BAND ,jo|5'|' CQNTINUDUS ALONG. LENGTH
OF BRACED WALL PANEL

Figura RG0Z. 10, 81y
Braced Wall Panel Connection When
Perpendicular to Floor/Ceiling Frammg

ForS:. Lingh= 254 mm

31

S7



11 s B ADDITIONAL FRAMING ~F ULL HEIGHT BLOCKING
A E'ES:E'];‘I:.’?,USR'MDH MEMBER DIRECTLY ABOVE @18 0L ALONG
| ENDUJDIST DRAGED WALL PANEL BRACED WALL PANEL,

M

- , g4 @6"0.C. ALONG. NCTOE NAIL 3B d
-8d' @ " 0.L. ALONG BRACED WALL PANEL HAILS AT EACH
BRACED WALL PANEL o SBLOCKING
- e > MEMBER
L L b
e BRACED WALL PANEL e BIRACED WALL PANEL. L BRACED WALL PANEL
3-16d @ 16" 0.C. ALONG -3-168d @.16" 0.C. ALONG —3 180 AT EAGH
|/ 'BRACED WALL PANEL' /_ BRACED WALL PANEL /_ BLOC KNG MEMBER,

2184 NAILS'
EACH ~51DE

WT T

— CONTINUOUS RIM.. -

_ ADDITIONAL FRAMING e oLt HEIGHT

OR-ENC JOIST MEMBER DIRECTLY BELOW ' BLOCKING @ 16" 0.0
'BRACED WALL PANEL ALONG BRACED WAL
For SI:-1 imch = 25.4 zum- TFigure R602.10:8(2)

Braced Wall Panel Comlection ’v»fhan
Para]lel to. Flovsz C eﬂmg Frammg

R602.10.8.1 Connections to roof framing., Top plates of exterior braced wall panels shall be
attached to rafters or roof trusses above in accordance with Table R602.3(1) and this section.
Where required by this section, blocking between rafters or roof trusses shall be attached to top
plates of braced wall panels and to rafters and roof trusses in accordance with Table R602.3(1). A
continuous band, rim, or header joist or roof truss parallel to the braced wall panels shall be
permitted to replace the blocking required by this section. Blocking shall not be required over
openings in continuously-sheathed braced wall lines. In addition to the requirements of this section,
lateral support shall be provided for rafters and ceiling joists in accordance with Section R802.8
and for trusses in accordance with Section R802.10.3. Roof ventilation shall be provided in
accordance with R806.1.

1. For wind speeds less than 100 mph (45 m/s):

1.1. Where the distance from the top of the braced wall panel to the top of the rafters or
roof trusses above is 9.25 inches (235 mm) or less, blocking between rafters or roof
trusses shall not be required.

1.2. Where the distance from the top of the braced wall panel to the top of the rafters or
roof trusses above is between 9.25 inches (235 mm) and 15.25 inches (387 mm)

blocking between rafters or roof trusses shall be provided above the braced wall
panel in accordance with Figure R602.10.8.1(1).

2. For wind speeds of 100 mph {45 m/s) or greater, where the distance from the top of the
braced wall panel to the top of the rafters or roof trusses is 15.25 inches (387 mm) or less,
32

58



blocking between rafters or roof trusses shall be provided above the braced wall panel in
accordance with Figure R602.10.8.1(1).

3. Where the distance from the top of the braced wall panel to the top of the rafters or roof
trusses exceeds 15.25 inches (387 mm), the top plate of the braced wall panel shall be
connected to perpendicular rafters or roof trusses above in accordance with one or more of
the following methods:

3.1.  Soffit blocking panels constructed per Figure R602.10.8.1(2).

3.2.  Vertical blocking panels constructed per Figure R602.10.8.1(3).

3.3.  Full-height engineered blocking panels designed per the AF&PA WFCM.

3.4. ___ Blocking, blocking panels, or other methods of lateral load transfer designed in
accordance with accepted engineering practice.

15.25" MAX,
2 A

\ SOLID BLOCKING BETWEEN
RAFTERS ATTACHED TOTOP
PLATES WITH 8d @ 6" OC ALONG.
LENGTH OF BRACED-WALL PANEL

ForSE 1ineh =25 4'mm

N Figure R602:10.8.1(1)
Braced Wall Panel Connection to Perpendicular Rafters

(Remainder of page intentionally left blank to fit figure on next page)

33



ROOF SHEATHING -

D /. A N
B BOCKING S L NN [ BBLOCKING

&
BRAGING:

"BRACED WALL
"PANEL:

NAILING PER
TABLE R602:3(1)

‘Foi S Linch=254mn
d. Methods of bracing shall e as describedin Section RE02:104
b. Provide ventilation (not shown) per Section RR0S.:
- Figure R602.10.8.1(2) o
Braced 'Wall Panel Connection Option to Parpendicular-
Rafters or Roof Trugses

(Remainder of page intentionally left blank to fit figure on next page)

34



PRO%DE VENT!NG
BER SECTION Ra06

ROOF SHEATHING

EDGE NAILING PER.
TABLE RG24} (TYE)

Xz sraciNG”
=
\E;_ &
3
=
T T »
‘E\ .':‘I’Ia'. %‘ E}_III II!IIIII’I (AT
P ’IIIIIIIII{I[!]I’/’II/I‘;’;’;::;::: - -
P ?5 5357 ;
;5 // .
.. :
7 i !
, / % |
2 Mathods of Bracing shall be as described in Seclion RE02.10.4:4
@ SECTION @ ELEVATION
Fignre R602.10.8.1(3)
‘Braced Well Panel Connection Option to
Perpendicular Raftess or Roof Trusses
R602.10.9 Braced wall panel support. Braced wall panel support shall be provided as follows:

1. Cantilevered floor joists complying with Section R502.3.3 shall be permitted to support
braced wall panels.

2. FElevated post or pier foundations supporting braced wall panels shall be desisned in
accordance with accepted engineering practice.

3. Maso stem walls less than 48 inches (1220 mm) in length that support braced wall
panels shall be reinforced in accordance with Figure R602.10.9. Masonry stem walls with a
length greater than or equal to 48 inches (1220 mm) supporting braced wall panels shall be
constructed in accordance with Section R403.1 Methods ABW and PFH shall not be
permitted to attach to masonry stem walls.

4. Concrete stem walls less than 48 inches (1220 mm) in length, greater than 12 inches (305
mm) tall and less than 6 inches (152 mm) thick shall have reinforcement sized and located

in accordance with Figure R602.10.9.

Exception: As an alternative to the Optional Stem Wall Reinforcement in Fig. R602.10.9. an
approved post-installed adhesive anchoring system shall be pemmitted. A minimum of two

anchors shall be installed as indicated in Figure R602.10.9. Anchors shall be located not more
than 4 inches (102 mm) from each end of the stem wall. Anchors shall be installed into the

concrete footing as follows:

35

61



1. _5/8 inch (16 mm) threaded rod — 3/4 inch (19 mm) diameter hole with a minimum

embedment of 6 inches (152 mm).

2. No. 4 reinforcing bar — 5/8 inch (16 mm) diameter hole with a minimum embedment of

4 1/2 inches (114 mm).

A minimum footing thickness of 8 inches (203 mm) is reguired and the minimum distance from
each anchor to the edge of the footing shall be 3 3/4 (95 mm).

The anchoring adhesive and anchors shall be installed in accordance with the manufactures
instructions and have a minimum tensile capacity of 5,000 Ibs (22 kN).

The reinforcement of the masonry stem wall and attachment of the braced wall panel to the
stem wall shall be as shown in Figure R602.10.9.

LESS THAN48" [

| BRACED WAL PAHEL
- 112! ANCHORBOLTS PER
T LEns THANS" /_ BRACEDMALL PANEL
e ESTHNS ) ppcepuALL PANEL - REQURAMATS
|IFF =12 anicHorBOLTS PRR 9RACED #|| —#apar
WAL FAREL REQUIRBMENTS - = 5

lg——— BOND BERA

~ ONDBEASWITH 184 BAR

I T (Y
1T 44 BARMIN: FIELDBENDS" ] I 2

#h L * BITENSIONINTO BONDBEMM -2 =] -
= k | | :g-"_/_—##BPR
g SN i XLl I | i i -

' Z ; T |

R = =

e b A Tye, {7 SRCTITRY ) AMINTYE, |

CovEeR—: - —t- FICOVER . peF —i-

SHORT STEM W LL REINFORCEMENT TALL §TEM WALL REINFORCEMENT,
LESSTHANE" BRACED WAL !
_ - FANEL
” ” s BRACEDRALL FANEL ]
" Al ] et BONDI BEA :
; " |~——BOND BEAM MTH 144 BAR - A
'3 T FACE BRICK—am{ ™V e & MIN. MU
2 < 58" THREADED RODS MAYBE  OPTIONAL® R s
'z $UBSTTUTED FORANCHOR ; =4
BOLTS AND REBAR A _
% " ST /I/
£ 21
=
T |
! iy

Le" COVER A MIN.Z' CUTWASHERS | PNET \
OPTIINAL ST ENWALL REINFORCEMENT TYPICAL STEMWALL SECTION.
" HOTE GROUT BOND BEAMS 24D ALL CELLS WHICH COMTAIN
"REBAR, THREADED RODSAND ANGHOR BOLTS: :

Fo#SI:1 in=305 mn N
Figure R602,10,9
Masomry Stem Walls Supporting Braced Wall Panels

36



R602.10.10 Panel joints. All vertical joints of panel sheathing shall occur over, and be fastened to

common studs. Horizontal joints in braced wall panels shall occur over, and be fastened to
common blocking of a minimum 1-1/2 inch (38 mm) thickness.

Exceptions:

1. Vertical joints of panel sheathing shall be permitted to occur over double studs, where
adjoining panel edges are attached to separate studs with the required panel edge

fastening schedule, and the adjacent studs are attached together with 2 rows of 10d box
nails (3 in. long x 0.128 in. dia.) at 10 inches (254 mm) o.c.

2. Blocking at horizontal joints shall not be required in wall segments that are not counted
as braced wall panels.

3. Where the length of bracing provided is at least twice the required length of bracing
from Tables R602.10.3(1) and R602.10.3(3) blocking at horizontal joints shall not be
required in braced wall panels constructed using Methods WSP, SFB. GB, PBS or HPS.

4, When Method GB panels are installed horizontally, blocking of horizontal joints is not
required.

R602.10.11 Cripple wall bracing. Cripple walls shall be constructed in accordance with Section
R602.9 and braced in accordance with this section. Cripple walls shall be braced with the length
and method of bracing used for the wall above in accordance with Tables R602.10.3(1) and

R602.10.3(3), except that the length of cripple wall bracing shall be multiplied by a factor of 1.15.

R602.10.11.1 Cripple wall bracing for townhouses in Seismic Design Category C. In addition to

the requirements in Section R602.10.11. the distance between adjacent edges of braced wall panels
shall be 14 feet (4267 mm) maximum,

Where braced wall lines at interior walls are not supported on a continuous foundation below.,
the adjacent parallel cripple walls, where provided, shall be braced with Method WSP or CS-WSP
per Section R602.10.4. The length of bracing required per Table R602.10.3(3) for the cripple walls
shall be multiplied by 1.5. Where the cripple walls do not have sufficient length to provide the

required bracing, the spacing of panel edge fasteners shall be reduced to 4 inches (102 mm) on
center and the required bracing length adjusted by 0.7. If the required length can still not be
provided, the cripple wall shall be designed in accordance with accepted engineering practice.

R602.10.11.2 Redesignation of cripple walls. Where all cripple wall segments along a braced wall
line do not exceed 48 inches (1220 mm) in height, the cripple wall shall be permitted to be
redesignated as a first story wall for purposes of determining wall bracing requirements. Where any
cripple wall segment in a braced wall line exceeds 48 inches (1220 mm) in height, the entire

cripple wall shall be counted as an additional story. If the cripple walls are redesignated, the stories
above the redesignated story shall be counted as the second and third stories respectively.

Change Section R602.11.1 to read:

602.11.1 Wall anchorage for townhouses in Seismic Design Category C. Plate washers, a minimum
of 0.229 inch by 3 inches by 3 inches (5.8 mm by 76 mm by 76 mm) in size, shall be provided

37

63



between the foundation sill plate and the nut except where approved anchor straps are used. The

hole in the plate washer is permitted to be diagonally slotted with a width of up to 3/16 inch (5

mm) larger than the bolt diameter and a slot length not to exceed 1% inches (44 mm), provided a

standard cut washer is placed between the plate washer and the nut.

Delete Section R602.11.2,

Replace Section R602.12. including all subsections, with the following:

R602.12 Simplified wall bracing. Buildings meeting all of the conditions listed below shall be

permitted to be braced in accordance with this section as an alternate to the requirements of Section

R602.10. The entire building shall be braced in accordance with this section: the use of other

bracing provisions of R602.10. except as specified herein, shall not be permitted.

1.

There shall be no more than two stories above the top of a concrete or masonry foundation

or basement wall, Permanent wood foundations shall not be permitted.

Floors shall not cantilever more than 24 inches (607 mm) beyond the foundation or bearing

wall below.

Wall height shall not be greater than 10 feet (2743 mm).

The building shall have a roof eave-to-ridge height of 15 feet (4572 mm) or less.

All exterior walls shall have gypsum board with a minimum thickness of 1/2 inches (12.7
mm) installed on the interior side fastened in accordance with Table R702.3.5.

The structure shall be located where the basic wind speed is less than or equal to 90 mph

(40 m/s), and the Exposure Category is A or B.

The structure shall be located in Seismic Design Catepory of A, B or C for detached one-

8.

and two-family dwellings or Seismic Design Category A or B for townhouses.

Cripple walls shall not be permitted in two-story buildings.

R602.12.1 Circumscribed rectangle. Required bracing shall be determined by circumscribing a

rectangle around the entire building on each floor as shown in Figure R602.12.1. The rectangle

shall surround all enclosed offsets and projections such as sunrooms and attached garages. Open

structures., such as carports and decks shall be permitted to be excluded. The rectangle shall have

no side greater than 60 Teet (18 288 mm), and the ratio between the long side and short side shall

be a maximum of 3:1.

(Remainder of page intentionally left blank to fit figure on next page)

38

64



10 NG SIDE | | LORG BI0E

Klr.—,_.._T-___:_ ~ ?‘I"_FI_G_I_L__-_-: ) ST,

I. WALL 1 r ‘|
1 GORNER 1 K i-'
I 1 H v
[ L L

-

“TYFEAL RECMENTS OF
WA LL BETIEEN ﬂp_RNEF\

TYPICKLEESRENTECF — /

WALL BETWIEEN €O m}lam

EHORT S0 E--

+—  BHORTEINE— =

| < GIRGUMSGRIBING RECTANGLE | [ GIRCUNSC AIEING REGTANGLE : :
I.‘i—'S—'—-‘-'-‘-'-"-.'"?'.—-"'.-'-- A e i?{"'.—"":""f."‘-'—,i
FIRST FLOOR PLAN SECOND FLOOR PLAN
- Figure 3602. 12.1
Rectatigle Circuﬁafcribing an Enclosed Building

R602.12.2 Sheathing materials. The following sheathing materials installed on the exterior side of
exterior walls shall be used to construct a bracing unit as defined in Section R602.12.3. Mixin
materials is prohibited.

1. Wood structural panels with a minimum thickness of 3/8 inch (9.5 mm) fastened in
accordance with Table R602.3(3).

2. Structural fiberboard sheathing with a minimum thickness of 1/2 inch (12.7 mm) fastened
in accordance with Table R602.3(1).

R602.12.3 Bracing unit. A bracing unit shall be a full-height sheathed segment of the exterior wall
with no openings or vertical or horizontal offsets and a minimum length as specified below.

Interior walls shall not contribute toward the amount of required bracing. Mixing of Items 1 and 2
below is prohibited on the same story.

1. Where all framed portions of all exterior walls are sheathed in accordance with Section
R602.12.2. including wall areas between bracing units, above and below openings and on

gable end walls, the minimum length of a bracing unit shall be 3 feet (914 mm).

2. Where the exterior walls are braced with sheathing panels in accordance with Section
R602.12.2 and areas between bracing units are covered with other materials, the minimum
length of a bracing unit shall be 4 feet (1219 mm).

R602.12.3.1 Multiple bracing units. Segments of wall compliant with Section R602.12.3 and
longer than the minimum bracing unit length shall be considered as multiple bracing units. The
number of bracing units shall be determined by dividing the wall segment length by the minimum
bracing unit length. Full-height sheathed segments of wall narrower than the minimum bracing unit

length shall not contribute toward a bracing unit except as specified in Section R602.12.6.
39

65



R602.12.4 Number of bracing units. Each side of the circumscribed rectangle, as shown in Fisure
R602.12.1, shall have, at a minimum, the number of bracing units per Table R602.12.4 placed on

the parallel exterior walls facing the side of the rectangle. Bracing units shall then be placed using
the distribution requirements specified in Section R602.12.5.

Table R602.12.4
Minimum Number of Bracing Units on Each Side of the Circumscribed Rectangle

EAVE-TO MIIJI;IMUM NUMBER OF BRACINbG MINIMUM NUMBER OF BRACINbG
“RIDGE ITS ON EACH LL?NG SIDE * UNITS ON EACH SHF)RT SIDE ™
STORY LEVEL HEIGHT Length of shont side (f)° Length of long side (f1)°©
(FEET) 10 | 20 30 | 4 50 60 | 10 [ 2 30 40 | 50 60
1 2 2 2 3 3 1 2 2 2 3 3
10
2 3 3 4 5 b 2 3 3 4 5 [
1 2 3 3 4 4 1 2 3 3 4 4
15
2 3 4 5 6 1 2 3 4 3 [ 1

For 8I: 1 ft = 304.8 mm

a. Interpolation shall not be permiited.

b. Cripple walls or wood-framed basement walls in a walk-out condition of a one-story structure shall be designed as the first floor of a
two-story house.

c. Actual lengths of the sides of the circumscribed rectangle shail be rounded to the next highest unit of 10 when using this table,

R602.12.5 Distribution of bracing units. The placement of bracing units on exterior walls shall
meet all of the following requirements as shown in Figure R602.12.5.

1. A bracing unit shall begin no more than 12 feet (3658 mm) from any wall corner.

2. The distance between adjacent edges of bracing units shall be no greater than 20 feet (6096
mm).

3. Segments of wall greater than 8 feet (2438 mm) in length shall have a minimum of one
bracing unit.

. 20FT. 12FT. 12FT,
[ e — ax [ Max ™
WaALL—ef VAR a—iirptL —of0 AT A e WAL
CORNER’ fj:/ //};/;//f,%/ | coruER |7 jL -l CORNER
. L] YA e ] ‘
ST L7 F//’,;’{////’ 3FT. L , #
sl |~ — | el Ut 4 e
MULTIPLE BRACING UNITS & MULTIPLE BRACING UNITS'#”
EQUAL LENGTH DIViDED, BY 4 EQUAL LENGTH DIVIDED BY 3
ERACING UNITS WiTH ARE AS BETWEEN BRACING UNITS WITH ALL FRAMED
"COYERED WITH OTHER MATERIALS PORTIONS OF WALL SHEATHED
Figure R602.12.5
Bracing Unit Distribution

40

66



R602.12.6 Narrow panels. The bracing methods referenced in Section R602.10 and specified in
Sections R602.12.6.1 through R602.12.6.3 shall be permitted when using simplified wall bracing,

R602.12.6.1 Method CS-G. Braced wall panels constructed as Method CS8-G in accordance with
Tables R602.10.4.1 and R602.10.5 shall be permitted for one-story garases when all framed

portions of all exterior walls are sheathed with wood structural panels. Each CS-G panel shall be
equivalent to 0.5 bracing units.

R602.12.6.2 Method CS-PF. Braced wall panels constructed as Method CS-PF in accordance with
Section R602.10.6.4 shall be permitted when all framed portions of all exterior walls are sheathed
with wood structural panels. Each CS-PF panel shall equal 0.5 bracing units. A maximum of four
CS-PF panels shall be permitted on all the segments of walls parallel to each side of the
circumscribed rectangle.

R602.12.6.3 Methods PFH and PFG. Braced wall panels constructed as Method PFH, in
accordance with Section R602.10.6.2, and PFG, in accordance with Section R602.10.6.3. shall be
permitted when bracing units are constructed using wood structural panels. Each PFH panel shall

equal one bracing unit, and each PFG shall equal 0.75 bracing units.

R602.12.7 Lateral support. For bracing units located along the eaves, the vertical distance from the
outside edge of the top wall plate to the roof sheathing above shall not exceed 9.25 inches (235
mm) at the location of a bracing unit unless lateral support is provided in accordance with Section
R602.10.8.1.

R602.12.8 Stem walls. Masonry stem walls with a height and length of 48 inches (1219 mm) or
less supporting a bracing unit or a Method CS-G, CS-PF or PFG braced wall panel shall be
constructed in accordance with Figure R602.10.9. Concrete stem walls greater than 12 inches (305
mm) tall and less than 6 inches (152 mm) thick shall have reinforcement sized and located in

accordance with Figure R602.10.9.

Change Section R703.7 to read:

R703.7 Stone and masonry veneer, veneral. Stone and masonry veneer shall be installed in
accordance with this chapter, Table R703.4 and Figure R703.7. These veneers installed over a
backing of wood or cold-formed steel shall be limited to the first story above-grade and shall not
exceed 5 inches (127 mm) in thickness. See Tables R602.10.3(3) and R602.10.3(4) for wall
bracing requirements for masonry veneer for wood framed construction and Section R603.9.5 for

wall bracing requirements for masonry veneer for cold-formed steel construction.

Exceptions:

1. For all buildings in Seismic Design Categories A, B and C, exterior stonec or masonry
veneer, as specified in Table R703.7(1), with a backing of wood or steel framing shall
be permitted to the height specified in Table R703.7(1) above a noncombustible
foundation.

2. For detached one- or two-family dwellings in Seismic Design Categories DO, D1 and
D2, exterior stone or masonry veneer, as specified in Table R703.7(2). with a backing

41 67



of wood framing shall be permitted to the height specified in Table R703.7(2) above a
nencombustible foundation.

Delete both the reference to footnote “f’ and the footnote itself in Fipgure R802.11.

Delete Section N1101.9.

Change Section P2601.2 to read:

P2601.2 Connections. Plumbing fixtures, drains and appliances used to receive or discharge liquid
wastes or sewage shall be directly connected to the sanitary drainage system of the building or

premises, in accordance with the requirements of this ¢ode. This section shall not be construed to
prevent indirect waste systems.

Exception: Bathtubs, showers, lavatories, clothes washers and laundry trays are not required to
discharge to the sanitary drainage system where those fixfures discharge to an approved gray
water or rain water recycling system.

Change Section E3802.4 to read:

E3802.4 In unfinished basements. Where tvpe SE or NM cable is run at angles with joists in

unfinished basements, cable assemblies containing two or more conductors of sizes 6 AWG and
larger and assemblies containing three or more conductors of sizes 8 AWG and larger shall not
require additional protection where attached directly to the bottom of the joists. Smaller cables
shall be run either through bored holes in joists or on running boards. NM cable installed on the

wall of an unfinished basement shall be permitted to be installed in a listed conduit or tubing or
shall be protected in accordance with Table E3802.1. Conduit or tubing shall be provided with a

suitable insulating bushing or adapter at the point the where cable enters the raceway. The NM or
SE cable sheath shall extend through the conduit or tubing and into the outlet or device box not less
than 1/4 inch (6.4 mm). The cable shall be secured within 12 inches (305 mm) of the point where
the cable enters the conduit or tubing. Metal conduit, tubing, and metal outlet boxes shall be
connected to an equipment grounding conductor.

Change Section E3902.11 to read:

E3902.11 Arc-fault protection of bedroom outlets. All branch circuits that supply 120-volt, single
phase, 15- and 20-ampere outlets installed in bedrooms shall be protected bv a comb1nat1on type
arc-fault circuit interrupter installed to provide protection of the branch circuit.

Exceptions:

1. Where a combination AFCI is installed at the first outlet to provide protection for the
remaining portion of the branch circuit, the portion of the branch circuit between the
branch-circuit overcurrent device and such outlet shall be wired with metal outlet and
junction boxes and RMC, IMC, EMT or steel armored cable, Type AC meeting the
requirements of Section E3908.8.

42



2. AFCI protection is not required for a branch circuii supplving only a fire alarm system
where the branch circuit is wired with metal outlet and junction boxes and RMC, IMC,
EMT or steel armored cable Type AC meeting the requirements of Section E3908.8. ]

IBC Chapter 4 — Special Detailed Requirements Based on Use and Occupancy

[ Delete IBC Section 403.4.4.

Change the title of IBC Section 410 to read:

Stages, Platforms and Technical Production Areas.

Delete the following definitions in IBC Section 410.2:
Fly gallery.
Gridiron.

Add the following definition to IBC Section 410.2 to read:

Technical production area. Open elevated arcas or spaces intended for entertainment technicians to
walk on and occupy for servicing and operating entertainment technology systems and equipment.
Galleries, including fly and lighting galleries, gridirons, catwalks and similar areas are designed for
these purposes. ]

Delete Section 410.5.3 of the IBC. add new Section 410.6 to the IBC and renumber Sections 410.6 and
410.7 of the IBC to Sections 410.7 and 410.8 respectively.

410.6 Means of epress. Except as modified or as provided for in this section, the provisions of
Chapter 10 shall apply.

410.6.1 Arrangement. Where two or more exits or exit access doorways are required per Section
1015.1 from the stage [ er-areabeneaththe-stage | . at least one exit or exit access doorway shall be
provided on each side of the stage [ erareabeneath-thestase ] .

410.6.2 Stairway and ramp enclosure. Stairways and ramps [ servine—thestase provided from
stages, platforms and technical production areas ] are not required to be enclosed.

410.6.3 [ Elyv—eallery Technical production areas . Technical production areas shall be provided
with means of egress and means or escape in accordance with Section 410.6.3.1 through 410.6.3.5.

410.6.3.1 Means of egress. | At least one [ exitor exit-aeecess means of egress ] shall be provided
from [ fv-ealleriesand the technical production areas.

410.6.3.2 Travel distance. The 1 maximum length of exit access travel shall not exceed 300 feet (91
440 mm) for buildings without a sprinkler system and 400 feet (121 920 mm) for buildings
equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1.

43



[ 410.6.3.3 Two means of egress. Where two means of egress are required, the common path of
travel shall not exceed 100 feet (30 480 mm).

Exception: A means of egress to a roof in place of a second means of egress is permitted.

410.6.3.4 Path of egress travel. ] The following exit access components are permitted when serving
only-the fy-eallery technical production areas ] ;

1. [ Unenclosedinteriorstairs Stairways ] .

2. | Ramps.

3. Spiral stairs stairways 1.

[ 3: 4. Statrways-with-a-minimum-width-of 22 dnches {550 mm} Catwalks ] .

[4:5.] Alternating tread devices.

[5:6. Permanently-installed Permanent ] ladders.

[ 410.6.3.5 Width. The path of egress travel within and from technical production areas shall be a
minimum of 22 inches (559 mm). ]

Add Section 4214 424.4 to the IBC to read:

4234 424 4 Skirting requirements for manufactured homes. As used in this section, “skirting”.
means a weather-resistant material used to enclose the space from the bottom of the manufactured
home to grade. [ Manufactured In accordance with § 36-99.8 of the Code of Virginia,
manufactured ] homes installed or relocated shall have skirting installed within 60 days of
occupancy of the home. Skirting materials shall be durable, suitable for exterior exposures and
installed in accordance with the manufacturer's installation instructions. Skirting shall be secured as
necessary to ensure stability, to minimize vibrations, to minimize susceptibility to wind damage
and to compensate for possible frost heave. Each manufactured home shall have a minimum of one
opening in the skirting providing access to any water supply or sewer drain connections under the
home. Such openings shall be a minimum of 18 inches (457 mm) in any dimension and not less
than three square feet (.28 m?) in area. The access panel or door shall not be fastened in a manner
requiring the use of a special tool to open or remove the panel or door. On-site fabrication of the
skirting by the owner or installer of the home shall be acceptable, provided that the material meets
the requirements of this code. [ In_addition. as a requirement of this code, skirting for the
installation and set-up of a new manufactured home shall also comply with the requirements of 24
CFR Part 3285 — Model Manufactured Home Installation Standards. ]

Add Section 4215 424.5 to the IBC to read:

42—14 424 5 Site work for 1ndustnahzed buﬂdlngs Slte Work for the erection and 1nstallat10n of an

respeﬂsibili%ies —uﬁd-ef——these—fegﬂ-lﬂt-}eﬂ-s. shall comply with the manufacturer’s installation

instructions. To the extent that any aspect of the erection or installation of an industrialized

44



building is not covered by %hese—fegu}a&eﬁs the manufac‘curer s mstallatmn mstructlons this code

shal-l—be—pemﬂtted—te—be—ﬁsed for any constructxon work %h&t—kﬁ—ﬁﬂbj-eet—%e—t}ﬁs—eede where the
industrialized building would be classified as a Group R-5 building. In addition, all administrative

requirements of this code for permits, inspections and certificates of occupancy are also applicable.
Further. the building official may require the submission of plans and specifications for details of
items needed to comprise the finished building that are not included or specified in the
manufacturer’s instructions, including, but not limited to, footings, foundations, supporting
structures, proper anchorage and the completion of the plumbing, mechanical and electrical
systems. Where the installation or erection of an industrialized building utilizes components which
are to be concealed, the installer shall notify the building official that an inspection is necessary
and assure that an inspection is performed and approved prior to concealment of such components,
unless the building official has agreed to an alternative method of verification.

[ Exception: Temporary family health care structures installed pursuant to § 15.2-2292.1 of the
Code of Virginia shall not be required or permitted to be placed on a permanent foundation, but
shall otherwise remain subject to all pertinent provisions of this section.

Add IBC Section 425 Aboveground Liquid Fertilizer Storage Tanks.

Add Sections 425.1 through 425.6 to the IBC to read:

425.1 General. This section shall apply to the construction of ALFSTs and shall supersede any
conflicting requirements in other provisions of this code. ALFSTs shall also comply with any

applicable non-conflicting requirements of this code.

425.1.1 When change of occupancy rules apply. A change of occupancy to use a tank as an ALFST
occurs when there is a change in the use of a tank from storing liquids other than liquid fertilizers
to use storing liquid fertilizer and when the type of liquid fertilizer being stored has a difference of
at least 20 percent of the specific gravity or operating temperature, or both, or a significant change

in the material’s compatibility.

425.2 Standards. Newly constructed welded steel ALFSTs shall comply with API 650 and TFI
RMIP. as applicable. Newly constructed ALFSTs constructed of materials other than welded steel
shall be constructed in accordance with accepted engineering practice to prevent the discharge of
liquid fertilizer and shall be constructed of materials that are resistant to corrosion, puncture or
cracking, In addition, newly constructed ALFSTs constructed of materials other than welded steel
shall comply with TFI RMIP, as applicable. For the purposes of this code, the use of TEFI RMIP
shall be construed as_mandatory and any language in TFI RMIP, such as, but not limited to, the
terms “should” or “may” which indicate that a provision is only a recommendation or a_guideline
shall be taken as a requirement. ALFSTs shall be placarded in accordance with NFPA 704.

Exception: Sections 4.1.4, 4.2.5, 5.1.2. 52.8, 5.3 and 8.1(d)(i) of TFI RMIP shall not be
construed as mandatory.

425.3 Secondary containment. When ALFSTs are newly constructed and when there is a change of

occupancy to use a tank as an ALFST, a secondary containment system designed and constructed
to prevent any liquid fertilizer from reaching the surface water, groundwater or adjacent land

45




before cleanup occurs shall be provided. The secondary containment system may include dikes,
berms or retaining walls, curbing, diversion ponds, holding tanks, sumps, vaults, double-walled

tanks, liners external to the tank, or other approved means and shall be capable of holding up to
110 percent of the capacity of the ALFST as certified by an RDP,

425.4 Repair, alteration and reconstruction of ALFSTs. Repair, alteration and reconstruction of
ALFSTs shall comply with applicable provisions of API 653 and TFI RMIP.

425.5 Inspection. Applicable inspections as required by and in accordance with API 653 and TFI
RMIP shall be performed for repairs and alterations to ALFSTS. the reconstruction of ALFSTs and

when there is a change of occupancy to use a tank as an ALFST. When required by API 653 or TFI
RMIP, such inspections shall occur prior to the use of the ALFST.

425.6_Abandoned ALTFSTs. Abandoned ALFSTs shall comply with applicable provisions of
Section 3404.2.13.2 of the IFC. ]

IBC Chapter 7 — Fire and Smoke Protection Features

[ Change Section 705.2 of the IBC to read:

705.2 Projections. Except for decks and open porches of buildings in Groups R-3 and R-4,

cornices, eave overhangs, exterior balconies and similar projections extending beyond the exterior
wall shall conform to the requirements of this section and Section 1406. Exterior egress balconies
and exterior exit stairways shall also comply with Sections 1019 and 1026, respectively.

Projections shall not extend beyond the distance determined by the following three methods,
whichever results in the lesser projection:

1. A point one-third the distance from the exterior face of the wall to the lot line where
protected openings or a combination of protected and unprotected openings are required in

the exterior wall.

2. A point one-half the distance from the exterior face of the wall to the lot line where all
openings in the exterior wall are permitted to be unprotected or the building is equipped
throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed under the provisions of Section
705.8.2.

3. More than 12 inches (305 mm) into areas where openings are prohibited.

Buildings on the same lot and considered as portions of one building in accordance with
Section 705.3 are not required to comply with this section.

Add Exception 4 to Section 706.5.2 of the IBC to read:

4. Decks and open porches of buildings in Groups R-3 and R-4. ]

IBC Chapter 9 — Fire Protection Systems

[ Change Section 903.2.3 of the IBC to read:

46



903.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group E occupancies as

follows:

1. Throughout all Group E fire areas greater than 20,000 square feet (1858 m21 in area.

2. Throughout every portion of educational buildings below the lowest level of exit discharge
serving that portion of the building.

Exception: An automatic sprinkler system is not required in any area below the lowest level
of exit discharge serving that area where every classroom throughout the building has at
least one exterior exit door at ground level.

Change Section 903.2.7 of the IBC to read:

903.2.7 Group M. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings
containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists:

1. A Group M fire area exceeds 12.000 square feet (1115 mz).

2. A Group M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane.

3. The combined area of all Groun M fire areas on all floors, including anv mezzanines,
exceeds 24.000 square feet (2230 m?). ]

Change Item 1 of Section 906.1 of the IBC to read:

1.In Group A, B, E, F, H, I, M, R-1, R-4 and S occupancies.
[ Exeeptions Exception | :

2- ] In Group I-3 occupancies, portable fire extinguishers shall be permitted to be located at
staff locations and the access to such extinguishers shall be permitted to be locked.

[ Change Section 911.1.3 of the IBC to read:

911.1.3 Size. The fire command center shall be a minimum of 96 square feet (9 m2! in area with a
minimum dimension of 8 feet (2438 mim).

Exception: Where it is determined by the building official, after consultation with the fire chief,

that specific building characteristics require a larger fire command center. the building official
may increase the minimum required size of the fire command center up to 200 square feet (19

m®) in area with a minimum dimension of up to 10 feet (3048 mm). ]

47

73



Add Change Section 913-31te 915.1 of the IBC to read:

913-3 915.1 General. [ Inbuilding For localities utilizing public safety wireless communications,
dedicated infrastructure to accommodate and perpetuate continuous in-building ] emergency
communication equipment to allow emergency public safety personnel to send and receive
emergency communications shall be provided in new buildings and structures in accordance with
this section.

Exceptions:
1. Buildings of Use Groups A-5, I-4, within dwelling units of R-2, R-3, R-4, R-5, and U.

2. Buildings of Type IV and V construction without basements [ , that are not considered
unlimited area buildings in accordance with Section 507 ] .

(Remainder of section unchanged)

Add Sections 4329132101322 and 01323 [ 045201521 01522 and 01523 915.1.1,
915.1.2 and 915.1.3 ] to the IBC to read:

91221 [ 94521 915.1.1 ] Installation. [ Radiating The building owner shall install radiating ]

cable [ systems |, such as coaxial cable or equivalent [ ;. The radiating cable ] shall be installed
in dedicated conduits, raceways, plenums, attics, or roofs, compatible for these specific
installations as well as other applicable provisions of this code. [ The locality shall be responsible

for the installation of any additional communication equipment required for the operation of the
system. |

91322 [ 94522 915.1.2 ] Operations. The locality will assume all responsibilities for the [
instatlation o peratlon ] and maintenance of [ add}’&enal the ] emergency commumcatlon equ1pment

&ie—b&ﬂémg—shaﬂ—be—prewéed— The bulldmg owner shall prov1de sufﬁment operatlonal space w1th1n

the building to allow the locality access to and the ability to operate in-building emergency
communication equipment. ]

913.2:3 [ 93523 915.1.3 ] Inspection. In accordance with Section 113.3, all installations shall be
inspected prior to concealment.

Add Section 3433 [ 9453 915.2 ] to the IBC to read:

9133 [ 9453 915.2 ] Acceptance test. Upon completion of installation, after providing reasonable
notice to the owner or their representative, emergency public safety personnel shall have the right
during normal business hours, or other mutually agreed upon time, to enter onto the property to
conduct field tests to verify that the required level of radio coverage is present at no cost to the

48



owner, Any noted deficiencies [ in the installation of the radiating cable or operational space ] shall
be provided in an inspection report to the owner or the owner's representative.

IBC Chapter 10 — Means of Egress

[ Change Section 1005.1 of the IBC to read:

1005.1 Minimum reaquired egress width. The means of egress width shall not be less than required

by this section. The total width of means of egress in inches (mm) shall not be less than the total

occupant load served by the means of egress multiplied by 0.3 inches (7.62 mm) per occupant for

stairways and by 0.2 inches (5.08 mm) per occupant for other egress components. The width shall

not be less than specified elsewhere in this code. Multiple means of epress shall be sized such that

the loss of anv one means of egress shall not reduce the available capacity to less than 50 percent

of the required capacity. The maximum capacity required from any story of a building shall be

maintained to the termination of the means of egress.

Exceptions:

1. Means of egress complying with Section 1028.

2. For occupancies other than Groups H-1. H-2, H-3. H-4 and I-2, in buildings equipped

with an_automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or
903.3.1.2, the total width of means of egress in inches {(mm) shall not be less than the

total occupant load served by the means of egress multiplied by 0.2 inches (5.08 mm)
per occupant for stairwavs and by 0.15 inches (3.81 mm) per occupant for other egress

components.

Change Section 1007.2 of the IBC to read:

1007.2 Continuity and components. Each required accessible means of egress shall be continuous

to a public wav and shall consist of one or more of the following components:

1.

Accessible routes complying with Section 1104,

2.

Interior exit stairways complying with Sections 1007.3 and 1022.

Exterior exit stairwavs complying with Sections 1007.3 and 1026 and serving levels other

than the level of exit discharge.

Elevators complying with Section 1007.4.

Platform lifts complying with Section 1007.5.

Horizontal exits complying with Section 1025.

Ramps complying with Section 1010.

Areas of refuge complying with Section 1007.6.

49

75



9. Exterior area for assisted rescue complying with Section 1007.7 serving exits at the leve] of
exit discharge.

Change Section 1007.7, including subsections, of the IBC to read:

1007.7 Exterior area for assisted rescue. The exterior area for assisted rescue shall be an area
provided on the exterior landing serving an exit door on an accessible route, The exterior area of
assisted rescue shall meet the size and access requirements of Section 1007.6.1.

1007.7.1 Separation. Exterior walls separating the exterior area of assisted rescue from the interior
of the building shall have a minimum fire resistance rating of 1 hour, rated for exposure to fire
from the inside. The fire resistance rated exterior wall construction shall extend horizontally 10 feet
(3048 mm) beyond the landing on either side of the landing or equivalent fire resistance rated

construction is permitted to extend out perpendicular to the exterior wall 4 feet (1220 mm)}
minimum on the side of the landing. The fire resistance rated construction shall extend vertically
from the ground to a point 10 feet (3048 mm) above the floor level of the area for assisted rescue or

to the roof line, whichever is lower. Openings within such fire resistance rated exterior walls shall
be protected in accordance with Section 715.

1007.7.2 Openness. The exterior area for assisted rescue shall be at least 50 percent open, and the
open area above the guards shall be so distributed as to minimize the accumulation of smoke or

toxic gases.

1007.7.3 Exterior stairway. Exterior stairways that are part of the means of egress for the exterior

area for assisted rescue shall provide a clear width of 48 inches (1219 mm) between handrails.

Add Exception 3 to Section 1009.7 of the IBC to read:

3. Spiral stairwayvs used as a means of egress from technical production areas.

Add Exception 7 to Section 1018.2 of the IBC to read:

7. Forty-four inches (1118 mm) — In corridors of Group I-2 assisted living facilities serving areas
with wheelchair, walker and gurnevy traffic where residents are capable of self-preservation or

where resident rooms have a means of egress door leading directly to the outside.

Change Exception 6 of Section 1022.1 of the IBC to read:

6. Means of epress stairways as provided for in Section 410.6.2 are not required to be enclosed.

Change Section 1022.8 of the IBC to read:

1022.8 Floor identification signs. A sign shall be provided at each floor landing in exit enclosures
connecting more than three stories designating the floor level. the terminus of the top and bottom
of the éexit enclosure and the identification of the stair or ramp by designation with a letter of the

alphabet. The signage shall also state the story of, and the direction to, the exit discharge and the
availability of roof access from the enclosure for the fire department. The sign shall be located 5

feet (1524 mm) above the floor landing in a position that is readily visible when the doors are in

the open and closed positions. Floor level identification signs in tactile characters complying with

50

76



ICC A117.1 shall be located at each floor level landing adjacent to the door leading from the
enclosure into the corridor to identify the floor level.

Change Section 1024.1 of the IBC to read:

1024.1 General. Approved luminous epress path markines delineating the exit path shall be
provided in buildines of Groups A, B, E. I. M and R-1 having occupied floors located more than

420 feet (128 016 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access in accordance with
Sections 1024.1 through 1024.5.

Exceptions:

1. Luminous egress path markings shall not be required on the level of exit discharge in
lobbies that serve as part of the exit path in accordance with Section 1027.1. Exception
1.

2. Luminous _egress path markings shall not be required in areas of open parking garages
that serve as part of the exit path in accordance with Section 1027.1, Exception 3. ]

IBC Chapter 13 — Energy Efficiency

[ Add Section 1301.1.1.1 to the IBC tg read:

1301.1.1.1 Changes to the International Energy Conservation Code (IECC). The following change
shall be made to the IECC:

1. Delete Section 401.3. ]
IBC Chapter 18 — Soils and Foundations

[ Add an exception to Section 1808.1 of the IBC to read:

Exception: One-story detached accessory structures not exceeding 256 square fect (23.78m2) of
building area, provided all of the following conditions are met:

1. The building eave height is 10 feet (3048 mm) or less.

2. The maximum height from the finished floor level to grade does not exceed 18 inches

(457.2 mm).

3. The supporting structural elements in direct contact with the ground shall be placed level on

firm soil and when such elements are wood they shall be approved pressure preservative
treated suitable for ground contact use.

4. The structure is anchored to withstand wind loads as required by this code.

5. The structure shall be of light-frame construction with walls and roof of light weight
material, not slate, tile, brick or masonry. ]

51

77



IBC Chapter 28 — Mechanical Systems
Add Section 28031 2801.1.3 to the IBC to read:

28031 2801.1.3 Changes to the International Mechanical Code [ (IMC) ] . The following changes
[ change changes ] shall be made to the [ International- Mechanieal Code IMC ] :

[ 1. Change Section 403.3 of the IMC to read:

403.3 Outdoor airflow rate. Ventilation systems shall be designed to have the capacity to
supply the minimum outdoor airflow rate determined in accordance with this section. The
occupant load utilized for design of the ventilation system shall not be less than the number
determined from the estimated maximum occupant load rate indicated in Table 403.3.
Ventilation rates for occupancies not represented in Table 403.3 shall be those for a listed
occupancy classification that is most similar in terms of occupant density, activities and

building construction; or shall be determined by an approved engineering analysis. The

ventilation system shall be designed to supply the required rate of ventilation air
continuously during the period the building is occupied, except as otherwise stated in other

provisions of the code.

With the exception of smoking lounges and other designated areas where smoking is
permitted, the ventilation rates in Table 403.3 are based on the absence of smoking in
occupiable spaces.

Exception: The occupant load is not required to be determined based on the estimated
maximum occupant load rate indicated in Table 403.3 where approved statistical data

document the accuracy of an alternate anticipated occupant density.

2. Add the following areas to Table 403.3 of the IMC in the occupancy classifications shown:

People
Qutdoor Area Outdoor
Airflow Rate Airflow Rate Defanlt Exhaust
in Breathing in Breathing Occupant Airflow
Zone Zone Density Rate
QCCUPANCY CLASSIFICATION Cfim/person R, cfin/f®® #1000 fi’® Cfm/fi™®
Food and beverage service
Bars or cocktail lounges designated as 30 - 100 =
an area when smoking is permitted®
Cafeteria or fast food designated as an 20 = 100 -
area when smoking is permitted®
Dining rooms designated as_an area 20 - pit] =
when smoking is permitted”
Public spaces
Lounges designated as an area where 30 - 100 =1
SlTlOkiIlg_iS_‘pel'miﬁedb

7-[ 4= 3. ] Add Section 801.1.1 to the [ Intemnational Mechanical-Code IMC ] to read:
(Remainder of this subdivision unchanged)

[ 4. Change Section 1101.10 of the IMC to read:
52




1101.10 Locking access port caps. Refrigerant circuit access ports located outdoors shall be
fitted with locking-type tamper-resistant caps or shall be otherwise secured to prevent
unauthorized access. ]

IBC Chapter 29 — Plumbing Systems
Change Section 2901.1 of the IBC to read:

2901.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter and the International Plumbing Code [ (IPC) ] shall
govern the design and installation of all plumbing systems and equipment, except that as provided
for in Section 103.11 for functional design, water supply sources and sewage disposal systems are
regulated and approved by the Virginia Department of Health and the Virginia Department of
Environmental Quality. The approval of pumping and electrical equipment associated with such
water supply sources and sewage disposal systems shall, however, be the responsibility of the
building official.

Note: See also the Memorandum of Agreement in the “Related Laws Package,” which is available
from DHCD.

Add Section 2901.1.1 to the IBC to read:

[ 2901.1.1 Use of Appendix C of the IPC for gray water and rain water recycling systems. In
addition to_other applicable provisions of the IPC, gray water recycling systems and rain water
recveling systems shall comply with the provisions in Appendix C of the IPC. In the use of
Appendix C of the IPC for rain water recycling systems, the term “rain water” shall be substituted
for the term “gray water.” Gray water recycling systems and rain water recycling systems shall be
separate systems and shall not be interconnected.

Add Section 2901.1.2 to the IBC to read:

20043+ 2901.1.2 ] Changes to the [ International PlumbingCode IPC | . The following changes
shall be made to the [ International Plambing Code [PC ] :

33



[ 1. Change Section 301.3 of the IPC to read:

301.3 Connections to drainage system. All plumbing fixtures, drains, appurtenances and
appliances used to receive or discharge liquid wastes or sewage shall be directly connected to
the sanitary drainage system of the building or premises, in accordance with the requirements
of this code. This section shall not be construed to prevent indirect waste systems required by

Chapter 8.

Exception: Bathtubs, showers, lavatories, clothes washers and laundry trays shall not be
required to discharge to the sanitary drainage system where such fixtures discharge to an

approved gray water system or rain water system for flushing of water closets and urinals or
for subsurface landscape irrigation. ]

2: [ £ 2. ] Delete Sections 311 and 311.1 [ of the IPC ] .

[ 3. Change Section 602.1 of the IPC to read:

602.1 General. Every structure equipped with plumbing fixtures and utilized for human
occupancy or habitation shall be provided with a potable supply of water in the amounts and at
the pressures specified in this chapter. This shall not prohibit the use of reclaimed water
distribution systems installed in accordance with this code and the Virginia Water Reclamation
and Reuse Regulation (9 VAC 25-740).

4. Change Section 604.1 of the IPC to read:

604.1 General. The design of the water distribution system, including any reclaimed water
distribution systems governed by the Virginia Water Reclamation and Reuse Regulation (9
VAC 25-740), shall conform to accepted engineering practice. Methods utilized to determine
pipe sizes shall be approved.

5. Add an exception to Section 608.8 of the IPC to read:

Exception: Reclaimed water supply systems shall be identified in accordance with the
provisions of the Virginia Water Reclamation and Reuse Regulation (9 VAC 25-740).

6. Change Section 608.8.2 of the IPC to read:

608.8.2 Color. The color of the pipe identification shall be discernable and consistent
throughout the building. The color purple shall be used to identify rain and gray water
distribution systems. ]

4-[ 2: 7. ] Delete Section 701.9 [ of the IPC ] .
5. [ 3: 8. ] Add Section 703.6 [ to the IPC ] to read:

{Remainder of subdivision unchanged)

54

80



IBC Chapter 30 ~ Elevators and Conveying Systems

[ Change Section 3008.1 of the IBC to read:

3008.1 General. Where elevators in buildings greater than 420 feet (128 016 mm) in building

height are to be used for occupant self-evacuation during fires, all passenger elevators for ceneral
public use shall comply with this section. ]

IBC Chapter 31 — Special Construction

IBC Chapter 34 — Existing Structures

| Add Section 3413.16 to the IBC to read:

3411.16 ALFSTs. Existing ALFSTs, regardless of when constructed, shall, by October 1, 2011,
meet the applicable requirements of API 653 and TFI RMIP for suitability for service and
inspections and shall provide a secondary containment system complying with Section 425.3. ]

IBC Chapter 35 — Referenced Standards

Change the referenced standards in Chapter 35 of the IBC as follows (standards not shown remain the
same):

Standard reference number Title Referenced in code

section number
! o Notional Standard for Pubh
[ ANSINSPI-1-2063 N . 31093
- g” - nal Standard for Pubh
ANSTANSPT 2 1000 31003
Spas ]

Standard Specification for Agencies
Engaged in the Testing and/or

ASTM E329-02 Inspection of Materials Used in

1703.1,1703.1.3

Construction
NEPAS-67 Installation-of Sprinkier Systems 9041190534 007-8-

55

81



Manufactured Homes
) ) i ) 0033120033511
NERPAIIR-OF Residential Oecupancies Up-to-and ? ?
Ineluding-Four-Stories-in-Height ’
NEPA_L4-07 Installation-of Stendpipe-and Hose 905.2-9053.4.9054-2-
System 905.8
NEPA2-07 National-Fuel-Adarm-Code 007.21223 0072 123
Standard Systermfor-the Identification
Emerpency-Response
[ API 650-09 Welded Steel Tanks for Oil Storage 425.2
API 653-09 Tank Inspection, Repair, Alteration and 495.4. 425.5. 3411.16

Reconstruction

ASME A17.1/CSA B44-

2007

Safety Code for Elevators and
Escalators with 2008 and 2009 Addenda

907.3.3,911.1.5, 1007.4,
1607.8.1, 1613.6.5,
3001.2, 3001 .4,

3002.5, 3003.2, 3007.1,

3008.3. 3008.12,
3008.14.1, 3411.8.2

Identification of the Hazards of

NEPA 704-07 Materials for Emergency Response 425.2
Aboveground Storage Tanks Containing
TFI RMIP-09 Liquid Fertilizer, Recommended 425.2,425.4,425.5,

Mechanical Integrity Practices

3411.16

Appendix E Supplementary Accessibility Requirements.

Appendix E of the IBC shall be part of this code. ]

56

82



Virginia Department of Housing and Community Development
Division of Building and Fire Regulation

2009 Code Change Cycle
Final Regulations for Review by the BHCD at the July 26, 2010 Meeting

UNIFORM STATEWIDE BUILDING CODE, PART III — VIRGINIA MAINTENANCE CODE

Note: Only those provisions having changes between proposed and final regulations are shown —
brackets are used to identify the changes comprising the final regulations.

Chapter 1 — Administration

105.1 General. This section shall apply to existing [ buidingser ] structures which are classified as
unsafe or unfit for human occupancy. All conditions causing such structures to be classified as unsafe
or unfit for human occupancy shall be remedied or as an alternative to correcting such conditions, the
structure may be vacated and secured against public entry or razed or removed. Vacant and secured
structures shall still be subject to other applicable requirements of this code. Notwithstanding the
above, when the code official determines that an unsafe structure or a structure unfit for human
occupancy constitutes such a hazard that it should be razed or removed, then the code official shall be
permitted to order the demolition of such structures in accordance with applicable requirements of this
code.

Note: [ Buildings-erstructures Structures | which become unsafe during construction are regulated
under the Virginia Construction Code.

105.2 Inspection of unsafe or unfit structures. The code official shall inspect any structure reported [ or
discovered ] as unsafe or unfit for human habitation and shall prepare a report to be filed in the records
of the local enforcing agency and a copy issued to the owner. The report shall include the use of the
structure and a description of the nature and extent of any conditions found.

105.3.1 Limitation to requirements for retrofitting. In accordance with Section 103.2, this code does
not generally provide for requiring the retrofitting of any [ buildinger | structure. However, conditions
may exist in [ buildings-or ] structures constructed prior to the initial edition of the USBC because of
faulty design or equipment that constitute a danger to life or health or a serious hazard. Any changes to
the design or construction required by the code official under this section shall be only to remedy the
serious hazard or danger to life or health and such changes shall not be required to fully comply with
the requirements of the Virginia Construction Code applicable to newly constructed buildings or
structures.

105.4 Notice of unsafe structure or structure unfit for human occupancy. When a [ building—or |
structure is determined to be unsafe or unfit for human occupancy by the code official, a written notice
of unsafe structure or structure unfit for human occupancy shall be issued [ in-persen by personal
service ] to the owner, the owner’s agent or the person in control of such structure. The notice shall
specify the corrections necessary to comply with this code, or if the structure is required to be
demolished, the notice shall specify the time period within which the demolition must occur.
Requirements in Section 104.5.4 for notices of violation are also applicable to notices issued under this
section to the extent that any such requirements are not in conflict with the requirements of this

83



section. [ 1

eﬁheﬁaeeept—er—rejeet—ﬂ&e—tefms—ef—ﬂie—&e&ee—]

Note: Whenever possible, the notice should also be given to any tenants of the affected building.

[ 105.4.1 Vacating unsafe structure. If the code official determines there is actual and immediate
danger to the occupants or public, or when life is endangered by the occupancy of an unsafe structure,
the code official shall be authorized to order the occupants to immediately vacate the unsafe structure.
When an unsafe structure is ordered to be vacated, the code official shall post a notice with the
following wording at each entrance: “THIS STRUCTURE IS UNSAFE AND ITS OCCUPANCY (OR
USE) IS PROHIBITED BY THE CODE OFFICIAL.” After posting, occupancy of use of the unsafe
structure shall be prohibited except when authorized to enter to conduct inspections, make required
repairs or as necessary to demolish the structure. ]

105.5 Posting of notice. If the notice is unable to be issued [ inpersen by personal service ] as required
by Section 105.4, then the notice shall be sent by registered or certified mail to the last known address
of the responsible party and a copy of the notice shall be posted in a conspicuous place on the
premises.

105.6 Posting of placard. In the case of a structure unfit for human habitation, at the time the notice is
issued, a placard with the following wording shall be posted at the entrance to the [ building structure ]
: “THIS STRUCTURE IS UNFIT FOR HABITATION AND ITS USE OR OCCUPANCY HAS
BEEN PROHIBITED BY THE CODE OFFICIAL.” In the case of an unsafe structure, if the notice is
not complied with, a placard with the above wording shall be posted at the entrance to the | building
structure | . After a [ building structure ] is placarded, entering the [ building structure ] shall be
prohibited except as authorized by the code official to make inspections, to perform required repairs or
to demolish the [ building structure | . In addition, the placard shall not be removed until the [ building
structure ] is determined by the code official to be safe to occupy, nor shall the placard be defaced.

106 5 R1ght of appeal ﬁhng of appeal appl1cat10n [ %eﬁwewf—a—bm}dmg—er—sh:uemfe—the—ewmr—s

eeée—e£ﬁe&al—eenee—mmg-twhe Anv person aggrleved bV the local enforcmg agency’s ] apphcatlon of the

this code [ to-such-buildingor structure-and-may-alse-appeala or the ] refusal [ by-the-code-official ] to

grant a modification to the provisions of this code [ pertainingto-such-building-orstrueture may appeal
to the LBBCA ] . The applicant shall submit a written request for appeal to the LBBCA within 14

calendar days of the receipt of the decision being appealed. The application shall contain the name and
address of the owner of the building or structure and in addition, the name and address of the person
appealing, when the applicant is not the owner. A copy of the code official's decision shall be
submitted along with the application for appeal and maintained as part of the record. The application
shall be marked by the LBBCA to indicate the date received. Failure to submit an application for
appeal within the time limit established by this section shall constitute acceptance of a code official's
decision.

IPMC Chapter 3 — General Requirements

[ Delete Section 304.1.1 of the IPMC.

Delete Section 305.1.1 of the IPMC.

84



Delete Section 306 of the IPMC in its entirety.

Add IMPC Section 310 Aboveground Liquid Fertilizer Storage Tanks (ALFSTSs)

Add Section 310.1 to the IPMC to read:

310.1 General. ALFSTs shall be maintained in accordance with the reguirements of Section

3411.16 of the Virginia Construction Code and the requirements of the Virginia Construction Code
applicable to such ATLFSTs when newly constructed. undergoing a change of occupancy to an

ALFST and when repaired, altered or reconstructed, including the requirements for inspections and
for a secondary containment system.

85



Virginia Department of Housing and Community Development
Division of Building and Fire Regulation

2009 Code Change Cycle
Final Regulations for Review by the BHCD at the July 26, 2010 Meeting

VIRGINIA STATEWIDE FIRE PREVENTION CODE

Note: Only those provisions having changes between proposed and final regulations are shown —
brackets are used to identify the changes comprising the final regulations.

Chapter 1 - Administration
107.2 Permits required. Permits may be required by the fire official as permitted under the SFPC in

accordance with Table 107.2, except that the fire official shall require permits for the manufacturing,
storage, handling, use, and sale of explosives. [ An In accordance with Section 3301.2.3.1, an ]

apphcatlon for a perrmt to manufacture store, handle use, or sell exploswes shall only be made by [ an

a de31gnated 1nd1v1dua1 ] .

Exception: Such permits shall not be required for the storage of explosives or blasting agents by the
Virginia Department of State Police provided notification to the fire official is made annually by
the Chief Arson Investigator listing all storage locations.

107 6. State Fire Marshal Perm1ts will not be requu’ed by the State Fire Marshal except for [ the

Mﬂ&&dﬂp}aﬁwf—ﬁfﬁ@ﬂes—eia—s%a%e—emed—pﬁepe&y those Derm1ts 11sted in Sectlon 107 13 and 107 14
of this code | .

Exception: Such permits shall not be required for the storage of explosives or blasting agents by the
Virginia Department of State Police provided notification to the State Fire Marshal is made
annually by the Chief Arson Investigator listing all storage locations within areas where
enforcement is provided by the State Fire Marshal’s office.

107.13. State explosives, blasting agents [ , theatrical flame effects | and fireworks permit fees:
[ Applications for firework or pyrotechnic displays shall be submitted to and received by the State Fire
Marshal’s Office not less than 15 days prior to the planned event. ] Fees for permits issued by the State
Fire Marshal's office for the storage, use, sale or manufacture of explosives or blasting agents, and for
the display of fireworks [ and flame effects ] on state-owned property shall be as follows:

1. [$160 8125 ] per year per magazine to store explosives and blasting agents.
2. [ $356 $200 | per year per city or county to use explosives and blasting agents.
3. $150 per year to sell explosives and blasting agents.

4, $200 per year to manufacture explosives, blasting agents and fireworks.

86



5. [ $3006-per $350 the first ] day [ for of ] fireworks, pyrotechnics or proximate audience displays
conducted in any state-owned building and $150 per day for each [ subsequent consecutive |
day [ for identical multi-day events ] . [ If an application is received by the State Fire Marshal’s
Office less than 15 days prior to the planned event, the permit fee shall be $450 per day and
$150 per day for each consecutive day for identical multi-day events. If an application is
received by the State Fire Marshal’s Office less than seven days prior to the planned event, the
permit fee shall be $550 per day and $150 per day for each consecutive day for identical multi-

day events. ]

6. [ $200-per $250 the first ] day [ fer of | fireworks, pyrotechnics or proximate audience displays
conducted out-of-doors on any state-owned property and $150 per day for each [ subseguent
consecutive | day [ for identical multi-day events ] . [ If an application is received by the State
Fireg Marshal’s Office less than 15 days prior to the planned event, the permit fee shall be $450
per day and $150 per day for each consecutive day for identical multi-day events. If an
application is received by the State Fire Marshal’s Office less than seven days prior to the
planned event, the permit fee shall be $550 per day and $150 per day for each consecutive day
for identical multi-day events. ]

7. [ 45 $100 ] per event for the use of explosives in special operations or emergency conditions.

[ 8.$300 the first day for flame effects conducted in accordance with Section 308.3.6 indoors of
any state-owned building or outdoors on_state-owned property and $150 per day for each
consecutive _day for identical multi-day events, or, if conducted as part of a firework
{pyrotechnic) display, $100 the first day and $75 per day for each consecutive day for identical

multi-day events. If an application for flame effects is received by the State Fire Marshal’s

Office less than 15 days prior to the planned event, the permit fee shall be $450 per day and
$150 per dav for each consecutive day for identical multi-day events. If an application is

received by the State Fire Marshal’s Office less than seven days prior to the planned event, the
permit Tee shall be $550 per dav and $150 per dav for each consecutive day for identical multi-

day events. |

107.14 State annual inspection permit fees. Annual fees for inspection permits issued by the State Fire
Marshal's office for the inspection of buildings shall be as follows:

(No change to [tems 1-4)

[ 5.Child day centers, assisted living facilities and adult day care centers licensed by the Virginia
Department of Social Services based on licensed capacity as follows:

5.1 $50 for 1 to 8.

5.2 $75 for 9 to 20.

5.3 $100 for 21 to 50.

5.4 $200 for 51 to 100.

5.5 $400 for 101 or more.




112.2 Membership. The BFPCA shall consist of at least five members appointed by the local
governing body and having terms of office established by written policy. Alternate members may be
appointed to serve in the absence of any regular members and as such, shall have the full power and
authority of the regular members. Regular and alternate members may be reappointed. Written records
of current membership, including a record of the current chairman and secretary shall be maintained in
the office of the local governing body. In order to provide continuity, the terms of the members may be
of different length so that less than half will expire in any one-year period. [ The BFPCA shall meet at
least once annually to assure a duly constituted board, appoint officers as necessary and receive such
training on the code as may be appropriate or necessary from staff of the locality. ]

112.5 Application for appeal. The owner of a structure, the owner’s agent or any other person involved
in the design, construction or maintenance of the structure may appeal a decision of the fire official
concerning the application of the SFPC or the fire official's refusal to grant modification under Section
106.5 to the provisions of the SFPC. The appeal shall first lie to the local board of fire prevention code
appeals (BFPCA) and then to the TRB except that appeals concerning the application of the SFPC or
refusal to grant modifications by the State Fire Marshal shall be made directly to the TRB. The appeal
shall be submitted to the BFPCA within 14 calendar days of the application of the SFPC. The
application shall contain the name and address of the owner of the structure and the person appealing if
not the owner. A copy of the written decision of the fire official shall be submitted along with the
application for appeal and maintained as part of the record. The application shall be stamped or
otherwise marked by the BFPCA to indicate the date received. Failure to submit an application for
appeal within the time limit established by this section shall constitute acceptance of the fire official’s
decision.

[ Note: In accordance with § 27-98 of the Code of Virginia, any local fire code may provide for an
appeal to a local board of appeals. If no local board of appeals exists, the TRB shall hear appeals of
any local fire code violation. ]

IFC Chapter 2 - Definitions

Add the following definitions:
Background clearance card: See Section 3302.1.
Blaster, restricted: See Section 3302.1.
Blaster, unrestricted: See Section 3302.1.

[ Designated individual: See Section 3302.1. ]

DHCD: The Virginia Department of Housing and Community Development.

Local government, local governing body or locality: The govering body of any county, city, or
town, other political subdivision and state agency in this Commonwealth charged with the
enforcement of the SFPC under state law.

Night club: Any building or portion thereof in which the main use is a place of public assembly
that provides exhibition, performance or other forms or entertainment; serves alcoholic beverages;
and provides music and space for dancing.

88



[ Pyrotechnician (firework operator): See Section 3302.1.

Responsible management. See Section 3302.1.
Sole proprietor. See Section 3302.1. ]
(Remainder of section unchanged)

IFC Chapter 3 — General Requirements

[ Change Section 315.] to read:
315.1 General. Storage shall be in accordance with this section.

Change Section 315.2 to read;

315.2 Storage in buildings. Storage of materials in buildings shall be orderly and stable. Storage of

combustible materials shall be separated from heaters or heating devices by distance or shielding so
that ignition cannot occur, ]

~ IFC Chapter 5 — Fire Service Features

[ Change Section 506.1 to read:

506.1 Where required. Where access to or within a structure or an area is restricted because of

secured openings or where immediate access is necessary for life-saving or fire-fighting purposes,

the fire code official is authorized to require a key box to be installed in an approved location. The
kev box shall be of an approved type listed in accordance with UL 1037 and shall contain keys to

gain necessary access as required by the fire code official.

Exception: Existing key boxes are not required to be listed in accordance with UL 1037 unless
replaced. ]

IFC Chapter 6 — Building Services and Systems

[ Change Section 605.10.1 to read:

605.10.1 Listed and labeled. Only portable electric space heaters listed and labeled in accordance
with UL 1278 shall be used.

Change Section 609.3.3.2 to read:

609.3.3.2 Cleaning. Hoods. grease-removal devices, fans, ducts and other appurtenances shall be
cleaned at intervals necessary to prevent the accumulation of grease based upon a written and
posted cleaning schedule that shall be established and maintained on the premises by the owner or
operator of the ventilation system. The schedule shall be originated by the owner or operator of the

ventilation system based upon criteria particular to the cooking operation. Cleanings shall be
recorded and the records shall state the extent, time and date of cleaning. ]

4

89



IFC Chapter 9 — Fire Protection Systems

[ Change Section 907.9.5 to read:

907.9.5 Maintenance, inspection and testing. The building owner shall be responsible to maintain
the fire and life safety systems in an operable condition at all times. Service personnel shall meet

the qualification requirements of NFPA 72 for maintaining, inspecting and testing such systems. A
written record shall be maintained and shall be made available to the fire code official. In addition

to all applicable information contained in Figure 10.6.2.3 of NFPA 72. the written record of

inspections, testing and maintenance shall contain the following minimum information.

1.

Date, name and address of property.

2.

Name of person performing inspection, maintenance and tests. or combination thereof, and

affiliation, business address and telephone number.

Name. address and representative of approving agency or agencies.

Test Frequency.

Designation of the detector or detectors tested (for example, “Test performed in accordance

with Section -=-—=--——- D).

Physical location (for example, “Heat detector in main kitchen; horn-strobe in Room 115.”")

and a list of all initiating and notification devices and appliances tested.

Functional Jist of detectors and required sequence of operations.

Check of all smoke detectors.

Loop resistance for all fixed-temperature, line-type detectors.

10.

Other tests as required by either the equipment manufacturer’s published instructions or the

11.

authority having jurisdiction.

Signature tests as required by the authority having jurisdiction.

12.

Disposition of problems identified during test (examples., “Owner netified,” “Problem

corrected or successfully retested, or both,” “Device abandoned in place.”). ]

IFC Chapter 22 — Motor Fuel-Dispensing Facilities and Repair Garages

[ Change Section 2205.4 to read:

2205.4 Sources of ignition. Smoking and open flames shall be prohibited within 20 feet (6096 mm)

of a_fuel dispensing device. The engines of vehicles being fueled shall be shut off during fueling.

Electrical equipment shall be in accordance with NFPA 70. ]

90



IFC Chapter 33 — Explosives and Fireworks
Change entire Section 3301.2 to read:
{No change to Sections 3301.2 through 3301.2.3)

3301.2.3.1. Permit applicants. [ The As a condition of permit as provided for in Section 107.5, the ]

fire official shall not issue a permit to manufacture, store, handle, use or sell explosives or blasting

agents to any [ i-Hd-I—V-}dHa-l- ] apphcant who [ ﬁﬂ@%eﬁﬁed—ba&ﬂ&e—%—asa—b&as%em&-aeeerd&nee

permit application the name and signature of a d651g11ated individual as_representing the
applicant | . [ When, as provided for in Section 107.2 or 107.6, a permit is required to conduct a
fireworks display, as a condition of permit as provided for in Section 107.5. the fire official shall
not issue a permit to design, setup or conduct a fireworks display to any applicant who has not
provided on the permit application the name and signature of a designated individual as
representing the applicant,

If the applicant’s designated individual changes or becomes no longer gualified to represent the
applicant as responsible management or designated individual, the applicant shall notify the fire
official who issued the permit on the change of status of the designated individual. The notice is to
be made prior to the use of any explosives or conducting a fireworks display but in no case shall
the notification occur more than seven days after the change of status and shall provide the name of
another designated individual. The fire official may revoke or require the re-issuance of a permit
based on a change of permit conditions or status or inability to provide another designated
individual. ]

3301.2.3.1.1. [ Backeround-clearanee-eard BCC | : [ A-backpround-clearance-card The SFMO shall

process all applications for a BCC for compliance with § 27-97.2 of the Code of Virginia and will
be the sole provider of a BCC. Using forms provided by the SEMO, a BBC ] may be [ applied for

and ] issued [ upen-completion-of the-followingrequirements:




record—cheek-regarding-such-applicant to any person who submits to the completion of a
background investigation by providing fingerprints and personal descriptive information to
the SFMO. The SFMO shall forward the fingerprints and personal descriptive information
to_the Central Criminal Records Exchange for submission to the Federal Bureau of
Investigation for the purpose of obtaining a national criminal history records check
regarding such applicant J .

(No change to Sections 3301.2.3.1.2 through 3301.2.4.1)

3301.2.4.2. Fireworks display. The permit holder shall furnish a bond or certificate of insurance in
an amount deemed adequate by the legal department of the jurisdiction for the payment of all
potential damages to a person or persons or to property by reason of the permitted display, and
arising from any acts of the permit holder, the agent, employees or subcontractors [ , but in no case
shall the value of the coverage be less than $500.000 1.

Change entire Section 3301.4 to read:

(No change to Section 3301.4)

3301.4.1. Certification of blasters [ and pyrotechnicians ] . Certificates as a restricted [ er blaster, |
unrestricted blaster [ or pyrotechnician ] will be issued upon proof of successful completion of an

examination approved by the SFMO [ commensurate to the certification sought ] and [ completion
of ] a background investigation for compliance with § 27-97.2 of the Code of Virginia. The

applicant for certification shall submit proof to the SFMO of the following experience:

1. For certification as a restricted blaster, at least one year under direct supervision by a
certified unrestricted blaster, certified restricted blaster or other person(s) approved by the
SFMO.

2. For certification as an unrestricted blaster, at least one year under direct supervision by a
certified unrestricted blaster or other person or persons approved by the SFMO.

[ 3.For certification as a pyrotechnician, aerial, or pyrotechnician, proximate, applicant was in
responsible charge of, or has assisted in the documented design. setup and conducting of, a

fireworks display on at least six occasions within the 24 months immediately preceding the
application for certification. ]

The SEMO shall process all certification applicants for compliance with § 27-97.2 of the Code
of Virginia and will be the sole provider of blaster [ and pyrotechnician ] certifications.

Exception: The [ use of explosives by the ] owner of real estate parcels of five or more acres
conforming to the definition of “real estate devoted to agricultural use” or “real estate devoted
to horticultural use” in § 58.1-3230 of the Code of Virginia when blasting on such real estate.

3301.4.2. Certification issuance. The issuance of a certification as a blaster [ or pyrotechnician ]
shall be denied if the applicant has been convicted of any felony, whether such conviction occurred
under the laws of the Commonwealth, or any other state, the District of Columbia, the United
States or any territory thereof, unless his civil rights have been restored by the Governor or other

7

92



appropriate authority [ , or has not provided acceptable proof or evidence of the experience
required in Section 3301.4.1, or has not provided acceptable proof or evidence of the continued

training or education required in Section 3301.4.5].

3301.4.3. Fee for certification. The fee for obtaining or renewing a blaster [ or pyrotechnician ]
certificate from SFMO shall be $150 plus any additional fees charged by other agencies for
fingerprinting and for obtaining a national criminal history record check through the Central
Criminal Records Exchange to the Federal Bureau of Investigation.

3301.4.4. Revocation of a blaster [ or pyrotechnician ] certification. After issuance of a blaster [ or
pyrotechnician ] certification, subsequent conviction of a felony will be grounds for immediate
revocation of a blaster [ or pyrotechnician ] certification, whether such conviction occurred under
the laws of the Commonwealth, or any other state, the District of Columbia, the United States or
any territory thereof. The certification shall be returned to the SFMO immediately. An individual
may subsequently reapply for his blaster [ or pyrotechnician | certification if his civil rights have
been restored by the Governor or other appropriate authority.

3301.4.5. Expiration and renewal of a [ BCC, ] blaster [ or pyrotechnician ] certification. A
certificate for an unrestricted [ of blaster, ] restricted blaster [ or pyrotechnician ]| shall be valid for
three years from the date of issuance. A [ backeround-clearance-card BCC ] shall be valid for three
years from the date of issnance. Renewal of the unrestricted blaster certificate will be issued upon
proof of at least 16 [ accumulated ] hours of continued training or education in the use of
explosives within three consecutive years and a background investigation for compliance with §
27-97.2 of the Code of Virginia. Renewal of the restricted blaster certificate will be issued upon
proof of at least eight [ accumulated ] hours of continued training or education in the use of
explosives within three consecutive years and a background investigation for compliance with §
27-97.2 of the Code of Virginia. [ Renewal of the pyrotechnician certificate will be issued upon
proof of at least 12 accumulated hours of continued training or education in the subject areas of
explosives storage, the design, setup. or conduct of a fireworks display within three consecutive
years and a background investigation for compliance with §27-97.2 of the Code of Virginia. ] The
continued training or education required for renewal of a blaster [ or pyrotechnician ] certificate
shall be obtained during the three years immediately prior to the certificate's published expiration
date. Failure to renew a blaster [ or pyrotechnician ] certificate in accordance with this section shall
cause an individual to obtain another [ blaster ] certificate upon compliance with Section 3301.4.1
to continue engaging in the unsupervised use of explosives [ or conducting a fireworks display ] .

Add the following definitions to Section 3302.1 to read:

Background clearance card [ (BCC) ] . An identification card issued to an individual who is not a
certified blaster [ or pyrotechnician ] and is [ representing-himselfor-acting-as—a—representative
responsible management or an emplovee ] of a company, corporation, firm or other entity, solely
for the purpose of submitting an application to the fire official for a permit to manufacture, use,
handle, store, or sell explosive materials [ , or conduct a fireworks display. A person to whom a
BCC has been issued can fulfill the role of a designated individual on an application for permit to
manufacture, use, handle, store, or sell explosive materials, or on an application for permit to
design, setup and conduct a fireworks display. ]

Blaster, restricted. Any person engaging in the use of explosives or blasting agents utilizing five
pounds (2.25 kg) or less per blasting operation and using instantaneous detonators. [ A certified

8

93



restricted blaster can fulfill the role of a designated individual on an application for permit to
manufacture, use, handle, store, or sell explosive materials. ]

Blaster, unrestricted. Any person engaging in the use of explosives or blasting agents without limit
to the amount of explosives or blasting agents or type of detonator. [ A certified unrestricted blaster
can fulfill the role of a designated individual on an application for permit to manufacture, use,
handle, store, or sell explosive materials.

Design. For the purposes of a fireworks display, either inside a building or siructure or outdoors, it

shall mean the pyrotechnician who will be in attendance and makes the final artistic determination
for the placement of fireworks and sround display pieces suitable for the display site.

Designated individual. A person in possession of a BCC issued by the SEFMO, or is certified by the
SFMO as a pyrotechnician, or is a restricted or unrestricted blaster, any of whom are responsible
for (i) ensuring compliance with state law and regulations relating to blasting agents and
explosives, (ii) applying for explosives or firework permits, (iii) is at least 21 vears of age, and (iv)
shall demonstrate the capability to effectively communicate safety messages verbally and in
writing in the English language.

Pyrotechnician (firework operator). Any person supervising or engaged in the design, setup or
conducting of any fireworks display, ecither inside a_building or outdoors. A certified
pyrotechnician can fulfill the role of a designated individual on an application for permit for a
fireworks display.

Pyrotechnician, aerial. A person supervising or engaged in the design, setup or conducting of a
outdoor aerial fireworks display performed in accordance with the regulations as set forth in
this code and NFPA 1123, a referenced standard for fireworks displays.

Pvyrotechnician, proximate. A person supervising or engaged in the design, setup or conducting
of a fireworks display, either inside a building or outdoors, performed in accordance with the
repulations as set forth in this code and NFPA 1126, a referenced standard for the use of
pyrotechnics before a proximate audience.

Responsible management. A person who is any of the following:

1. The sole proprietor of a sole proprietorship.

2. The partners of a general partnership.

3. The managing partners of a limited partnership,

4. The officers of a corporation.

5. The managers of a limited liability company.

6. The officers or directors of an association, or both.

7. Individuals in other business entities recognized under the laws of the Commonwealth as
having a fiduciary regponsibility to the firm.

9

94



Sole proprietor. A person or individual, not a corporation, who is trading under his own name, or

under an assumed or fictitious name pursuant to the provisions of § 59.1-69 through 59.1-76 of the
Code of Virginia. ]

Permissible fireworks. Any sparklers, fountains, Pharaoh's serpents, caps for pistols, or pinwheels
commonly known as whirligigs or spinning jennies.

[ Add-exeeptionte Change ] Section 3308.2 to read:

[ 3308.2 Permit application. Prior to issuing permits for a fireworks display, plans for the fireworks
display, inspections of the display site and demonstrations of the display operations shall be
approved. A plan establishing procedures to follow and actions to be taken in the event that a shell
fails to ignite in, or discharge from. a mortar or fails to function over the fallout area or other
malfunctions shall be provided to the fire code official.

In addition to the requiremenis of Section 3301.2.3.1, a permit to conduct a fireworks display
shall not be issued to anvy applicant without the applicant identifying on the application the

pyrotechnician who will be in responsible charge of the fireworks display and who is appropriately
certified as a pyrotechnician in accordance with Section 3301.4.1. ]

Exception: Permits are not required for the [ supervised ] use or display of permissible
fireworks on private property with the consent of the owner of such property.

[ Change Section 3308.3 to read.

3308.3 Approved fireworks displays. Approved fireworks displays shall include only the approved
fireworks 1.3G, fireworks 1.4G, fireworks 1.4S and pyrotechnic articles 1.4G. The design, setup,
conducting or direct on-site supervision of the design, setup and conducting of any fireworks
display, either inside a building or outdoors, shall be performed only by persons certified by the
SFMO in accordance with Section 3301.4.1 as a pyrotechnician (firework operator) and at least one
person properly certified by the SFMO as a pyrotechnician shall be present at the site where the
fireworks display is being conducted. The approved fireworks shall be arranged, located,
discharged and fired in a manner that will not pose a hazard to property or endanger any person.

Exception: Certification as a pyrotechnician is not required for the use or display of permissible
fireworks when conducted on private property with the consent of the owner of such property.

Change Section 3308.4 to read:

3308.4 Clearance. Spectators, spectator parking areas, and dwellings, buildings or structures shall
not be located within the display site. The site for the outdoor land or water display shall have at
least 100-ft/in. (31-m/2.4mm) radius of internal mortar distance of the largest shell to be fired as
shown in Table 3308.4.

Exceptions:

1. This provision shall not apply to pyrotechnic special effects and fireworks displays using
Division 1.4G materials before a proximate audience in accordance with NFPA 1126.

10




2. This provision shall not apply to unoccupied dwellings, buildings and structures with the
approval of the building owner and the fire code official.

Add Table 3308.4 to read:

Table 3308.4
Distances for Outdoor Fireworks Display Sites: Minimum Separation Distances from Mortars to
Spectators for Land and Water Displays

.1 Minimum Secured . 2 Angled Mortars® Mortars to Special
Mortar Size, Diameter of Site Vertical Mortars_ 1/3 offset Hazards®
in. mm ft m iy m ft m i m
=3 <76 300 92 150 46 160 3L 300 32
3 76 600 183 300 2 200 61 600 183
4 102 800 244 400 122 266 81 800 244
] 127 1000 303 500 152 334 102 1000 305
[ 152 1200 366 600 183 400 122 1200 366
2 178 1400 427 700 213 467 142 1400 427
8 203 1600 488 800 244 534 163 1600 488
10 254 2000 610 1000 305 667 203 2000 610
12 303 2400 132 1200 366 800 244 2400 132
>12 Requires the approval of the fire official

1. Aerial shells, mines, and comets shall be classified and described only in terms of the inside diameter of the mortar from which they
are fired [e.g., 3-in. (76-mm) aerial shells, mines and comets are only for use in 3-in. (76mm) mortars].

2. Where the mortars are positioned vertically, the mortars shall be placed at the approximate center of the display site.

3. Mortars shall be permitted to be angled during a displav to allow for wind and to carry shells away from the main spectator viewing
areas. For angled mortars, the minimum secured diameter of the display site does not change. Only the location of the mortars within the
secured area changes when the mortars are angled.

4. Note that this is only the distance to the special hazards. The minimum secured diameter of the display site does not change. ]

IFC Chapter 38 — Liquefied Petroleum Gases

[ Add Sections 3809.15 and 3809.15.1 to read:

3809.15 LP-Gas cvlinder exchange for resale. In addition to other applicable requirements of this
chapter, facilities operating cylinder exchange stations for LP-gas that are accessible to the public

shall comply with the following requirements.

1. Cvlinders shall be secured in a lockable, ventilated metal cabinet or other approved
enclosure.

2. Cylinders shall be accessible only by authorized personnel or by use of an automated
exchange system in accordance with Section 3809.15.1.

3. A sign shall be posted on the entry door of the business operating the cylinder exchange
stating “DO NOT BRING LP-GAS CYLINDERS INTO THE BUILDING” or similar

approved wording,

4. An emergency contact information sign shall be posted within 10 feet of the cylinder
storage cabinet. The content, lettering, size. color and location of the required sign shall be
as required by the fire code official.

11



3809.15.1 Automated Cylinder Exchange Stations. Cylinder exchange stations that include an

automated vending system for exchanging cylinders shall comply with the following additional

requirements:

1. The vending system shall only permit access to a single cvlinder per individual transaction.

2. Cabinets storing cylinders shall be designed such that cylinders can only be placed inside
when they are oriented in the upright position.

3. Devices operating door releases for access to stored cvlinders shall be permitted to be

pneumatic, mechanical or electrically powered.

4. Electrical equipment inside of or within 5 feet of a cabinet storing cylinders, including but

not limited to electronics associated with vending operations, shall comply with the
requirements for Class 1. Division 2 eguipment in accordance with NFPA. 70.

5. A manual override control shall be permitted for use by authorized personnel. On newly

installed cylinder exchange stations, the vending system shall not be capable of returning to

automatic operation after a manual override until the system has been inspected and reset
by authorized personnel.

6. Inspections shall be conducted by authorized personnel to verify that all cylinders are

secured, access doors are closed and the station has no visible damage or obvious defects,

which necessitate placing the station out of service. The frequency of inspections shall be as

specified by the fire code official. ]

Chapter 46 — Construction Requirements for Existing Buildings

[ Delete Chapter 46 in its entirety. ]

Chapter 47 — Referenced Standards

Change the referenced standards as follows (standards not shown remain the same):

12

Standard reference number Title Referenced in code section number
Standards for Visual
CGA C-6 (2001) Inspection of Steel 3806.4
Compressed Gas Cylinders
NEPA-16-07 Portable Fire Extinpuishers 9@5351}?1]’ ;55’5555 2!’253
NERA 13 07




NEPAT04-07

Identificati e LI
of Materialsfor Emergeney
Respense

[ UL 1037-99

Standard for Antitheft Alarms

and Devices

506.1

UL 1278-00

Standard for Movable and
Wall- or Ceiling-Hung
Electric Room Heaters

605.10.1 ]

13

98



Virginia Department of Housing and Community Development
Division of Building and Fire Regulation

2009 Code Change Cycle
Final Regulations for Review by the BHCD at the July 26, 2010 Meeting

VIRGINIA INDUSTRIALIZED BUILDING SAFETY REGULATIONS

Note: Only those provisions having changes between proposed and final regulations are shown -
brackets are used to identify the changes comprising the final regulations.

13 VAC 5-91-70. Appeals.

mplianee—assy geneie pufacture : alize : g Any person
aggrieved by ] DHCD s applzcatlon of ﬂ'llS chapter shall be heard bv the State Review Board
establlshed bV 5 36 108 of the Code of V1rg1n1a [ iPhe—S»tate—ReﬁeWLBeafd—shaH—ha*re—ﬂ&e—eeweHﬂd

made~In-a : apter—appe shall be submltted[te—the
State Review Board ] w1th1n 21 calendar days of recelpt of DHCD?’s decision. A copy of the decision
of DHCD to be appealed shall be submitted with the application for appeal. Failure to submit an
application for appeal within the time limit established by this section shall constitute acceptance of
DHCD’s decision.

13 VAC 5-91-260. Registration seal for industrialized buildings.

A. Registered industrialized buildings shall be marked with ag approved registration seal seals issued
by the SBCAO. The seal seals shall be applied by the manufacturer to a registered industrialized
building intended for sale or use in Virginia prior to the shipment of the building from the place of
manufacture.

B. Registered industrialized buildings shall bear & one registration seal for on each dwellingunitin

residential oceupaneies—For-nonresidential-occupancies;a manufactured section or module, or, as an
alternative, the registration seal isrequired-foreach-registered for each manufactured section or module

may be placed in one location in the completed building.

C. Approved registration seals may be purchased from the SBCAO in advance of use. The fee for each
registration seal shall be $75 [ $56 §75 ] . Cheeks Fees shall be submitted by checks made payable to

“Treasurer of Virginia”-er-shall-be-submitted-by—electronie-means.” Payment for the seals must be
received by the SBCAOQ before the seals can be sent to the user.

(Remainder of section unchanged)

99



Virginia Department of Housing and Community Development
Division of Building and Fire Regulation

2009 Code Change Cycle
Final Regulations for Review by the BHCD at the July 26, 2010 Meeting

VIRGINIA AMUSEMENT DEVICE REGULATIONS

Note: Only those provisions having changes between proposed and final regulations are shown —
brackets are used to identify the changes comprising the final regulations.

13 VAC 5-31-40. Incorporated standards.
A. The following standards are hereby incorporated by reference for use as part of this chapter:

1. American National Standards Institute (ANSI) Standard No. B77.1-2006 for the regulation of
passenger tramways; and

2. American Society for Testing and Materials (ASTM) Standard Nos. F698-94 (Reapproved
2000), F747-06, F770-06a, F846-92 (Reapproved 2003), F853-05 F893-05a; F1159-03a,
F1193-06, F1305-94 (Reapproved 2002), F1950-99, F1957-99 (Reapproved 2004), F2007-06,
F2137-04 [ Reapproved 2009 ], [ £2291-66a F2291-09b ], F2374-07a, F2376-06 and F2460-
06 for the regulation of amusement devices.

The standards referenced above may be procured from:

ANSI ASTM
25 W 43rd Street 100 Barr Harbor Dr.
New York, NY 10036 West Conshohocken, PA 19428-2959

(Remainder of section unchanged)
13 VAC 5-31-75. Local building department.
(No changes to subsections A-H)

[ L In accordance with subdivision 7 of § 36-137 of the Code of Virginia, the local building department
shall collect a 2% levy of fees charged for permits under this chapter and transmit it quarterly to
DHCD to support training programs of the Virginia Building Code Academy. Localities which
maintain individual or regional training academies accredited by DHCD shall retain such levy. ]

13 VAC 5-31-85. Accidents involving serious injury or death.

A. If an accident involving the serious injury or death of a patron occurs, the operation of an
amusement device shall cease and the local building department [ and DHCD ] shall be notified as
soon as practicable, but in no case later than during the next working day. The operation of the device
shall not resume until inspected by a private inspector or an inspector from the local building
department, except where the owner or operator determines the cause was not related to malfunction or
improper operation of the amusement device.

100



(Remainder of section unchanged)

[ Part IX
Accessibility Requirements for Amusement Devices

13 VAC 5-31-280. Scope. This part shall apply to newly designed and constructed amusement devices
for permanent installation and does not apply to amusement devices regularly assembled or
dissembled. This part also does not apply to mobile, portable or temporary amusement devices set up
for short periods of time such as at traveling carnivals, state and county fairs and festivals. For the
purposes of this part, newly designed and constructed amusement devices are those which are new
upon first use by patrons and the first permanent installation of the ride and would not include a ride
which was moved within a park or to another park after several seasons of use.

13 VAC 5-31-290. Reguirements.

Amusement devices subject to this part shall comply with applicable requirements of 36 CFR Part
1191 — Americans With Disabilities Act (ADA) Accessibility Guidelines for Buildings and Facilities;

Architectural Barriers Act (ABA) Accessibility Guidelines, 69 FR 44151-44455 (July 23, 2004). ]

101



