1978
ACCUMULATIVE
SUPPLEMENT
TO

THE
UNIFORM STATEWIDE
BUILDING CODE

BOARD OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
205 NORTH FOURTH STREET
RICHMOND, VIRGINIA 23219
804-700-1575

BUILDING CODE SECTION
804-708-5041

EFFECTIVE
AUGUST 1, 1978




SOURCE OF COPIES:

ABSTRACT

1978 Accumutalive Supplement 1o the Unilorm
Statewde Building Code

Board of Housing and Community Develop-
ment and the Depanment of Housng and
Community Development

Reagulations and Amendmenls for Adrministra-
tion ol the Un:form Statewide Building Code

August 1, 1978

Commonwealth of Virgimia
Department of Housing and Commurnity
Development

Depariment of Housing and Community
Development

Building Code Section

205 North Fourth Sireet

Richmond, Virgima 23219

As Needed

1978
‘May 1982

.1

This document sets forth the Uniform
Glatewide Buiiding Code, adopted by the
Board of Housing and Community
Development, pursuant 1o Asticie 1, Chapter 6,
Title 38 and Chapler 8, Title 36 of the Code of
Virginia 1950, as amended.



1978
ACCUMULATIVE
SUPPLEMENT
TO

UNIFORM STATEWIDE
BUILDING CODE

See Revision
Updates beginning
on page 55






TABLE OF CONTENTS

INbeOQUCTION . o i sind 5T - v oo v Saibine SEENTEL ob 30 o o SRR B e s 1
UseofthisBooK ... .. . . i 2
Part "A", Administrative Rules and Regulations ...................... 3
Part"B"
Chapter 6, Code of Virginia, Unilorm Stalewide BuildingCode ......... 15
§36-97Definitions .............. o i i i i e 16
§36-98 Board to Promulgale Code ... i, 17
§36-99 ProvisionsofCoade .. _....... ... ... i 17
§36-99.1 Certification of Electrical and Plumbing Workers ............. 18
§36-99.2 Standards for ReplacementGlass ......................... 10
§36-100 Notice and Hearings on AdoptionofCode ................... 18
§36-101 EffectiveDateoiCode .. .. ... .. iiiiiieiirii e 18
§36-102 Modification, Amendment or Repeal of Code Provisions . .. .. .. 18
§36-103 Buildings, etc., Existing or Projected Before Effective Date of

the Cogde i i e s e e e e eetenaeeraaeranafinannns 18
§36-104 Code Printed and FurnishedonRequest .................... 19
§36-105 Enlforcement of Code, Appeals from Local Department ....... 19
§36-106 ViolationaMisdemeanor ............ .. .. ... .ciiviiinnann. 19
§36-107 Employmentof Personne! . ............. ......ce... faaane 19
§36-108 State Building Code Technical ReviewBoard ................ 20
§36-1000Micers ...... ... e 20
8 o B 0 = g 20
§36-1110athand Bonds . ... .....ooirrnr e nirirarraneanenns 20
§I6-T12Meelings ... .. oottt it e, 20
§6-1130MiCes . ... oo i 20
§36-114 Board 10 Hear Appeals from Decisions UnderCode .......... 2
§36-115 Subpeonas, Witnesses, etc .................oooviaia.n.. 21
§36-116 Repealed by ACIS 1977 ... ..ottt iiii i nenss 21
§35-117Record of DeCISIONS . .........ioiie it i ierei i rnenns 4]
§36-t18interprefationofCode ............. ..., 2
§36- 119 Rules and Regulations, Under §36-73 Not Superseded . ...... 4]
Chapter 7, State Board of Housing, Repealed by Acts 1977 ........... x
Chapter 8, Department of Housing & Community Development . .. ..... 2
§36-131Definitions . ........ oottt i i 2
§36-132 Creation of Dept., Appoiniment of Direclor .................. 2
§36-133 Director to SuperviseDepariment ...................ccovvuns - 4
§36-134 General Powersof Ditector ..............covvvnvnvrinrnnns -]
§36-135 Board of Housing & Community Development Created . . . ... .. 2
§36-136Meelings of Board ............. ..ottt e 23
§36-137 Powers andDutiesof Board ................ccovvvvvvnvnnss 23
§36-138 Compensation of MembersofBoard ....................... 24
§36-139 Powers and Dutiesof Director ...............cc.cevveunnnnns 24
PART “C"
Adoption of UNIFORM STATEWIDE BUILDING CODE ................ 2



PART "D" -

BOCA BASIC BUILDING CODE/1978

Article 1, Administration and Enforcement

Saction 100, 1. Tile:. v edei bty il Sges  Tadd e ams - - fedi,
SOCHON 1002 SCOPB :v:i. v iwvsisrmw iy v i 5w wie i B 38 o L
Section 1004 CodeRemedial . ..., ............0oviveeiiiianaaiians
Section 101.3 Matters Not ProvidedFor . ....................coeevens
Section 101.50therRegulations ... .. .. .. ... ... ....ccoveiia...
Soction 1021 GeNeral . ... ... ... i iaiiaaaas .
Section 106.0 Existing Slruclures ..................................
Section 107.1Building Official . . _.....................cccoiiiian,
Saction 107.2Appointment ... ...... ..ottt
Saction 107.7 RestrictionoflEmployees .. ................ooocaa. .,
Section 108.6 Rule Making Authority . ......... ...................,
Section 108.7.1 DepartmentRecords . .............ccovrivueneia..
Section 110.1.a Inspection Requirements . ..........................
Sectior. 110.1.bIngpectionTime ..... . ..... _....... ... oiiiae.
Section 110.1.cMinimuminspections .................0ccvuiienons.
Seclion 112.3 By Whom ApplicationisMade ... ...................
Section 112.3.1OwnerPerformance .................coooiiiienann.
Section 112.3.1.aApprovalofPlans .....................oooiiin
Section 11231 bPermmit . ... .. ... ... i iiiieiiiiiiaiiiaaa
SectoN 112.3.1.0WOMK .. ... otiiiiiiiiit it
Section 112.3.1.dTe81S . ...... ... ottt i
Saction 112.5Pansand Specifications .. .............. ... e
Section 112.7EngineeringDelails ... .......... ..........cooien.
Section 113.3Previous Approvals .. ...............c..oo ciiniiiiiaes
Section 117.0Fees & ooyl el i v el
Section'118.0 Volume COmputauon .........................
Saction 121.4 Violation Penallies . .. ............ e
Section 121.5 Abatement of Violation .. ........... SOV -
Section 126.2.2 Qualification ot Board Members ... ... A Gl
Section 126.6Board Review .. .............c.cociiiiiiiniinanienns
Soction 126.7CourtReview ... ............ccoveiniianrrininrinans
Section 1220 ConstructionControl ............ooviiiieiiiiiiiann.
Section 3001 Scope T Fs e M. alidn LG GG T a
Section301.2FireLimits . ... ... i e
Table 305 (page 88) Height and Area Limitations of Buildings ..........
Saction 315.0 Physically HandicappedandAged ....................
Section 402.2.1 Outside Underground System . ... ........ccovveinnn.
Seclion406.3Bottled (GASs ............veieiiiiiiiiii e
Saction424.1General. ... ... . . .
Section 424.2 CONBINUCHON .. ... .....ovveeaummrrnoomsioetiieannn,
SoctioN424.3L0CatON ... ... ...t
Saection 424.3.1 Anchorage and Tie-down . .. ........................
Section 424.3.2 Required ANChorage ..............coiviiiiianu..s

L



Section 424.3.3 Placement of Ground Anchors .. ... ................. 32

Seclion424.3 4 Hurricane Zones .. ..................oooeeiinnr s, 2
Seclion 424.3.5Non-Hurricane Zones ... ...............c.oovnnon... < v
Section424.36LoadCapacily . ............cooiiiinieiineinnnn, 2
Section 424.3.7 WealherResistance ............................... 3
Section 609.4 Emergency ESCape .................cvviiiiieninn.. k<
Section 6312.5 Security Requirement .. ...................ccooo ... b <
Seclion 612.5.1 Exterior SwingingDoors .. ..................... .... 33
Section 612.5.5.2 Exterior SlidingDoors ........................ ... & <]
Section6125.53Windowlatches . ............... ................ <}
Section 724.1 FrostProtection . .................. ... oo, <)
Section 8726 FloodProofing .. ....... ... i iiiiiiian, k-
Section 807.7 ContinuityofWalls ................................. %8
Section 1100.2 MechanicalCode ..................... B 508060 k]
Section 1100.3 Air Pollution Control ... ..........ccviuieennnn. .. ]
Seclion 130020therLaws ... .............ccviririieiiinrnin, k]
Section 1506.0 Energy Conservalion in Electrical Distribution Systems .. 38
Section 1702.1.1 Private Sewage Disposal .......................... 3
Seclion 1704.3 Private Water Supply ..............cooeriiiinniin. 7
Seclion 1800.18C0PE ... ....oeivr i e, veer 37
Appendix B Accepted Engineering Practice Standards ............... 3B
PART “E"

BOCA BASIC PLUMBING CODE/1978

SeclionP-100.0General . ........... ..o, 33
Section P-109.0 Plumbing Official . ................................s »
Section P-110.0 Dulies and Powers of the Plumbing Official ........... 39
SeclionP-122.0Means of Appeal ........ooiiiieen i, 3%
Table 1202.2.1 (page 107) Minimum Number of Plumbing Fixures . . . .. »
Article 15 Individual Sewage DisposalSystem . ...................... »
Section 1601.0WalerRequired .. ..........cc0iitveernennnnnnns »
Article 17 Individual Waler SUPPIY ..........oooirieeerennnnnns »
PART “"F"

BOCA BASIC MECHANICAL CODE/1978

SeclionM-100.0Genaral ................ .. it 41
Section M109.0Mechanical Official .................c.ooieieriss. ]
Section M-110.0 Duties and Powers of the Mechanical Official ......... 4
Section M-122.0Means ol Appeal ............ooviveiieieiinannns .
SeclionM-301.18C0P8 . .. .. ..ot 41
Article 11 AirPollution Control ............coviie i, 41
PART "G"

ONE AND TWO FAMILY DWELLING CODE/1978

Chapler 1, Administrative . . ................. i, 43
Section B-1041thruR-113 ... ... . 43
SectionR-206 CeilingHeight . ..................................... 43
SectionR-207 Sanitalion . . . ............ ... 43
SeclionR-209GIazing ...........ooviiii e a4
Section R-Z1TEXS .. ... ... . i, a4



Section R-212 Doors and Hallways . . 44
Section R-213 Landings . 44
SocllonFIszandrmhanthmﬂrm T -
Saction R-216Smoke Detactor . . .........ccovnrieieiiriroaaenan 45
Saction R-217FoamPIBSlICE ... ........coovvernicarnnmsniaaaninns a5
Section R-218FIAMBSPread ... ......oooeviiiiiiiaraanininn 48
Section R-303 Foolings . cenene.. A8
Figure No. A-a(pageazlhinmnmmmﬂrmm ......... 48
Section R-308 Protection Agam Daclv andTermites ................ 48
Section R-402 Wood . i, B
Table NO. 4-B (PAEEB2) . ... ..overnieeannin et A7
Section R-410.2.3 Reinforced Hollow UnitMasonry ................0e 47
SeclionR-B02ZWOOd ..........cccivvrniiirirnnrassssiassnnnnranasss &7
TableN0. 8-C(PBJE5B) .. ... .oconvvearavrinnirsirinaeeannsocsmee 4T
TableNO. 6-E(pageBl) .. .........ccocernmmmninmsannnananasosss 48
Figure NO. A-B(PAgBG2) ... .. ...covviuiiminiriire i 48
SectionR-TO2W0oOd .......cvviiiimiiiciacannnnassrararanrannrnan L]
Section R-706 Attic Access . iiienea... 4B
Section H-BDGComposmonAsphutﬁwucFaushﬂulas .. 48
Chaplers 9thiu25 ..........oeivrerrinnnitnnerrniaaraaaans 3 48
Chapter 26 SIBNAArdS . .........ovvrrooniuneaeeiiiniaie e 49
Appendix ASNOWLOBAS ...........oouiiiiiiiiiiiiei
PART “H"

INCONSISTENT LOCAL BUILDING CODES AND
REGULATIONSREPEALED .. .......cvvviiiiiirnesanrinanrionens 51
PART “I"

SAVINGS CLAUSE ......ccviivvrnecrennarcrsrsssnsamsssrsancans 52
PWIIJID

DATEOFACCEPTANCE ........ivvivriiienrnrnirnnssnsosnnanens 53
PART “K"

MEMBERS . .....cucvnveiiianinnnnecnnsasaabanasaaannsanananns 54
REVISION UPDATES ..o.cvevceucorssarsssnceaceassonsecssssasnss 55




introduction

The General Assembly passed legislation crealing a State Board of Housing
and directed it to adopt a building code that would apply equally across
Virginia. On January 29, 1973 the State Board of Housing selected a nation-
ally recognized, performance oriented code. In 1977, the General Assembly
repealed the legislation creating the Slate Board of Housing and created the
Board of Housing and Community Development, effective July 1, 1978. Using
the model code of Bujlding Officials and Code Administrators, International,
inc. (BOCA), on June 19, 1978 the Board adopted the following to be the
Uniform Statewide Building Code of Virginia, sometimes relerred to as “this
Code™

The BOCA Basic Building Code/1978

The BOCA Basic Plumbing Code/1978

The BOCA Basic Mechanicai Code/1978

The Cne and Two Family Dwelling Code/1975
The National Electrical Code/1978

The Virginia Administrative Amendments/1978*

“The Virginia Administrative Amendments/1978 consisted of changes that
were needed to conform the model code for use in Virginia. These amend-
ments have been merged into this Accumulative Supplement.

The Virginia General Assembly also created a State Building Code Technical
Review Board (the "Review Board") lo interpret provisions of this Cods, to
hear appeals and to provide technical assistance to the Board of Housing
and Community Development on amendmenits.

The Uniform Statewide Building Code becomes effective August 1, 1978 for
the entire Stale of Virginia.

All sections of this Code which have been amended by the State Board of
Housing are printed in this Accumulative Supplement.



Use Of This Book

The material in this Supplement has been organized inlo eleven (11) paris,
letterad A through K, as follows:

Part A - Administrative Rules and Regulations,
Part B - Chaptlers 6, 7 and 8, Title 36, Code ot Virginia 1950, as amended.

Part C - Lists all the publications that, when taken together, make up the
Uniforn Statewide Building Code.

Part D - Amendments to the BOCA Basic Building Code/1978 (white
peper).

Pant E - Amendments to the BOCA Basic Pulmbing Code/1978 (gray
paper). -

PartF- qu):m\ems to tha BOCA Basic Mechanical Code/1978 (blue
papef).

Pan G- Amondrnents to the One and Two Family Dwelling Code/1975
(pink paper).

All amendments are numberad 10 the respective section in the respeciive
code and should be posted thereto.

Parts H, | and J - These paris contain official regulations of the Board of
Housing and Community Development regarding
administration of the Uniform Statewide Building Code.

PartK - Membership

Part L-Revision updates

Code changes adopted by the Board of Housing and
Community Development and State legislation en-
acted by the Virginia General Assembly since the
1978 Uniform Statewide Building Code was adopted
by the Board on June 19, 1978,and became effective
August 1, 1978.



PartA
Administrative Rules and Regulations

(1) Article One of the 1978 BOCA Basic Building Code, as amendad by this
Supplement, shall be the Uniform Administrative Procedurss for the
Uniform Statewide Building Code.

(2) The BOCA Basic Building Code shall be used in determining the require-
ments and design for the construction of buildings and structures.

{3) Installation of equipment as defined by §36-97(13) Code of Virginia,-and
required or installed shall be in accordance with standards and accepted
engineering praclices established wihtin the 1978 BOCA Mechanical
Code, the 1978 BOCA Basic Plumbing Code and the 1978 edition of the
National Electrical Code. ,

(4) Pursuant lo §36-118 Code of Virginia, requests for Interpretations shall be
forwarded to the Depariment of Housing and Community Development,
using the Interpretation Request Forms supplied by the office of the local
building department. Decisions of the State Building Code Technical
Review Board will be disseminated on a quarterly basis as follows:

interpretations Will Be Wil Be
Submitted Considered Malled
Jan. - Feb. March April
May - June July August
Sept. - Oct. November December

(5) Pursuant to §36-114 Code of Virginia, applications for appeal to the Stale
Building Code Technical Review Board shall be forwarded to the Depart-
ment of Housing and Community Development using the Appeal Form.

(6) The following forms are utilized by the State Bullding Code Staff in
carrying our their administrative responsibilities. Copies ol these forms
are available through the local building department or by writing the State
Building Code Staff:

Interpretation Request Form
Interpretation Answer Form
Application For Appeal

Uniform Code Change Submittal Form
Chafllenge Form



(7) Modifications and Variation: A desired modification or variation 1o the
provisions of the Uniform Statewide Building Code should be requested
by the owner in writing to the local building official as permitted by Section
109 of the BOCA Basic Building Code.

The building official should research and investigate the request as
required by Sections 109.2, 109.4 and other applicable sections of the
Code. Should tha building official refuse to grant the request, the owner
should be advised of his right to appeal.

Appeals: When the owner desires an appeal of the building official’s
decision, the building official should have said owner apply to the local
apeals board on forms provided by the local department in accordance
with Section 126 of the BOCA Basic Building Code.

In event the awner wishes to appeal to the State Building Code Technical
Review board, the local building official should have the owner fill out the
Appeal Form and transmit a copy of the ruling to the State Building Code
Technical Review Board. Upon receipt, the Staff shall set the date for the
hearing, and all concemed parties will be nolified.

{8) The State Building Code Statf is available to all citizens for consultation,
when Code questions arise. Their telephone number is (804) 786-5041

Opinions rendered by the State Building Code Stalt and by BOCA are
unofficial opinions. Pursuant to §36-118 Code of Virginia, the State
Building Code Technical Review Board will render an official opinion
when requested o do so.



interpretation Request Form
TO: State Building Code Technical Review Board
205 N. Fourth Street
Richmond, Virginia 23219

FROM: _

REPRESENTING:

Pursuant 1o Section 36-118 of the Code of Virginia, 1950 as amen-
ded, | hereby request an Official Interpretation of the following Arti-
cle(s)/Section(s) of the Virginia Uniform Statewide Building Code,

Code Seclions: Attachments:

QUESTION:

Date:
Signature of Applicant
Building Code Stalf Action
Date Received Interpretation No.
Date Submitied
Comments:
Final Dispasition:
Staff Member







UNIFORM STATEWIDE BUILDING CODE
interpretation

Code Interpretation Number:

Code Section{s): _
Volume. i Edition:

QUESTION

ANSWER:

This Official Interpretation was issued by the State Building Code
Technical Review Board at their meeting o







Commonwealth of Virginia
Depantment of Housing and Community Development

205 N. Fourth Street
Richmond, Virginia 23219

Application for Appeal

Date

Pursuant 1o §36- 114 of the Code of Virginia {1950), as amended, | hereby
request an appeal belore the State Building Code Technical Review Board,
relative to the following:

Appellant - (Applicant) vs. Appelle

Name
Address

Representing

if building owned by other than Appellant, show owner's complete name and
address:

Background Information:
1. Type or Use of Building or Structure:

2. Location:

3. Modification Request:




COMMENTS:
Copy of Building Official’s Decision
Copy of Decision of local Board of Appeals
Supplemental Data

Action for Appeal
1. Building Official refuses to grant modification.

True intent of code or rules legally adopted
thereundar have been incorrectly interpreled

2.

3. Provigions of code do not fully apply.

4. Equally good or better form of construction can
be used.

Staff Action:

Request for Appeal Received
Chairman Contacted

Date of Appeal

Notice Mailed

Staff input, if any




Commonweallh of Virginia Code
Board of Housing and Community Development  Change No.
Codes and Standards Committee

205 N. Fourth Street See Also
Richmond, Virginia 23219 Change No.

Committee Recommendation _

Do Nol Write Above This Line

—_— . Code Section
Proponent
{Check One)
—_Change Subseclion to read — Delete subsection and
as follows. substitute as follows.
~___Add new subsection to read —Delete subsection without
as follows. substitution.

Give here the specilic code changes, with the exact rewording proposed.
Show malerial in brackets [ ] to be deleted from present text. Show material
underscored to be added to present text.

Supporting Statement(s):

Submit four (4) copies of each proposed change with four copies of support-
ing information. Additional copies of this form available from the Deparntment
ol Housing and Community Development, 205 N. Fourth Street, Richmond,
Virginia 23219.



e e

g

-~




CHALLENGE FORM
PROPQOSED CHANGES TO THE UNIFORM STATEWIDE BUILDING CODE

A Notice of Challenge to the Board of Housing and Community Develop-
ment's Recommendation for Proposed Changes to the Uniform Statewide
Building Code.

TO: Chairman, Codes and Standards Committee
Board of Housing and Community Development

FROM:
{Name of Challenger) (Title/Position)
{Company/Agency/Associalion)
(Streel Address} {A/C-Telaphone Number)
{City) (State) (Zip)
RE: | Challenge the Recommendation of the Board of Housing and
Community Development for the proposed change to
(Article) (Section)
(Volurne)
{Signature)
SUPPORTING STATEMENT:

I {will) {will not) appear or be represented at the Public Hearing.

3






Part 8

36-97.
36-98

36-99.
36-99.1.

36-99.2

36-100

36-101.

36-103.

36-103.

36-105.
36-106.
36-107.

CHAPTER 6

Uniform Statewide Building Code

Article 1.
General Provisions

Definitions.

Board to promulgate State-
wide Code, other codes
and regulalions
superseded.

Provisions of Code.

Certilicalion ol electrical
and plumbing workers.

Standards lor replacement
glass.

Notice and hearing on
adoption of Code,
amendments and
repeals.

Effective date of Code,
when local codes may
remain in effect.

Modilicalion, amendmant
or repeal of Code
provisions.

Buildings, elc., exisling or
projected belore
eflective dale of Code

. Code to be printed and fur-

nished on request; true
copy.
Enforcement of Code.
Violation a misdemeanor.
Employment of personnel
for administration of
chapter.

Article 2.

State Building Code Technical

Sec.

36-108.
36-109.
36-110.
36-111.
36-112.
36-113.
36-114.

36-115.

36-116.
36-117.
36-118.

36-119.

Review Board

Board continued; members

Officers; secretary.

Expenses.

Oath and bonds.

Meetings.

Offices.

Board to hear appeals from
decisions under Code.

Subpoenas; witnesses;
designation of sub-
ordinates.

(Repealed)

Record of decisions.

interpretation ol Code;
recommendation of
modifications.

Rules and regulations
under §36-73 not
superseded.

15



ARTICLE 1
General Provisions

§36-97. Definiions — As used in this chapter, unless the context or
subject matter requires otherwise, the following words or terms shall have the
meaning herein ascribed to them, respectively:

(1) “Board"” means the Board of Housing and Community Development.

(2) (3) (Repeated.) '

(4) "Review Board” means the State Building Code Technical Review
Board.

(5) “Buliding Code"” means the Uniform Statewide Building Code.

{6) “Code provisions” means the provisions of the Uniform Statewide
Building Code as adopled and promuigated by the Board, and the amend-
ments therof as adopted and promulgated by such Board from time to time.

(7) "Building reguiations” means any law, rule, resolution, regulation,
ordinance or code, general or special, or compilation thereof, heretofore or
hereafter enacted or adopted by the State or any county or municipality
including departments, boards, bureaus, commissions, or other agencies
thereol, relating to construction, reconstruction, alleration, cornversion,
repair, maintenance, or use of struciures and buildings and installation of
equipment therein. The term does not include zoning ordinances or cther
land use controls that do not affect the manner of construction or materials to
be used in the erection, alteration or repair of a building or structure.

{8) “Municipality” means any city or town in this State.

{9) “Localgoveming body" means the governing body of any city, county
or town in this Siate.

(10) “Local bullding department” means the agency or agencies of any
local governing body charged with the administration, supervision, or en-
forcement of building codes and regulations, approval of plans, inspeclion of
buildings, or issuance of permits, licenses, cerlificates or similar documenis
prescribed or required by State or local building regulations.

{11) “State agency” means any State depantment, board, bureau, com-
misgsion, or agency of this State.

(12) “Building” means a combination of any materials, whether portable
or fixed, having a roof to form a structure for the use or occupancy by persons,
or property; provided, however, that farm buildings not used for residential
purposes and frequented generally by the owner, members of his family, and
farm employees shall be exempt from the provisions of the Uniform Statewide
Building Code, but such buildings lying within flood plain or in a mudslide-
prone area shaif be subject to flood proofing regulations or mudslide regula-
tions, as applicable. The word "building” shall be construed as though
followed by the words “or part or parts thereof” unless the context clearly
requires a different meaning.

(13) “Equipment” means plumbing, heating, electrical, ventilating, air-
conditioning and refrigeration equipment, elevators, dumb waiters, escala-
fors, and other mechanical additions or installations,

(14) “Construction” means the construction, reconstruction, afteration,
repair or conversion of buildings.



(15) “Owner” means the owner or owners of the freehoid of the premises
or lesser estate therein, a morigages or vendee in possession, assignee of
rents, receiver, execulor, trustee, lessee or other person, firm or corporation
in control of a building.

{16) (Repealed.)

(17) “Director” means the Director of the Department of Housing and
Community Development.

(18) “Structure” means an assembly of materials forming a construction
for occupancy or use including stadiums, gospel and circus tents, reviewing
stands, platforms, stagings, observation towers, radio lowers, water tanks,
trestles, piers, wharves, swimming pools, amusement devices, starage bins.
and other structures of this general nature; provided however, that farm
structures not used for residential purposes shall be exempt fsom the provi-
sions of the Uniform Statewide Building Code, but such structures lying within
a flood plain or in a mudslide prone area shall be subject 1o flood prooting
regulations or mudslide regulations, as applicable. The word "structure shall
be construed as though followed by the words “or part or parts thereof”
unless the context clearly requires a ditferent meaning.

(19) “Department” means the Department of Housing and Community
Development. (1972, c. 829; 1974, cc. 622, 668, 1975, c. 384; 1977, cc. 423,
613; 1978, c. 703.)

§ 36-98. Board 1o promulgate Statewide Code; other codes and regula-
tions superseded. — The Board is hereby directed and empowered to adopt
and promulgate a Uniform statewide Building Code. Such Building Code
shall supersede the building codes and regulations of the counties, munici-
palities and State agencies. (1972, c. 829; 1977, ¢. 613.)

§ 36-99. Provisions of Code. — The Building Code shall prescribe
standards o be complied with in the conslruction of buildings and structures,
and procedures for the administration and enforcement of such standards.
The provisions thereofl shall be such as to protect the health, salety and
wellare of the residents of this State, provided that buildings and structures
should be permitied o be conslructed al the least possible cost consistent
with recognized standards of health, safety, energy and water conservation
and barrier-free provisions for the physically handicapped and aged. Such
sthandards shall be reasonable and appropriate 1o the objectives of this
chapter.

In formulating the Code provisions, the Baard shall have due regard for
generally accepled standards as recommended by nationally recognized
organizations, including, but not limited to, the standards of the Southern
Building Code Congress, the Building Officials Conference of America and
the National Fire Proteclion Association.

Where practical, the Code provisions shall be stated in terms of required
ievel of perflormance,

s0 as lo facilitate the prompt acceptance of new building
materials and methods. When generally recognized standards of perfor-
mance are not available, such provisions shall provide for acceptance of

17



materials and methods whose performance has been found by the Board, on
the basis of reliable test and evaluation data, presented by the proponent, to
be substantially equal in salety to those specified. (1972, ¢. 829; 1974, c. 433;
1975, c. 394; 1977, cc. 423, 613; 1978, c.581.)

§36-99.1. Certification of electrical and plumbing workars. — No electri-
cal worker or plumbing worker shall be required 1o be examined or certified
by the Board or by the locality at the direction of the Board if such person was
certified or licensed for two years prior to January one, nineteen hundred
eighty, in accordance with provisions made by any local goveming body,
provision required of any local governing body or provision made by the
Commoanwealth. (1974, c. 437, 1977, ¢. 613; 1978, cc. 268, 751.)

§ 36-99.2. Standards for replacement glass. — Any replacement glass
installed in buildings constructed prior to the effective date of the Uniform
Statewide Building Code shall meet the quality and installation standards for
glass installed in new buildings as are in effect al the time of instailation.
{1976, c. 137).

§ 36-100. Notice and hearings on adoption of Code, amendments and
repeals. — Before any Code provisions are adopted, the Board shall hoid at
least one public hearing. At least thirty days' notice thereof shall be given by
publication in at least four newspapers of general circulation published in the
State. In addition to notice by publication, the board shall notiy in writing the
mayor or olher like official of every municipality in the State, and the chairman
of the governing body of every county in the State of such hearing, but failure
to give or receive any such nolice shall not in anywise impair the validity of any
Code provisions adopted, amended or repealed. At any such hearing all
persons desiring to do so shall be afiorded an opportunity 1o present their
views. Notice of amendments to or repeal of any Code provisions theratofore
adopled shall be given as aloresaid. (1972, c. 829; 1977, ¢. 613 )

§36-101. Effective date of Code; when local codes may remain in effect.
— No Code provisions shall be made effective prior to January one, nineteen
hundred seventy-three, or later than September one, nineteen hundred
sgventy-three; provided that the initial Building Code shall not become effec-
tive earlier than one hundred eighty days after the publication thereof.

It is further provided that where, in the apinion of the Raview Board, local
codes are in substantial conformity with the State Code the local code may,
with the concurrence of the Review Board remain in effect for two years from
the effective day of the State Code for transition to implementation of the State
Code. (1972, ¢.829)

§36-102, Modification, amendment or repeal of Code provisions. — The
Board may modify, amend or repeal any Code provisions from time to time as
the public interest requires, after nolice and hearing as provided in § 36-100
of this chapter. No such modification or amendment shall be made effective
earlier than thirty days from the adoption thereof. (1972, ¢, 829; 1977,¢. 613.)

§ 36-103. Buildings, etc., existing or projected before effactive date of
Code. — Any buildirig or structure, for which a building permit has been
issued or on which construction has commenced, or for which working

19



drawings have been prepared in the year prior to the effective date of the
Building Code, shall remain subjeci to the building regulations in effect at the
time of such 1ssuance or commencement of construction. Subsequent recon-
struction, renovation, repair or demolition of such buildings or structures shall
be subject to the pertinent provisions of the Building Code. The provisions of
this section shali be applicable to equipment. (1972, ¢. 829; 1976, c. 638))

§ 36-104. Code to be printed and furnished on request; true copy. — The
Depariment shall have printed from time to time and keep available in pam-
phlet lorm all Code provistons. Such pamphiels shall be furnished upon
request o members of the public. A true copy of all such provisions adopted
and in force shall be kept in the office of Department, accessible to the public.
The Department may charge a reasonable fee for distribution of the Building
Code based on production and distribution costs (1972, ¢. 829, 1974, c. 298,
1977,.c. 618}

§ 36-105. Enlorcement of Cade; appeals Irom decisions of local depart-
ment. — Enlorcement of the Building Code shall be the responsibility of the
local building depariment There shall be established within each local build-
ing depariment a local board of Bullding Code appeals whose composilion,
duties and responsibilibes shall be prescribed in the Building Code. Appeals
from the local buitding department concerning application of the Building
Code or relusat to granl a modification to the provisions of the Code covering
the mannear of construction or matenals to be used in the erection, alteration or
repair of a building or siructure shall first lie to the local board ol Building Code
appeals No appeal to the State Bullding Code Technical Review Board shall
lie prior 1o a final determination by the local board of Building Code appeals.
Whenever a counly or a municipality doesnot have such a building depari-
ment or board ol Bulding Code appeals. the local governing body shall enter
into an agreement with the local governing body of another county or munici-
pality or with some other agency. or a Slate agency approved by the Cepart-
ment, for such enforcement and appeals resuling therefrom. Fees may be
levied by the local governing body in order 1o defray the cost of such
enlorcement and appeals.

Any building may be inspected at any lime belore completion, and shall
nal be deermed in compliance unlil approved by the inspecting authority but
where the construction cost is less than one thousand dollars the building
inspeclion may, in the discretion of the inspecling authogity, be waived.
(1972, c 829, 1974, c 433, 1977,cc. 423,613}

§ 36-106. Violation a misdemeanor. — It shall be unlawful for any owner
or any other person, firm or corporation, on or after the effective date of any
Code provisions, to violate any such provisions. Any such violation shall be
deemed a misdemeanor and any owner or any other person, firm or corpora-
tion convicted ol such a violalion shall be punished by a fine of not more than
one thousand dollars. {1972, ¢. B29; 1975, ¢ 367.)

§ 36-107. Employment of personnel for administration of chapter. —
Subject to the provisions of chapter 10 (§ 2.1-110 et seq.) of Title 2.1 of the
Code of Virginia, the Direclor may employ such permanent and temporary
clerical, technical and other assistants as are necessary or advisable for the

19



proper administration of the provision of this chapter. (1972, ¢. 829; 1974, ¢
668; 1977, ¢.613)

§ 36-108. Board continued; members. — There is hereby continued in
the Department, the State Building Code Technical Review Board, consisting
of seven members, appointed by the Governor subject to confirmation by the
General Assembly. The members shall include one member who is a regis-
tered architect, selected Irom a slate presented by the Virginia Society of the
American Institute of Architects; one member who is a prolessional engineer
in private practice, selected from a slate presented by the Virginia Society of
Professional Engineers; one member who is a residential buiider selected
from a slate presented by the Home Builders Association of Virginia; one
member who is a general contractor selecied from a slate presented by the
Virginia Branch, Associated General Contractors of America, one member
who has had experience in the field of enforcement of building regulations,
selected from a slate presenied by the Virginia Building Officials Conference:
one member who is employed by a public agency as a lire prevention officer
selected from a slate presented by the Virginia Fire Chiefs' Association; and
one member from the State al large who may be a member of a local
governing body. The members shal! serve al the pleasure of the Governor
(1972, c. 829; 1974, c. 668; 1976, c. 484; 1977, cc. 92,613 )

§36-109. Officers; secretary. — The Review Board, under rules adopied
by itself, shall elect one of its members as chairman, for a term of two years,
and may elect one of its members as vice-chairman. The review board may
also elect a secretary, who may be a nonmenber. (1972, c. 829)

§36-110. Expenses. — The members of Ihe Review Board shall receive
no salaries, but shall be paid their necessary traveling and other expenses
incurred in attendance of meelings or while olherwise engaged in the dis-
charge of their duties and, in addition thereto, shall be paid the sum of
thirty-live dollars a day for each day or portion thereof in which they are
engaged in the performance of their duties. (1972, c. 829, 1974, ¢. 668.)

§36-111.  Oath and bonds. — Belore entering upon the discharge of his
duties, each member of the Review Board shall take an oath that he will
taithfully and honestly execute the dulies of his office during his conlinuance
therein, and shall give bond with corporate surely in such penalty as may be
fixed by the Governor, conditioned upan the faithiul discharge of his dulies
The premiums on such bonds shall be paid for as other expenses of the
Department are paid. (1972, ¢. 829, 1974, c. 668, 1977, ¢ 613))

§ 36-112. Meetings. — The Review Board shall meet at the call of the
chairman, or at the written request of al least three of its members; provided
that it shall act within thirty days following receipt of any appeal made under
the provisions of this chapter. (1972, c. 829.)

§ 36-113. Offices. — The Review Board shall be furnished adequate
space and quarters in the suite of offices of the Depariment and such Board's
main office shall be therein. (1972, c. B29; 1974, ¢ 668: 1977, c. 613)

20



§ 36-114. Board to hear appeals from decisions under Code. — The
Review Board shall have the power and duty 1o hear all appeals from deci-
sions arising under application of the Building Code, and to render its deci-
sion on any such appeal, which decision shall be final if no appeal 1s made
therefrom Proceedings of the Review Board shali be governed by the prowvi-
sions of chapter 1.1:1 of Titte 8 (§ 9-6. 141 el seq.) of the Code of Virgima.
(1972,¢.829,1977, ¢ 423)

§ 36-115. Subpoenas; witnesses; designation of subordinates. — In any
matter belore it on appeal for hearing and determination, the Review Board,
or is designated subordinates, may compel the attendance of all needed
witnesses in like manner as a circuil court, save the Review Board shall not
have the power of imprisonment. In taking evidence, the chairman or any
member of the review board, or ils designaled subordinates, shall have the
power to administer oaths lo witnesses Where a designated subordmate or
the review Board presides over hearings on appeals, such subordinate shall
submit recommended findings and a decision lo the Review Board Pursuant
10 § 9-6. 14:12 ol the Code of Virginia. (1972, c. B29; 1977,c 423)

§36-116. Repealed by Acls 1977, ¢. 613.

§36-117. Record of decisions. — A record of all decisions of the Review
Board, properly indexed, shall be kept in the office of such Board. Such
record shall be open to public inspection at all times during business hours.
(1972, c.B29)

§ 36-118. Interpretation of Code; recommendation of modifications. —
The Review Board shall interprel the provisions of the Building Code. the Fire
Salety Code, and shall make such recommendations, which it deems appro-
priate, lo the Board for modification, amendment or repeal of any of such
provisions. A record of all such recommendations, and of the Board's actions
thereon, shalt be kept in the office of the Review Board. Such record shall be
open to public inspection at all times during business hours, (1972, c. 829;
1977,¢.613.)

§36-119. Rules and Regulations, under § 36-73 not superseded. — This
chapter shall not amend, supersede, or repeal the rules and regulations
prescribing standards to be complied with, in industrialized building units
and mobile homss promulgated unde § 36-73 of the Code of Virginia. {1972,
c.829.)

CHAPTER 7
State Board of Housing
§ 36-120 to 36-130: Repealed by Acts 1977, ¢. 813.

21



CHAPTER S
Department of Housing and Community Development

Sec. Sec.

36-131. Definitions. 36-136° Meelings of Board
36-132. Creation of Depariment, 36-137. Powers and duties of
appointment of Board

Director 36-138. Compensalion of members
36-133. Director to supervise of Board

Department. 36-139. Powers and dulies of
36-134. General powers ol Director

Director
36-135. Board of Housing and

Community Develop-

ment created; members,
terms; chairman

§36-131. Definitions. — As used in this chapter, the tollowing words and
terms have the following meanings. unless a different meaning clearly ap-
pears from the context.

A. “Deparntment” means the Depariment ol Housing and Communily
Development.

B. “Dirsctor” means the Director of the Department ol Housing and
Community Development

C. “Board” means the Board of Housing and Community Development
(1977.¢c.613)

§ 36-132. Creation of Department; appoiniment of Director. — There 1s
hereby created in the execulive department, responsible to the Secretary of
Commerce and Resources, the Depariment of Housing and Community
Development. The Department shall be headed by a Direclor who shall be
appointed by the Governcr, subject to confirmation by the General Assembly,
to serve at the pleasure of the Governor for a term concident with s own,
(1977,c. 613)

§ 36-133. Director to supervise Department. — The Director of the De-
partment of Housing and Community Development shall. under the direction
and control of the Governor and the Secretary of Commerce and Resources,
be responsible for the supervision of the Department and shall exercise such
other powers and perform such other duties as may be required of him by the
Governor and the Secretary ol Commerce and Resources. (1977, c. 613.)

§ 36-134. General Powers of Director. — The Direclor shall have the
following general powers.

A. To employ such personnel as may be required to carry out the pur-
poses of this chapter.



B. To make and enter into all contracts and agreements necessary or
incidental to the performance of the Department's duties and the execution of
its powers under this chapter, including, but not limited to, contracis with the
United States, other states, agencies and governmenial subdivisions of this
Commonwealth.

C. To accept grants from the United States government and agencies
and instrumentalities thereof and any other source. To these ends, the De-
partment shall have the power 1o comply with such conditions and execule
such agreements as may be necessary, convenient or desirable.

D. Todo all acts necessary or convenient to carry oul the purposes of this
chapter. (1977, ¢.613.)

§ 36-135. Board of Housing and Community Development created;
members: terms; chairman, — There is hereby created within the Depariment
of Housing and Community Development the Board of Housing and Com-
rmunity Development. The Board shall consist of nine members appointed by
the Govemnor, subject to confirmalion by the General Assembly Members
shall serve for four-year terms and no member shall serve for more than two
full successive terms_ Initial appointments to the Board shall be made as
follows: Two shall be for terms of one year, two shall be for terms of two years,
two shall be for terms of three years, and three shall be for terms of four years
each, and thereatter all appointiments shall be lor terms of four years each. A
chairman of the Board shail be elected annually by the Board. (1977,¢ 613.)

§ 36-136. Meetings of Board. — The Board shall meet al least once
every three months, and on the call of the chairman, when, in his opinion,
additional meetings are necessary. {1977, c. 613.)

§ 36-137. Powers and duties of board. — The Board shall exercise the
following powers and duties, and such others as may be provided by law:

A. Provide a means of citizen access to the Depariment.

B. Provide a means of publicizing the policies and programs of the
Department in order lo educate the public and elicit public support for
Department aclivilies.

C. Monilor the policies and activities of the Departiment and have the right
of access to departmental information,

D. Advise the Govemor, the Secretary of Commerce and Resources and
the Director on matters relating to housing and community development.

E. From time to time make such rules and regulations as may be neces-
sary to carry out its responsibililies and from time to time thereatter to repeal or
amend such rules.

F. To promulgate design standards relative 1o making places of public
accommodation constructed, remodeled or rehabilitated in this State after
the effective date of the standards promulgated under this section reasona-
bly accessible to and useable by physically handicapped persons, as de-
fined in § 2.1-109.02, at the least possible cost to those subject to the



standards; provided, however, that construction, remodaling or rehabilitation
done under contracts for planning, design or construction of places of public
accommodation which have been awarded prior to the effective date of
standards promulgated under this section shall not be subject to such stan-
dards. Within the meaning of this subsection "places of public accommoda-
tion” shall mean all auditoriums, hospitals, nursing homes, convalescent
homaes, theatres, stadiums, convention centers, restaurants, hotels, motels,
shopping centers and malls, department stores, supermarkets, public trans-
portation terminals, medical buildings, medical and dental offices, apariment
developments containing more than twenty dwelling units, and office build-
ings containing ten thousand or more square feet of gross floor area. The
Board shall also have the power and duty to recommend design standards
which would make all buildings, struclures, facilities, complexes or improved
%eﬁs accessible to physically handicapped persons. (1977, c. 613; 1978, c.

§36-138. Cempensation of members of Board. —Members of the Board
shall receive compensalion of fifty doftars per day lor each day they are
. engaged in the performance of their official duties, and shall be reimbursed
for actual expenses incured in the discharge of their duties. (1977, c. 613.)

§ 36-139. Powers and duties of Director. — The Director shall have the
following rasponsibilities:

A. Collecting from the governmental subdivisions of the Commonwealth
information relevant to their planning and development activilies, boundary
changes, changes of forms and status of government, intergovernmental
agreements and arrangements, and such other information as it may deem
necessary.

B. Making information available to communities, planning district com-
missions, service districts and governmental subdivisions of the Common-
wealth. .
C. Providing professional and technical assistance to, and cooperating
with, any planning agency, planning district commission, service district, and
govemmental subdivision engaged in the preparation of development plans
and programs, service district plans, or consolidation agreements.

D. Assisting the Governor in the providing of such State financial aid as
may be appropriated by the General Assembly in accordance with § 15.1-
1412 of the Code of Virginia.

E. Administering federal grant assistance programs, including funds
from the Appalachian Regionat Commission, the Economic Devalopment
Administration and other such federal agencies, directed al promoting the
development of the Commonwealth’'s communities and regions.

F. Developing State housing and community development policies,
goals, plans and programs for the consideration and adaption of the Board
with the ultimate authority for adoption 1o rest with the Govemor and the
General Assembly.



G. Determining present and fulure housing requirements of the State and
designing programs to coordinate the elements of housing production which
programs shall be designed to assure the availability of housing where and
when needed.

H. Assuming administrative coordinalion of the various State housing
programs and cooperating with the various State agencies in their programs
as they relate to housing.

I Establishing public information and educational programs relating to
housing; devising and administering programs o inform all citizens about
housing and housing-related programs that are available on all levels of
government; designing and administering educational programs to prepare
families for home ownership and counseling them during their first years as
homeowners; and promoling educational programs to assist sponsors in the
development of low and moderate income housing as well as programs to
lessen the problems of rental housing management.

J. Administering the provisions of the Urban Assistance Incentive Fund
as set forth in § 15.1-1500 through 15.1-1505 of the Code of Virginia.

K. Administering the provisions of the Industrial Building Unit and Mobile
Home Salety Law

L. Administering the provisions of the Uniform Slatewide Building Code.
M. Administering the provisions of the Virginia Fire Safety Law.

N. To adminisier design standards promulgaled by the Board pursuant
10§ 36-137F.

O. To establish and operale a voluntary training program for the instruc-
lion of the personnel ol local building departments concerning the content,
application and ntent of the Unilorm Statewide Building Code. Upon the
salisfactory completion of such instruction by any person, the Board may
grant certdficalion of his successful completions.

P. Carrying out such other duties as may be necaessary and convenient to
the exercise of powers granted to the Department.

Q. To administer, in conjunclion with the federal government and pro-
mulgate any necessary rules and regulations regarding energy standards for
existing buildings as may be required pursuant to federat law. (1977, ¢. 613;
1978, cc. 737, 751.)



PartC
Adoption of the UNIFORM STATEWIDE SUILDING CODE

A certain document, which is on file in the Office of the Director of the
Department of Housing and Community Development, was adopted on June
19, 1978 as the Uniform Statewide Building Code of the Commonwaalth of
Virginia, hereinatter sometimes referred to as “this Code", to bacome effec-
tive on August 1, 1978.

The Uniform Statewide Building Code is now comprised of the following texts
as fully set out in these regulations with the additions, insertions, deletions
and changes, if any, prescribed in Parts D, E, F and G of this Supplement:

The BOCA Basic Building Code/1978

The BOCA Basic Plumbing Code/1978

The BOCA Basic Mechanical Code/1978
The One and Two Family Dwelling Code/1975
The National Electrical Code/1978

The Virginia Administrative Amendments/1978
{merged into this Accumulative Supplement)



PartD
BOCA Basic Buliding Code/1978

Section 100.1 Change total paragraph to read as follows:

Title: These regulations shall be known as the Uniform Statewide Building
Code, herein referred to as this Code; and shall apply to buildings and
structures construcied after effective date of September 1, 1973,

Pursuant to § 36-103 Code of Virginia those buildings which are not covered
by the Uniform Statewide Building Code remain subject to local building
codes

The Jocal jurisdiction has the authority to adopt provisions for condemnation
and maintenance of buildings exempt from this Code.
Section 100.2 Add the following in (Name of jurisdiction):

State of Virginia -
Section 100.4 Add underiined words:
Code remedial: This code shall be construed to secure its expressed intent,
which is to insure public safety, health and welfare insofar as they are atfected
by building construction, provigions for energy conservation and accessibi-
lity to the_physically_handicapped, through structural strength, adequate
egress facililies, sanitary equipment, light and ventilation and fire safety; and,
in general, to secure salety 1o lite and property from all hazards incident to the
design, erection, repair, removal, demolition or use and occupancy of build-
ings, structures or premises.

Section 101.3 Delete words in parenthesis:

Matters not provided for:  Any requirement essential for structural, fire or
sanitary safety of {an exisling or proposed) a building or structure, or essential
for the safety of the occupants thereof, and which is not specifically covered
by this code, shall be determined by the building official.

Section 101.5 Delete t0tal sub-section

Section 102.1 Change total peragraph to reed as follows:

General: the term “ordinary repairs” shall mean the replacement of existing
materials with like materials, such as painting, roofing, siding, glass, doors,
windows, flooring, plaster, wall board, cabinets and the like, but shall not
include, alterations, additions, structural repairs, or the addition to, alteration
of, replacement or relocation of any plumbing, electrcal or mechanical,
wiring, piping or equipment or other work affecting health or general safety.
Section 104.1 Acd the following:

NOTE: This Section shall not prohibit the enforcement of an existing or
adoption of a fire prevention ordinance.

Section 108.0 Delele entire section and subetituie as follows:
NOTE: Refer to § 36-103 Code of Virginia,

Section 107.1 Change total paragraph 10 read as follows:
Buliding official: Each local building department shall have an executive
official in charge, who shal be known es the building official.



Section 107.2 Delete total sub-section

Section 107.7 Delete total sub-sectign

Section 100.6 Delete total sub-section

Section 100.7.1  Add the following:

The Bullding Oficial should upon request submit a monthly report to the
g:pwﬂnontofﬂoumgandmumryoowlopmmtm forms provided by

Section 110.1.a  Add following sub-section:

inspection Requirements: It shall be the responsibility of the permit holder or
his representative to notity the Building Official when certain stages of con-
struction are reached and no work requiring an inspection shall be concealed
without approval of the Building Official or his representative.

Section 110.1.b  Add following sub-section:

Inspection Time: The Building Official shall respond to inspection requests
without unreasonable delay, and shall approve the work or give written notice
of defective work to the permit holder or his agent in charge of the work. Such
defects shall be corrected and reinspected before any work proceeds that
would conceal them,

Section 110.1.c Add following sub-section:
Minimum Inspections: Inspections shall include but not be limited to:

1. The bottom of footing trenches after all reinforcement steel is set and
belore any concrete is placed.

2. The installation of piling: The Building Official may require the instal-
lation of pile foundations to be supervisd by the owner's architect or
engineer or by such professional as approved by the Building Official.

3. Reinforced concrete beams, columns and slabs afier all reinforcing is
sel before any concrete is placed.

4. Structural framing and fastenings, prior 1o covering with concealing
materials.

5. All concealed, electrical, mechanical and plumbing work prior to
installation of any concealing matarials.

6. Required insulating materials before covering with any materials,

Section 1123 Change total sub-section to read as follows:

By whom application is made: When required by the bufding official,
application for a permit shall be made by the owner or lessee of the building or
structure, or agent of either, or by the licensed angineer or architect em-
ployed in connectlion with the proposed work. If the application is made bya
person other than the owner in fee, it shall be accompanied by a duly verified
affidavit of the owner or the qualified person making the application that the
proposed work is authorized by the owner in fee and that the applicant is
authorized to make such application. The full names and addresses of the
owner, lessee, applicant and of the responsible officers, if the owner or lessee
is a corporate body, shall be stated in the application.



Section 112.3.1 Add new sub-section as follows:

ADD: Owner performance: Nothing herein contained shall prohibit the
owner of a single family dwelling, when owner occupied, from personally
undertaking construction, replacement and/or repalr of equipment in his own
residence under the conditions specified in the following sections:

Section 112.3.1.a Add new sub-section as follows:
Approval of plans: Approval of plans and final approval of the building
official shall be obtained.

Saction 112.3.1b  Add new sub-section as follows:
Permit: A permit shall be secured as herein provided before the work is
performed.

Section 112.3.1c  Add new sub-section as follows:
Work: Al work shall be performed by the owner in accordance with the
provisions of this code.

Section 112.3.1d Add new sub-section as follows:
Tests: The owner shall make application for all required inspections and
tests. ’

1125 Add the following:

Note #1. In compliance with Section 36-103, Code of Virginia, working
drawings prepared within a year prior to a change in Building Code remain
subject to the Building Code in effect prior to change.

Note #2. Use group R-4 requirements for detailed plans may be walved by
the building official, provided specifications are submitted which satisfac-
torfly indicate compliance.

11227 Add the following:

Note: Chapter 3 Title 54 Code of Virginia govemns the requirements for
architects and engineers practicing in Virginia.

113.3 Deleie total sub-section.

117.0 Delete sub-sections 117.1 thru 117.8

117.1 Substitute the following:

Fees for permits are to be established under local ordinances. Enforcement
of the Code is the responsibility of the local building department (§ 38-105,
Code of Virginia).

118.0 Delete totnl section

121.4 Change total sub-section to read as follows:

Violation penalties: §36-106. Violation amisdemeanor. It shall be unlawful
for any owner or any other person, firm or corporation, on or after the effective
date of any Code provisions, to violate any such provisions. Any such viola-
tion shall be deemed a misdemeanor and any owner or any other person, firm
or corporation convicted of such a violation shall be punished by a fine of not
more than one thousand dollars. (1972, c. 829; 1975, ¢, 367.)



121.5 Add the following:
Note: See § 38-106 of Code of Virginia

125.0 Delete Total Section

128.2.2 Change total sub-saction to read as follows:

Qualifications of board members: Each member shall be a licensed profes-
sional engineer or architect, or a builder or superintendent of building con-
struction, with at least ten (10) years of experience, for five (5) years of which
he shait kave been in responsible charge of work; and there shall not be mare
than two (2) members of the board selected from the same profession or
business; and at least one (1) of the prolessional engineers shall be a
ticensed structural or civil engineer of archilectural engineering experience.
Alternate qualifications may be allowed for local board members.

126.6 Change total sub-section to read as follows:

Board Review: Any person aggrieved by a decision of the board of appeals,
whether or not a previous party 1o the decision, or any officer or official board
of the jur sdiction, may apply 1o the State Building Code Technical Review
Board. Application for review shall be made to the State Building Code
Technical Review Board within 15 days of the filing of the board’s decision in
the office of the building official.

126.7 Add new sub-section as follows:

Court Review: An appeal from the review Board shall be in accordance with
the provisions of Section 8-6.13 of the Code ot Virginia, and an appeal shall lie
to the supreme court as provided in Section 9-6.14 ol such Code.

127.0 Delete total section.

300.1 Change total sub-section to read as followa:

Scope: The provisions of this aricle shall contro! the division of the local
jurisdiction into fire limits and the general limilations of haight and area of all
buildings hereafier erected, and extensions to existing buildings hereafter
altered or enlarged as affected by the fire and iife hazard incident to type of
construction, use group, density of development, exierior exposure and
accessibility of buildings and structure to firefighting facilities and equipment.

301.2 Change total sub-section to read as follows:

Fire limits: The fire limits shall comprise the areas containing congested
business, cormmercial manufaciuring and industrial uses or in which such
uses are developing. The limits of such areas are described as established
by local ordinance.

Table 305 Add the following:

Note: Number of siories above grade plane are determined as lollows:

The floor to ftoor distance of the lowermost level is divided into equal thirds. i
the ratio of exposed area of the lowest level exterior wall to the total area of the
lower level exterior wall is less than 1/3, the level is counted as zero stories. if
this ratio is greater than 1/3 and less than 2/3, the level is counted as one half
story; if the ratio is greater than 2/3 then the level is counted as one (1) story.



315.0 Add the following:
Note: A definition of buildings coverad and number of units required by this
section are covered by § 36-137, Coda of Virginia (see Part A).

402.2.1 Add the following:
Note: Installation in accordance with NFiPA standard 30 shall be deemed in
compliance with this Code.

406.3 Addthe
Note: Instaliation in accordanoo with NFIPA standards shall be deemed lo
be in compliance with this Code.

424.1 Dolete total sub-section, add the following:
Note: Refer to § 36-73 Code of Virginia (Industrialized Building Unit and
Mobile Home Safety Law).

424.2 Delete iotal sub-section
424.3 Delets total sub-section
424.3.1 Change total sub-section 0 read as follows:

and Tie-down:

Mobile homes shall not be permanently anchored to foundations. Where the
mobile home is 10 be used in one focation for a protracied period, a system of
stabilizing devices conforming to accepted engineering practices shall be
used. The manufacturer shall provide printed instructions with each mobile
hame specifying the location, required capacity and other details of stabiliz-
ing devices (tiedowns, piers, blocking, footings, etc.) on which the design of
the unit is based. Foolings or foundations on which piers or other stabilizing
devices are mounted shall be carried down to the established frost ling.

42432 Required Anchorags:

{a) Mobile homes installed or relocated in the Hurricane zone on or after
October 15, 1974 and mobile homes instalied or relocated outside of
the Hurricane zone on or after April 15, 1975 shall be anchored in
accordance with this section.

(b) The Hurricane zone includes the following counties and all cities
located therein, conliguous thereto, of to the east thereof:

Accomack King William Richmond
Chartes City Lancaster Surry

Essex Mathews Sussex
Gloucester Middlesex Southampton
Greensville Northumberiand Waestmoreland
Isla or Wight Northampton York

James City New Kent

King & Queen Prince George

{c) Mobile homes equipped by the manufacturer with a system of tie-
downs designed in accordance with one of the reference standards
listed at the end of this section, shall be attached vertically and

i



diagonally to a system of ground anchors in a manner adequale 1o
resist wind overtuming and sliding as imposed by the design loads.
Mobile homes hereafier installed in the Hurricane zone shall be of
*Hurricane and Windstorm Resistive” design as definad by the appli-
cable relerence standards listed at the end of this section. Mobile
homes not equipped by the manufaciurer with a system of tiedowns
shall be anchored in a manner deemed adequate by the local build-
ing official 1o resist wind overturning and sliding as imposed by the
design loads of the applicable reference standards listed below.

REFERENCE STANDARDS

(1) ANSI A119.1 (NFPA No. 501B), Standard for Mobile Homes, Body
and Frame Design and Construction Requirements, and the instalia-
Hon of Plumbing, Heating and Electrical Systems.

American National Standards Institute
1430 Broadway, New York, New York 10018

{a) Either the 1974 or 1975 Edition, until superseded by the Federal
Mobile Home construction and Salety Standards, with the fol-
lowing amendment:

Part C, Section 11.2.1 - Water Connection - Add the following
sentance: A master cold water shut off full flow valve shall be
installed on the main feeder line in an accessible area.

(2) Federal Mobile Home Construction and Salety Standards, U. S.
Dapartmaent of Housing and Urban Development; Part 280, Code of
Federal Regulations. May be used as an oplicn to the ANSI A119.1
Standard listed above.

(a) Standards published in the Federal Register, Volume 40, Number
244, on December 18, 1975 - no time limit.

424.3.3 Placementof Ground Anchors: Unless the entire tiedown, system,
including ground anchors, is designed by a professional engineer or archi-
tect ground anchors shall be placed as follows:

424 3.4 Huricane Zones: Not more than 12 {eet on centers beginning
from the front line of the mobile home stand (congruent with the front wall of
the mobile homa). Not more than 6 feet open-end spacing shall be provided
at the rear line of the mobile home stand unless additional tiedowns are
installed.

42435 Nonhumicane Zones: Not more than 24 feet on cenlers beginning
from the front line of the mobile home stand {congrusnt with the front wall of
the mobile home). Not more than 6 feet open-end spacing shall be provided
at the rear line of the mobile home stand unless addilional tiedowns are
installed.

42436 Load Capacity: Each ground anchor shall be capable of resisting
an allowable working load equal to or exceeding 3,150 pounds applied in the
direction of the tisdown. In addition, each ground anchor shall be capable of
withstanding a 50 percent overioad without failure.



424.3.7 Weather Resistance: Ground anchors shall be resistant 1o wea-
thering deterioration at least equivalent 1o that provided by a coating of zinc
on steel straping of not less than 0.30 cunces per square foot of surface
coated.

609.4 Delete: 5.7 square feet and the following - “The minimum net clear
opening height dimension shall be twenty-four (24) inches. The mini-
mum net clear opening width dimension shall be twenty (20) inches”;
five (5)

Add: Three (3) square fest and the following - “The minimum net
clear opening dimension shall be sbdeen (16) inches"; three (3)

6125.5 Security Requirement

812.5.5.1 Add the following:

Exterior Swinging Doors: Exterior swinging doors of each unit of buildings
hereafter erected or convented to residential R-1 or R-2 use shall be equipped
with a horizontal bolt dead lock, or a dead bolt with not less than five eights
(5/8") throw, and the lock on these exierior doors shall be capable of being
locked or unlocked by key from the oulside and by furm-knob from tha inside.
Allarnate devices providing equal sacurity may be substituted subject to prior
appraval by the building official.

612.5.5.2 Add the following:

Exterior Sliding Doors: Exterior sliding doors of units of buildings hereatter
erected or converted to residential R-1 or R-2 use shall be equipped with
locks or hardenad steel inserts with mounting screws for the lock case
inaccessible from the outside.Tha lock bolt shall engage the strike sufficiently
to prevent ils being disengaged by any possible movement of the door with
the space of clearance provided for installation and operation. These
requirements shall apply to sliding doors opening into patios or balconies
which are one story or less above grade, are shared by two or more dwelling
units, or are otherwise accessible from the outside. Altemate devices pro-
viding equal security may be substituted subject to prior approval by the
building official.

812.5.5.3 Add the following:

Window Latches: Window latches shall be provided on all windows which
are less than ten fest (10") from the adjoining ground level, or otherwise
accessible from the outside for all buildings hereatfter erected or converted o
residential R-1 or R-2 usa.

724.1 Change total sub-section to read as follows:
Frost protection: Except when erected upon solid rock or otherwise pro-
tected from frost, foundation walls, piers and other parmanent supports of all
buildings and structures larger than one hundred (100) square feet in area or
ten (10) feet in haight shall extend below the frost line of the locality, and
spread footings of adequate size shall be provided when necessary to
properly distribute the load within the allowable bearing vaiue of the soil. Or,
such structures shall be supported on piles or ranging timbers when solid
earth to mock is not available. Footings shall not be founded on frozen soils
3



unless such frozen condition is of 2 permanent characier. The building official
shall insert focal frost depth, however, the minimum frost line depth shall be
twelve (12} inches.

8728

Change total sub-section to read as follows:
Where a structure is located in a One Hundred (100} Year

fiood plain, the following performance standards must be salislied.

(a)

(b)

(c)

(d)
(@)
1))

The lowest floor (including basement) of all new construction or sub-
stantial improvements to exisling structures must be built at or above
the level of the One Hundred (100) Year Fiood with the exception that
non-residential structures, together with attendant utility and sanitary
tacilities, may be floodproofed to that level in a watentight manner with
walls substantially impermeable to the passage of water and with
structural components having the capability of resisting hydrostatic
and hydrodynamic loads and the effects ol buoyancy.

Provide that all new construction and substantial improvements to
existing structures within identified coastal high hazard areas be
constructed on adequalely anchored pilings or columns, and secure-
ly anchored to such piles or columns so that the lowes! portion of the
structural members of the lowest llcor (excluding the pilings and
columns} is elevated to or above the level of One Hundred (100) Year
Fiood. The space below the lowest floor shall remain Iree from ob-
slructions or be constructed with “breakaway walls” intended to
collapse under stress withoul jeopardizing the structural support of
the structure so that the impact on the structure by abnormally high
tides and wind-driven waler is minimized,

A certification by a regislered professional engineer or architect shall
be required to assure thal the fioodprooling and anchoring provisions
ol subsections (a) and (b) have been satisfied.

All structures shall be anchored lo prevent fiotation, collapse, or
lateral movement.

In idenlified coastal high hazard areas, the use of fill tor structural
support of buildings shall be prohibited.

All mobile homes, whether placed in a new, expanded, substantially
improved mobile home park or mobile home subdivision, or placed on
an individual lot, shall adhere to the following:

1.) Each mobile home shall be constructed and anchored in accor-
dance with the provisions of the “Virginia Industrialized Building
Unit and Mobile Home Safety Regulations - Part One.”

2.) Adequate surlace drainage and access for a mobile home hauler
shall be provided.

3.) Stands or lots shall be elevated on compact fill or pilings so that
the towest floor of each mobile home will be at or above the level of
the One Hundred (100) Year Flood



4.) When mobile homes are lo be elevaled on piiings, lots shall be
large enough to permit steps, piles shall be placed in stable soil
no more than ten (10) feet apar, and reinforcement shall be
provided for pilings more than six (6) feet above ground level.

{g) Provide that all on-site waste disposal systems are located to avoid
impairment to them and contamination from them during flooding.

DEFINITIONS

1. Coastal High Hazard Area
An area subject to high velocity waters; including but not limited to hurri-
cane wave wash,

2. Moblie Home
A structure, transportable in one or more sections, which is eight body feet
or more in width and is thirty-two body leet or more in length, and which is
built on a permanent chasis, and designed to be used with or without
permanent foundation, when connected 1o the required utilities, and in-
cludes the plumbing, heating, air-conditioning, and slectrical systems
contained therein.

3. One Hundred (100) Year Flood
A flood that has one (1) chance in one hundred (100) or a one percent (1%)
chance of being equaled or exceeded in any given year.

4. Substantial iImprovement
A.) Any repair, reconstruction, or improvement of a structure, the cost of
which equals or exceeds 50 percent of the market value of the struo-
fure either,

{1) belore the improvement or repair is started or

(2) if the structure has been damaged, and is being restored,
before the damage occurred.
For the purposes of this definition “substantial improvement" ig considared to
occur when the first alteration of any wall, ceiling, floor, or other structural part
of the building commences, whether or not that alteration affacts the external
dimensions of the structure. The term does not, however, include either,

(1) any project for improvernent of a structura to comply with exist-
ing state or local health, sanitary, or safety code specifications
which are solely necessary 10 assure sale living conditions or

(2) any alteration of a structure listed on the National Register of
Historic Places or a State Inventory or Historic Maces,

B.) The repair, reconstruction or improvement of the streets, utilities and
pads in a mobile home park or mobile home subdivision which
equals or exceeds 50 percent of the value of the streets, utilities and
pads belore the repair, reconstruction or improvement has com-
menced.



907.7 Add the following:

Nots: Fire refardant treated plywood shall be considered as an approved
non-cumbustible material.

1100.2 Change total sub-section to reed as follows:

Mechanical code: All mechanical equipment and systems shall be con-
structed, installed and maintained in accordance with the mechnical code
listed in Appendix B. insta¥ation of bollers and pressure vessels shall also
mp&wmmmamm&mmmmﬂmgm-

1 100.3 Add new sub-ssction to read as follows:

Air Pollution Control: The requirements for air pollution control shall be as
prescribed by the State Air Pollution Control Board.

1300.2 Change total sub-section to resd as follows:

Otherlaws: Nothing herein contained shall be construed to nullify any rules,
regulations or statutes of stale agencies governing the protection of the
public or workmen from health or other hazards involved in manulacturing,
mining and other processes and operalions which generate toxic gases, dust
or other elements dangerous to the respiratory system, eyesight or health.
Note: Cartain provisions are regulated by the Department of Labor and

Section 1508.0 Add the following:

Note: Electrical power for artificial lighting shall be limited in accordance
with the criteria specified in ASHRAE Standard 90-75 listed in Appendix B
and IES Lighting Handbook. This pertains to all structures of 10,000 square
feet or maore gross floor area.

1702.1.1 Add new sub-section as follows:

Private sewage disposal:  When water closets or other plumbing fixtures
are installed in buildings which are not located within a reasonable dislance
of a sewer, suitable provisions shall be made for dispc sing ol the building
sewage by some method of sewage ireatmenl and disposal salislactory to
the administrative authority having jurisdiction. When an individual sewage
system is required, the control and design of this system shall be as approved
by the State Departrnent of Health, who must approva the location and design
of the system and septic tanks or other means of disposal. Pumping and
elactrical equipment shail be the responsibility of the building official. When
requested in accordance with Section 109. Administrative prodecures, modi-
fications may be granted by the building official to use pit privies or other
maans for reasons of hardship, unsuitable soil conditions or temporary recre-
ational use, upon compliance with the following conditions:

A. A single parcel of land owned by applicant and single family dwelling
being constructed for own use. State Health Department, to approve design
and location of sanitary faciities prior to the issuance of bullding permit.

Note: The design, inspection and approval of any and all fiti stations is the
rasponsibility of the Building Official.



1. Temporary recreational use siructures and buildings shall mean any
structure or building occupied intermittently for recreational purposes only.
Such structures or buildings shall be located in areas only as prascribed by
local jurisdiction. Such structures or buildings shalil not be focated within an
approved or recorded residential subdivision.

2. Requests found not in compliance with the requirements of tem Aand B
above, shall be determined on an individual basis by the local building official
in conjunction with the State Health Departmant.

1704.3 Change total sub-section io read as follows:
Private water supply: When public water mains are not available, a private
source of water supply may be used provided samples are submitied perio-
dically to the health official for analysis and approval and the use of such
source of supply has been approved by him and the building official. When
private walter supply is required, the location, construction and testing of the
water source shall be as approved by the local State Health Department.
Plumbing, pumping and electrical equipment are the responsibility of the
building official.
Note: The State Department of Health should approve the design and
location of private sewer and water systems prior to issuance of a
Building Permit.

1800.1 Change total sub-section to read as follows:

Scope: The provisions of this article shall govem the materials and methods
of construction of all prefabricated buildings, prefabricated subassemblies
and prefabricated building units as herein defined. Reference is made to the
Virginia industrialized Building Unit and Mobile Home Safely Regulations for
the construction of modular struciures.



APPENDIX B

CONCRETE
Delete the following:
Reinlorced Concrete - Building Code Requirements for . . .. ACI 318-71
1876 Accumulative Supplement ... ... ... . ... .. . AC)-76
Add the following:

Reinforced Concrete - Building Code Requirements for . . .. ACI 318-77
EQUIPMENT

Delets the foliowing:
Elevalors, Dumbwaiters, Escalators and Moving Walks
-SaletyCodefor...... .. ......... .. .. ... ANSIA17.1-71
- 1972 Supplement . . . .. i R L, ......ANSIA17.1a-72
- 1873 Supplement . ... ... e ANSIA17.1b-73
- 1974 Supplement ... ... ... R ANSIA17.1c-74
-19°5Supplement .. . ........... ... .. .. .. . ANSIA17.1del75
Add the following:

American National Standard Safety Code for Elevators. Dumbwaiters,
Escalators and MovingWalks . ........... ... ... .ANSIA17.1-1978



PartE
BOCA Basic Plumbing Code/1978

Note: Any reference lo Plumbing Official shall be construed to mean Build-
ing Official.

P-109.0 Delete this total section and add the following:
Note: Reler to Article 1 of the BOCA Basic Building Code/1978.

P-110.0 Delete this total section and add the following:
Note: Referto Article 1 of the BOCA Basic Building Code/1978.

P-122.0 Delete this total section and add the following:
Note: Refer to Article 1 of the BOCA Basic Building Code/1978.

Table P-1202.1, page 107 - Delets Note 11.

Article 15 Delete this total Article and add the following:
Note: Refer to Article 17, BOCA Basic Building Code/1978, as amended.

P-1601.0 Delete this toial section and add the following:
Note: Refer lo Article 17. BOCA Basic Building Code/1978, as amended.

Article 17 Delete this total Article and add the following:
Note: Refer to Article 17, BOCA Basic Building Code/1978, as amendad.






Part F
BOCA Basic Mechanical Code/1978

Note: Any relerence to Mechanical Official shall be construed 1o mean
Building Official.

M-109.0 Delete total section and add the following:
Note: Refer to Article 1, BOCA Basic Building Code/1978, as amended.
M-110.0 Delete total section and add the following:
Note: Refer to Article 1, BOCA Basic Building Code/1978, as amended.

M-122.0 Delate total section and add the following:

Note: Refer i Article 1, BOCA Basic Building Code/1978, as amended.
M-301.1 Change last paragraph to read as follows:

For special applications such as hospitals, laboratories, supermarkets, ther-
mally sensitive equipment, computer rooms, and manufacluring processes,
the design concepts and paramelers shall conform to the requirements of the
application at minimum energy levels.

Article 11 Delete total Article and add the foliowing:
Note: Refer to the requirements of the State Air Poliution Control Board,

41






PartG
One and Two Family Dwelling Code/1975

Chapter 1.

Note #1: Energy conservation Standards are as follows;

Building Envelope - Chaptar 20, BOCA Basic Building Code/1978
Electrical - Section 1506.0, BOCA Basic Building Code/1978
Mechanical Equipment - Arlicle 3, BOCA Basic Mechanical Code/1978
Plumbing - Section 1606, BOCA Basic Plumbing Code/1978

Note #2: One and Two Family Dwellings designed and consiructed in

accordance with Farmers Home Administration and/or HUD Energy Stan-

gards shall be deemed in compliance with the Uniform Statewide Building
ode.

Sections R-104 thru A-113: Delete in total
Add following: Note - Refer to Article 1, BOCA Basic Building Code/1978

Section R-206: Change to read as follows:
Habitable rooms shall have an average ceiling height of not less than 7 feet 6
inches in at least 50 percent of their required area with no portion less than 5
feet in height.
Exceplion: Beams and girders spaced not less than 4 feet on center
may project not more than 6 inches below tha required average ceiling
height.
(Ali other rooms, including hallways and corridors, shall have a ceiling height
of not lass than 7 feet measured !0 the lowest projection from the ceiling.)

Section R-207: Change to read as follows:

Every dwelling unit shall be provided with a water cioset, lavatory, bathiub, or
shower, kitchen area, and every kitchen area shall be provided with a sink.
Request for Varlance

Variances to Section R-207 may be granted for reason of hardship, unsuitable
soil condition or temporary recreational use by the local building official, upon
agresment of the local Health Department, when such variance is in the
sound discretion of the local building official, necessary for the reasons
stated above.

EXCEPTION: Said variance may be granted and permit issued by the local
building official when the following conditions are complied with:

(1) A single parcel of land owned by applicant and building being con-
structed for own use.

(2) Local Health Department approval of sanitation facilities.

(3) Building and sanitation facilities to be located not less than 1000 feet from

nearest residence.

(4) Temporary recreational use structures and buildings shall mean any

structure or building occupied intermittently for recreational purposes only.
4



Such structures or buildings shall be localed in areas only as prescribed by
local jurisdiction. Such structures or buildings shall not be located within an
approved of recorded subdivision.

Section R-209: Delete In total and add the following:
Note: Glazing Standards are as lollows:
Architectural Glazing Materials — Safety
Standardfor .................. ..CPSC 16 — CFR Part 1201; 42FR1428

NOTE: Pursuant to the Consumer Products Salety Act (Federal Public Law
92-573), the Consumer Product Safety Commission has established
this Salety Standard for Architeciural Glazing Materials (effective
July 6, 1977). This standard prescribes which architecturat features
and field installed configurations of glazing must be provided with
appropriate glazing due to human impact hazards and prescribes
standards of compasition and testing which define appropriate
glazing for human impact hazards. The Consumer Product Safety
Act preempls state and focal govemment requirements unless
indentical to those of this standard. Certain salety glazing as listed
below have been administratively exempted.

Satety Glazing Material Used in Buildings — Performance

Specifications and Methods of Testfor ............. ANSIZ297.1 —72/75

NOTE: For products incorporating glazing material which are manufac-
tured, fabricated, or assembled between July 6, 1977, and July 5,
19;3. and where such glazing was manutactured before July 6,
1977.

Section R-211: Delete In total and add the following:

Not less than one exit conforming to this Chapter shall be provided from each
dwelling unit,

Every sleeping room shall have at least one {1) operable window or exterior
door approved for emergency egress or rescue. The units must be operable
from the inside to a full clear opening without the use of separate tools. Where
windows are provided as a means of egress or rescue they shall have a sill
height of not more than forty-four (44) inches above the floor.

All egress or rescue windows from sleeping rooms must have a minimum net
clear opening of three (3) square feet. The minimum net clear opening
dimension shall be sixteen (16) inches.

Section R-212: Delets in total and add the following:

The required exit door shall be a side-hinged door not less than 3 feet in width
and 6 feet B inches in height. The minimum width of a hallway or exit access
shall be not less than 3 feet.

Section R-213: Dedete in total and add the following:

A landing shali be pravided on each side of an exit door. The fioor or landing
shall not be more than 1% inches lower than the threshold of the doorway.
Where doors open over landings, The landing shall have a length and width of
3 teet minimum. A door may open on the top of a flight of stairs provided the

4“4



door does not swing over the 1op step and the top step is not more than 7%
inches below the threshold level.

Section R-215: Changes as follows:
1st. paragraph - no change
2nd. paragraph - Porchas, balconies or raised floor surfaces located more
than 30 inches above the floor or grade below shall have

: guardrails not less than 36 inches in height.

3rd. paragraph - no change
Section R-216: Delete in total and add the following:
Smoke detector: Each sleeping area shall be provided with a minimum of
one approved listed and labeled smoke deteclor installed adjacent to the
sleeping area. The detector shall be installed in a manner and location
consistent with its listing and sense visible and invisible particles of combus-
lion. When actualed the detector shall provide an alarm suitable to wam
occupants within the sleeping araa.

Section R-217: Add new section as follows:

Foam plastics: 1. General. excepl where specifically exempled by sub-
section 2 below, foam plaslics shall have a flame spread rating of not more
than 75 and shall have a smoke developed rating of not more than 450 when
tested in accordance with approved standards in the thickness intended lor
use. Specific requirements. The lollowing requirements shall apply to all
uses of foam plastics in or on the walls, ceiling or bolh, or in attics, roof or
floors, crawl spaces or similar areas. Foam plastics may be used in the
following locations: Within the cavity of a masonry or concrete wall. 2.1.2 On
the room side surface of contorming walls or ceiling or other surfaces referred
to in the first sentence of Section R-217.2, provided the foam plastic is fully
protected from the interior of the building by a thermal barrier of ¥-inch
gypsum wallboard having a finish rating of not less than 15 minutes or other
approved material having an equivalent finish rating. Thermal barriers shall
be installed in a manner such that they will remain in place for a minimumof 15
minutes under the same test conditions. Trim, picture molds, chair rails,
baseboards, handrails and show window backing may be of wood. Foam
plastic trim covering not more than 10 percent of the wall or ceiling area may
be used provided such trim has a density of no less than 20 pounds per cubic
foot, has a maximum thickness of ¥2-inch and a maximum width of 4 inches,
and has & flame spread rating no greater than 75. Foam plastics may ba used
as a roof covering if the foam plastic is a part of a Class A, B or C roofing
assembly. That plastic loam which is nearest the interior of the building shall
be protected by an approved barrier which need not have a 15-minute finish
raling. Ordinary roof coverings, other than Class A, B or C, may be applied
over foam plastic when the foam is separated from the interior of the building
by plywood sheathing not less than Yz-inch in thickness with exterior glue,
with edges supporled by blocking, tongue and groove joints, or other
approved type of edge supporl, or an equivalent material. Foam plastic
having a flame-spread rating of 75 or less may be used as siding backer
board with a maximum of 3/8-inch thickness when.it is of not more than 2000
BTU per square foot and is separated from the interior of the building by not
less than 2 inches of mineral insulation or equivalent.

45



separated from the interior of the building by not less than 2 inches of mineral
insulation or equivalent.

Section R-218: Add new section as follows:

Flame spread:1. General. Flame spread requirements for finishes shall not
apply to trim defined as picture moids, chair rails, baseboards and handrails;
to doors and windows or their frames; nor to materials which are less than
1/28 inch in thickness cemeted to the surface of walls or ceilings, if these
materials have flame spread characteristics no greater than paper of this
thickness cemented to a noncombustible backing. Testing. Tests shall be
made in accardance with the standards set forth in the model codes in order
to arrive at flame spread or smoke density ratings. Flame spread. All rooms
shall have a flame spread classilication of not greater than 200. Exception:
Flame spread requiremenis are not applicable to balhrooms. 4. Smoke
density. The smoke density shall be no greater than 450.

Section R-303: Make changes as follows:

1st. paragraph - All exterior walls, bearing walls, columns and piers shall be
supported on solid masonry or concrete footings, or other
approved structural systems which shall be of sufficient
design to suppon safely the loads imposed as determined
from the character of the soil, and shall in all cases axtend
below the frost line. Minimum concrete or masonry bearing
walls shall be as set forth in Figure No. A-3.

2nd. paragraph - no change
3rd. paragraph - no change
Figure A-3: Change the figure as follows:

The basement fioor slab dimension in the first diagram, should be changed
from 4 inches lo 3%z inches.

Section R-308: Revise the last paragraph to read as follows:

Lumber and plywood required to be preservatively treated in accordance
with this code as set forth in Seclion 5-26.308 shall bear the quality mark of an
approved inspecticn agency.

Section R-402:

1. Add a new sentence to the end of ltem 1 10 read as lollows;

Approved end-jointed lumber may be used interchangeably with solid sawn
membears of the species and grade.

2. ltem 2 - no change

3. Add the lollowing paragraph to item 3:

Interior nonbearing partitions may be capped with a single lop plate installed
to provide overlapping at cormers and at intersections with other walls and
partitions. The plate shall be continuously tied at joints by solid blocking at
least 16 inches in length and equal in size 1o the plate or by 1/8 x 1% inc*
metal ties with spliced sections fastened with two 16d nails on each side of the
joint.

48



4. ltem 4 - no change
5. Change Item 5 to read as follows;

Headers. The allowable spans for headers in bearing walls shall not exceed
the values set torth in Table No. 4-B.

Table 4-B: Delete second sentence of Footnote 4. Add new foolnote 6 10
read as follows:

6. Spans and header sizes may be computed independently of the above
fable when designed in accordance with accepied engineering practice and
substantiating data is provided and submitted as required.

Section R-410.2.6: Change o read as lollows:

When the grouting is stopped for one hour or longer, horizontal construction
joints shall be formed by stopping the pour of grout not less than ¥e-inch
below the top of the uppermost unit grouted. Horizontal steel shall be fully
imbedded by grout in an uninterrupted pour.

Section R—802: Add new sentence to ltem 1 to read as follows:
Approved end-jointed lumber may be used interchangeably with solid sawn
members of the same species and grade.

Table No.8-C: Delate second sentence of Footnote #1. Add new Foolnole
#4 1o read as follows:

4. Spans and header sizes may be computed independently of the above
table when designed In accordance with accepted engineering practice and
subtantiating data is provided and submitied as required.



Table No. 6-E: Changue to read as foliows:
Table No. 8-E

ALLOWABLE SPANS FOR PLYWOOD FLOOR AND
ROOF SHEATHING CONTINUOUS OVER TWO OR MORE SPANS
AND FACE GRAIN PERPENDICLUALAR TO SUPPORTS

ROOF 2
Maarnum Load Capacdy Floor
Parsl Porel Span {ins Pounds Per Maumum
uﬂ?\ Thchnes (M nches) Squars Foot} Spand
Edoesd | Ecom Tol tve | (nmches)
biocked | Unbiocked | Load Load
120 ane 12 155 150 a
1 518, 38 18 95 15 0
200 518 8 20 7% € 0
240 .2 24 24 65 s 0
12 ) 0 2 70 50 125
2ne 1/2.5/8 2 2 58 0 187
6 En % 0 55 50 167
42720 578, 34, 118 2 » 408 256 207
4824 N4 T8 L] k.1 408 156 24

1, n-uvn-mhsumulmn.m-umwcce.wmg-mmy Spans shall be
leratect 10 veluss sh ol wflect of ioads

2. Urviomn ioad deflection ktsison. 11180 of the $pan under kve Iosd plus dead load 17240 uncar irve load only

3 identitcanon index appears on ol panels s the constucton graces ksied in Footnote No 1 The numarsier and

denormenaion

4

Teprésent the aliowabis apans kr rools foors respecively Tor Diocked paneia

! Wm“mmwmmmmwmwmm.m
Ya-nch thick L} o hrugh fioos W 25/32-mch wood 3tnp  Allowabia undom
loadtased on deflachon of 1/360 of spen 18 185 pounds par squans kol

3. May be H-nch i 25/32-nth wood stip fioonng i netalied 81 Hoht angies (0 ot

& For rool ive ioad of 40 pounds per square 0ot o 0Ll Ined of 55 pawncds per squars foot decreased spensby 13
Pov canl of ube panal with ne sl greeter identhcaton ndex

7. May be 24-nch i 25/X2-inch wond strip iconng i snatalied & nght angles 10 psty

8. Edpges may be blocked with kenber or other ype ol sdge

Figure A-8: Delete the following: "Solid blocking over girder.”

Section R-702: Add a new sentence to end of Item 1 10 read as follows:
Approved end-jointed lumber may be used interchangeably with solid sawn
members of the same species and grade.

Section R-708: Change o read as follows:
A readily accessible attic access opening not less than 22 inches by 30
inches shalt be provided 1o any attic area having a clear height of over 30
inches.
Section R-803: Add a new paragraph to read as lallgws;
Composition asphalt organic felt shingles: Asphalt shingfes laid with double
coverage may be installed on slopes as low as 2 inches to 12 inches,
provided the shingles are approved self-sealing or are hand sealed and are
installed with an underlayment consisting of two layers of Type 15 fell, applied
shingle fashion. In areas where the January daily average temperature is 25
degrees F. or less, or where there is a possibility of ice lorming along the
eaves and causing a back up of water, the two layers of feit should be
cemenled together from the eaves up the roof to overlie a point 24 inches
inside the interior wall line of the building.
Chapters 9 thru25: Delete in total
Refer to appropriate BOCA Mechanical Code, BOCA
Plumbing Code or National Electircal Code




Chapter 26: Change as foliows:

Section S-26.001

Revise address to read:

AWPB - American Wood Presarvers Bureau
P.0. Box 6085, Arlington, Virginia 22206
Section S-26.401

Revise the following standards to read:

National Design Specification for Wood Construction. Na-
tional Forest Products Assaciation (1977 with November
1977 Supplement).

Redwood. Standard Specifications for Grades of Caiifor-
nia Redwood Lumber of the Redwood Inspection Service
(Second Printing — 1975 including Supplements Nos. 1
and 2).

TPI-74. Design Specilications for Light Metal Plate Con-
necied Wood Trusses (1974).

Western Lumber. Standard Grading Rules, Western Wood
Products Assaciation (July 1, 1974).

Wood Poles. Specifications and Dimensions for Wood
Poles. ANSI05.1-1972.

Canadian Lummber. Standard Grading Rules for Canadian
Lumber, U.S. edition (July 1, 1973). Approved by the
American Lumber Standards Board of Raview.

Seclion 5-26.601
Revise the following standard to read:

Canadian Dimension Lumber, Revised Edition 1972, Cana-
dian Wood Council.

Section S-26.701

Revise the following standard to read:
Canadian dimension Lumber, Revised Edition 1972, Cana-
dian Wood Council.



Appendix: Substitute new Snow Load map as follows;




PartH

inconsistent Local Buliding Codes and Regulstions Repealed

All building codes and regulations of the counties, municipalities and State
agencies in conflict herewith are repealed as called for in Article 1, Chapter 6,
Title 36 (§ 36-98 at. seq.) of the Code of Virginia 1950, as amended.

5



Pastl

SAVINGS CLAUSE .

Nothing in these regulations hereby adopted shall be construed to affect any
suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights acquitied, or liability
incumed, or any cause or causes of action acquired or existing, ynder any act
or local regulations repealed as cited in Part H of these regulations; nor shall
any just or legal right or remady of any characler be lost, impaired or affected

these regulations.



PARTJ

Dats of Acceptance

The Board of Housing and Community Development shall certify 1o the
adoption of thase regulations and cause the same to be published as
requirad by the statutes of Virginia, and these regulations are effective August
1,1978.



Part K
Membership

Director of the Department of Housing and Community Development
The Honorable O. Gene Dishner

Board of Housing and Commtmity Development

Mr. John Dillard Powell, Chairman Mr. William T, Clements
Ridgeway, Virginia Norton, Virginia

Mr. Beverly R. Middleton, Vice Chairman Mr. J. B. Hall, Jr.
Virginia Beach, Virginia Richmond, Virginia

Mr. Thomas M. Batchelor, Jr. Mr. Emil M. Keen
Charlottesville, Virginia Alexandria, Virginia
Mr. T. W. Bloeafield Mr. Othel N, Sparks
Richmond, Virginia Richmond, Virpinia

Mr. Joseph D. Stoutamire, Jr.
Salem, Virginia

State Building Code Technical Review Board

Mr. Walter R. Nexsen, Chairman Mr. Sidney W. Galloway
Norfolk, Vivginis Richmond, Virginia

Mr. Bernard E. Cooper, Vice Chairman Mr. Harry E. Diezel
Richmond, Virginias Virginia Beach, Virginia
Mr. Herman F. Blake, Jr. Mr. Philip 0. Shepherd, Jr.
Richmond, Virginia Arlington, Virginia

Mr, Oliver P, Strawn, Jr.
Blacksburg, Virginia

Building Code Section
Jack A. Proctor, Administrator
Supervisors
John C. Drinkard

H. Leon Mann
Milton R. Nash, Jr.



. Part L-Revision updates 1979 Legislation

§ 38-88. Board to promulgate Statewide Code; other codes and
regulations superseded; exceptions; coordination of regulations of
Board and other agencies. — The Board is hereby directed and empowered
io adopt and promulgate a Uniform Statewide Building Code. Such building
code shall supersede the building codes and regulations of the counties,
municipalities and State agencies, but this shall not prevent other State
agencies from adopting, administering and enforcing regulations promuligated
pursuant to other State law which explicitly confers such authority, provided
such regulations do not conflict with the construction and maintenance
requirements of the Uniform Slatewide Building Code. The Board and other
State agencies shall coordinate their various regulations in such a manner as
io eliminate conflicts with the Uniform Statewide Building Code; provided,
however, that nothing herein shall prohibit the State Board of Health or the
State Water Control Board from promulgating regulations relating to the
sanitary condilions of domeslic water and sewerage services pursuani 1o the
provisions of Title 32.1 and chapter 3.1 of Title 62.1 (§ 62.1-44.2 et seq.) of the
Code. (1972, c. 829; 1977, ¢, 613, 1979, c. T18))

§ 36-99.1. Certification of electrical, plumbing and bullding related
mechanical workers. — No electrical worker or plumbing worker or building
related mechanical worker shall be required to be examined or certified by the
Board or by the locality at the direction of the Board if such person was certified
or licensed for two years prior to January one, nineteen hundred eighty, in
accordance with provisions made by the Conimonwealth, (1974,¢.437,1977,
c. 613; 1978, cc. 268, 751; 1979, c. 352.)

§ 38-105. Enforcement of Code; appeals from decisions of local
department. — Enforcement of the Building Code shall be the responsibility of
the local building departimenti. There shall be astablished within each local
building department a local board of Building Code appeals whose
composition, duties and responsibilities shall be prescribed in the Building
Code. Appeals from the local building depariment concerning application of
the Building Code or refusal to grant a modification 1o the provisions of the
Code covering the manner of construction or materials 10 be used in the
eraction, alteration or repair of a building or structure shall first lie to the local
board of Buitding Code appeals. No appeal io the State Building Code
Technica! Review Board shall fie prior to a final determination by the local
board of Building Code appeals. Whenever a county or a municipality does not
have such a building depariment or board of Building Code appeals, the local
governing body shall enter into an agreement with the locat governing body of
another county or municipality or with some other agency, or a State agency
approved by the Depariment for such enforcement and appeals resulling
therafrom. Fees may be levied by the local goveming body in order o defray
the cost of such enforcement and appeals.

Any building may be inspected at any time before completion, and shall not
be deemed in compliance until approved by the inspecting authority but where
the construction cost is less than one thousand dollars the building inspection
may, in the discretion of the inspecting authority, be waived. The building
official shall coordinate all reporis with inspections for compliance of the
Buiiding Code, from fire and health officials delegated such authority, prior to
issuance of an occupancy permit. (1972, c. 829; 1974, ¢. 433; 1977, cc. 423,
613; 1978, ¢. 578.) 55



Part L-Revision updates 1HOU Lugisisuun .

§ 36-98. Board to Statewide Code: other codes and reguisations -
cporodads aresplionn, — Board i directad and empowered to-
llldmulnnlUnifmSuuw‘i.thB Cod..Sudlbuﬂdmteodo

the codas and ions of the counties,
tha superseds the building et reguiations g
wﬁ- and' x Ho .

false statement, representation. impersonation or ather
frauduient shail be commenced within five years naxt after the
commission of the offenss; and in a prosscution for violation of laws 93'
thoplmtofehﬂdrnforadwﬁmwithwtaﬁmpmmmgﬁa.l-l

of the Code, no sttion shall be commenced sfter the expiration of one year from



al U i I
momwmwdw fiil mmmm I
i T
mmm mmmwm b il 1l
SRARERa pBadsil  WBoedy ASg0
ke S L
itk i (e
it il s
it it S s

57



Part L-Revision updates

Changes Adopled by the Beard

‘ .

te the 1978 Accumulative Supplement
to the Unltorm Statewide Building Codo,

Porl B, Boca Dazle Bulidlng Cade /1078

The entire text of the Code Sections as amended by the
Board is printed below. They become effective January
1, 1981.

Section 112.1 Change to read as follows:

When permit is required: It shall be unlawful to
construct, enlarge, alter or demolish a structure; or
change the occupancy of a building or structure
requiring greater strength, exitway or sanitary pro-
visions; or to change to another use; or to install
or alter any equipment for which provisgion is made or
installation or which is regulated by this code, with-
out first filing an application with the building
official in writing and obtaining the required per-
mit therefor; except that ordinary repairs, as de-
fined in Section 102.0, which do not involve any vio-
laticn of this code shall be exempt from this pro-
vision. The building official may, at his discretion,
authorize work to be commenced pending receipt of the
written application and issuance of the required per-
mit.

Section 112.2 Change to read as follows:
Form of application: The application for a permit

shall be submitted on such form as the building
official may prescribe.



Table 305 Change the note added by the 1978 amendment to
read as follows:

Note i. MNumber of stories above grade plane are deter-
mined as follows: The floor to floor distance of the
lowermost level is divided into equal thirds. If the
ratio of exposed area of the lowest level exterior
wall to the total area of the lower level exterior is
less than 1/3, the level is counted as zero stories.
If the ratio is greater than 1/3 and less than 2/3,
the level is counted as one half story; if the ratio
is greater than 2/3 then the level is counted as one
(1) story. This note shall not apply to one and two
family dwellings or to multiple single family dwell-
ings erected side-by-side.

Section 1502.4 Reinspection: Change to read as follows:

The bullding official may require reinspection of an
electrical installation from which electrical service
has been discontinued for a period of thirty (30)
days or more before service may be restored.

APPENDIX B

ACCEPTED ENGINEERING PRACTICE STANDARDS
Unclassified Miscellaneous

Add the following:

An Illustrated Handbook of the Handicapped
Section of the North Carolina State
Building Code - 77.....State of North Carolina
Making Bulldings and Facilities Accessible to and
Usable by Physically Handicapped People -
Specifications for.....ANSI A117.1-80



Part L-Revision updates 19817 Legisiation

% 15.1-114. Ordinances certifying certain plumbers, building-related
mechanical workers and electricians. — A. The governing body of a county,
city or town may, subject to the limitations of paragraph D, herein, by d tly
adopted ordinance, require any person, who engages in, or offers to engage in,
for the Fenernl public for compensation, plumbing, building-related mechani-
cal or electrical work in such county, city or town, to obtain a certificate from
such county, city or town. .

B. Such ordinance shall require the applicant for such certificate to furnish
evidence of his ability and proficiency; shall require the examination of every
such applicant to determine his qualifications; shall designate or establish an
agent or board for the county, city or town to examine and determine a person’s
qualifications for certification: and shall refuse to grant a certificate to an
apElicant found not to be qualified.

. In accordance with the Administrative Process Act (chapter 1.1:1 (%
9-6.14:1 et ae(}_.l of Title 9 of the Code of Virginia), the Director of the State
Department ol Houainﬁ and Community Development shall establish stan-
dards to be used in determining an applicant's ability, proficiency and
qualifications.

No person certified pursuant to this section or certified or licensed pur-
suant to 3 36-99.1 shall be required to obtain such a certificate or pay a fee in
any other county, city or town in which he practices his trade. After a %ers;n

y the

. has been certified under an apprenticesh ﬁ program which in apiroved

60

Virginia Apprenticeship Council, he shall not'be required by the governing
bodﬁ of any county, city, or town to obtain a certificate from or to pay a fee to
such county, city, or town.
E. Any such ordinance adopted by a county, city or town may provide for
gggalties not exceeding those applicable to Class 3 misdemeanors. (1978, c.
; 1978, c. 362; 1981, c. 331.)

§ 40.1-117. Apprenticeship Council; membership and terms of office;
meetings and duties. — The Governor shall appoint an Apprenticeship Coun-
cil, composed of three representatives each from employer and employee orga-
nizations respectively, and all of whom shall be familiar with apprenticeable
occupations. The Commissioner of Labor and Industry and the State Director
of Vocational Education, or their designated representative, shall be members,
ex officio, of the Council. At the beginning of each year the Governor shall
designate one member to serve as chairman. The original appointments having
been for terms of one, two and three years and all successors having been
anointed for three years, each member hereafter shall be appoirited for a term
of three years. Any member appointed to fill a vacancy occurring prior to the
expiration of the term of his predecessor shall be appointed for the remainder
of such term. All members, including ex officio members. shall have voting
privileges.

The Apprenticeship Council shall meet at the call of the chairman of the
S:)uncil and shall formulate policies for the effective administration of this

apter.

e Apprenticeship Council shall establish standards for apprentice
agreements which shall not be lower than those prescribed by this chapter and
those established pursuant to subsection C of § 15.1-11.4. and shall perform
such other functions as may be necessary to carry out the intent and purposes
of this chapter. Not less than once a year the Counci! shall make a report of
its activities and findings to the General Assembly and to the public. (Code
1950 (Repl. Vol. 1953), § 40-123; 1968, c. 273: 1970, c. 321; 1978, c. 206: 1980,
¢. 728; 1981, c. 331.)



§ 16.1-20.9. Smoke detectors in certain buildings. — The governing
body of any county, city, or town, notwithstanding any contrary provision of
law, general or srecia . may require by ordinance that smoke detectors be
installed in the following structures or buildings constructed prior to the adop-
tion of the Uniform Statewide Building Code: (i) any multifamilr buildin
containing four or mure dwelling units, (ii} any hotel or motel re? arlly usetﬁ
offered for, or intended to be used to provide overnight sleeping
accommodations for one or more persons, and 11ii) rooming houses refu&rly
used, offered for, or intended to be used to provide overnight sleeping
accommodations and which contain more than lour units. Smoke detectors
installed pursuant to this section shall be installed in confermance with the
provisions of the Uniform Statewide Building Code. The ordinance shall allow
the type of smoke detector to be either battery operated or AC powered units.
With res to multifamily buildinﬁs containing four or more dwelling unitas,
such ordinance shall require that the owner of each unit which is rented or
leased, at the beginning of each tenancy and at least annually thereafter, shall
furnish the tenant with a certificate that all required smoke detectors are
present, have been inspected, and are in good working order. Except for smoke
detectors located in hallways, stairwells, and other public or common areas,
interim testing, repair, and maintenance of such smoke detectors shall be the
responsibility of the tenant; provided. however, that the owner shall be obli-

ted to service, repair, or replace any mall‘unctioninﬁ smoke detectors within

ive days of receipt of written notice that such smoke detector is in need of
service, repair, or replacement. (1981, ¢. 324.)

§ 96-88.1, State buildings. — The Building Code shall be applicable to all
State-owned buildings and structures.
Any State-owned building or structure for which working drawings were
Enpnmd or on which construction commenced prior to July one, nineteen
undred eighty-one, shall remain subject to the building regulations in effect
at the time of such construction or design. Subsequent reconstruction,
renovation, repair, or demolition of such building or structure shall be subject
to the pertinent provisions of the Building Code.

Notwithstanding the provisions of § 36-105 the review of plans, inspections
of construction, and enforcement of the Building Code shall be ﬂ_provided by the
Department of General Services, the State Fire Marshal's Office, other State
agencies having such responsibiiity. or other State agencies at the request of
the Department of General Services. State agencies and institutions, when
requested to do so, shall allow local building inspectors to inspect the con-
struction of State buildings, provided such inspection shall be of an adviso
nature only. The Department of General Services shall function as the Build-
ing Oﬁ'iciarfor State-owned buildings in regard to a%proval of plans and specifi-
cations, granting of modifications and inspections based on policies issued by
the Department. (1981, c. 325.)

a1



§ 36.99. Provisions of Code. — The Building Code shall prescribe stan-
dards to be complied with in the construction of buildings and structures, and
the equipment tgnerein as defined in § 36-97, and shall prescribe regulations to
insure that such standards are proper!f maintained, and shall also prescribs
procedures for the administration and enforcement of such standards, Tlie
provisions thereof shall be such as to protect the health, safety and welfare of
the residents of this State, provided that buildings and structures should be
permitted to be constructed at the least possible cost consistent with recognized
standards of health, salety, energy conservation and water conservation and
barrier-free provisions for the physically handicapped and aged. Such stan-
dards shall be reasonable and appropriate to the objectives of this chapter.

In formulating the Code provisions, the Board shall have due regard for
generally accepted standards as recommended by nationally recognized orga-
nizations, including, but not limited to, the standards of the Southern Buildin
Code Congress, the Building Officials Conference of America and the Nationa
Fire Protection Association.

Where practical, the Code provisions shall be stated in terms of required
level of performance, 8o as to {acilitate the prompt acceptance of new building
materials and methods. When generally recognized standards of performance
are not available, such provisions shall provide for accegtance of materials and
methods whose performance has been found by the Board, on the basis of
reliable test and evaluation data, presented by the proponent, to be substan-
tially equal in safety to those specified. (1972, ¢c. 829; 1974, c. 433; 1975, c. 394;
1977, cc. 423, 613; 1978, c. 581; 1981, c. 2.)

§ 36-105. Enforcement of Code; appeals from decisions of local
department; inspection of buildings. — Enforcement of the Building Code
shall be the responsibility of the local building department. There shall be
established within each local building degartment a local board of Building
Code aneaIa whose composition, duties and responsibilities shall be prescribe
in the Building Code. Appeals from the local building department concerning
application of the Building Code or refusal to grant a modification to the
provisions of the Code covering the manner of construction or materials to be
used in the erection, alteration or repair of a building or structure shall first
lie to the local board of Building Code appeals. No appeal to the State Building
Code Technical Review Board shall lie prior to a final determination by the
local board of Building Code appeals. Whenever a county or a municipality does
not have such a building department or board of Building Code appeals, the
local governing body shall enter into an agreement with the local governing
body of another county or municipality or with some other agency, or a State

ncy approved by the Department for such enforcement and appeals
gulcgng % erel'rom.y Fees may be levied by the local governing body in order
to defray the cost of such enforcement and appeals.

82



. Any building may be inspected at any time before completion, and shall not
de deemed in compliance until approved by the inspecting authority but where

* the construction cost is less than one thousand dollars the building inspection
may, in the discretion of the inspecting authority, be waived. A local governing
bodgr may provide that buildings and structures, permanent or temporary,
which are used to store hazardous materials, or occupied or to be used b
twenty or more persons who are employed, lodged, housed, assembled, served,
entertained or instructed therein, or the common areas of residential struc-
tures containing four or more units; including buildings owned by the State or
by any of its political subdivisions and the etglipment therein be inspected
period%cally alter completion to insure that the Building Code standards at the
time of construction are properly maintained. The ulldm% official shall
coordinate all reports with inspections for compliance of the Building Code,
from fire and health officials delegated such authority, prior to issuance of an
occupancy permit. (1972, c. 829; 1974, c. 433; 1977, cc. 423, 613; 1978, c. 578;
1981, c. 498.)

§ 36-135. Board of Housing and Community Develepment created;
members; terms; chairman. — There is hereby created within the Depart-
ment of Housing and Community Development the Board of Housing and
Community Development. The Board shall consist of nine members aﬁpointed
bﬁathe Governor, subject to confirmation by the General Assembly. Members
shall serve for four-year terms and no member shall serve for more than two
full successive terms. Initial all:_opointments to the Board shall be made as
follows: Two shall be for terms of one year, two shall be for terms of two years,
two shall be for terms of three years, and three shall be for terms of four years
each, and thereafter all appointments shall be for terms of four years each. A
chairman of the Board shall be elected annually by the Board. (1977, ¢. 613.)

§ 36-138. Meetings of Board. — The Board shall meet at least once every
three months, and on the call of the chairman, when, in his opinion, additional
meetings are necessary. {1977, ¢. 613.) :

§ 36-137. Powers and duties of Board. — The Board shall exercise the
following powers and duties, and such others as may be provided by law:

A. Provide & means of citizen access to the Department.

B. Provide a means of publicizing the policies and programs of the Depart-
mci?t' :_n order to educate the public and elicit public support for Department
activitiea.

C. Monitor the policies and activities of the Department and have the right

_of access to departmental information.

D. Advise the Governor, the Secretary of Commerce and Resources and the
Director on matters relating to housing and community development.

E. From time to time make such rules and regulations as may be necessary
to carry out its responsibilities and from time to time thereafter to repeal or
amend such rules.

F. [Repealed.) .

G. Issue a certificate of competence concerning gw content, aprlication. and
intent of specified subject areas of the Uniform Statewide Building Code to
present or prospective personnel of local governments who have completed
training programs or in other ways demonstrated adequate knowledge. (1977,
c. 613; 578. ¢. 751; 1980, c. 107; 1981, ¢. 309.)

63



§ 36-139. (Effective July 1, 1982) Powers and duties of Director. — The
Director of the Department of Housing and Community Development shall .
have the following responsibilities: '
. A. Collecting from the governmental subdivisions of the Commonwealth -
information relevant to their planning and development activities, boundary

) of forme and status of ﬁovemment. intergovernmental *
agreements arrangements, and such other information as it may deem
necessary. -

_B. Making information available to communities, planning district commis-
sions, service districts and governmental subdivisions of the Commonwealth.

C. Providing professional and technical assistance to, and cooperating with,
any planning agency, planning dietrict commission, service district, and gov-
ernmental subdivision engagvﬁ in the preparation of development plans and
programs, service district plans, or consolidation agreements.

D. Assisting the Governor in the providing of such State financial aid as may
be appropriated by the General Assembly in accordance with § 15.1-1412 of the
Code of Virginia.

E. Administering federal grant assistance programs, including funds from
the Appalachian Regional Commission, the Economic Development Adminis-
tration and other such federal agencies, directed at promoting the development
of the Commonwealth’s communities and regions.

F. Developing State housing and community development goliciea, 5-?“5’
plans and programs for the consideration and adoption of the Board with the
ultimalt:la_ authority for adoption to rest with the Governor and the General

y.

G. Determining present and future housing requirements of the State and
designing programs to coordinate the elements of housing production which
programs shall be designed to assure the availability of housing where and
when needed.

H. Assuming administrative coordination of the various State housing pro-
ﬂ-nme and cooRerating with the various State agencies in their programs as

ey relate to housing.

1. Establishing public information and educational programs relating to
housing; devising and administering programs to inform all citizens about
housing and housing-related programs that are available on all levels of gov-
ernment; designing and administering educational programs to prep
families for home ownership and counseling them during their first years as
homeowners; and promoting educational programs to assist sponsors in the

development of low and moderate income housing as well as programe to lessen
the problems of rental housing management. ) .

J. Administering the provisione of the Urban Asasistance Incentive Fund as
set forth in §§ 15.1-1600 through 15.1-1505 of the Code of Virginia. .

K. Administering the provisions of the Industrial Building Unit and Mobile
Home Safety Law. ) . .

L. Administering the provisions of the Uniform Statewide Building Code.

M. Administering the provisions of the Virginia Fire Safety Law.
381}3"1‘70Fadminister design standards promulgated by the Board pursuant to §

0. To establish and operate a voluntary training program for the instruction
of the personnel of loca.Ple)uilding departments concerning the content, applica-
tion and intent of the Uniform Statewide Building Code. )

P. Carrying out such other duties as may be necessary and convenient to the
exercise of powers granted to the Department. .

Q. To administer, in conjunction with the federal government and promul-
gate any necessary rules and regulations regardxgs energy standarda for
existing buildings as may be required pursuant to federal law.

R Identifyinﬁ and disseminating information to local governments about the
availability and utilization of federal and State resources. (1977, c. 613; 1978, 64
cc. 737, 761; 1981, cc. 309, 315.)



.4 36-139. (Effective until Jul{ 1, 1083) Powers and duties of Director.
- - The Director shall have the foll responsibilities:

A. Collecting from the governmental subdivisions of the Commonwealth

* information relevant to their planning and development activities, boundary

changes, ¢! of forms and status of tﬁovemment. intergovernmental

agreements and arrangements, and such other information as it may deem

mnc information available to communities, planning district commis-
8i pervice districts and governmental subdivisions of the Commonwealth.

C. Providing professional and technical assistance to, and cooperating with,
any planning agency, planning district commission, service district, and gov-
ernmental subdivision eng in the preparation of development plans

, service district plana, or consolidation agreements
, Assisting the Governor in the providing of such State financial aid as may
%e o:gp : riated by the General Assembly in accordance with § 15.1-1412 of the
of Virginia.

E. Administering federal grant assistance programs, including funds from
the Appalachian Regional Commission, the Economic fbvelopmnt Adminis-
tration and other such federal agencies, directed at promoting the development
of ll;:.ho[)(:drnllmonw%atl.th'uheommug.i&u and l'egi;:ynn.i - ¢ vl

. Deavelopi te housi community developmen icies, Enls,
plans and pl?o;‘ima for the egtguiderntiou and adoption of the gud with the
m& authority for adoption to rest with the Governor and the General

y.

G. Determining present and future housing requirements of the State and
designing p to coordinate the elementa of housing production which
programsh “‘;:la be designed to assure the availability of housing where and
when n .

H. Assuming administrative coordination of the various State housing pro-

and eoog:nting with the various State agencies in their programs as
ey relate to uling.

1. Establishing public information and educational programs relating to
housing; devising and administering programs to inform all citizens about
housing and housing-related programs that are available on all levels of gov-
ernment; designing and administering educational progum to prepare
families for home ownership and counseling them during their first years as
homeowners; and promoting educational programs to assist sponsors in the
development of low and moderate income housing as well as programs to lessen
the problems of rental housing ment.

d. Administarini the provisions of the Urban Assistance Incentive Fund as
set forth in §§ 15.1-1500 through 15.1-1606 of the Code of Vl;s;tnh.

K. Administering the provisions of the Industrial Building Unit and Mobile
Home Safety Law.

L. Administering the provisions of the Uniform Statewide Building Code.

M. Administering the provisions of the Virginia Fire Safety Law.
381:‘1'3'!!'0 Fadminishr design standards promulgated by the Board pursuant to §

Q. To establish and operate a voluntary training program for the instruction
of the nnel of local building departments concerning the content, ica.
Do g otons of the Uniform Statewide Building Cod. =

P. Carrying out such other duties as may be necessary and convenient to the
exercise of gwen granted to the Department.

Q. To administer, in conjunction with the federal government and promul-
gate any necessary rules and regulations regarding energy standards for
existing buildings as may be required pursuant to f ] law. (1977, c. 613;
1978, cc. 737, 7601; 1981, ¢. 309.)






