1984

EDITION

VIRGINIA

UNIFORM STATEWIDE
BUILDING CODE

VOLUME1
NEW CONSTRUCTION CODE

COMMONWEALTH OF VIRGINIA

BOARD OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT






1984 EDITION

1984 EDITION VIRGINIA UNIFORM STATEWIDE BUILDING CODE
VOLUME T - NEW CONSTRUCTION CODE

VR 394-01-021

Adopted by the State

BOARD OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT

Effective APRIL 1, 1986

Issued by the
Division of Building Regulatory Services
Department of Housing and Community Development
205 North Fourth Street
Richmond, Virginia 23219

FIRST PRINTING FEBRUARY 1986
SECOND PRINTING APRIL 1986
THIRD PRINTING DECEMBER 1986
FOURTH PRINTING JANUARY 1987
FIFTH PRINTING JULY 1987



PREFACE
SUMMARY

Volume I - New Construction Code of the 1984 Edition
of the Virginia Uniform Statewide Building Code
(USBC) is a mandatory, statewide uniform regulation
which must be complied with in all buildings or
additions hereafter constructed , altered, enlarged,
repaired, or converted to another use group. Its
purpose is to protect the health, safety and welfare
of building users, and to provide for energy conser-
vation, water conservation, and accessibility for the
physically handicapped and aged. Technical require-
ments of the New Construction Code are based on the
BOCA model Building Code. The New Construction Code
specifies the enforcement procedures to be used by
local governments. Enforcement by local governments
is mandatory. Provision is made for modifications by
the building official when alternate means will
provide equivalent health and safety. An adminis-
trative appeals system 1s established for resolution
of disagreements between the building owner and the
building official.

Minor clarifications have been made to the adminis~
trative and enforcement provisions. Accessibility
for persons with disabilities contained in Article 5
of Addendum 1 have been extensively revised to
reflect comments received from affected groups
throughout Virginia. Incremental changes to the
bullding design requirements of the New Construction
Code will occur when the referenced model codes are
updated to the current editions as proposed by the
Board. The referenced models include the 1984
editions of the model Building, Plumbing and
Mechanical Codes of Building Officiazls and Code
Administrators International, 1Inc., and the Elec=-
trical Code of the Natiomal Fire Protection Associa-
tion, These will be supplemented by adoption of the
1983 edition, with 1984 supplement, of the One and
Two Family Dwelling Code (published by the Council of
American Building Officials).

ii



ARRANGEMENT OF 19684 EDITION

The 1984 edition of the USBC represents a change in
organization and format from the 1981 edition.
Requirements of the USBC are now divided into two
volumes:

Volume I - New Construction Code
Volume II - Building Maintenance Code

Volume II governs the maintenance and use of build-
ings. Local governments are required by law to
enforce Volume I, Local enforcement of Volume II is
optional.

USE OF NATIONALLY RECOGNIZED MODEL CODES AND
STANDARDS

The Board bases the technical requirements of the
USBC on nationally accepted model codes and stan-
dards. It makes as few amendments as possible. The
purpose is to benefit the citizens of Virginia by
promoting efficiency in the building industry, many
aspects of which are interstate in nature. For this
reason, the Board encourages anyone who believes that
a technical amendment is needed to submit his pro-
posal directly to the organization which publishes
the affected model code or standard. Amendments made
by such organizations will then be considered for
inclusion in future editions of the USBC,

Information on how to present proposals to the model
code and standards organizations is available from:

Office of Uniform Building Code

Department of Housing and Community Development
205 North Fourth Street

Richmond, Virginia 23219

Telephone (804) 786-3041

iii



FUTURE EDITIONS

State law requires the Board of Housing and Community
Development to keep the USBC up-to~date. The Board
plans to do this by updating the USBC every three
years when new editions of the model codes become
publicly available, Suggestions for improvements are
invited at any time. They should be addressed to the
Board of Housing and Community Development in care of
the Office of Uniform Building Code.

USER ASSISTANCE

Because enforcement of the New Construction Code is
the responsibility of local government, the local
building department should be consulted for infor-
mation and assistance. An administrative and enforce-
ment procedures manual has been prepared to assist
enforcing officials. It may be obtained from the
Office of Uniform Building Code. Copies of the model
codes and standards referenced by the New Construc-
tion Code are available for public inspection in the
Office of Uniform Building Code. They may be pur-
chased through:

Building Officials and Code Administrators
International, Inc.

4051 West Flossmoor Road

Country Club Hills, Illinois 60477
Telephone (312) 799-2300

INTERPRETATIONS

In case of doubt as to the meaning of any specific
provision of the New Construction Code, a request for
an interpretation may be made to the State Building
Code Technical Review Board. Request forms are
available from the Office of Uniform Building Code.

iv



1984 EDITION

VIRGINIA UNIFORM STATEWIDE BUILDING CODE

Article 1

Section
100.0
101.0
102.0
1G3.0

104.0
105.0

106.0
107.0
108.0

109.0
110.0
111.0
112,0
113.0
114.0
115.0
116.0
117.0
118.0
119.0

120.0

121.0
122.0
123.0
124,0
125.0
126.0

VOLUME I - NEW CONSTRUCTION CODE
TABLE OF CONTENTS

Adoption, Administration and Enforcement

General .....vc.... L S |
Reference Standards and Amendments ...., 3
Local Building Department se...eceeeeeee 5
Duties and Powers of the

Building Official.i.veeiecncvsveneeeesssd
Application for Comstruction Permit ....11
Professional Engineering and

Architectural Services .......ce000...15
Approval of Materials and Equipment.... 16
Modifications .....vveevennecnennnnnnesal?
Interagency Coordination

= Functional Design...evvevvee ovee.. 18
Construction Permits ......vvovevvweeee. L8
Conditions of Permits ....veevvveveeneeso2l
Inspections. . veuusseeseceareenennneneasall
Workmanship ...vuveninnnnninnneennnnnss 24
Violations ..i.iveveivennnnennns cesnsessall
Stop Work Order .e.viveveenvvansneeneness25
Posting Buildings ...vevvuvecnncecennsea2b
Approval of Equipment Operation ........27
Certificate of Use and Occupancy .......27
Local Board of Building Code Appeals....29
Appeal to the State Building Code

Technical Review Board .......ceeuuee.32
Alterations and Maintenance after

Construction c.cvivrieeeennonenonnnsssedl
Conversion of Building Use .......0.....36
Demolition of Buildings .vueseeeeeeeseosod?
Moved Buildings .......oceveveveennneeseld?
Unsafe Buildings ....vvevevevnesaneese..38
Continuation of Compliance ......evee...40
Validity covvvuiveeiniseneencansonnennasakl



ADDENDA

vi

Amendments to the BOCA Basic/National Building
Code /1984 Edition ......... cessesnssoanssees 41

Amendments to the CABO One and Two Family
Dwelling Code/1983 Edition

and 1984 Supplement ....svevevecsonasnsannee 78
Virginia Uniform Statewide Building Code

and Related Laws ......... e susattetraacons 83
State Agenciles with Functional

Design Respousibilities ...uvevsverenccans . 94
Previous Adoptions and Amendments ...... sese 104
Board of Housing and

Community Development...civeeeaseassas sese 107
State Building Code

Technical Review Board ..... sessasssaveess 108

Forms Available,.....cusceevevescncaassnsness 109

A/E Seal on DrawingsS.....eveeesnsonces ArEO O Aol b L)



1984 EDITION
VIRGINIA UNIFORM STATEWIDE BUILDING CODE
VOLUME - I - NEW CONSTRUCTICN CODE
ARTICLE 1
ADOPTION, ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT

SECTION 100.0 GENERAL

100.1 Title: These regulations shall be known as
Volume I - New Construction Code of the 1984 edition
of the Virginia Uniform Statewide Building Code.
Except as otherwise indicated, USBC, and New Con-
struction Code, as used herein, shall mean the 1984
Volume I - New Construction Code of the 1984 edition
of the Virginia Uniform Statewide Building Code.

Note: See Volume II - Building Maintenance Code
for maintenance regulations applying to all existing
buildings.

100.2 Authority: The USBC is adopted under authority
granted the Board of Housing and Community Develop-
ment by the Uniform Statewide Building Code Law,
Chapter 6, Title 36, Code of Virginia,

100.3 Adoption: The USBC was adopted by order of the
Board of Housing and Community Development on
November 18, 1985. This order was prepared according
to requirements of the Administrative Process Act.
The order is maintained as part of the records of the
Department of Housing and Community Development, and
is available for public inspection.

100.4 Effective date: The 1984 edition of the USBC
replaces previous editions. It shall become effec-
tive on April 1, 1986. Any building that was
subject to previous editions of the USBC, and for
which a building permit has been issued or on which
construction has commenced, or for which working
drawings have been prepared in the year prior to the




USBC 1984

effective date of this edition of the USBC shall
remain subject to the edition of the USBC in effect
at the time of such issuance or commencement of
construction. Subsequent reconstruction, reno-
vation, repair or demolition of such buildings
shall be subject to the pertinent provisions of the
USBC in effect at the time of such actiom.

100.5 Application: As provided in the Uniform State-
wide Building Code Law, Chapter 6, Title 36, Code of
Virginia, the USBC supersedes the building codes and
regulations of the counties, municipalities and other
political subdivisions and State agencies, relating
to any construction, reconstruction, alterationms,
conversion, repair, maintenance or use of buildings
and installation of equipment therein that takes
place after the effective date of the initial edition
of the USBC. The USBC doeg not supersede zoning
ordinances or other land use controls that do not
affect the manner of construction or materials to be
used in the construction, alteration or repair of a
building.

100.5.1 Industrialized building units: Industria-
lized building units labeled by an approved testing
facility and bearing the Virginia Registration Seal
in accordance with the Virginia Industrialized
Building and Mobile Home Safety Regulations are
exempt from the USBC and shall be acceptable in all
localities as meeting the requirements of safety to
life, health and property.. The building official is
responsible for inspecting site work and installation
of industrialized building units and mobile homes.

100.6 Exemptions for certain utility equipment: The
provisions of the USBC shall not apply te distri-
bution equipment installed by a provider of publicly
regulated utility services, or to electrical equip-
ment used for radio and television transmission.
However, the buildings, including their service
equipment, housing such utility services shall be




ADMINISTRATION

subject to the USBC. The exempt equipment shall be
under the exclusive control of the public service
agency and located on property by established rights,

100.7 Exemptions for farm buildings and structures:
Farm buildings and structures not used for residen-
tial purposes shall be exempt from the provisions of
the USBC; however, such buildings and structures
lying within a flood plain or in a mudslide-prone
area shall be subject to the provisions relating to
the applicable floodproofing regulations or mudslide
regulations.

100.8 Purpose: The purpose of the USBC is to ensure
safety to life and property from all hazards incident
to building design, construction, maintenance, use,
repair, removal or demolition. Buildings shall be
permitted to be constructed at the least possible
cost consistent with nationally recognized standards
for health, safety, energy conservation, water
conservation, adequate egress facilities, sanitary
equipment, light and ventilation, fire safety, strue-
tural strength, and physically handicapped and aged
accessibility,

SECTION 101.0 REFERENCE STANDARDS AND AMENDMENTS

101.1 Adoption of model codes and standards: The
following model building codes, and all portions of
other model codes and standards that are referenced
in this Code are hereby adopted and incorporated in
the USBC. Where differences occur between provisions
of the USBC and the referenced standards, the provi-
sions of the USBC shall apply.

The referenced model codes are:

® BOCA BASIC/NATIONAL BUILDINGC CODE/1984 EDITION
(also referred to herein as BOCA Code)

Published by:



USBC 1984

Building Officials and Code Administrators
International, Inc.

4051 West Flossmoor Road

Country Club Hills, Illinois 60477

As an acceptable alternative for detached one and
two family dwellings not more than three stories in
height, and their accessory structures.

CABO ONE AND TWO FAMILY DWELLING CCDE/1983 EDITION
AND 1984 SUPPLEMENT {(also referred to herein as One
and Two Family Dwelling Code)

Jointly published by:
Building Officials and Code Administrators
International, Inc.

Southern Building Code Congress, and International
Conference of Building Officials.

Note: The following major subsidiary model codes are
among those included by reference as part of the BOCA
Basic/National Building Code/1984 Edition:

BOCA Basic/National Plumbing Code/1984 Edition

BOCA Basic/National Mechanical Code/1984 Edition

NFiPA National Electrical Code/1984 Edition

101.2 General administrative and enforcement
amendments to referenced codes: All requirements of
the referenced model codes that relate to fees,
permits, certification of fitness, unsafe notices,
certification of compliance, approval of plans and
specifications and other procedural, administrative
and enforcement matters are deleted and replaced by
the procedural, administrative and enforcement
provisions of Article 1 of the USBC.




ADMINISTRATION

Note: The purpose of this provision is to eliminate
overlap, conflict and duplication by providing a
single standard for administration and enforcement of
the USBC.

101.3 Amendments to the BOCA Code: The amendments
noted in Addendum 1 of the USBC shall be made to the
specified articles and sections of the BOCA Basic
National Building Code/1984 Edition for use as part
of the USBC.

101.4 Amendments to the One and Two Family Dwelling
Code: The amendments noted in Addendum 2 of the USBC
shall be made to the indicated chapters and sections
of the One and Two Family Dwelling Code/1983 Edition
and 1984 Amendments for use as part of the USEC.

SECTION 102.0 LOCAL BUILDING DEPARTMENT

102.1 Responsibility of local pgovernments: Enforce-
ment of the USBC Volume I shall be the responsibility
of the local building department in accordance with
§36-105, Code of Virginia. Whenever a local govern-
ment does not have such a building department, it
shall enter into an agreement with another local
government or with some other agency, or a State
agency approved by the Virginia Department of Housing
and Community Development for such enforcement. The
local building department and its employees may be
designated by such names or titles as the local
government considers appropriate.

102.2 Building official: Each local building depart-
ment shall have an executive official in charge,
hereinafter referred to as the building official.

102.3 Appointment of Building Official: The building
official shall be appointed in a manner selected by
the local government having jurisdiction. Upon
appointment of the building official, the Office of
Uniform Building Code shall be notified.




USBC 1984

102.4 Qualifications of local building department
personnel: The building official and technical
assistants shall be qualified as required by this
Section. The local governing body may establish
additional qualification requirements.

102.5 Qualifications of the building official: The
building official shall have had at least five years
of building experience as a licensed professional
engineer or architect, building inspector, contractor
or superintendent of building construction, with at
least three years of building experience in which he
has been in responsible charge of work as a licensed
professional engineer or architect, building
ingpector, contractor or superintendent of building
construction, or shall have any combination of
education and experience which would confer equiva-
lent knowledge and ability., The building official
shall be generally informed on sound engineering
practice in respect to the design and construction of
buildings, the basic principles of fire prevention,
the accepted requirements for means of egress and the
installation of elevators and other service equipment
necessary for the health, safety and general welfare
of the occupants and the public.

102.6 Qualifications of technical assistants: A
person shall not be appointed as a technical assis-
tant who has had less than three years experience in
general buillding construction. Any combination of
education and experience which would confer equiva-
lent knowledge and ability shall be deemed to satisfy
this requirement.

102,.7 Educational requirements for building officials
and technical assistants: Within one year after
appointment, the building official and technical
assistants shall successfully complete an orientation
course approved by the State Office of Uniform
Building Code concerning the administration and
enforcement of the USBC. The building official and




ADMINISTRATION

technical assistants shall attend a program of
instruction, approved by the Office of Uniform
Building Code, after each code change cycle of the
USBC concerning changes that have been made thru
adoption of a new edition of the USBC.

102.8 Certification requirements for building
officials: The building official shall obtain a
certificate of competency from the Board of Housing
and Community Development under Section 36-137 of the
Code of Virginia within three years of April 1, 1986
or, if employed after that date, within three years
of date of employment. To become certified, the
bullding official shall:

1. Successfully complete either the certification
examination for Building Official sponsored by the
Council of American Building Officials or the certi-
fication examination for Professional Code
Administrator sponsored by the National Academy of
Code Administration.

2. Comwply with the other requirements of this Section
for building officials.

3. Submit an application for certification to the
Board of Housing and Community Development on forms
provided by the Office of Uniform Building Code,

4. Those individuals who have been issued a certi-
ficate by the State Board of Housing as "Building
Official” shall be considered in compliance with
these certification requirements,

102.8.1 Exemption from certification: An individual
employed as the building official in any locality in
Virginia for at least 3 years prior to the effec~
tive date of the 1984 Edition of Volume I of the USBC
shall be exempt from certification while employed as
the building official in that jurisdiction. This
exemption shall not apply to subsequent employment




USBC 1984

as building official in another jurisdiction.

102.9 Relief from personal responsibility: The
local building department personnel shall not be
personally liable for any damages sustained by any
person in excess of the policy limits of errors and
omissions insurance, or other equivalent insurance
obtained by the locality to insure against any action
that may occur to persons or property as a result of
any act required or permitted in the discharge of
official duties while assigned to the department as
employees. The building official or his subordinates
shall not be personally liable for costs 1in any
action, suit or proceedings that may be instituted in
pursuance of the provisions of the USBC as a result
of any act required or permitted in the discharge of
official duties while assigned to the department as
employees, whether or not said costs are covered by
insurance. Any suit instituted against any officer
or employee because of an act performed by him in the
discharge of his duties and under the provisions of
the USBC may be defended by the department's legal
representative.

102.10 Control of conflict of interest: The building
official and other technical assistants shall not be
engaged in or directly or indirectly connected with
the furnishing of labor, materials or appliances for
the construction, alteration or maintenance of a
building, or the preparation of plans or specifica-
tions thereof, unless that person is the owner of the
building; Such officer or employee shall not engage
in any work which conflicts with official duties or
with the interests of the department within the
jurisdiction in which they work. They may perform
ordinary repairs for which a permit is not required
by the USBC. In addition, they may perform main-
tenance work on buildings owned, operated or leased
by the local government by whom they are employed.




ADMINISTRATION

102.11 Scate Assistance: The local government shall
notify the Office of Uniform Building Code within 30
days of the appointment or release of the building
official, Upon notification of appointment of a
building official, the Office of Uniform Building
Code shall advise the official of all services
offered and will keep him continually informed of
developments affecting the interpretation and admin-
istration of the USBHC.

SECTION 103.0 DUTIES AND POWERS
OF THE BUILDING OFFICIAL

103.1 General: The building official shall enforce
the provisions of the USBC as provided herein, and as
interpreted by the State Building Code Technical
Review Board in accordance with Section 36-118, Code
of Virginia.

103.2 Applications and permits: The building official
shall receive applications and issue permits for the
construction and alteration of buildings, and verify
that plans bear the seal of a Virginia licensed
architect or engineer, when required by State law.

103.3 Building notices and orders: The building
official shall issue necessary notices or orders to
remove unsafe conditions, to require the necessary
safeguards during construction and to ensure com-
pliance with all the USBC requirements for the
health, safety and general welfare of the public,

103.4 Inspections: The buillding official shall make
the required inspections, .or accept reports of
inspection by approved agencies or individuals.
Reports of such inspections shall be in writing and
certified by a responsible officer of such approved
agency or by the responsible individual. The build-
ing official may engage such expert opinion as may be
necessary to report upon unusual technical issues




USBC 1984

that may arise, subject to the approval of the
appointing authority.

103.5 Delegation of duties and powers: The building
official may delegate duties and powers subject to
any limitations imposed by the local government, but
shall be responsible that any powers and duties
delegated are carried out in accordance with the
USBC.

103.6 Credentials: The building official and assis-—
tants shall carry proper credentials of office when
inspecting buildings and premises in the performance
of duties under the USBC.

103.7 Department records: The building official shall
keep records of applications received, permits and
certificates issued, reports of inspections, notices
and orders issued and such other matters as directed
by the local government. A copy of the certificate of
use and occupancy and a copy of any modification of
the USBC issued by the building official shall be
retained in the official records, as long as the
building to which it relates remains in existence.
Other records may be disposed of in accordance with
the provisions of the Virginia Public Records Act
and, (a) after retention for onme year in the case of
buildings under 1,000 square feet in area and one and
two family dwellings of any area, and (b) after
retention for three years in the case of all other
buildings.

103.8 Annual report: At least annually, the building
official shall submit to the authority designated by
the local government a written statement of opera-
tions in the form and content prescribed by such
local government. A copy shall be forwarded to the
Office of Uniform Building Code for use in studies to
improve the Virginia USBC system.

10



ADMINISTRATION

103.9 Fees: Fees may be levied by the 1local gov-—
erning body in order to defray the cost of enforce-
ment and appeals in accordance with Section 36~105
of the Code of Virginia.

103.9.1 When payable: A permit to begin work for
new construction, alteration, removal, demolition or
other building operation shall not be issued until
the fees prescribed by the local government have
been paid to the department of building inspection or
other authorized agency of the jurisdiction, nor
shall an amendment to a permit necessitating an
additional fee be approved until the additional fee
has been paid. At the discretion of local government,
fee adjustment may be delayed until completion of the
project or when work has been authorized to commence
prior to permit issuance,

103.9.2 Fee schedule: A fee for each plan exami-
nation, building permit, and inspection shall be paid
in accordance with a schedule of fees which shall be
established by the local government. The schedule
shall incorporate unit rates which may be based on
square footage, or cubic footage, or cost of con-
struction, or other appropriate criteria.

103.9.3 Refunds: 1In the case of a revocation of a
permit or abandonment or discontinuance of a building
project, the local government shall provide fee
refunds for the portion of the work which was not
completed.

SECTION 104.0 APPLICATION FOR CONSTRUCTION PERMIT

104.1 When permit is required: Written application
shall be made to the building official when a con-
struction permit is required. A permit shall be
issued by the building official before any of the
following actions subject to the USBC may be com-
menced

1. Constructing, enlarging, altering, repairing, or

11



USBC 1984

demolishing a building or structure.

2. Changing the use of the building to a different
use group.

3. Changing the use of the building within a use
group.

4. Installing or altering any building equipment.

The building official may, at his discretion, autho-
rize work to be commenced pending receipt of the
written application and issuance of the required
permit.

Exception: Ordinary repairs as defined in Section
120.4 which do not invelve any violation of the USBC
shall be exempt from this provision.

104.2 Who may apply for a permit: Application for a
permit shall be made by the owner or lessee of the
building or agent of either, or by the 1licensed
professional engineer, architect or contractor
employed in connection with the proposed work. If
the application is made by a person other than the
owner, it shall, when required by the building
official, be accompanied by a signed and witnessed
statement of the owner and the applicant that the
proposed work is authorized by the owner and that the
applicant is authorized to make such application.
The full names and addresses of the owner, lessee and
the applicant, and of the responsible officers if the
owner or lessee is a corporate body, shall be stated
in the application. The building official shall not
require the applicant to appear in person.

Note: TIf the application is made by a professional
engineer, architect or contractor, the building
official should verify that the applicant is either
licensed to practice in Virginia or is exempt from
licensing under the Code of Virginia.

12



ADMINISTRATION

104.3 Form of application: The application for a
permit shall be submitted on forms supplied by the
building official.

104.4 Description of work: The application shall
contain a general description of the proposed work,
its location, the use of all parts of the building
and of all portions of the site not coverad by the
building, and such additional information as may be
required by the building official,

104.5 Plans and specifications: The applicacion for
the permit shall be accompanied by not less than two
copies of specifications and of planrs drawn to scale,
with sufficient clarity and dimensional detail to
show the nature and character of the work to be
performed. Such plans and specifications shall
include the seal and signature of the architect or
engineer under whose supervision they were prepared,
or if exempt under the provisions of State law, shall
include the name, address, and occupation of the
individual who prepared them. When quality of
materials is essential for conformity to the USEC,
specific information shall be given to establish such
quality. The building official may waive the
requirement for filing plans and specifications when
the work involved is of a minor nature.

104.6 Plans for Use Group R-4:: Detailed plans may
be waived by the building official for buildings in
Use Group R-4, provided specifications and outline
plans are submitted which satisfactorily indicate
compliance with the USBC.

104.7 Site plan: The application shall also contain
2 site plan showing to scale the size and location of
all the proposed new construction and all existing
buildings on the site, distances from lot lines, the
established street grades and the proposed finished
grades. The building official may require that the
application contain the elevation of the lowest floor

13



USBC 1984

of the building. It shall be drawn in aeccordance
with an accurate boundary line survey. In the case
of demolition, the site plan shall show all con-
struction to be demolished and the location and size
of all existing buildings and construection that are
to remain on the site. In the case of alterations,
renovations, repairs and installation of new equip-
ment, the buillding official may waive submission of
the site plan or any parts thereof.

104.8 Engineering details: The building official
may require adequate details of structural, mecha-
nical and electrical work to be filed, including
computations, stress diagrams and other essential
technical data. All engineering plans and compu-
tations shall include the signature of the pro-
fessional engineer or architect responsible for the
design. Plans for buildings more than two stories in
height shall indicate where floor penetrations will
be made for pipes, wires, conduits, and other com-
ponents of the electrical, mechanical and plumbing
systems. The plans shall show the material and
methods for protecting such openings so as to main-
tain the required structural integrity, fireresis-
tance ratings, and firestopping affected by such
penetrations.

Note: The building official should verify that the
professional engineer or architect signing the cons-
truction document is licensed in compliance with the
Code of Virginia.

104.9 Amendments to application: Subject to the
limitation of Section 104.10, amendments to plans,
specifications or other records accompanying the
application for permit may be filed at any time
before completion of the work for which the permit is
issued. Such amendments shall be considered part of
the original application and shall be filed as such.

14



ADMINISTRATION

104.10 Time limitation of application: An applica~
tion for a permit for any proposed work shall be
considered to have been abandoned six months after
notification by the building official cthat the
application is defective unless the applicant has
diligently sought to resolve any problems that are
delaying issuance of the permit; except that for
reasonable cause, the building official may grant one
or more extensions of time.

SECTION 105.0 PROFESSIONAL ENGINEERING AND
ARCHITECTURAL SERVICES

105.1 Professional services in gemeral: All plans
and specifications for new construction work shall be
prepared by licensed professional engineers or archi-
tects, unless exempted by the Virginia professional
licensing laws. All such plans and specifications
required for a building permit application shall
include the professional engineer's or architect's
signature and seal in accordance with Virginia law,
or shall include the name, address and occupation of
the person other than a licensed professional engi-
neer or architect by whom they were prepared. In
cases where such plans and specifications are exempt
under State law, the building official may require
that they include the signature and seal of a pro-
fessional engineer or architect.

Note: Information on the types of construction
exempted from the requirement for a professional
engineer's or architect's seal and signature is
included in Addendum 3,

105.2 Waiver of plans review: The building official
may waive review of plans and specifications prepared
by professional engineers and architects.

105.3 Special professional services; when required:
Where an application for unusual design or magnictude
of construction is filed or where reference standards

15



USBC 1984

in Appendix A of the BOCA Code require special archi-
tectural or engineering inspections, the building
official may require full time project representation
by a professional engineer or architect. This
project representative shall keep daily records and
submit reports as required by the building official.

105.3.1 Time of decision: A decision to require
special professional services shall be made by the
building official prior to the issuance of the
building permit and shall be made a condition for
issuance of the permit.

105.3.2 Attendant fees and costs: All fees and costs
related to the performance of special professional
services shall be the responsibility of the building
cwmer.,

SECTION 106.0 APPROVAL OF MATERIALS AND EQUIPMENT

106.1 Approval of materials; basis of approval: The
building official shall require that sufficient tech-
nical data be submitted to substantiate the proposed
use of any material, equipment, device or assembly.
If it is determined that the evidence submitted is
satisfactory proof of performance for the use in-
tended, the building official may approve its use
subject to the requirements of the USBC. In deter-
mining whether any material, equipment, device or
assembly complies with the USBC, the building offi-
cial may consider the recommendations of nationally
recognized research, testing and product certifi-
cation organizations and of engineers and architects
registered in this State.

106.2 Used materials and equipment: Used materials,
equipment and devices may be used provided they have
been reconditioned, tested or examined and found to
be in good and proper working condition and approved
for use by the building official.

16



ADMINISTRATION

106.3 Approved materials and equipment: All mate-
rials, equipment, devices and assemblies approved for
use by the building official shall be constructed and
installed in accordance with the conditions of such
approval.

SECTION 107.0 MODIFICATIONS

107.1 Modifications: When there are practical
difficulties involved in carrying out any provisions
of the USBC, the building official may modify such
provisions upon application of the owner or his
agent. Modifications may be granted provided the
spirit and intent of the USBC are observed and public
health, welfare and safety are assured.

Note: The current editions of many nationally
recognized model codes and standards are referenced.
by the Uniform Statewide Building Code. Future
amendments do not automatically become part of the
USBC; however, the building official should give
consideration to such amendments in deciding whether
a requested modification should be granted. See
State Building Code Technical Review Board Inter-
pretation Number 250, issued November 16, 1984.

107.2 Alternative design, materials, and equipment:
Upon application of the owner, the building official
may modify the provisions of the USBC relating to
building design or building materials, equipment,
devices or assemblies. The building official may
grant modifications provided the proposed alterna-
tives are satisfactory and comply with the intent of
the USBC and are, for the purposes intended, at least
the equivalent of that prescribed in the USBC for
quality, strength, effectiveness, fire resistance,
durability and safety.

107.3 Supporting data: The building official may
require the application to include architectural and
engineering plans and specifications that include the
seal of a professional engineer or architect. The

17



USBC 1984

building official may alse require and consider a
statement from a professional engineer, architect or
other competent person as to the equivalency of the
proposed modification.

107.4 Records: The application for modification and
the final decision of the building official shall be
in writing and shall be officially recorded with the
copy of the certificate of use and occupancy in the
permanent records of the local building department.

SECTION 108.0 INTERAGENCY COORDINATION -
FUNCTIONAL DESIGN

108.1 Functional design approval: Pursuant to
Section 36-98 of the Code of Virginia, certain State
agencies have statutory authority to approve func-
tional design and operation of building related
activities not covered by the USBC. The building
official may refuse to issue a permit until the
applicant has supplied certificates of functional
design approval from the appropriate State agency or
agencies. State agencies with functional design
approval are listed in Addendum 4.

SECTION 109.0 CONSTRUCTION PERMITS

109.1 Action on application: The building official
shall examine all applications for permits within a
reasonable time after filing. If the application or
the plans do not conform te the requirements of the
USBC, the building official shall reject such appli-
cation in writing, stating the reasons for rejection.
If the building official is satisfied that the
proposed work conforms to the requirements of the
USBC, and all applicable laws and ordinances a permit
shall be issued as soon as practicable. For purposes
of coordination, the local governing body may require
reports to the building official by other departments
as a condition for issuance of a building permit or
certificate of use and occupancy. Such reports shall

18



ADMINISTRATION

be based upon review of the plans or inspection of
the project as determined by cthe local governing
body.

Note: Before issuing a permit, the building
official should consider the effects of any appli-
cable regulations of other governmental agencies so
that proper coordination may be achieved before the
work is commenced.

109.2 Approval of partial plans: The building offi-
cial may issue a permit for the construction of
foundations or any other part of a building before
the plans and specifications for the entire building
have been submitted, provided adequate information
and detailed statements have been filed indicating
compliance with the pertinent requirements of the
USBC. The holder of such permit for the foundations
or other part of a building shall proceed at his own
risk with construction operations, and without
assurance that a permit for the entire building will
be granted.

109.3 Approved plans: The building official shall
stamp Approved or provide an endorsement in writing
on both sets of approved plans and specifications.
One set of such approved plans shall be retained by
the building official. The other set shall be kept at
the building site, open to inspection by the building
official at all reasonable times.

109.4 Signature on permit: The signature of the
building official or his authorized representative
shall be attached to every permit.

109.5 Separate or combined permits: Permits for two
or more buildings on the same lot may be combined.
Permits for the installation of equipment such as
plumbing, electrical or mechanical systems may be
combined with the structural permit or separate
permits may be required for the installation of each

19



USBC 1984

system. Separate permits may also be required for
special construction considered appropriate by the
local government.

109.6 Annual permit: Instead of an individual
permit for each alteration to an already approved
equipment installationm, the building official may
issue an annual permit.

109.7 Annual permit records: The person to whom an
annual permit is issued shall keep a detailed record
of all alterations to an approved equipment instal-
lation made under such annual permit. Such records
shall be accessible to the building official at all
times or shall be filed with the building official
when so requested.

109.8 Posting of permit: A true copy of the building
permit shall be kept on the construction site. It
shall be posted for public inspection until the work
is completed.

109.9 Previous approvals: No changes are required
in the plans, construction or designated use of a
building for which a permit has been properly issued
under a previous edition of the USBC, provided the
permit has not lapsed or become invalid in accordance
with Section 109.10 or 109.11 below.

109.10 Revocation of permits: The building official
may revoke a permit or approval issued under the
provisions of the USBC in case of any false statement
or misrepresentation of fact in the application or on
the plans on which the permit or approval was based.

109.11 Suspension of permit: Any permit issued
shall become invalid if the authorized work is not
commenced within six months after issuance of the
permit, or if the authorized work is suspended or
abandoned for a period of six months after the time
of commencing the work; however, permits issued for

20



ADMINISTRATION

building equipment such as plumbing, electrical and
mechanical work shall not become invalid if the
permit is still in effect. Upon written request the
building official may grant one or more extensions of
time not to exceed six months per extension.

SECTION 110.0 CONDITIONS OF PERMITS

110.1 Compliance with code: The permit shall be a
license to proceed with the work and shall not be
construed as authority to omit or amend any of the
provisions of the USBC, except as specifically stipu-
lated by approved modification pursuant to the appli-
cation,

110.2 Compliance with permit: All work shall
conform to the application and plans for which the
permit has been issued and any approved amendments
thereto.

110.3 Compliance with site plan: All new work shall
be in accordance with the approved site plan.

110.4 Change in site plan: A site shall not be
changed, increased or diminished in area from that
shown on the official site plan, unless a revised
plan is submitted and approved as part of an amended
application for the permit.

SECTION 111.0 INSPECTIONS

l111.,1 Preliminary inspection: Before 1issuing a
permit, the building official may examine all build-
ings and sites for which an application has been
filed for a permit to construct, enlarge, alter,
repair, remove, demolish or change the use thereof.

111.2 Required inspections: After issuing a building
permit, the building official shall conduct inspec-
tions from time to time during comstruction and upon
completion of the work for which a permit has been

21



USBC 1984

issued. A record of such inspections and of all
violations of the USBC detected shzll be maintained
by the building official,

Note: Section 36-105 of the Code of Virginia pro-
vides, pursuant to enforcement of the USBC, that any
building may be inspected at any time before comple-
tion., It also permits local governments to provide
for the reinspection of buildings,

111.2,1 Right of entry: The building official may
inspect buildings for the purpose of enforcing the
USBC in accordance with the authority granted by
Section 36-105 of the Code of Virginia.

111.3 Minimum inspections: Inspections shall
include but are not limited to the following:

I. The bottom of footing trenches after all rein-
forcement steel is set and before any concrete is
placed.

2. The installation of piling. The building official
may require the installation of pile foundations be
supervised by the owner's professional engineer or
architect or by such professional service as approved
by the building official.

3. Reinforced concrete beams, or columns and slabs
after all reinforcing is set and before any concrete
is placed.

4. Structural framing and fastenings, prior to cov-
ering with concealing materials.

5. All concealed electrical, mechanical and plumbing
work prior to installation of any concealing mate-
rials.

6. Required insulating materials before covering with

any materials.

22



ADMINISTRATION

7. Upon completion of the building, and before
issuance of the certificate of use and occupancy, a
final inspection shall be made to ensure that all
violations have been corrected to conform with the
USBC.

111,3.1 Notification by permit holder: It shall be
the responsibility of the permit holder or his repre-
sentative to notify the building official when the
stages of construction are reached that require an
inspection under Section 111.3 and for other critical
items as directed by the building official. All
ladders, scaffolds and test equipment required to
complete an inspection or test shall be provided by
the property owner, permit holder or his representa-
tive.

111.3.2 1Inspections to be prompt: The building
official shall respond to inspection requests without
unreasonable delay. The building official shall
approve the work or give written notice of defective
work to the permit holder or the agent in charge of
the work. Such defects shall be corrected and rein-
spected before any work proceeds that would conceal
them.

Note: A reasonable response time should normally
not exceed 48 hours.

l11.4 Approved inspection agencies: The building
official may accept reports from individuals or
inspection agencies which satisfy qualifications and
reliability requirements. Inspection reports shall be
in writing and shall be certified by the individual
inspector or by the responsible officer when the
report is from an agency. An identifying label or
stamp permanently affixed to the product indicating
that factory inspection has been made shall be
accepted instead of the written inspection report,
if the intent or meaning of such identifying label or
stamp is properly substantiated.

23



USBC 1984

111.5 1In-plant inspections: When required by the
provisions of this code, materials or assemblies
shall be inspected at the point of manufacture or
fabrication. Prior to the approval of a closed
prefabricated assembly and issuance of a building
permit, the building official shall require the
submittal of an evaluation report of each prefabri-
cated assembly, indicating the complete details of
the assembly, including a description of the assembly
and its components, the basis upon which the assembly
1s being evaluated, test results, and other data as
necessary for the building official to determine
conformance with this code.

111.6 Coordination with other agencies: The build-
ing official shall, to the extent practical, co-
operate with fire, health and other State and local
agencies having related maintenance, inspection or
functional design responsibilities, so as to produce
effective application of their respective regulations
with the least amount of confusion and burden upon
those affected.

111.7 Inspection of discontinued electric service:
The building official may require reinspections
before service may be restored to an electric instal-
lation from which electrical service has been discon-
tinued for a period of thirty (30) days or more.

SECTION 112.0 WORKMANSHIP

112.1 General: All construction work shall be
performed and completed in an acceptable manner so as
to secure the results intended by the USBC.

SECTION 113.0 VIOLATIONS

113.1 Code violations prohibited: No person, firm
or corporation shall construct, alter, extend,
repair, remove, demolish or use any building or
equipment regulated by the USBC, or cause same to be

24



ADMINISTRATION

done, in conflict with or in violation of any of the
provisions of the USBC.

113.2 Notice of violation: The building official
shall serve a notice of violation on the person
responsible for the construction, alteration, exten-
sion, repair, removal, demolition or use of a build-
ing in violation of the provisions of the USBC, or in
violation of plans and specifications approved
thereunder, or in violation of a permit or certi-
ficate issued under the provisions of the USBC. Such
order shall direct the discontinuance and abatement
of the violation.

113.3 Prosecution of violation: If the notice of
violation is not complied with promptly, the building
official shall request the legal counsel of the
jurisdiction to 1institute the appropriate legal
proceedings to restrain, correct or abate such
violation or to require the removal or termination of
the use of the building in violation of the provi-
sions of the USBC.

113.4 Violation penalties: Violations are a misde-
meanor in accordance with Section 36-106 of the Code
of Virginia. Violators, upon conviction, may be
punished by a fine of not more than one thousand
dollars.,

113.5 Abatement of wviolation: Conviction of a
violation of the USBC shall not preclude the insti-
tution of appropriate legal action to prevent other
violations or recurring violations of the USBC
relating to construction and use of the building or
premises,

SECTION 114.0 STOP WORK ORDER

114.1 Notice to owner: When the building official
finds that work on any building is being executed
contrary to the provisions of the USBC or in an

25



USBC 1984

unsafe and dangerous manner, an order may be issued
to stop such work immediately. The stop work order
shall be in writing. It shall be given to the owner
of the property involved, or to the owner's agent, or
to the person doing the work. It shall state the
conditions under which work may be resumed. No work
covered by a stop work order shall be continued after
issuance, except under the conditions stated in the
order.

114.2 Application of order limited: The stop work
order shall apply only to the work that was being
executed contrary to the USBC or in an unsafe and
dangerous manner, provided other work in the area
would not be unsafe or cause concealment of the work
for which the stop work order was issued.

SECTION 115.0 POSTING BUILDINGS

115.1 Use group and form of sign: Prior to its use,
every building designed for Use Groups B, F, H, M or
5 shall be posted by the owner with a suitably
designed sign in a form designated by the building
official. It shall be securely fastened to the
building in a readily visible place. It shall state
the use group, the live load and the occupancy load.
The date of posting shall be shown on the sign.

115,2 Occupant load in places of assembly: Every
room constituting a place of assembly or education
shall have the permissible occupant load of the room
posted on an approved sign in a conspicuous place,
near the main exit from the room. Signs shall be
maintained in a legible manner by the owner or his
agent. Signs shall be durable and shall indicate the
maximum number of occupants permitted for each room
use,

115.2.1 Street numbers: Each structure to which a
street number has been assigned shall have the number
so assigned displayed in a position easily observed

26



ADMINISTRATION

and readable from the public right of way.

115.3 Replacement of damaged signs: All posting
signs shall be furnished by the owner and shall be of
permanent design. They shall not be removed or
defaced and, if removed or defaced, shall be immedi-
ately replaced.

SECTION 116.0 APPROVAL OF EQUIPMENT OPERATION

116.1 General: Equipment governed by the provisions
of the USBC or any referenced standard and hereafter
installed, relocated or altered shall not be operated
by persons other than the installer thereof until
such equipment has been inspected and tested as
required by the USBC or the referenced standard and a
final or limited inspection and approval has been
made by the building official.

SECTION 117.0 CERTIFICATE OF USE AND OCCUPANCY

117.1 When required: A building subject to the USBC
when erected shall not be used until a certificate of
use and occupancy has been issued by the building
official.

Note: Before issuing the certificate of use and
occupancy, the building official should consider the
effect of any applicable regulations of other govern-
mental agencies so that proper coordination therewith
may be achieved,

117.2 Temporary use and occupancy: Upon request of
the holder of a permit, the building official may
issue a temporary certificate of use and occupancy
for a building, or part thereof, before the entire
work covered by the permit has been completed,
provided such portion or portions may be occupied
safely prior to full completion of the building.

117.3 Contents of certificate: When a building is

27



USBC 1984

entitled thereto, the bullding official shall issue a
certificate of use and occupancy after written appli-
cation. The certificate shall state the purpose for
which the building may be used in its several parts,
When the certificate is issued, the building shall be
deemed to be in compliance with the USBC. The certi-
ficate of use and occupancy shall specify the use
group, the type of construction, the occupancy load
in the building and all parts thereof, the date on
which the building permit was issued, and any special
stipulations and conditions,

117.4 Changes in use and occupancy: A building
hereafter changed from one use group to another, in
whole or in part, whether or not a certificate of use
and occupancy has heretofore been issued, shall not
be used until a certificate for the changed use group
has been issued by the building official. Any use
which was not discontinued during the process of
change shall be discontinued within 30 days after the
completion of the use group change unless the re-
quired certificate therefor i1is secured from the
building official.

117.5 Reestablishment of prior use and occupancy:
After a change of use has been made in a building,
the re-establishment of a prior use that would not
have been legal in a new building of the same type of
construction is prohibited wunless the building
complies with all applicable provisions of the USBC.
A change from one prohibited use, for which a permit
has been granted, shall not be wmade to another
prohibited use.

117.6 Existing buildings: Upon written request from
the owner of an existing building or his agent, the
building official shall issue a certificate of use
and occupancy, provided there are no violations of
applicable State and local regulations and the
present use of the building existed prior to the
effective date of the initial edition of the USBC.

28



ADMINISTRATION

The USBC does not require the removal, alteration or
abandonment of, or prevent continued use of an
existing building that was not subject to the USBC
when constructed.

SECTION 118.0 LOCAL BOARD OF BUILDING CODE APPEALS

118.1 Local Board of Building Code Appeals: Each
local government shall have a local Board of Building
Code Appeals to act on applications for appeals as
required by Section 36-105 of the Code of Virginia;
or it shall enter into an agreement with the govern-
ing body of another county or municipality or with
some other agency, or a State agency approved by the
Virginia Department of Housing and Community Develop-
ment.

118.1.1 Separate divisions: The local Board of
Building Code Appeals may be divided into two or more
separate divisions to consider appeals relating to
separate areas of regulation of the Uniform Statewide
Building Code. When separate divisions are created,
the scope of each shall be clearly stated., The local
Board of Appeals may permit appeals from a division
to be submitted directly to the State Building Code
Technical Review Board. Each division shall comply
with the wmembership requirements and all other
requirements of the Uniform Statewide Building Code
relating to the local Board of Building Code Appeals.

118.2 Membership: The local Board of Building Code
Appeals shall consist of not less than five members
appointed by the local government. Members may be
reappointed.

Note: 1In order to provide continuity, it is recom~
mended that the terms of local Board members be stag-
gered so that less than half of the terms expire in
any one year.

118.2.1 Qualifications of Board members: Board

29



USBC 1984

members shall be selected by the local government on
the basis of their ability to render fair and compe-
tent decisions regarding application of the code, and
shall to the extent possible, represent different
occupational or professional fields. Employees or
officials of the local government appointing the
Board shall not serve as Board members.,

Note: At least one member should be an experienced
builder. At least one other member should be a
licensed professional engineer or architect.

118.3 Officers of the Board: The Board shall select
one of its members to serve as chairman. The build-
ing official shall designate an employee from the
department to serve as secretary to the Board. The
secretary shall keep a detailed record of all pro-
ceedings on file in the local building department,

118.4 Alterrates and absence of members: The local
government wmay appoint alternate members who may sit
on the Board in the absence of any regular members of
the Board and, while sitting on the Board, shall have
the full power and authority of the regular member.
A procedure shall be established for use of alternate
members in case of absence of regular members.

118.5 Control of conflict of interest: A member of
the Board shall not vote on any question in which
that member is currently engaged as contractor or
material dealer, has prepared the plans or speci-
fications, or has any personal interest.

118.6 Notice of meeting: The Board shall meet upon
notice of the chairman or at stated periodic meetings
if warranted by the volume of work. The Board shall
meet within 20 working days of the filing of an
appeal.

118.7 Application for appeal by building owner or
agent: The owner of a building or his agent may

30



ADMINISTRATION

appeal to the local Building Code Board of Appeals
within 90 days from a decision of the building
official when it is claimed that:

l. the building official has refused to grant a
modification which complies with the intent of the
provisions of the USBC; or

2. the true intent of the USBC has been incorrectly
interpreted; or

3. the provisions of the USBC do not fully apply; or

4. the use of a form of construction that is equal
to or better than that specified in the USBC has been
denied.

118.7.1 Form of application: Applications for
appeals shall be submitted in writing to the local
building code Board of Appeals.

118.8 Hearing open to public: All hearings shall be
public. The appellant, the appellant's representa-
tive, the official of the jurisdiction and any other
person whose interest may be affected by the matter
on appeal, shall be given an opportunity to be heard.

118.9 Postponement of hearing: When che total
current membership of the Board, as represented by
members or alternates, 1s not present to consider a
specific appeal, either the appellant, the building
official or their representatives may, prior to the
start of the hearing, request a postponement of the
hearing. A vote equivalent to a majority of the
quorum of the Board is required to reverse or modify
the decision of the building official. A quorum
shall be more than 50% of the Board.

118.11 Form of decision: Every action of the Board
shall be by resolution. Certified coples shall be

31



USBC 1984

furnished to the appellant and to the building
official,

118.12  Enforcement of decision: The building
official shall take immediate action in accordance
with the decision of the Board.

118.13 Appeal by Chief Fire Marshal: This section
shall apply only to buildings subject to State licen-
sure. The Chief Fire Marshal authorized by the
Virginia Public Building Safety Law, Article 2,
Chapter 6, Title 27, Code of Virginia, shall have the
right to inspect applications for building permits or
conversions of use group. He may appeal to the Local
Building Code Board of Appeals from the decision of
the building official when it is claimed that the
true intent of the USBC has been incorrectly inter-
preted as applied to the proposed construction or
conversion. Such appeals shall be filed before the
required permits are issued. The Chief Fire Marshal
may also inspect the building during construction,
repair or alteration. He may appeal to the 1local
building code board of appeals from the decision of
the building official when it is claimed that the
construction, répairs or alterations do not comply
with the approved plans. Such appeals shall be filed
prior to the issuance of the new or revised certi-
ficate of occupancy. Copies of all appeals shall be
furnished to the building official and to the appli-
cant for the building permit.

Note: The building official is encouraged to have
plans submitted to the Chief Fire Marshal for build-
ings subject to State licensure in order to prevent
delays in construction.

SECTION 119.0 APPEAL TO THE STATE BUILDING CODE
TECHNICAL REVIEW BOARD

119.1 Appeal to the State Building Code Technical
Review Board: Any person aggrieved by a decision of

32



ADMINISTRATION

the Local Board of Building Code Appeals who was a
party to the appeal, or any officer or member of the
governing body of the local jurisdiction, may appeal
to the State Building Code Technical Review Board.
Application for review shall be made to the State
Building Code Technical Review Board within 15 days
of receipt of the decision of the local appeals board
by the aggrieved party.

119.2 Enforcement of decision: Upon receipt of the
written decision of the State Building Code Technical
Review Board, the building official shall take
immediate action in accordance with the decision.

119.3 Court review: Decisions of the State Building
Code Technical Review Board shall be fipal if no
appeal is made. An appeal from the decision of the
State Buillding Code Technical Review Board may be
presented to the court of the original jurisdiction
in accordance with the provisions of the Adminis-
trative Process Act, Article 4, Title 9-6.14:1 of the
Code of Virginia.

SECTION 120.0 ALTERATIONS AND MAINTENANCE
AFTER CONSTRUCTION

120.1 Buildings constructed under USBC: Any build-
ing, for which a building permit had been issued or
on which construction had commenced, or for which
working drawings had been prepared in the year prior
to the effective date of any edition of the USBC,
shall remain subject to the edition of the USBC in
effect at the time of such issuance or commencement
of construction or preparation of plans and shall be
maintained in compliance with the edition of the USBC
under which the building permit was issued. Subse-
quent reconstruction, renovation, repair or demoli-
tion of such buildings shall be subject to the
pertinent provisions of the edition of the USBC in
effect at the time of such action. The provisions of
this section shall be applicable to equipment.

33



USBC 1984

120.1.1 Alterations to buildings constructed under
USBC: Existing parts of such buildings need not be
brought into compliance with later editions of the
USBC when reconstruction, renovation, or repair
thereof is undertaken. Existing materials and equip-
ment may be replaced with new materials and equipment
of a similar kind; however, all new systems, mate-
rials and equipment that are added shall be subject
to the edition of the USBC in effect at the time of
installation.

Note: The intent of this Section i1is that when
buildings are altered by the addition of equipment
that is neither required nor prohibited by the USBC,
only those requirements of the USBC that regulate the
health and safety aspects thereof shall apply. For
example, .a partial automatic alarm system may be
installed when no alarm system is required provided
it does not violate any of the electrical safety or
other safety requirements of the Code.

120.2 Buildings constructed before the USBC: Any
building which was not subject to any edition of the
USBC when constructed need not comply with the
requirements of the USBC for new construction.’

120.2.1 Alterations to buildings constructed before
the USBC: Existing parts of such buildings shall be
maintained in compliance with applicable State and
local codes when reconstruction, renovation, or
repair is undertaken. Existing waterials and equip-
ment may be replaced with new materials and equipment
of the same kind or replaced with greater capacity
equipment in the same location when not considered a
hazard; however, when items of equipment or con-
struction are added that were not part of the exist-
ing building, they shall be subject to the USBC.

Note: Alterations after construction may not be
used by the building official as justification for
requiring any part of the old building to be brought

34



ADMINISTRATION

into compliance with the current edition of the USBC.
For example, replacement of worn exit stair treads
that are somewhat deficient in length under current
standards does not, of itself, mean that the stair
must be widened. It is the intent of the USBC that
alterations be made in such a way as not to lower
existing levels of health and safety.

120.3 When additions are allowed: Unless separated
by a fire wall, an addition that increases the height
or area of an existing building shall meet the
conditions listed below:

l. The addition and the existing portion, when con-
sidered as a single building, shall conform to the
height and area limitations of the USBC in effect at
the time of the addition.

2. Means of egress conforming to the requirements of
the USBC shall be available to occupants of the addi-
tion either in the addition or in the existing
portion.

3. The addition shall otherwise comply with the
USBC,

4. Exposure to conditions in the existing portion
shall not reduce fire safety for the addition and its
occupants below that required by the USBC for build-
ings of such use and occupancy.

120.4 When ordinary repairs are allowed: Ordinary
repairs to buildings may be made without application
or notice to the building official; however, such
repairs shall not include the cutting away of any
wall, or partition or portion thereof, or the removal
or cutting of any structural beam or bearing support,
or the removal or change of any required means of
egress, or rearrangement of parts of a building
affecting the exit requirement. Ordinary repairs
shall not include additions, alterations, replacement

35



USBC 1984

or relocation of the plumbing, mechanical, or elec-
trical systems; nor other work affecting public
health or general safety. The term "ordinary repairs"
shall mean the replacement of the following materials
with like materials:

1. Painting.

2. Roofing when not exceeding 100 sq. ft. of roof
area.

3. Glass when not located within specific hazardous
locations as defined in Sectiom 1301,5.6.1 of the
BOCA Code, and all glass repairs in Use Group R-3 and
R~4 (single family) buildings.

4. Doors, except those in fire-rated wall assemblies
or exitways and the required exit of a dwelling,

5. Floor coverings and porch flooring.

6. Repairs to cracks in plaster and interior tile
work and the like.

7. Cabinets installed in residential occupancies.

SECTION 121.0 CONVERSION OF BUILDING USE

121.1 When allowed: No change shall be made in the
use of a building which would result in a change in
the use group classification unless the building
complies with all applicable requirements for the new
use group classification. An application shall be
made and a certificate of use and occupancy shall be
issued by the building official for the new use.
Where it is impractical to achieve exact compliance
with the USBC the building official shall, upon
application, consider 1issuing a modification under
the conditions of sectien 107.0 to allow conversionm.

36



ADMINISTRATION

SECTION 122,0 DEMOLITION OF BUILDINGS

122.1 Disconnection of utility services: Before a
building may be demolished or removed, the owner or
his agent shall notify all utilities having service
connections te the building such as water, electric,
gas and sewer. A permit to demolish or remove a
building shall not be issued until a release is
obtained from the utilities, stating that their
respactive service connections and appurtenant
equipment, such as meters and regulators, have been
removed or sealed and plugged in a safe manner.

122.2 Notice to adjoining owners: Prior to issuance
of a permit to demolish, written notice shall be
given by the applicant to the owners of adjoining
lots and to the owners of other lots where the
temporary removal of utility wires or other facil-
ities may be necessitated by the proposed work,

122.3 Hazard prevention: Whenever a building is
demolished or removed, the premises shall be main-
tained free from all unsafe or hazardous conditions
by the proper use of the premises and by restoration
of established grades and by the erection of the
necessary retaining walls and fences in accordance
with the provisions of Article 18 of the BOCA Code.

SECTION 123.0 MOVED BUILDINGS

123.1 General: No building shall be moved into or
within the jurisdiction without application to the
building official and issuance of a certificate of
use and occupancy for the new location. The entire
building shall be brought into compliance with the
USBC unless it meets the following requirements after
relocation,

l. No change has been made in the use of the build-
ing.

37



USBC 1984

2. The building complies with all State and 1local
requirements that were applicable to it in its
previous location and that would have been applicable
to it 1if it had originally been constructed in the
new location.

3. The building has not become unsafe during the
moving process due to structural damage or for other
reasons,

4. Any alterations, reconstruction, renovations or
repairs made pursuant to the move have been done in
compliance with the USBC.

SECTION 124.0 UNSAFE BUILDINGS

124.1 Right of condemnation before completion: Any
building under construction that fails to comply with
the USBC through deterioration, improper maintenance,
faulty construction, or for other reasons, and
thereby becomes unsafe, unsanitary, or deficient in
adequate exit facilities, and which constitutes a
fire hazard, or is otherwise dangerous to human life
or the public welfare, shall be deemed an unsafe
‘building. Any such unsafe building shall be made
safe through compliance with the USBC or shall be
taken down and removed, as the building official may
deem necessary.

124.1,1 Right of condemnation after completion:
Authority to condemn unsafe buildings on which
construction has been completed and a certificate of
occupancy has been issued ,or which have been occu-
pled, may be exercised after official action by the
local governing body pursuant to Section 36-105 of
the Uniform Statewide Building Code law of the Code
of Virginia,

124.2 Inspection of unsafe buildings; records: The
building official shall examine every building
reported, before completion, as unsafe, and shall

38



ADMINISTRATION

prepare a report to be filed in the records of the
department. In addition to a description of unsafe
conditions found, the report shall include the use of
the building, and nature and extent of damages, if
any, caused by a collapse or failure,

124.3 Notice of unsafe building: If a building is
found to be unsafe the building official shall serve
a written notice on the owmer, his agent or person in
control, describing the unsafe condition and speci-
fying the required repairs or improvements to be made
to render the building safe, or requiring the unsafe
building or portion thereof to be taken down and
removed within a stipulated time. Such notice shall
require the person thus notified to declare without
delay to the building official his acceptance or
rejection of the terms of the notice.

124,4 Posting of unsafe building notice: If the
person named in the notice of unsafe building cannot
be found after diligent search, such notice shall be
sent by registered or certified mail to the 1last
known address of such person. 4 copy of the notice
shall be posted in a conspicuous place on the pre-
mises. Such procedure shall be deemed the equivalent
of personal notice.

124.5 Disregard of notice: Upon refusal or neglect
of the person served with a notice of unsafe building
to comply with the requirement of the notice to
abate the unsafe condition, the legal counsel of
the jurisdiction shall be advised of all the facts
and shall be requested to institute the appropriate
legal action to compel compliance,

124.6 Vacating building: When, in the opinion of the
building official, there is actual and immediate
danger of failure or collapse of a building, or any
part thereof, which would endanger life, or when any
building or part of a building has fallen and life is
endangered by occupancy of the building, the building

39



USBC 1984

official wmay order the occupants to vacate the
building forthwith, The building official shall
cause a notice to be posted at each entrance to such
building reading as follows: This Structure is
Unsafe and its Use or Occupancy has been Prohibited
by the Building Official. No person shall thereafter
enter such a building except for one of the following
purposes: (a) to make the required repairs; (b) to
take the building down and remove it; or {c) to make
inspections authorized by the building official.

124.7 Temporary safeguards and emergency repairs:
When, in the opinion of the building official, there
is immediate danger of collapse or failure of a
building or any part thereof which would endanger
life, or when a violation of this code results in a
-fire hazard that creates an immediate, serious and
imminent threat to the life and safety of the occu-
pants; he shall cause the necessary work to be done
to the extent permitted by the local government to
render such building or part thereof temporarily
safe, - whether or not legal action to compel com-"
pliance has been instituted.

SECTION 125.0 CONTINUATION OF COMPLIANCE

125.1 Continued compliance required: Buildings and
their equipment shall be maintained in safe and
sanitary condition in compliance with the edition of
the USBC to which they were subject when constructed.

SECTION 126.0 VALIDITY

126.1 Partial invalidity: 1In the event any part or
provision of the USBC is held to be illegal or void,
such holdings shall not have the effect of making
void or illegal any of the other parts or provisions
thereof, It shall be presumed that the USBC would
have been adopted without such illegal or invalid
part or provision if the determination of invalidity
had been known at the time of adoption.

40



1984 EDITION
VIRGINIA UNIFORM STATEWIDE BUILDING CODE

ADDENDA
ADDENDUM 1

AMENDMENTS TO THE BOCA BASIC/NATIONAL BUILDING,
CODE/1984 EDITION

As provided in Section 101.3 of the Virginia Uniform
Statewide Building Code, the amendments noted in this
Addendum shall be made to the BOCA Basic/National
Building Code/1984 Edition for use as part of the
USBC.

ARTICLE 1
ADMINISTRATION AND ENFORCEMENT

(A) Entire article is deleted and repléced by Article
1, Adoption, Administration and Enforcement, of the
Virginia Uniform Statewide Building Code.

ARTICLE 2
DEFINITIONS

(A) Change the following definitions in Section 201.0,
General Definitions to read:

"Building" Means a combination of any materials,
whether portable or fixed, that forms a structure for
use or occupancy by persons or property; provided,
however, that farm buildings not used for residential
purposes and frequented generally by the owner,
members of his family, and farm employees shall be ex-
empt from the provisions of the USBC, but such build-
ings lying within a flood plain or in a mudslide-prome
area shall be subject to flood proofing regulations,
as applicable. The word building shall be construed
as though followed by the words "or part or parts
and fixed equipment thereof unless the context clearly
requires a different meaning. The word building
includes the word structure,

41



USBC 1984

"Jurisdiction" Means the local governmental unit which
is responsible for enforcing the USBC under State law.

"Owner" Means the owner or owners of the freehold of
the premises or lesser estate therein, a mortgagee or
vendee in possession, assignee of rents, receiver,
executor, trustee, lessee or other person, firm or
corporation in control of a building.

"Structure" Means an assembly of materials forming a
construction for use including stadiums, pgospel and
circus tents, reviewing stands, platforms, stagings,
observation towers, radio towers, water tanks, tres-
.tles, pilers, wharves, swimming pools, amusement de-
vices, storage bins, and other structures of this
general nature. The word structure shall be con-
strued as though followed by the words 'or part or
parts thereof' unless the context clearly requires a
different meaning.

(B) Add these new definitions to Section 201.0,
General Definitiomns:

"Ambulatory" Means the condition of a person who is
physically and mentally capable of making an exit
from a building in an emergency. This includes the
ascent and descent of stairs, without the assistance
of another person or without being dependent on the
use of any device, such as, but not limited to, a
wheel chair, walker or leg prosthesis. The deter-
mination of whether a person is ambulatory shall be
based on information contained in the medical report.

"Conversion" Means a change in use group classifica-
tion.

"Farm building" A structure located on a farm uti-
lized for the storage, handling or production of
agricultural, horticultural and floricultural pro-
ducts normally intended for sale to domestic or
foreign markets and buildings used for the mainte-

52



ADDENDUM 1

nance, storage or use of animals or equipment related
thereto.

"Local govermnment" Means any city, county or town in
this State, or the governing body thereof.

"Mobile home" Means a structure, transportable in one
or more sections, which in the traveling mode is 8
body feet or more in width or 40 body feet or more in
length, or, when erected on site, is 320 or more
square feet, and which is built on a permanent chassis
and designed to be used as a dwelling with or without
a permanent foundation when connected to the required
utilities, and includes the plumbing, heating, air
conditioning and electrical systems contained therein.

"Night club" Means a place of assembly that provides
exhibition, performance or other forms of entertain-
ment; serves food and/or alcoholic beverages; and pro-
vides music and space for dancing.

"Plans" Means .all drawings that together with the
specifications, describe the proposed building con-
struction in sufficient detail and provide sufficient
information to enable the building official to deter-
mine whether it complies with the USBC.

"Specifications" Means all written description, compu-
tations, exhibits, test data and other documents that
together with the plans, describe the proposed build-
ing construction in sufficient detail and provide suf-
ficient information to enable the building official to
determine whether it complies with the USBC.

"Use group" Means the classification or subclassi-
fication of a building or structure based on the
purpose for which it is used as listed in Article 3.

The term includes:

Use Group A (Section 302.0)

43



USBC 1984

Use Group B (Section 303.0)

Use Group E (Section 304.0)

Use Groups F, F-1, F~2 (Section 305.0)

Use Group H (Seaction 306.0)

Use Groups I, I-1, I-2, I-3 (Section 307.0)
Use Group M (Section 308.0)

Use Groups R-1, R-2, R-3, R-4 (Section 309,0)
Use Groups S, S-1, 5-2 (Section 310.0)

Use Group U (Section 311.0)

ARTICLE 3
USE GROUP CLASSIFICATION

(A) Change Section 302.1 to read:

302.1 General: All buildings and structures, or parts
thereof, shall be classified in Use Group A which are
used or designed for places of assembly as defined in
this code. Assembly type uses with a total occupancy
load of 50 or less shall be classified as Use Group B.

(B) Add the following note to Section 307.1:

Note: For builldings such as hospitals and nursing
homes that must comply with the Federal Life Safety
Code standards, consideration should be given to
modifications based on the use of the 1985 Amendments
to the BOCA Basic/National Model Building Code. These
amendments are intended to reconcile the differences
between the BOCA Code and the Life Safety Code.

(C) Change Section 307.2 to read as follows:

307.2 Use Group I-1: This use group shall include
buildings housing more than 20 individuals who,
because of age, mental instability or other reasons,
must live in a supervised environment but who are
physically capable of responding to an emergency
situation without personal assistance and who are
ambulatory as defined in Section 201.0, General

44



ADDENDUM 1

Definitions. Included in this group are uses such as
facilities for children 2-1/2 years of age or older,
aged persons, mentally dimpaired and convalescents,
including convalescent facilities, group homes, homes
for the aged, mentally retarded care facilities,
nursing homes (ambulatory), orphanages and residential
care facilities. Occupancies such as the above
housing fewer than 21 individuals shall be classified
as a residential use group,

ARTICLE 4
TYPES OF CONSTRUCTION CLASSIFICATION
{A) Delete Section 401.2 False designation:
ARTICLE 5
GENERAL BUILDING LIMITATIONS
(A) Change Section 505.1 to read as follows: .
505.1 Alteration limitations: These provisions shall

not be deemed to prohibit alterations within the
limitations of Section 505.2.

(B) Replace Section 512.0 Physically Handicapped and
Aged with the following new section:

SECTION 512.0 BUILDING ACCESSIBILITY AND USABILITY
FOR PERSONS WITH PHYSICAL DISABILITIES

512,1 Application: The accessibility and usability
requirements of Section 512.0 shall apply to buildings
and to the exterior sites and facilities associated
therewith, except as follows:

1. Section 512.0 shall not apply to buildings or
portions thereof classified as Use Group H, S, or
Ul

45



USBC 1984

2, Section 512.0 shall not apply to any building with
an area of 1,000 square feet or less., However, the
building entrance and the entrances to all spaces
therein that are open to the public shall be
accessible.

3. Section 512.0 shall not apply to a building of Use
Group A that accommodates fewer than 51 persons.
However, the building entrance and the entrances to
all spaces therein that are open to the public
shall be accessible,

4. Section 512.0 shall apply only to the first story
of any multistory building in which the combined
area of all stories i1s less than 12,000 square
feet. However, the entrances to all spaces therein
that are open to the public shall be accessible.

5. Section 512.0 shall not apply to individually owned
dwelling units in buildings of Use Groups R-1, R-2,
and R-3, :

6. Section 512.0 shall not apply to buildings of Use
Group R-4.

7. Section 512.0 shall not apply to mechanical rooms,
storage rooms, and other types of incidental rooms
and spaces.

512.2 Standard imposed: Buildings regulated by this
section, the functional spaces and elements therein,
and the exterior sites and facilities associated
therewith, shall be made accessible and usable in
accordance with American National Standard Specifi-
cations for Making Buildings and Facilities Accessible
to and Usable by Physically Handicapped People,
ANST All7.1-1980 (Standard).

Note: For ease of reference, the corresponding
section numbers of the ANSI Standard are appended, in
brackets to some of the following provisions of this
sectilon.

46



ADDENDUM 1

512.2.1 Accessibility defined: Accessible, as
applied to building sites and facilities, to build-
ings, and to functional spaces and elements in build-
ings, means that they have been designed and equipped
in compliance with the Standard so that they can be
approached, entered and used by physically disabled
persons. ANSI 3.5

312.2.2 Adaptability defined: Adaptability, as applied
to buildings, sites and facilities, to buildings, and
to functional spaces and elements in buildings, means
that they have been designed in compliance with the
definition of adaptability in the Standard so that
they can be readily converted to comply with the
accesslbility requirements of Section 512.0 without
the necessity for structural changes or for changes to
the concealed plumbing, electrical or mechanical
services, ANSI 3.4

512,3 Reasonable numbers for accessibility in build-
ings: Where the Standard requires that a reasonable
number of functional spaces and elements be made
accessible in buildings, the following numbers shall
apply: ANSI 2,2.3

l. Drinking fountains: If drinking fountains are
provided, at least one on each accessible floor
shall comply with the Standard. ANSI 4,1.2(9) 1

2. Toilet and bathing facilities: If toilet, bathing
or shower facilities are provided, a minimum of one
for each sex on each accessible floor shall comply
with the Standard. If there are practical diffi-
culties involved in carrying out this requirement
when alterations or additions are made to an
existing building, or when one Use Group is changed
to another Use Group, the required separate rooms
for each sex need not be made accessible if an
additional accessible room containing the required
facilities is provided. Such room shall be lock-
able from the interior for privacy. A separate

47



USBC 1984

accessible wurinal is not required if an accessible
water closet 1s provided. ANSI 4,1.2(10)

3. Toilets in shopping malls: In shopping centers and
shopping malls, required toilet facilities may be
installed in individual stores or in a central
toilet area if the distance of travel from the main
entrance of any store does not exceed 250 feet and
the way of travel is totally within the shopping
center or mall.

4. Public telephones: If a bank of public telephones
is provided on any accessible floor, at least one
telephone shall be equipped with a volume control
that complies with the Standard. ANSI 4,31.5

5. Fixed seating, tables, and work surfaces: 1If fixed
or built-in seating, tables or work surfaces are
provided in accessible spaces, a minimum of two
percent, but at least one, shall comply with the
Standard. ANSI 4.1.2(17)

6. Seating in assembly areas: A minimum of two
percent, but at least two, of the total of all
seats shall be arranged as accessible seating
locations in compliance with the Standard for
persons who use wheelchairs , Portable or quick
release seats may be utilized in fifty percent of
the required accessible seating locations 1in
assembly areas with fixed seats, provided the seats
are removed when the space is needed for persons
using wheelchairs. Accessible seating locations
shall be provided on all levels where wheelchair
access is possible. ANST 4.33.1

512.3.1 Supplemental requirements for accessibility
in buildings: The following functional spaces and
elements in buildings shall be made accessible, except
in single family dwelling units:

l. Dormitories: A minimum of two percent, but at

48



ADDENDUM 1

least one, of the dormitory bedroom spaces and at
least one of each type of public functional space and
element in the building. Only the floors which have
dormitory and bedroom spaces, or on which accessible
functional spaces and elements are provided, need be
accessible,

2. Dining areas: A minimum of two percent, but at
least one, of the seating locations, and a minimum
of one of each type of functional space and
element associated with the dining area.

3. Laboratories: A minimum of two percent, but at
least one, of the stations within each laboratory,
and a minimum of one of each type of functional
space and element associated with the laboratory.

4, Libraries: On each library floor, a minimum of two
percent, but at least one, of the seating locations
at study carrels, and at least one table and one of
each type of functional space and element asso-
ciated with the library.

5. Physical education facilities: In locker or
dressing rooms, a minimum of one percent, but at
least one, of the lockers and one of each type of
associated functional space and element shall be
accessible.

512.4 Reasonable numbers for exterior accessibility:
Where the Standard requires that a reasonable number
of exterior sites and facilities associated with
buildings be made accessible, the following numbers
shall apply:

l. Parking for 5 or more vehicles: When 5 or more
parking spaces are provided for Use Group R-1 and
R-2 buildings, a minimum of one per cent, but at
least one, of the parking spaces shall comply with
the Standard. When parking is provided for other
buildings, the number of parking spaces required to

49



USBC 1984

comply with the Standard shall be as specified in
Table 3512.4. Accessible parking spaces shall be
identified by signs showing the symbol of accessi-
bility specified in the Standard. The bottom edge of
each sign shall be no lower than 4 feet, nor higher
than 7 feet, above the parking surface. This require-
ment applies to parking lots and garages.

2. Parking for fewer than 5 vehicles: When fewer than
5 parking spaces are provided, at least one shall
be 13 feet wide. Tt shall be marked with lines to
provide a parking area 8 feet in width and a
loading area 5 feet in width.

TABLE 512.4
Total parking spaces Required Number of
in lot or garages accessible spaces
5 thru 50 1
51 thru 100 2
101 thru 200 3
201l and over 3 plus 1% of
spaces In excess
of 200

Note: When determination by percent results in a
number containing a decimal of .5 or more, the next
higher full number shall be used.

3. Drinking fountains: If drinking fountains are
provided, at least one shall comply with the
Standard. ANSI 4,1.1(9)

4. Toilet and bathing facilities: If toilet, bathing
or shower facilitles are provided, a minimum of one
for each sex shall comply with the standard. If
there are practical difficulties involved in
carrying out this requirement when alterations or
additions are made to an existing building, or when

50



ADDENDUM 1

one Use Group is changed to another Use Group, the
required separate rooms for each sex need not be made
accessible if an additional accessible room which
contains the required accessible facilities is pro-
vided. Such room shall be lockable from the interior
for privacy. A separate accessible urinal is not
required if an accessible water closet is provided.
ANST 4.1.1(10)

5. Public telephones: If a bank of public telephones
is provided, at least one telephone shall be
equipped with a volume control that complies with
ANST 4.31.5,

6. Fixed seating, tables, and work surfaces: If fixed
or built-in seating, tables or work surfaces are
provided, a minimum of two percent, but at least
one shall comply with the standard,

7. Seating in assembly areas: A minimum of two
percent, but at least two, of the total of all
seats shall be arranged as accessible seating
locations in compliance with the Standard for
persons who use wheelchairs. Portable or quick
release seats may be utilized in fifty percent of
the required accessible seating locations in
assembly areas with fixed seats, provided the seats
are removed when the space is needed for persons
using wheelchairs. Accessible seating locations
shall be provided on all levels. ANSI 4,33.1

512.5 Bedroom units in Use Group R-l1: In hotels,
motels, and other buildings of Use Group R-1 the
entrance doors to bedroom units and to the toilets
therein shall be accessible. In such buildings that
contain more than 20 bedroom units, the number of
bedroom units required to be accessible shall be as
follows:

1. 21 through 99, one accessible unit;

51



USBC 1984

2, 100 and over, one accessible unit, plus one for
each additional 100 units or fraction thereof. To
the extent practicable, the accessible bedroom
units shall be representative of the different
types of units within the building.

512.5.1 Multiple buildings on a single lot: 1In
determining the number and location of accessible
bedroom units, all buildings of Use Group R-1 on a
single lot shall be considered as one building.

312.6 Dwelling units in Use Group R-2 and R-3: 1In
buildings of Use Group R-Z or R-3 containing more than
20 dwelling units ,except those that are individually
owned, the number of dwelling units required to be
accessible shall be as follows:

1. 21 through 99, one accessible unit;

2, 100 and over, one accessible unit plus one for each
additional 100 units or fraction thereof.

512.6.1 Multiple buildings on a single lot: 1In deter-
mining the required number and location of accessible
dwelling units, all buildings of Use Group R-2 and R-3
on a single lot shall be considered as one building.
ANSTI 3.5

512.7 Adaptability in R-2 Dwelling Units: Such units
need not be fully equipped for accessibility at the
time of construction provided at least 5% of all
dwelling units comply with the adaptability require-
ments of Sections 4.34.4, 4.34.5 and 4.34.6 of the
Standard. The accessibility requirements for tele-
phone height, for lavatory, tub and shower controls,
and for other items specified in Section 4.34.2 of the
Standard may be omitted at the time of construction
provided any such item can, when needed by the occu-
pant, be readily adapted to full accessibility without
plumbing, electrical, mechanical, or structural
change.

52



ADDENDUM 1

ARTICLE 6
SPECIAL USE AND OCCUPANCY REQUIREMENTS

(A) Delete Section 603.0 Fire Prevention Code.
(B) Change Section 613.0 to read as follows:

SECTION 613.0 MOBILE HOMES

613.1 Anchorage and tiedown: Mobile homes may be
mounted on and anchored to permanent foundations
specifically designed for each such mobile home. When
the mobile home 1s not mounted on and anchored to a
permanent foundation, a system of stabilizing devices
conforming to accepted engineering practices shall be
used. The manufacturer shall provide printed instruc-
tions with each mobile home specifying the location,
required capacity and other details of stabilizing
devices (tiedowns, piers, blocking, footings, etec.) on
which the design of the mobile home is based, Foot-
ings or foundations on which piers or other stabi-
lizing devices are mounted shall be carried down to
the established frost line.

613.2 Required anchorage:

(a) Mobile homes installed or relocated in the Hurri-
cane zone on or after October 15, 1974, and mobile
homes installed or relocated outside of the Hurricane
zone on or after April 15, 1975, shall be anchored in
accordance with this section.

(b) The Hurricane zone includes the following counties
and all cities located therein, contiguous thereto, or
to the east thereof:

Accomack King William Richmond
Charles City Lancaster Surry

Essex Mathews Sussex
Gloucester Middlesex Southampton
Greensville Northumberland Westmoreland
Isle of Wight Northampton York

53



USBC 1984

James City New Kent
King & Queen Prince George

(c) Mobile homes equipped by the manufacturer with a
system of tiedowns, shall be attached vertically and
diagonally to a system of ground anchors in a manner
adequate to resist wind overturning and sliding as
imposed by the design loads. Mobile homes hereafter
installed in the Hurricane zone shall be of Hurricane
and Windstorm Resistive design. Mobile homes not
equipped by the manufacturer with a system of tiedowns
shall be anchored in a manner deemed adequate by the
local building official to resist wind overturning and
sliding.

613.3 Placement of ground anchors: Unless the entire
tiedown system, including ground anchors, is designed
by a professional engineer or architect, ground
anchors shall be placed as follows:

l. Hurricane zones: Not more than 12 feet on centers
beginning from the front wall of the mobile home.
Not more than 6 feet open-end spacing shall be pro-
vided at the rear wall of the mobile home unless
additional tiedowns are installed.

2. Nonhurricane zones: Not more than 24 feet on
centers beginning from the front wall of the mobile
home. Not more than 6 feet open-end spacing shall
be provided at the rear line of the mobile home un~
less additional tiedowns are installed.

3. Load capacity: Each ground anchor shall be capable
of resisting an allowable working load equal to or
exceeding 3,150 pounds applied in the direction of
the tiedown. In addition, each ground anchor shall
be capable of withstanding a 50 percent overlead
without failure.

4, Weather resistance: Ground anchors shall be
resistant to weathering deterioration at least

54



ADDENDUM 1

equivalent to that provided by a coating of zinc on
steel strapping of not less than 0.30 ounces per
square foot of surface coated.

ARTICLE 7
INTERIOR ENVIRONMENTAL REQUIREMENTS

(A) Delete Section 702.1 Unsafe Conditions.
(B) Add new Section 704,2.2 as follows:

704.2.2 Insect screens: Every door and window or
other outside opening used for ventilation purposes
serving any building containing habitable rooms, food
preparation areas, food service areas, or any areas
where products used in food for human consumption are
processed, manufactured, packaged or stored, shall be
supplied with approved tight fitting screens of not
less than 16 mesh per inch.

(C) Amend Section 715.0 as follows:

SECTION 715.0 SOUND TRANSMISSION CONTROL
IN RESIDENTIAL BUILDINGS

715.1 Scope: This section shall apply to all common
interior walls, partitions and floor/ceiling assem-
blies between adjacent dwellings or between a dwelling
and adjacent public areas such as halls, corridors,
stalrs or service areas in all buildings of Use Group
R.

715.2 Airborne noise: Walls, partitions and floor/-
ceiling assemblies separating dwellings from each
other or from public or service areas shall have a
sound transmission class (STC) of not less than 45 for
airborne noise when tested in accordance with ASTM E90
listed in Appendix A. This requirement shall not
apply to dwelling entrance doors, but such doors shall
be tight-fitting to the frame and sill,

55



USBC 1984

715.3 Structure borme sound: Floor/ceiling assemblies
between dwellings and between a dwelling and a public
or service area within the structures shall have an
impact insulation class (IIC) rating of not less than
45 when tested in accordance with ASTM E492 listed 1in
Appendix A,

SECTION 716.0 HEATING FACILITIES

716.1 Residential buildings: Every owner of any
structure who rents, leases, or lets one or more
dwelling units or guest rooms on terms, either ex-
pressed or implied, to furnish heat to the occupants
thereof shall supply sufficient heat during the period
from October 1 to May 15 to maintain a room temper-
ature of not less than 65 degrees F., (18 degrees €.),
in all habitable spaces, bathrooms, .and toilet rooms
during the hours between 6:30 a.m. and 10:30 p.m. of
each day and maintain a temperature of not less than
60 degrees F. (16 degrees C.) during other hours. The
temperature shall be measured at a point 3 feet (914
mm) above the floor and 3 feet (914 mm) from exterior
walls,

Exception: When the exterior temperature falls
below 0 degrees F. (-18 degrees C.) and the heating
system is operating at its full capacity, a minimum
room temperature of 60 degrees F. (16 degrees C.)
shall be maintained at all cimes.

716.2 Other structures: Every owner of any structure
who rents, leases, or lets the structure or any part
thereof on terms, either express or implied, to
furnish heat to the occupant thereof; and every
occupant of any structure or part thereof who rents or
leases said structure or part thereof on terms, either
express or implied, to supply its own heat, shall
supply sufficient heat during the period from October
1 to May 15 to maintain a temperature of not less than
65 degrees F. (18 degrees C.), during all working
hours in all enclosed spaces or rooms where persons

56



ADDENDUM 1

are employed and working. The temperature shall be
measured at a point 3 feet (914 mm) above the floor
and 3 feet (914 mm) from exterior walls.

Exceptions:

I. Processing, storage and operations areas that
require cooling or special temperature conditioms,

2. Areas in which persons are primarily engaged in
vigorous physical activities,

ARTICLE 8
MEANS OF EGRESS

(A) Delete Section 804.0 Existing Buildings.
(B) Change Section 812.5.1 to read as follows:

812.5.1 Locks and Latches: All required egress doors
shall be readily openable from the side from which
egress is to be made without the use of a key, tool,
special knowledge or effort, except for special
institutional uses as indicated in Section 812.5.5 and
occupancies as indicated in Section 812.5.3. Except
for dwelling wunits, draw bolts, hooks and other
similar devices shall be prohibited on all egress
doors.

(C) Change Section 812.5.3 to read as follows:

812.5.3 Special Locking Devices: Devices such as
double cylinder dead bolts which can be used to lock
doors to prevent egress shall be permitted on egress
doors in Use Groups B, F, M or S. These doors may be
locked from the inside when all of the following
conditions are met:

l. The building is occupied by employees only and all
employees have ready access to the unlocking
device,

57



USBC 1984

2. The locking device is of a type that is readily
distinguished as locked, or a "DOOR LOCKED" sign
with red letters on white background is installed
on the locked doors. The letters shall be 6" high
and 3/4" wide.

3. A permanent sign is installed on or adjacent to
lockable doors stating "THIS DOOR TO REMAIN UN-
LOCKED DURING PUBLIC OCCUPANCY." The sign shall be
in letters not less than 1" high on a contrasting
background,

EXCEPTION: Key operation is permitted from a dwelling
unit provided the key cannot be removed when the door
is locked from the side from which egress is to be
made.

(D) Change Table 816 as follows:

Table B16
TREAD AND RISER SIZE 2+ ¢
Use group Max. riser Min. rise Min. tread
R-3 and within 8% in. - 9 in.
dwelling units
in Use Group R-2
All others® 7 in. - 11 in.

Note a. There shall not be a variation exceeding
3/16" in the depth of adjacent treads or in the height
of adjacent risers, and the tolerance between the
largest and smallest riser shall not exceed 3/8" in
any flight. Except in one and two family dwellings,
tread and riser shall be so proportioned that the sum
of two risers plus one tread, exclusive of nosing, is
not less than 24 inches nor more than 25 inches.

58



ADDENDUM 1

Note b. 1In balconies and galleries, risers and
treads shall be as shown in above table, but one tread
in each seat platform width may have a greater width
to accommodate access to seats. Seating platforms
shall be of a uniform width.

Note ¢. 1 inch = 25.4 mm.

ARTICLE 9
STRUCTURAL LOADS AND STRESSES

(A) Delete Section 905.0 Existing buildings.
(B) Change Section 905.3 as follows:

Section 905.3 Buillding repaired: When repairs are
made to the structural portion of an existing build-
ing, and the uncovered structural portions are found
unsound, such parts shall be replaced with like
materials or be made to conform to the requirements
for buildings hereafter erected.

ARTICLE 10
FOUNDATION SYSTEMS

(A) Add new provision to Section 1005.0 Depth of
Footings:

1005.4 Small storage sheds: The building official may
accept utility sheds used for storage purposes that do
not exceed 150 square feet in gross floor area when
erected or mounted on adequate supports.

ARTICLE 11
MATERIALS AND TESTS

(A) Add new Section 1100.4 to read as follows:

59



USBC 1984

1100.4 Lead based paint: Lead based paint with a lead
content of more than 0.5 percent shall not be applied
to any interior or exterior surface of a dwelling,
dwelling unit or child care facility, including fences
and outbuildings at these locationms.

ARTICLE 12
STEEL, MASONRY, CONCRETE, GYPSUM AND LUMBER
CONSTRUCTION

(A) Change Section 1201.2 to read as follows:

1201.2 Plans: Plans in sufficient detail to indicate
compliance to the building official, and drawn to
appropriate scale, shall be submitted showing the
slze, section and relative locations of all structural
members with floor levels, column centers and all
offsets dimensioned. The design 1loads shall be
clearly indicated for all parts of the building.

ARTICLE 13
BUILDING ENCLOSURES, WALLS AND WALL THICKNESS

(A) Add new provision to Section 1312.4 as follows:

1312.4,2 Underfloor space: The finished grade of the
underfloor space may be located at the bottom of the
footings; however, where there is evidence that the
ground water table can rise to within 6 inches of the
finished grade at the building perimeter or where
there is evidence that surface water does not readily
drain from the building site, the building official
may require that the grade in the underfloor space be
as high as the outside finished grade, wunless an
approved drainage system is provided.

(B) Change Section 1313.0 to read as follows:

60



ADDENDUM 1

SECTION 1313.0 FLOODPROOFING

1313.1 General: All buildings or structures located
in areas prone to flooding as determined by the
governmental body having jurisdiction shall be flood-
proofed in accordance with the provisions of this
section. Areas subject to a 1 percent or greater
chance of flooding in any given year (100 year flood)
shall be the minimum criteria for determining an area
prone to flooding.

1313,2 Base flood level (100 year flood level): The
base flood level (100 year flood level) shall be the
elevation or depth of potential flooding as determined
by the governmental body having jurisdiction, but in
no case less than the elevation or depth established
by the 100 year flood plain.

1313.2.1 Anchorage: All structures shall be. anchored
to prevent flotation, collapse or lateral movement.

1313.2.2 Elevations: The 1lowest floor, including
basement, of all new construction or additions and
alterations to existing structures must be built at or
above the level of the One Hundred (100) Year Flood,
except that non-residential structures, together with
their attendant utility and sanitary facilities may be
floodproofed to that level in a watertight manner with
wvalls impermeable to the passage of water and with
structural components having the capability of resist-
ing hydrostatic and hydrodynamic loads and the effects
of buoyancy. All on site waste disposal systems shall
be located to avoid impairment to them
and contamination from them during flooding.

1313.3 Coastal High Hazard Areas: All new construc-—
tion and additions or alterations to existing struc-
tures within identified coastal high hazard areas
shall be constructed on adequately anchored pilings or
columns, and securely anchored to such piles or
columns so that the lowest portion of the structural

61



USBC 1984

members of the lowest floor, except pilings and
column, shall be elevated to or above the base flood
level., The use of fill for structural support of
buildings or structures 1s prohibited in the coastal
high hazard area. For the purpose of this section,
coastal high hazard area shall mean an area subject to
high velocity waters, including but net limited to
hurricane wave wash.

1313.3.]1 Obstructions: In coastal high hazard areas,
the space below the lowest floor shall remain free
from obstructions, except pilings and columns, or be
constructed with "breakaway walls" intended to col-
lapse under stress due to flooding, wind driven water
or abnormally high tides without jeopardizing the
structural supports of the building or structure.
Such enclosed space shall not be used for human
occupancy.

1313.4 Manufactured homes: All manufactured homes or
mobile homes shall have the lowest floor at or above
the base flood level. They may be elevated by the use
of compacted fill or by placement on pilings. Pilings
shall be placed in stable soil no more than ten 10
feet apart. Where pilings extend six (6) feet or more
above ground level, reinforcement shall be provided.
When elevated, units shall be provided with exterior
stairway and landings as required by the applicable
sections of this code.

1313.4.1 Anchorage and tie-down: All manufactured
homes or mobile homes shall be anchored to withstand
wind forces and uplift to prevent flotation, collapse
or lateral movement. Where concrete platforms are
provided for parking of the unit, anchorage may be by
eyelets embedded in the concrete with adequate anchor
plates, hooks or other suitable means. Anchorage and
tie downs shall be installed in accordance with the
manufacturers installation instruction, and Section
613.0.

62



ADDENDUM 1

1313.4.2 Surface drainage: Adequate surface drainage
shall be provided around manufactured homes or mobile
homes.

1313.5 Floodproof certification: A 1licensed pro-
fessional architect or engineer shall certify that all
applicable floodproofing requirements of this section
are met,

ARTICLE 14
FIRERESISTIVE CONSTRUCTION REQUIREMENTS

(A) Change Section 1401.]1 to read as follows:

1401.1 General: Plans in sufficient detail to indi-
cate compliance to the building official, and drawn to
appropriate scale, shall be submitted that designate
the type of construction and the fireresistance rating
of all structural elements as required by the BOCA
Code. The plans and specifications shall include the
supporting data needed to substantiate all fireresis-
tance ratings.

(B) Change Section 1405.8.1 as follows:

1405.8.1 General: The use of uninhabited basements,
cavity walls, areas above ceilings or attic spaces as
supply, makeup, exhaust or return air plenums or ducts
is prohibited.

Exception: Air-ceiling plenums may be installed as
supply or return air plenums in all occupancies except
buildings of Use Group R-3, provided such air plenums
meet the requirements of other applicable articles of
this code and of the mechanical code listed in Appen-
dix A, and provided fuel-fired equipment or exposed
materials with flame spread greater than 25 and smoke
developed greater than 50 are not located therein.
The use of air-ceiling plenums shall be confined to
one fire area. The floor or roof assembly above an

63



USBC 1984

unlisted air-ceiling plenum shall not depend upon the
air-ceiling for a portion of its fireresistance
rating. Insulated cold water, hot water, steam, fire
protection piping, building sanitary and storm drains,
and vent systems may be installed in air-ceiling
plenums. Electrical wiring and equipment in air-
ceiling plenums shall conform to the requirements of
NFiPA 70 listed in Appendix A. The use of air-ceiling
plenums in evaporative cooling systems is prohibited.
Panning of the joist or stud space for returm air is
permitted in buildings of Use Group R~3 only.

ARTICLE 16
MECHANICAL EQUIPMENT AND SYSTEMS

(A) Change Section 1600.2 to read as follows:

1600.2 Mechanical code: All mechanical equipment and
systems shall be constructed, installed and maintained
in accordance with the mechanical code 1listed in
Appendix A, as amended below:

l. Change Section M-301.1 as follows:

M-301.1 General: The use of uninhabited basements,
cavity walls, areas above ceillings or attic spaces as
supply, makeup, exhaust or return air plenums or ducts
is prohibited.

Exception: Air-ceiling plenums may be installed as
supply or return air plenums in all occupancies except
buildings of Use Group R-3, provided such air plenums
meet the requirements of other applicable articles of
this code and of the mechanical code listed in Appen-
dix A, and provided fuel-fired equipment or exposed
materials with flame spread greater than 25 and smoke
developed greater than 50 are not located therein.
The use of air-ceiling plenums shall be confined to
one fire area. The floor or roof assembly above an
unlisted air-ceiling plenum shall not depend upon the

64



ADDENDUM 1

air-ceiling for a portion of 1its fireresistance
rating. Insulated cold water, hot water, steam, fire
protection piping, building sanitary and storm draius,
and vent systems may be installed in air-ceiling
plenums. - Electrical wiring and equipment in air-
ceiling plenums shall conform to the requirements of
NFiPA 70 listed in Appendix A. The use of air celling
plenums in evaporative cooling systems is prohibited.
Panning of the joist or stud space for return air is
permitted in buildings of Use Group R-3 onmnly.

2. Change Section M-40l1.1 as follows:

M-401.1 Labeling: All mechanical equipment and/or
appliances regulated by this code shall bear the label
of an approved agency unless otherwise approved in
accordance with Section 106.1 of the USBC.

. 3. Delete Section M-508.0 Maintenance and Test

4. Change Section M-701.1 as follows:

M-701 Piping: Piping material shall conform to the
standards cited in this section. The standards shall
be considered minimum standards. Piping material not
covered in this section may be used when approved in
accordance with Section 106.1 of the USBC,

5. Change Section M-801.1 as follows:

M-801.]1 General: Piping material shall conform to the
standards cited in this section for the installationm,
alteration or repair of fuel gas piping systems. The
standards shall be considered minimum standards.
Piping material not covered in this section may be
used when approved in accordance with Section 106.1 of
the USBC.

6. Change Section M-901l.1 as follows:

901.] General: Piping material shall conform to the

65



USBC 1984

standards cited in this section. The standards shall
be considered minimum standards. Piping material not
covered in this section may be used when approved in
accordance with Section 106.1 of the USBC.

7. Delete Article 17 Air Quality:
B. Delete Section M-2000.1, Scope:

9. Delete Section M-2000.4, Boiler operator
certificate of fitness:

10. Delete Section M=2000.4.1,Renewal of certificate:
11, Delete Section M~2001.1., Periodic inspections:

12. Delete Section M-2001.8, Inspection to determine
remaining thickness:

13. Delete Section M-2001.9, Seller's inspection:
(B) Change Section 160l.1 to read as follows:

1601.1 General: Plans and specifications for the
installation, repair, extension or removal of any
mechanical equipment or system shall be submitted in
accordance with the USBC, and a permit shall be
secured prior to the commencement of any work.

(C) Change Section 1601.2 to read as follows:

1601.2 Matter covered: The plans and specifications
shall show in sufficient detail, as determined by the
building official, all pertinent features and clear-
ances of the appliances and systems, including: size
and type of apparatus; construction of flue, stack or
chimney; stack connections; type of fuel; method of
operation; and the method of compliance with all
regulations for the c¢lass and type of equipment
ingtalled.

(D) Change 1601.3 to read as follows:

66



ADDENDUM 1

1601.3 Details: An application for permit shall be
accompanied by specifications and diagrammatic mecha-
nical drawings in sufficient detail, complying with
the provisions of this code, before a permit shall be
issued for the mechanical equipment and system. The
plans shall be drawn to a scale of not less than 1/8
inch to the foot (10 mm/m), and shall show the loca-
tion and arrangement of all equipment and distribution
elements including safety and pressure controlling
devices.

(E) Delete Section 1602.4 Power to deem unsafe,
(F) Delete Section 1603.0 Existing Buildings.
(G) Delete Section 1604.0 Fees.
ARTICLE 17

FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS
(A) Revise Section 1701.0 to read as follows:

SECTION 1701.0 PLANS AND SPECIFICATIONS

1701.1 Required: Plans and specifications shall be
submitted in sufficient detail to indicate to the
building official that the required fire protection
systems are in compliance with the BOCA Code,

ARTICLE 18
PRECAUTIONS DURING BUILDING OPERATIONS

(A) Change Section 1800.1 to read as follows:

1800.1 Scope: The provisions of this article shall
apply to all construction operations in connection
with the construction, alteration, repair, removal or
demolition of buildings. It is applicable only to the

67



USBC 1984

protection of the gemeral public. Occupational health
and safety protection of building-related workers are
regulated by the Virginia Occupational Safety and
Health Standards for the construction industry, which
are issued by the Virginia Department of Labor and
Industry.

(B) Delete Section 1801.1 Temporary Constructiom.
(C) Delete Section 1803.0 Inspection,

(D) Change Sections 1807.2,1 and 1807.2.2 to read as
follows:

1807.2.1 Deep excavations: Whenever an excavation is
made to a depth of more than 10 feet (3048 mm) below
the established curb, the person who causes such
excavation to be made, 1f afforded the necessary
license to enter the adjoining premises, shall pre-
serve and protect from injury at all times and at his
own expense such adjoining structure or premises which
may be affected by the excavation. If the necessary
license is not afforded, it shall then be the duty of
the owner of the adjoining premises to make his
building or structure safe by installing proper
underpinning or foundations or otherwise. Such owner,
if it be necessary for the prosecution of his work,
shall be granted the necessary license to enter the
premises where the excavation or demolition is con-
templated.

1807.2.2 Shallow excavations: Wherever an excavation
is made to a depth of 10 feet (3048 mm) or less below
the curb, the owner of a mneighboring building or
structure the safety of which may be affected by the
proposed excavation, shall preserve and protect from
injury and shall support his building or structure by
the necessary underpinning or foundations. If neces~-
sary for that purpose, such owner shall be afforded a
license to enter the premises where the excavation is
contemplated. Such protection shall be at the expense

68



ADDENDUM 1

of the person who causes such excavation to be made.
Change Section 1822.1 to read as follows:

1822.1 General: The building official, when requested
by any person, aggrieved or otherwise, shall serve a
written notice on any owner, tenant and their agents
who fail to conform to the requirements of this
article directing such person to take the necessary
remedial action. If the person whose duty it is to
protect his own or adjoining property under those
provisions fails to proceed to fully comply with such
notice within three days of the receipt thereof, or
within 2 reasonable time thereafter as determined by
the building official, the building official may cause
the necessary work to be done when the health, safety
and general welfare of the public are jeopardized.

ARTICLE 19
SIGNS

(A) Delete Section 1901.1 Owner's Consent.
(B) Delete Section 1901.2 New Signs.

(C) Delete Section 1906.0 Bonds and Liability
Insurance.

ARTICLE 20
ELECTRIC WIRING AND EQUIPMENT

(A) Change Section 2000.1 Scope as follows:

2000.1 Scope: The provisions of this Article shall
control the design and construction of all new instal-
lation of electrical conductors, equipment and systems
in buildings or structures and all alterations to
existing wiring systems therein to ensure safety. All
such installation shall conform to the provisions of

69



USBC 1984

NFiPA 70 listed in Appendix A as amended below:

1.

2.

3.

Delete Tables 310-20 thru 310-30, NEC

Delete Figure 310-1: Cable Installation Dimensionms,
NEC

Change Section 310-15 {a), NEC as follows:

310-15 (a) Applications Covered by Tables: Ampa-
cities for conductors rated 0-2000 volts shall be
as specified in Tables 310-16 through 310-19 and
their accompanying notes. The ampacity for Types
V, AVA, AVB, and AVL conductors rated 2001 - 5000
volts shall be the same as or those conductor types
rated 0-2000 volts. The ampacities for solid
electric insulated conductors rated 2001 to 35000
volts shall be as specified in Tables 310-69
through 310 - 84 and their accompanying notes.

Change Section 331-1, NEC, as follows:

331-3 Uses Permitted: Electrical nonmetallic
tubing and ficttings shall be permitted to be used
in one and two family dwellings, multifamily
dwellings and other structures {a} in walls,
floors and ceilings; (b) in locations where subject
to severe corrosive influences as covered in
Section 300-6 and where subject to chemicals for
which the materials are specifically approved; (c)
where the potential 1s 600 volts or less.

For the purpose of this article, the first floor of
a building shall be that floor which is designed
for human habitation and which has 50 percent or
more of its perimeter level with or above finished
grade of the exterior wall line.

(B) Add Section 2000.5 to read as follows:

2000.5 Telephone outlets: Each dwelling unit shall be

70



ADDENDUM 1

pre-wired to provide at least one telephone outlet
(jack). 1In multifamily dwellings the telephome wiring
shall terminate inside or outside of the building at a
point prescribed by the telephone company.

(C) Change Section 200l,1 to read as follows:

2001.1 General: Plans and specifications, in suffi-
cient detail to indicate compliance to the building
official, shall be filed with the building official
showing the location and capacity of all 1lighting
facilities, electrically operated equipment and
electrical circuits required for all service equipment
of the building except as may be modified by the
building official.

(D) Delete Section 2001l.3 Other Authorities.

(E) Delete Section 2005.0 Existing Installatiouns
except Section 2005.3 Additional Loads.

ARTICLE 21
ELEVATOR, DUMBWAITER AND CONVEYOR EQUIPMENT,
INSTALLATION AND MAINTENANCE

(A) Delete Sections 2102.1 General, 2102.3 Periodic
tests and periodic inspections, 2102.3.1 Periodic
tests, 2102.3.2 Periodic inspections, 2102.4 Frequency
of tests and inspections, 2102.4.1 Periodic inspection
intervals, and 2102.4.2 Periodic test intervals.

(B) Delete Section 2104.0 Maintenance and accidents.
(C) Delete Section 2105.0 Existing installations.

(D) Delete Section 2114.3 Maintenance, 2114.3.1
Owner responsibility, and 2114.3.2 Housekeeping.

Note: Maintenance/inspections of elevators allowed
by Volume II.

71



USBC 1984

ARTICLE 22
PLUMBING SYSTEMS

(A) Change Section 2200.1 to read as follows:

2200.1 Scope: The design and installation of plumbing
systems, including sanitary and storm drainage, sani-
tary facilities, water supplies and storm water and
sewage disposal in buildings shall comply with the re-
quirements of this article and the plumbing code
listed in Appendix A (BOCA Basic/National Plumbing
Code/ 1984, as amended below:

1. Delete Section P-103.0, Existing Plumbing
2. Delete Section P-30l1.1, General
3. Change Section P-303.2 to read as follows:

P-303.2 Public systems available: A public water
supply system or public sewer system shall be deemed
available to premises used for human occupancy if such
premises are within (number of feet and inches as
determined by the local government) measured along a
street, alley, or easement, of the public water supply
or sewer system, and a connection conforming with the
standards set forth in the USBC may be made thereto.

4, Change Section P-308.3 to read as follows:

P-308.3 Freezing: Water service piping and sewers
shall be installed below recorded frost penetration
but not less than (number of feet and inches to be
determined by the local government) below grade for
water piping and (number of feet and inches to be
determined by the local government) below grade for
sewers. In climates with freezing temperatures,
plumbing piping in exterior building walls or areas
subjected to freezing temperatures shall be adequately
protected against freezing by insulation or heat or
both,

72



ADDENDUM 1

5. Delete Section P-311.0, Toillets for workers.
6. Revise Section P-501.7.3 as follows:

P-501.7.3 Soldered joints: All joint surfaces shall
be cleaned by approved procedure. An approved flux
shall be applied. Solder conforming to ASTM B32
listed in Appendix A shall be applied, except that
solder or flux containing more than 0.2% lead shall
not be used in water service or water distribution
piping. The joint shall be made by heating to the
proper temperature.

7. Revise Section P-501.8.4 as follows:

P-501.8.4 Soldered joints: All joint surfaces shall
be cleaned by approved procedure, An approved flux
shall be applied. Solder conforming to ASTM B32
listed in Appendix A shall be applied, except that
solder or flux containing more than 0.2% lead shall
not be used in water service or water distribution
piping. The joint shall be made by heating to the
proper temperature.

8. Change Note d of Table P-1202.1 to read:

For attached one and two family dwellings one
automatic clothes washer connection shall be required
per 20 dwelling wunits. Automatic clothes washer
connections are not required for Use Group R-4.

9. Delete Section P-1203.0, Handicapped Plumbing
Facilities.

10. Add new Section P-1501.3:

1501.3 Public water supply and treatment: The ap-
proval, installation and inspection of raw water
collection and transmission facilities, treatment
facilities and all public water supply transmission
mains shall be governed by the Virginia Waterworks

73



USBC 1984

Regulations. The internal plumbing of buildings and
structures, up to the point of connection to the water
meter shall be governed by this code. Where no meter
is installed, the point of demarcation shall be the
point of connection to the public water main; or, in
the case of an owner of both public water supply
system and the building served, the point of demar-
cation is the point of entry into the building.

Note: See Memorandum of Agreement between the Board
of Housing and Community Development and the Virginia
Department of Health, signed July 21, 1980,

11. Delete P-1600.0, General

12, Delete P-1602.0, types of individual water supply
13. Delete P-1603.0, quantity and quality of water

14, Delete P-1604.0, Protection of supply

15. Change Section P-1700.1 Scope to vead:

P-1700.1 Scope: The provisions of this article shall

control the inspections and methods of testing of
plumbing installations.

16. Delete Section P-1703.0, Maintenance
(B) Change Section 2201.1 to read as follows:

2201.1 When required: Prior to the issuance of any

permit, plans and specifications for the installation

of or alterations or additions to the plumbing system

of any building or premises shall be submitted to the

building official for approval. The plans and specifi-
cations shall show, in sufficient detail to indicate

compliance to the building official: the layout and

spacing of fixtures; the size, waterial and location

of all building and storm sewers and drains; and the

soil, waste, vent, and water supply piping.

74



ADDENDUM 1

{C) Add new section 2202.1.1 as follows:

2202.1.1 Private sewage disposal: When water closets
or other plumbing fixtures are installed in buildings
which are not located within a reasonable distance of
a sewer, suitable provisions shall be made for dis-
posing of the building sewage by some method of sewage
treatment and disposal satisfactory to the adminis-
trative authority having jurisdiction. When an
individual sewage system is required, the control and
design of this system shall be as approved by the
State Department of Health, which must approve the
location and design of the system and septic tanks or
other means of disposal. Approval of pumping and elec-
trical equipment shall be the responsibility of the
building official.

(D) Add new section 2202.1.2 as follows:

2202.1.2 Modifications: Modifications may be granted
by the buillding official to use pit privies or other
means for reasons of hardship, unsuitable soil condi-
tions or temporary recreational use, upon compliance
with the following conditions:

1. A single parcel of land is owned by applicant
and a single family dwelling is being constructed
for the owners use, State Health Department to
approve design and location of sanitary facilities
prior to the issuance of building permit.

2. Temporary recreational use buildings shall mean
any building occupied intermittently for recrea-
tional purposes only. Such buildings shall be
located in areas only as accepted by 1local go-
vernment. Such buildings shall not be located
within an approved or recorded residential sub-
division.

(E) Delete Section 2203.0 Permits and Certificates
of Approval.

75



USBC 1984

(F) Change Section 2204,3 to read as follows:

2204.3 Private water supply: When public water mains
are not used or available, a private source of water
supply may be used. The Health Department shall
approve the location, design and water quality of the
source prior to the issuance of the permit. The
building official shall approve all plumbing, pumping
and electrical equipment associated with the use of a
private source of water.

(G) Delete Section 2205.0 Existing Buildings and
Installations.

ARTICLE 24
ENERGY CONSERVATION

(A) Revise Section 2400.2 to read as follows:

2400.2 Other Standards: Compliance with the appli-
cable provisions of ASHRAE 90 A listed in Appendix A
shall be deemed to meet the requirements of this ar-
ticle, unless otherwise specifically provided herein.
Use Groups R-3 and R-4 may, in lieu of compliance with
the ASHRAE Standard, be deemed to meet the require-
ments of this article when complying with one of the
following standards:

1. EXHIBIT D to FHA INSTRUCTION 1924-A, THERMAL
PERFORMANCE CONSTRUCTION STANDARD, 1979 edition
with revision dated May 28, 1980

Published by: Farmers Home Administration, U.S.
Department of Agriculture, Washington, DC 20250

2. CABO Model Energy Code/1983
3. MANUAL OF ACCEPTABLE PRACTICES FOR ENERGY CONSER-

VATION IN ONE AND TWO FAMILY DWELLINGS, 1984
edition,

76



ADDENDUM 1

Published by: Office of Uniform Building Code,
Department of Housing and Community Development,
205 North Fourth Street, Richmend, VA 23219

AFPPENDIX A
REFERENCE STANDARDS

(A) Add following sentences to preamble:

When a later edition of a listed standard, (other than
2 model code or standard 1issued by BOCA) became
effective and was publicly available on or before
March 1, 1985, it shall replace the listed standard in
this Appendix.

77



ADDENDUM 2

AMENDMENTS TO THE CABO ONE AND TWO FAMILY
DWELLING CODE/1983 EDITION AND 1984 SUPPLEMENT

As provided in Section 101.4 of the Virginia Uniform
Statewide Building Code, the amendments noted in this
Addendum shall be made to the CABO One and Two Family
Dwelling Code/1983 Edition and 1984 Supplement for use
as part of the USBC.

PART I - ADMINISTRATIVE
CHAPTER 1 - Administrative

(A) Any requirements of Sectioms R-101 Through R-113
that relate to administration and enforcement of the
CABO One and Two Family Dwelling Code are superseded
by Article 1 Adoption, Administration and Enforcement
of the Virginia USBC.

PART II - BUILDING PLANNING
CHAPTER 2 - Building Planning

(A) Change Table R-202.4, Minimum Uniformly Distri-
buted Live Loads as follows:

Use Live Load

Balconies and decks (exterior) 40

(B) Add Section R-204.1.1 Insects Screens:

R-204.1.1 Insect Screens: Every door and window or
other outside opening used for ventilation purposes
serving any building containing habitable rooms, food
preparation areas, food service areas, or any areas
where products used in food for human consumption are
processed, manufactured, packaged or stored, shall be
supplied with approved tight fitting screens of not
less than 16 mesh per inch.

{C) Add Section R-205.1:

78



ADDENDUM 2

R-205.1: Area For Sleeping Purposes: Every room
occupled for sleeping purposes by one ocgupant shall
contain at least 70 square feet (6.5IM°) of floor
area, and every room occupied for sleeping purposes by
more than ong person shall contain at least 50 square
feet (4.65 M") of floor area for each occupant there-
of.

(D) Change Section R-207 to read as follows:

SECTION R-207 - SANITATION:

Every dwelling unit shall be provided with a water
closet, lavatory and a bathtub or shower.

Each dwelling unit shall be provided with a kitchen
area and every kitchen area shall be provided with a
sink of approved nonabsorbent material.

All plumbing fixtures shall be connected to a sani-

tary sewer or to an approved private sewage disposal
system,
All plumbing fixtures shall be connected to an ap-
proved water supply and provided with hot and cold
running water, except water closets may be provided
with cold water only.

Modifications to this section may be granted by the
local building official, upon agreement by the local
health department, for reasons of hardship, unsuitable
soil conditions or temporary recreational use of the
building.

(E) Add to Section R-212:

EXCEPTION: Key operation is permitted from a dwelling
unit provided the key cannot be removed when the door
is locked from the side from which egress is to be

made,

(F) Add new Section R-221:

79



USBC 1984

SECTION R-221 - TELEPHONE QUTLETS

Each dwelling unit shall be prewired to provide at
least one wall telephone outlet (jack). The telephone
wiring shall terminate on the exterior of the building
at a point prescribed by the telephone company.

(G) Add new Section R-222:

SECTION R-222 — LEAD BASED PAINT

Lead based paint: Lead based paint with a lead
content of more than 0.5 percent shall not be applied
to any interior or exterior surface of a dwelling,
dwelling unit or child care facility, including fences
and outbulldings at these locations.

(H) Add new Section R-223:

SECTION R-223 - STREET NUMBERS

Street numbers: Each structure to which a street
number has been assigned shall have the number so
assigned displayed in a position easily observed and
readable from the public right of way.

PART III - CONSTRUCTION
CHAPTER 3 ~ Foundations

R-302.4 Floodproofing: All buildings or structures
located in areas prone to flooding as determined by
the governing body having jurisdiction shall be
floodproofed in accordance with the provisions of
Section 1313 in Addendum !,

(A) Revise Figure No. A-3 on page 22, MINIMUM FOUNDA~
TION REQUIREMENTS, as follows: Change the drawing of
the interior concrete slab footing to increase the
minimum thickness of the slab associated therewith
from 3 inches to 3.5 inches.

8O



ADDENDUM 2

CHAPTER 9 - Chimneys And Fireplaces

(A) Change Note at bottom of Table No. R-904.1 to
read:

1The letters refer to Figure No. R=904,

(B) Add Section 904.10 as follows:

R-904.10 Spark Arrestor: Spark arrestor screens shown
in Figure R-904 are optional unless specifically

required by the manufacturer of the fireplace stove or
other appliance utilizing a chimmey.

PART IV - MECHANICAL
Add new Section 110i.1:

Section 1101.1 Residential buildings: Every owner of
any structure who rents, leases, or lets one or more
dwelling units or guest rooms on terms, either ex-
pressed or implied, to furnish heat to the occupants
thereof shall supply sufficient heat during the period
from October 1 to May 15 to maintain a room temper-
ature of not less than 65 degrees F. (18 degrees C.),
in all habitable spaces, bathrooms, and toilet rooms
during the hours between 6:30 a.m. and 10:30 p.m. of
each day and maintain a temperature of not less than
60 degrees F. (16 degrees C.) during other hours. The
temperature shall be measured at a2 point 3 feet (914
mm) above the floor and 3 feet (914 mm) from exterior
walls.

Exception: When the exterior temperature falls
below 0 degrees F. (-18 degrees C.) and the heating
system is operating at its full capacity, a minimum
room temperature of 60 degrees F. (16 degrees C.)
shall be maintained at all times,

81



USBC 1984

PART V - PLUMBING
CHAPTER 21 - Plumbing Materials

(A) Change Section P-2104.4 Joints and Connections to
read:

P-2104.4 Joints and Connections: Joints in poly-
butylene (PB) plastic pipe or tubing underground shall
be prohibited. Joints in copper pipe or tube installed
in a concrete flecor slab or under a c¢onerete floor
slab on grade shall be installed using wrought copper
fittings and brazed joints. All other joints in
copper pipe or tube shall be made by the appropriate
use of cast bronze or wrought copper fittings, fluxed
and made with solder conforming to ASTM B32, except
that solder or flux containing more than 0.2% lead
shall not be used in water service and water distri-
bution piping.

Note: Automatic c¢lothes washer connections are not
required for Use Group R-4,

PART VI - ELECTRICAL
(A) Revise Part VI as follows:

The electrical installations shall conform to the
Electrical Code for One and Two Family Dwellings (NFPA
70 A-1984) published by the National Fire Protection
Assoclation,

PART VII - ENERGY CONSERVATION
(A) Revise Part VII as follows:
The energy conservation requirements shall conform

to Article 24 of the BOCA Basic/National Building
Code/1984.

82



ADDENDUM 3

UNIFORM STATEWIDE BUILDING CODE LAW

CODE OF VIRGINIA

TITLE 36 CHAPTER 6

(and other related laws)

: aections 36-110 &

ote
116 have been repealed

n
ig-



CODE OF VIRGINIA

§ 16-97. Definitlons. As used in this chapter. unless the context or subject matter requires
olherwise, the [ollowing words or ierms shall have the meaning heremn ascribed to them,
respectively:

(I} “Board" means the Board of Housing and Community Development.

{2), {3) [Repealed.]

{4) "Review Board” means the State Building Code Technical Review Board.
(5) “Building Code™ means the Uniform Statewide Building Code.

(6) “Code provisions” means the provisions of the Unifgorm Statewide Building Code as
adopted and promulgated by the Board. and the amendments lhereof as adopted and
promulgated by such Board from time to time.

(1 “Building regulations” means any law. rule. resolution, regulation. ordinance or code.
general or special, or compilation thereof, heretofore or hereafter enacted or adopted by the
Commonwealth or any county or municipality, including departments, boards, byreaus.
commissions, of other agencies thereof, relating to constructlon, reconstruction. alteranon.
conversion, repair. maintenance, or use of structures and buildings and installation of equipment
therein. The lerm does not include zoning ordinances or other land use controls that do not
affect the manner of construction or materiais to be used in the erection, alteration ar repair of
a building or strucrure.

(B} “Municipality” means any city or town in this Commonwealth.

(9) “Local governing budy”™ means the governing body of any city, county or town in this
Commonwealth.

{107 “Locai building department” rmeans the agency or agencies of any local governing be
charged with the adminstrauon, supervision, or enforcement of building codes and reguiattot
approval af plans. inspection of buildings. or issuance of permuts, licenses, cerulicates or similar
documents prescribed ar required by state or local building regulations.

(1) “State agency” means any stalé department, board, bureau, commission. or agency of
this Commuonwealth.

(12) “Building” means a combination of any materials, whether portable or (Ixed. having a
roof 1o form a structure for the use or occupancy by persons, or property. however, farm
buildings not used for residential purposes and {requented generally by the owner, members of
his family, and farm employees shall be exempt from the provisions of the Uniform Statewide
Building Code. but such buildings iving within flood plain or in a mudslide-prone area shall be
subject to flood proofing regularions or mudsiide regularions, as applicable. The word “building”
shall be construed as though followed by the words “or part or parts thereof” uniess the conte
clearly requires a different meaming

(13} “Equipment” means plumbing. heating, electrical, ventilating. air-conditioming and
refrigeratlon equipment. elevators, dumbwaiters. escalators, and other mechamcal additions or
tnstallations.

. {14) “Construction™ means the construction, reconstruction. alteration, repair or conaversion of
vildings.

{13) “Owner” means the owner or owners of the freehold of the premises or lesser esta.
therein, 2 morigagee or vendes in possession, assignee of rents. receiver. executor. lrustee, lessee
or other person, flrm or corporation in control of 2 building.

(18) [Repealed.]

(I7) “Director” means the Director of the Department of Housing and Community
Development.

{1B) "Structure” means an assembly of materials forming a construction for occupancy or
use including stadiums. gospel and circus [enls. reviewing stands. platforms. stagngs. observatior
lowers. radio towers., waler lanks. trestles. piers. wharves, swimming pools, amusement device
siorage bins. and other struciures of this general nature but excluding water weils. Farn.
siructures aol used for residenttal purposes shall be exempt from the provisions of the Uniform

83



Statewide Buiiding Code. but such structures lying within a flood plain or in 2 mudstide-prone
area shall be subject to flood proafing regulattons or mudslide regutations, as applicable. The
word “structure” shall be construed as though followed by the words “or part or parts thereof”
uniess the context clearly requires a different meaming.

(19) "Department” means the Department of Housing and Community Development

y 13698, Board to promulgate Statewide Code: other codes and regulations superseded:
exceplions. The Board is hereby directed and empowered (0 adopt and promuigate a Uniform
Statewide Building Code. Such building code shall supersede the building codes and regulations of
the countles., municipalities and other political subdivisions and state agencies. However. such
Code shall not supersede the regulations of other state agencies which require and govern the
functional design and operation of building retated activities not covered by the Uniform
Statewide Building Code including but not limited to. (1) public waler supply systems, (2) wasie
water treatment and disposal systems, and (J) solid waste (acilities. Nor shall state agencies be
prevented from requiring. pursyant 10 other state law, that buildings and equipment be
maintained in accordance with provisions of the Uniform Statewide Building Code.

§ 36-98.1. State buildlngs. The Building Code shall be applicable to all state-owned buildings
and structures. with he exception that 3§ 2.!-514 through 2.1-521.1 shall provide the standards
for ready access to and use of state-owned buildings by the physically handicapped.

Any state-owned building or structure (or which preliminary plans were prepared or on
which consiruction commenced after the initial effective date of the Uniform Statewide Building
Code. shall remain subject to the provisions of the Uniform Statewide Building Code that were in
effect at the time such plans were compieted or such consiruction commenced. Subsequent
reconstruction, renovation or demolition of such buiding or structure shall be subject [0 the
pertinent provisions of the Bwiding Code

Acting through the Division of Engineenng and Buildings, the Department of General
Services shall function as the building official (or stateowned buildings. The Department shall
review and approve plans and specifications. grant modifications, and establish such rules and
regulations as may be necessary to imptement this section. [t shall provide for the inspection of
state-owned buildings and enforcement of the Butlding Code and standards for access by (he
physically handicapped by delegaung inspection and Building Code enforcement duties to (he
State Fire Marshal's Qffice, lo other appropriate stale agencies having needed expertise, and to
local building departments, all of which shall provide such assistance within a reasonable time
and in the manner requesied. State agencies and institutions occupying buildings shall pay to the
local building department the same fees as would be paid by a private citizen for the services
rendered when such services are requested by the Department of General Services. The
Department of General Services may aller or overrule any decision of the Incal bwlding
department after having flrst considered the local buslding department's report or other rationale
given for its decision. When altering or overruling any decision of a local building department,
the Department of General Services shall provide the local building department with a written
summary of its reasons for doing so

3 36-98.2. Appeals from decision of Building Qfflcial regarding state-owned buildings. Appeals
by the involved state agency (rom the decision of the Building Official for staie-owned bulidings
shall be made directly to the State Building Code Technical Review Board.

3 J6-98.3. Amusement devices. A. The Board shall have the power and duty to promulgate
regulations pertaining to the construction. maintenance. operation and inspection of amusement
devices. Amusement device means a device or structure open 10 the public by which persons are
conveyed or moved in an unusual manner for diversion. Regulations promulgated hereunder
shall include provisions for the following:

1. The issuance of certificates of inspection prior to the operation of an amusement device;

2. The demonstration of financial responsibility of the owner or operator of the amusement
device prior to the operation of an amusement device.

3. Mainlenance inspections of exising amusement devices;
4. Reporting of accidents resulting in senous injury or death:

5. Immediate investigative inspections following accidents involving an amusement device that
result 1 serous njury or death;

(=¥ A



6. Certification of amusement device inspectors.
7. Qualiflcations of amusement device operators:

§ Noliflcation by amusemeni device owners or operators of an tntent o operate at a
location within the Commonweaith, and

9. A timely reconsideration of the decision of the local buillding department when an
amusement device owner or operator s aggrieved by such a decision.

8. In promulgating regutations. the Board shall have due regard for generally accepted
standards as recommended by nationally recognized organizations, Where appropriate, the Boare
shall establish separate standards for mobile amusement devices and for amusement devic
permanently affixed to a site.

C. To assist the Board in the administration of this section. the Board shall appmint an
Amusement Device Technical Advisory Commitlee, which shall be composed of five members
who. by virtue of their education. traming or employment. have demonstrated adequate
knowledge of amusement devices or the amusement industry. The Board shall determine the
terms of the Amusement Device Techrical Advisory Committee members. The Amusement
Device Technical Advisory Committee shall recommend standards for the construction,
maintenance. operation and inspecton of amusement devices, including the qualifications of
amusemeni device operators and the certification of inspectors, and otherwise perform advisory
functions as the Board may require,

D. Inspections required by this section shall be performed by persons certifled by the Board
pursuant 1o j 36:137 G of the Code of Virginia as competent to inspect amusement devices The
provisions of 3 J4-105 of the Code of Virginia notwithstanding, the local governing body sha
enforce the regulations promulgated by the Board for existing amusement devices. Nothig .
this section shail be consirued to prohibit the local governing body [rom authorizing inspections
to be performed by persons who are not employees of the local governing body, provided those
Inspectors are certified by the Board as provided herein. The Board is authoriZed to conduct or
cause to be conducted any inspection required by this section. provided that the person
performing the inspection on behall of the Board is certified by the Board as provided herein.

E. To the extent they are not superseded by the provisions of this section and the
regulatlons promulgated hereunder, the provisions of this chapter and the Lniform Statewide
Building Code shall apply 10 amusement devices.

§ 38-99. Provisions of Code. The Building Code shall prescribe building regulations to be
complied with in_the construction of buildings and structures. and the equipment therein as
defined in § 16-97, and shall prescnbe regulations fo insure that such regulations are properl
maintained. and shall also prescmbe procedures for the administration and enforcement of suc
regulations. The provisions thereof shall be such as to prolect the heaith, safety and welfare of
Ihe residents of this Commonweaith, provided that buildings and structures should be permitted
to be constructed at the least possible cost consistent with recogmized standards of health. safety,
énergy conservatlon and water comservation and barrier-free provisions for the paysicaily
hairsldrcapped and aged. Such regulations shall be reasonable and appropriate 1o the objectives of
this chapter.

In formulating the Code provisions, the Board shall have due regard [or generally acceptec
standards as recommended by nationally recognized orgarizations, including, but not limited tc
the standards of the Southern Building Code Congress, the Building Officials Conference of
America and the National Fire Protection Association,

Where practical, the Code provisions shall be stated in terms of required level of
performance, so as to (acilitate the prompt acceptance of new building materials and methods
When generally recognized standards of performance ace not available, such provisions shall
provide for acceptance of materials and methods whose performance has been found by the
Board. onr the basis of reliable test and evaluabon data, presented by the proponent. o be
substantially equal in safety to those specitied

§ J6-99.1. Certification of electrical. plumbing and building related mechanical workers. N
electrical worker or plumbing worker or buwiding related mechanical worker shall be required o
be exammed or certified by the Board or by ihe locality at the direction of the Board if such
person was certifled or ticensed prior to July 1, 1976, (n accordance with provisions made by
any local governing body. provision required of any local governing body or provision made by
lhe Commonwealth,



§ 36-99.2. Standards for replacement glass. Any replacement glass installed in buildings
constructed prior to the effective date of the Uniform Statewide Building Code shall meet the
quaiity and installation standards for glass installed in new busldings as are in effect at the ume
of instatlation.

j 36-99.3. Smoke detectors in colleges and umiversities. College or umiversity buildings
containing dormitories for sleeping purposes shail be provided wuh battery or AC powered
smoke detector devices installed therein n accordance with the Umiform Statewide Building
Code. After January 1, [984. all college and university dormitories shall have installed and use
due diligence in maintaining m good working order such detectors regardiess of when the
building was coastructed.

The chief administrative office of the college or university shall obtain a certificate of
compliance from the building official of the locality in which the college or umversity is located
g: in the case of state-owned buildings, from the Director of the Department of General

rvices,

The provisions of this section shall not apply to any dormifery at a state-supported military
college or university which is patrolled twenty-four hours a day by milltary gwards.

§ 36-99.4. Smoke detectors in certain juvenile care facilities. Battery or AC-powered smoke
detector devices shall be installed in all local and regional detention homes, group homes. and
other residential care facillties for children or juveniles which are operated by or under the
auspices of the Department of Corrections, regardless of when the building was consiructed. in
accordance with the provision of the Uniform Statewide Building Code by July 1. 1986,
Administrators of such homes and (acilities shall be responsible for the installation and
maintenance of the smoke detector devices.

§ 36-93.5, Smoke detectors for the deaf and hearing-impaired. Smoke detectors providing a
light signal sufficient to warn a deaf or hearing-impawred :ndividual shall be provided. upon
written request by the occupant lo the landlord or proprietor. to any deafl or heanngampaired
occupant of any of the following occupancies, regardless of when constructed:

L. Al dormitorvy buildings arranged for the shelter and sleeping accommeodations of more
than rwenty individuals;

2. All multiple-famuly dwellings having more than two dwelling umts. including all
docmitories. boarding and lodging houses arranged for shelter and sleeping accommodations of
more than {ive and not more than twenty individuals: or

1. All buiidings arranged for use of one-family or two-family dwelling umits. including not
more than (lve lodgers or boarders per family

A ftenant shall be responsible for the maintenance and operation of the smoke detector in
the tenant’s unit.

A hotel or motel shall have available no fewer than one such smoke detector for each 100
units, except that this requirement shall not apply lo any hotel or motel with lewer than fifty
units.

The proprietor or landlord may require a refundable deposit for a smoke detector, not to
exceed the original cost or replacement cost whichever is greater of the smoke detector.

Failure to comply with the provisions of this section within a reasonable time shall be
punishable as a Class 4 misdemeanor.

This law shall have no effect upon existing local law or regulation which exceeds the
provisions prescribed herein,

j J-100. Notice and hearings on adoption of Code, amendments and repeals. Before any
Code provisions are adopted, thne Board shall hold at least one public hearing. At least thirty
days' notice thereol shall be given by publication in at least four newspapers of general
circulation published in the State. In addition to notice by publication. the Board shall notify in
wrillng the mayor or other like official of every municipality in the State, and the chairman of
the governing body of every county in the State of such hearing, but failure to give or receive
any such notice shall not in anywise impair the validity of any Code provisions adopted.
amended or repealed. At any such hearing all persons desiring to do so shall be afforded an
opportunity lo present their views. Notice of amendments to or repeal of any Code provisions

86



theretofore adopted shall be given as aloresaid.

j 36-101. Effective date of Code: when local codes may remain In effect. No Code provision”
shall be made effective prior to January 1. 197), or later than Seprember 1. 1973 provided ti
the nitial Building Code shall not become effective earhier than (80 days after the publicatic
thereof

It is further provided that where. in the opinion of the Review Board. local codes are n
substantial conformity with the State Code the local code mayv, with the concurrence of the
Review Board remain in effect for two years from (he effective day of the State Code for
transition to implementation of the State Code.

§ 36-102. Modification, amendment or repeal of Code provisions. The Board may modify
amend or repeal any Code provisions from time (o time as the public interest requires. aft
notice and hearing as provided in § 36-100 of this chapter. No such modification or amendme.
shall be made effective earlier than thirty days from the adoption thereof.

§j 36-103. Buildings, etc.. existing or projected before effective date of Code, Any buildlng or
strucwure, for which a butlding permut has been issued or on which constryction has commenced,
or for which working drawings have been prepared in the year prior to the effective date of the
Building Code. shall remain subject to the building regulations in effect at the tme of such
issuance or commencement of construction. However, the Board may adopt and promulgate as
part of the Building Code, minimum building regulations for existng buildings o ensure the
protection of public health, saftety and welfare. Subsequent recoastruction, renovation. repair or
demolition of such buildings or structures shall be subject 10 the pertineat provisions of the
Building Code, The provisions of this section shall be applicable to equipment. However, building
owners may elect to instail partial or full flre alarms or other safety equipment that was not
required by the Building Code in effect at the time a building was constructed without meeting
current Building Code requirements. provided the installation does not create 3 hazardo
condition. Permits for installation shall be obtained in accordance with the Unmifarm Siatewh
Building Code.

j 36-104. Code 10 be printed and furmished on request: true copy. The Department shall have
printed from tme (o time and keep available in pamphlet form all Code prowisions, Such
pamphlets shall be furnished upon request to members of the public. A true copy of all such
provisions adopted and in force shall be kept in the office of the Department, accessible (o the
public. The Department may charge a reasonable fee for distribution of the Building Code based
on production and distribution costs.

§ 36-105. Enforcement of Code appeals from decisions of local department: inspection of
buildings. Enforcement of the Building Code shall be the responsibility of the local building
department. There shall be established within esach local building department a local board o*
Building Code appeals whose composition, duties and responsibilities shall be prescribed in t
Building Code. Appeals from the local bwiding department concerning application of the Buidir,
Code or refusal to grant a modification to the provisions of the Code covering the manner of
constructton or materiais [0 be used in the erection. alteration or repalr of a bwiding or
structure shall first lie to the local board of Building Code appeals. No appeal to the State
Building Code Technical Review Board shall lie prior to a final determination by the local board
of Building Code appeals. Whenever a coumty or a municipality does not have such a building
department or board of Building Code appeals, the local governing body shall enter imto an
agreement with the local governing body of another county or municipality or with some other
agency, or a state agency approved by the Department for such enforcement and appea
resulting therefrom. Fees may be levied by the tocal governing body in order (o defray the co.
of such enforcement and appeals.

Any building may be inspected at any time befors completion, and shall not be deemed in
compliance until approved by the inspecting authority. Where the construction cost is less than
$1.000, however, [he building inspection may, in the discretion of the :nspecting authority, be
waived. A local governing body may provide that buildings and struclures. permanent or
temporary, which are used to store hazardous materials, or occupled or 1o be used by twenty or
more persons who are employed. lodged. housed. assembled. served. entertained or snstructed
theretn, or the common areas of residential structyres coataining four or more units, includine
buildings owned by the Commonwealth or by any of its political subdivisions and the equipme
therein. be inspecied periodically after completion to insure that the Building Code regulatio
are properly maintained. The building official shall coordinate all reports with inspections for
compliance of the Buiding Code. from fire and health officials delegaled such authonty. pnor (o
issuance of aa occupancy permit.

87



The tocal governing body may inspect and enforce the building regulations promulgated by
the Board for existing buildings. Such énforcement shall be carned out by an agency or
department designated by the governing body.

§ 38-108, Violation a misdemeanor. It shall be unlawful for any owner or any other persan.
flrm or corporation., on or after the effective date of any Code provisions. to violate any such
provisions. Any such violation shall be deemed a misdemeancr and any owner ar any nather
person, firm or corporation convicted of such a violation shall be punished by a fine of not
more than $1,000.

§ 36-107. Employment of personnel for administration of chapter. Subject to the prowvisions of
Chapter 10 (§ 2.1.110 et saq.) of Title 2.1 of the Code of Virginia. the Director may employ such
permanent and temporary clerical. technical and other assistants as are necessary or advisable
(or ihe proper administration of the provision of this chapter.

$ 36-108, Board continued: members. There is hereby continued, in the Department, the State
Building Code Technical Review Board. consisting of seven members. appoiated by the Governor
subject to confirmation by the General Assembly. The members shall include one member who
Is a registered architect, selected from a slate presented by the Virginia Society of the Amertcan
Instinate of Architects: one member who is 2 professional engineer in private practice, selected
from a slate presented by the Virginia Society of Professional Engineers: one member who is a
residential builder selected from a slate presented by the Home Builders Association of Virgimia:
one member who is a general contractor selected from a slate presented by the Virginia Branch,
Associated General Contractors of America; one member who has had experience in the field of
enforcement of building regulations, selected [rom a slate presented by the Virginia Building
Officials Conference; one member who is employed by a public agency as a flre prevention
olficer selected from a slate presented by the Virginia Fire Chiefs' Association: and one member
from the State at large who may be a member of a local governing body The members shall
serve at the pleasure of the Governor.

§ 36-109. Officers: secretary. The Review Board, under rules adopted by itself. shali elect one
of its members as chairman. for a lerm of two vears, and may elect one of its members as
vice-chairman. The Review Board may also elect a secretary. who may be a noamember

§ 16-111, Oath and bonds. Before entering upon the discharge of his duties, each member of
the Review Board shail take an oath that he will faithfully and honestly execute the duuties of
his office dunng his continuance therein; and shall give bond with corporate surety n such
penalty as may be fixed by the Governor, conditioned upon the faithful discharge of his duties
The premiums on such bonds shall be paid for as other expenses of the Department are paid.

§ 36-112. Meetings. The Review Board shatl meet at the call of the chairman. or at the
writlen request of at least three of itS members; provided that it shall act within thirty davs
following receipt of any appeal made under the provisions of this ¢hapler.

} 36-111. Offices. The Review Board shall be furnished adequate space and quarters in the
suite of offlces of the Department. and such Board's main office shall be therein.

§ 36114, Board to hear appeals from decisions under Building Code, Fire Prevention Code,
and [ndustrialized Building Safety Law The Review Board shall have the power and duty to
hear all appeals from decisions ansing under application of the Building Code. the Fire
Prevention Code adopted under the Statewide Fire Prevention Code Act (§ 27-94 et seq.). and
the Industrialized Building Safety Law (§ J6-70 et seq.). and to render its decision on any such
appeal, which decision shall be final if no appeal is made therefrom. Proceedings of the Review
Board shall be governed by the provisions of the Administrative Process Act (j 9-6.14:1 et seq.).

§ J6-115. Subpoenas: witnesses: designation of subordinates. In any matter before it on appeal
for hearing and determtnation, the Review Board, or its designated subordinates, may compel the
attendance of all needed wilnesses in like manner as a circuit court, save the Review Board
shall not have the power of imprisonment. In taking evidence, the chairman or any member of
the Review Board. or its designated subordinates. shall have the power to administer oaths to
witnesses. Where a designated subordinate or the Review Board presides over hearings on
appeals. such subordinate shall submit recommended (lndings and a dectsion o the Review
Board pursuant to j 3-6.14:12 of the Code of Virginia,

§ 36-117. Record of decisions. A record of all decisions of the Review Board. properly
indexed, shall be kept in the office of such Board. Such record shall be open to public
inspection at all times during busiress hours.

88



§ 38-118. Interpretation of Code: recommendation of modifications, The Review Board shall
interpret the provisions of the Buiding Code, the Fire Safety Code. and the Fire Prevention
Code, and shall make such recommendations, which it deems appropriate. 0 the Board for-
modiflcation. amendment or repeal of any of such provisions. A record of all  sues
recommendations. and of the Board's actions thereon. shatl be kept in the office of the Res
Board. Such record shail be open to public inspection at all fimes during business hours.

§ 36-119. Rules and regulations under § 36-73 not superseded. This chapter shall not amend.
supersede, or repeal Ihe rules and regulalions prescribing standards to be complied with, in
itrlidusul-iallzed bwiding units and mobile bomes promulgated under § 36-73 of the Code of

rgnia.

§ J6-119.1. Existing buildings. This chapter shall not supersede state building regulations,
heretofore or hereafter promulgated by the Board of Housing and Community Devejopmient
under 3§ 27-72 and 27-37 of the Code of Virginia. that prescribe standards to be comptied v
in existing buildings or strucrures, provided that such regulations shall not impose reguirem
that are more restrictive than those of the Uniform Statewide Building Code nor shail the Fu¢
Prevention Code impose requirements that are more restrictive than the applicable building code
under which said buildings or structures were constructed. Subsequent alteration, enlargement.
repair, or conversion of the occupancy classification of such buildings and structures shall be
subject to the Building Code.

other related laws

j 18.28. Limitation of prosecutions. A prosecution for a misdemeanor, or any pecuniary fine,
forfeiture. penaity or amercement, shall be commenced within one year next after there was
cause therefor. excepl that a prosecution for petit larceny may be commenced within five years,
and for an altempt (o produce abortion, within (wo years after commission of the offense. In a
prosecution for violation of laws governing the placement of children for adophion without 2
license pursuant to j §3.1-196 of the Code. no action shall be commenced after the exprration
one year (rom the date of the filing of the petition for adoption. A prosecution for makiny
false statement or representation of a material fact knowing 1t 1o be false or knowirgly (ailing i
disclose a material fact, fo obtan or increase any benefit or other payment under the Virgin:a
Lnemployment Compensation Act (§ 60.1-L et seq) shall be commenced Within three yedars nexi
after the commssion of the offense. A prosecuilon for any violation of 3§ 10-17.29, 62.1-44.32 (b,
62.1-194.1, or 3 62.1-195 which involves the discharge, dumping or emission of any toxic
substance as defined m § 32.1-239 shall be commenced within three years next after the
commission of the offense. Prosecution of Bullding Code violations under § 36-105 shait
commence within one year of either commisstan of the offense or discovery of the offense by
the gwner or by the building official; provided that such discovery occurs within one year of the
date of Initial occupancy or use after construction of the building or structure, or the issuance of
a certiflcate of use and occupancy for the building or structure, whichever is later, but in either
event not more than two vears from the date of the commission of the olfense. Prosecution of
nonfelonious offenses which constitute malfeasance n office shall commence within (wo ver
next after the commission of the offense, Prosecution of any viglation of j§ 55-79.87. 5579
55-79 89, 55.79.90, 55-79.93. 55-79 94, 55-79.95. §5-79.103, or any rule adopted under or order issuew
pursuant to § 55-79.98. shall commence within three years next after the commission of the
offense. Nothing in this section shail be construed to apply to any person fleeing from justice or
concealing himself within or without this Commonweaith to avoid arrest or be construed to limut
the time within which any prosecution may be commenced for desertion of a spouse or child or
forldneyect or refusal or failure to provide for the support and maintenance of a spouse or
child.

§ 94-37. Exemptions from provisions of chapter. The following shall be exempted from i
provisions of this chapter:

(1) Practice of professional engineering and land surveying by a licensed architect when i
such practice s incidental lo what may be properly considered an architectural undertaking.

(2) Practice of architecture and land surveying by a licensed professional engineer when
such practice is incidenial to an engineenng project.

(3) {Repealed.]

() Practice as a professional engineer, architect, land surveyor or certifled landsc:
architect in this State by any person not a resident of and having no established place .
business in this State, or by any person resident in this State Whose arrival is recent: pravided,
however, that such person shall have filed within lilteen days after commencement of such
practice an applicanon for licensure as a professional engineer, architect or land surveyor or
certification as a landscape architect, and that such person is legally qualified for such

[2Ta)



professional service in his own state or country. and shall have paid the required (ee. Such
exemption shal! coatinue for only such reasonable time as the Board requires in which '»
consider and grant or deny the application for licensure or certification.

(5) Engaging in the practice of professional engineering as an employee under a3 licensed
professional engineer, engaging in the practice of architecture as an employee under a hicensed
architect, or engaging in the pracrice of land surveying as an employee under a licensed land
surveyor: provided, that such practice may aot include responsible charge of design or
supervision.

(6) Practice of professional engineering, architecture or land surveying solely as an
employee of the United States: provided, however, that il such employee [urnishes advisory
service for compensation to the public in connection with engineering, acchitectural or l(and
surveying matters, he shall not be exempt from other provisions of this chapter.

(T Practice of professional engineering. architecture or land surveying as a regular tull-time,
salaned employee of this State or any political subdivision thereol; provided that such person
does not furnish advisory service for compensation to the public or as an independent
contracting party in this State or any political subdivision thereof in connection with engineering,
architecrural or land surveying matiers.

(8) Practice of architecture or professional engineering by an individual. firm or corporation
on property owned or leased by such individual. firm or corporation, unless the same involves
the pubtic heaith or safety.

(9 Practice of engineering solely as an employee of a corporation engaged in interstate
commerce. or as an employee of a public service corporation. by rendering such corporation
engineering service in connection with its facilities which are subject to reguiation by the State
Corporation Comnussion; provided, that such corporation employees as furrish advisory service to
the public in connection with engineering matters ofher thaa in coanection with such
employment shall not be exempt from the provisions of this chapter.

§ 54-37.1. Exemptions from license requirements. A. Terms used in this section, and not
otherwise defined in this chapter. shail have the meanings provided in the Umform Statewide
Building Code in effect on July 1, 1982, including subsequent amendments thereto

B. No license as an architect or professional engineer shall be required pursuant to y 54-26.1
for persons who prepare plans. speciflcations. documents and designs (or the following, provided
any such plans, specifications, documents or design bears the name and address of the author
and his occupation:

1. Single- and two-family homes. townhouses and multi-family dwellings. excluding electnical
and mechanical systems, not exceeding X 1,2 stonies or forty feet in height: or

2, All {arm structures used primarily in the production, handling or storage of agriculturai
products or implements. including, but not limited to, structures used for the handling,
processing, housing or storage ol crops. feeds, supplies, equipment, animals or poultry. or

3. Buildings and structures classified with respect lo use as business (Use Group By and
mercantile (Use Group M), as provided in the Uniform Statewide Bullding Code. exciuding
electrical and mechanical systems, where such building or structure does not exceed 5,000
square feet in total net floor area, J stories, or 40 feet in height or

4. Buildings and structures classified with respect lo use as factory and industrial (Use Group
F) and storage (Use Group $) as provided im the Uniform Siatewide Building Code. excluding
electrical and mechanical systems, where such building or structure does not exceed 15.000
square feet in total net floor area. J stories, or 40 [eet in height: or

5. Additions, remodeling or interior design without a change in occupancy or occupancy load
and without modification to the structural system or a change in access or exit patterns or
increase in fire hazard: or

8. Electric installations which comply with all applicable codes and which do not exceed 600
volts and B0O amps. where work is designed and performed under the direct supervision of a
person licensed as a master's level electrician or Class A electrical contractor by written
examination, and where such installation 15 not contained m any structure exceeding 2 .2
stories or 40 feet in height or located in any of the following categones:

90



a. Use Group A-l theaters which exceed assembly of 100 persons;
b. Use Group A-4 excepr churches;

c. Use Group I, institutional buildings., except day nrurseries and climes without life-sup!
systems; or

7. Plumbing and mechanical systems Using packaged mechanical egquipment. such as
equipment of cataloged standard design which has been coordinated and tested by the
manufacturer, which comply with all applicable codes. Thess mechanical systems shail not
exceed gauge pressures of 125 pounds per square inch. other than refrigeration, or temperatures
other than flue gas of 300° F (150° C) where such work is designed and performed under the
direct supervision of a person licensed as a masier's level plumber, master's level heating, air
conditioning and vendlating worker, or Class A contractor in those speciaities by wniten
examination. In addition. such installation may not be contained in any structure exceeding 2
stories or lorty feet in height or located in any structurs which is defined as (o its usa n any
the following categories:

a. Use Group A-1 thealers which exceed assembly of 1800 persons;
b. Use Group At except churches:

€. Use Group [ institutional buildings, except day care nurseries and clinics without
life-suppoct systems: or

8. The preparation of shop drawings, lield drawings and specifications for components by a
contractor who will supervise the installation and where the shop drawings and specificarinns (1}
will be reviewed by the licensed professional engineer or architect responsibie for the project ar
{ii} are otherwise exempted, or

9. Buildings. structures. or elecirical and mechanical installations which are noi otherw
evempled but which are of standard design, provided they bear the certificanon of .
professional engineer or architect registered or licensed in another state, and provided thal the
design is adapted for the specific locauon and for conformity with local codes. ordinances and
regularions. and is 50 certified by a professional engineer or architect licensed in Virginia.

C. Mo person shail be exempt from licensure as an architect or engineer who engages In the
preparation of ptans, specifications, documents or designs (or:

1. Any unique design of structural elements for floors, walls, roofs or foundations; or
1. Any building or structure classifled with respect to its use as high hazard (Lse Group Hi.

j 54-37.2. Other building laws not affected: duties of public officials. A. Nothing contained
this chapter or regulations of the Board shall be construed to Mlmit the authority of any put
official authorized by law o approve plans, specilicattons or calculations . connectron wi,.
impravements (o real property. This shall incjude. but shall not be limited to. the authonty of
officials of local building departments as defined in § 3697 (10). to require pursuant lo the
Uniform Statewide Bullding Code. state or local statutes or ordinances or code requirements that
such work be prepared by a person licensed or certified pursuant o this chapter.

B. Any public body authorized by law to require that plans, specifications or calculations be
prepared in connection with improvements 10 real property shail estabiish a procedure to ensur-
thal such pians, specifications or calculations be prepared by an architect, professional engine
land surveyor or landscape architect licensed. certified or authonzed pursuant o 3 34-17.1 or
this chapter in any case in which the exemptions contained in § 5437 or 3 34-37.1 are not
applicable.

91



ADDENDIM 4

STATE AGENCIES WITH FUNCTIONAL DESIGN
RESPONSIBILITIES

See Section 108.0, Functional design approval.

Although the USBC supersedes the building codes and
regulations of State agencies, Section 36-98 of the
Code of Virginia provides that it shall not supersede
State Agency regulations which require and govern the
functional design and operation of building related
activities not covered by the USBC. However, under
Section 108.0 of the USBC, the building official may
require applicants for building permits to submit
evidence of compliance with State agency functional
design requirements prior to issuance of the permit.

Functional design activities include but are not
limited to: public water supply systems, waste water
treatment and disposal systems, and solid waste fa-
cilities. State Agencies may also require, when
authorized by other State law to do so, that buildings
and equipment related to these functions be maintained
in accordance with the provisions of the USBC under
which constructed.

What follows 1is a 1list of the functional design,
operation, and maintenance approval authority for
which certain State agencies are currently responsible
under State law. It is intended as a guide to users

- of the USBC.

In a few cases, a memorandum of agreement has been
concluded between the Department of Housing and
Community Development and the affected State agency
for purposes of coordination. A note has been placed
in the following listing wherever such an agreement
exists, Copies may be obtained from the Office of
Uniform Buillding Code upon request.

92



USBC 1984

(sswoy 3Tnpy se auesg)

udysap TeUOTIOUN
{sawoy saed Aep A1jweg ‘uaipiiyo
d0J sawoy dnoin *sSITIATIIORI 2aeD PITYD

091£-982 (%08)

T%Z€C VA ‘puounyoTy

¥90¢T xod "0 °d ‘393135 yilanog yilaoN ¢Og
A13snpuy pue 1ogqeq jo Juaujaedaq
10323dsuy aaftog IaIY)

@oueuljurew ‘uorlexado ‘uoyierieisul
‘sT9ssan vanssailg ‘siafjoq

8122-98L (%08)

6TCET VA ‘puoun oty

139135 uiey Ised (oY

S1Te3JV A1RITTIW Jo Juswiiedag
I29uy8ug jje3sg

udgsap teuoyiIdUNg
:sa1aouly

9t06-18Z (%08B)

887€Z vA ‘puouydty

2AT2Q L312A0281Q /008

3urpITng 1teTM

30141285 [erouy Jo Juawlaedag
A3tTo4 pue spaepueig jo iostaxadng

usysap reuoiiIdunyg
{5193u90 s1ed fep pue sauwot] ITnpy

901N05 UOTjEWICJU]

adods !pajerndoy sIUTprIng

™
h



ADDENDUM 4

T6T9-699 (£04)
T0T%Z VA ‘Tolstag
89 xog "0 °d

!SnoT1o03 s ——
uotleliodsuelr] pue sfemy31H jo juauwiaedsaq
Isautdug 3I0F138IQ

u8rsep TreuUOfIOUNyg
‘sdemydty aielg Fuiiazus sLemaaraqg

9z5e-98L (%08)

6TCET VA ‘puowyoTy

199115 A0UIBA0YH {OT

yaresy jo jusmiaedag
uorjeITURS NTFH JO 10322ayq

uorleljfues pue udysap y[euoyIouUnyg
{sjuetd Buyssoooad JTIH ‘satareq

00€6-18¢ (%08)

T92€¢ vA ‘puounyoty

1321315 peoadg 18aM T00S
SU0T193110) Jo Juamjaedag

‘aousuajurey pue Lefing jeifde) jJo uOTSTALQ

‘103093170 JUBISISSY

A31and9s pue u3ysap [ruorjITUNG
‘{sawoy dnoal
Teruoilysodsyp-3sod pue—a2ad pue ‘*sied
19373ys Aousdiowd ‘somoy dnoad Ayjue)
‘S90TAI2S TERIIUIPIS31 LIFunuwod jInpe
‘8193ua0 "GuiuaeaT ‘uorjualap yoeaa
-Ino BufpnIduUl $3TIFTIOEI paiefaa pue
‘sTTer ‘SeTIfIToE] [BPUOTIDSIIO0)

JOIN05 UOTIEWAOJUT

adoog Tpajendoy sodurpring

94



USBC 1984

10/8-6€£S (%08)
SEYET VA “dTo33ns
0{0T Xod "0 *4

0066~-588 (€0¢)
10%2Z vA ‘uojuneig
6%27C xod ‘0 °'d

8S€S-L8E (€0Z)
ESTYT VA ‘wateg
1L %o °0 *d

6659-825 (v08)
90S%Z va ‘3anqyoudq
65911 xo04 -0 °4q

88Z%-668 (€0!)

10%27 VA ‘3angsyoraapaxg
808 Xog ‘0 °4

00€8-528 (£0¢)

10£22 VA ‘asdadiny

1.9 xog *Q °*4

(*3u0d) 8337330 199urBuy IDTIISTQ

(*3u03) sdemaarag

331n0§ uorjEPWIOIUT

adodg !pajeynday squrpring

[’g]
[=)]



ADDENDUM 4

1802-98¢ (%08)
6TTEZ VA ‘puocuydTy
799215 10u1aA0Y 60T

yiTesH jo uswjaedag
‘S90TAI95 SITITTTOBE Bursanp
pue TEIIP3aH JO UOTSTAT(Q “I093Ty2ay

spaepuels unIleIfUES pUE TEUOTIdIUNY
s1elrdsol

£v1£-982 (%08)
6TZE€Z VA ‘puoundoty
399135 10ulano) g

UOFSSTUMO) SHIvWpueT DFIACISTH
3223TY2ay TeITI0ISTH

suopieTndea uorlealesaiq
fsyiewpuet pue sSUFpPLINg 2FA0ISIH

£ese-98¢ (%08)
6TZET VA ‘puounioty
193135 queqg QOTT
Suppiing uolduyysem
2an3Tndfal8y jo Jjuawjaedaq
‘UoTsTAaTQg uoylegnday
L11snpuy pue jonpoag ‘uofidsadsul poay

uorielfues pup ufissp TeUOTIOdUNG
{ofe103% pue Buyssocoxd paoy

?a0an0g uorjewroju]

adodg Tpaje[nday SSUFprIng

96



USBC 1984

98%€-98L - 708)
6TCEC VA ‘puowyoty
192135 1ouaaaon £z
uoylepaelay TeIual
PUB Yjfeay Telusy jo jJuswiiedag
A19jes uorIoniIsuo) jo 03291%Q

ugdysap yeuofiduny pue A31ayes ‘yiteay
‘(JuBuleaal Tejuaw pue Juswieal)y 10402
-Te ‘juswjeaal Fnip ‘saed Te0T8oToyoLsed
dugpracad) safafTroeR] yYaresy Tejudy

237330 YITE®H ITIqng Tev07]

SPAEPpPUBIS UOCTIRITUBS pue feuofloung
*SPTITTIoR}
Tesodsyp @31sem prios ‘ylfjpueq

£98%-98L (%08)

612€Z VA ‘puomyoty

9011 wooy ‘3uypiyng 827330 3193135 YIugN
PleOd TOI3U0) uUOIINTIOd ATV

aJueiTduo) jo uoIsTATQ

T013U03 UoFINTTOg
‘sjuerd Suypieay
[EToa2umod ‘sAauwpyo ‘s10jeIsUTIU]

L80Z-98. (%08)
6TZ£Z VA ‘puonyory
19213F aA0UIIA0Y) 60T

Yarean jo juawjaedaq
uorlejTUERS
JUYSTTqEISY ISTANOL JO 103I31f(

(JuauysTIqeISy IsTInog jo neang)
uorjelrues pue udrsap JeUOTIOUNG

iseale 38711noj)

pue Bujydwed pue sduej ‘sTood Bujumgmg

‘sjueanelsay ‘*syajon pue sT230H

221n0g uoljewWIojuf

adoog Tpajeynday sIujpring

r~
(=



ADDENDUM 4

19%€-£8L (€0¢)

YSEYZ VA ‘uoTael
199135 UTEW YINog kGG
SurprIng TINH zoOT

800T-16¢ (€0¢)

%0€27 VA ‘efapuexsaiy
392135 JuTITYM yanos QT
S.1amoj, jlewpue] ‘gTf 921INng

:SMO0TT0] se -- juawdoTanag
A3Tunuwo) pue Bursnoy Jo Juawjaedaq
TBUSIEY 3114 3IRIS JO 297330
‘asaurFug I0711351Q

(2poD 3urpiing wiojyun jo 297330 woijy
aTqeTreAR Juswaaaly jo unpueiowsy)
2po) Buypryng

IpIMeIe]S Wwaogjun Yl jo sjusuwm
-axtnbaa £3sjes sayg JO JouruIIUTEY

s3uIpTINg O11qNg

(sTeardsoy se oueg)

SPI1EpPUE]S UOTIRIFUES pue TRPUOTIDJuUNy
fsauwoy Buysany

331330 YITEaH OF1qng Ted07

uofjejrueg
‘sduwed 1oqey jueafiy

821N0g uofjeWIOJUT

adodg fpajeTnday sSupprIng

98



USBC 1984

S€0z-S¢¢ (408)

6TZ€Z VA ‘puouwydty

b-9 xog ‘0 -4

BuTpTINg @soauoy svwer

uorlednpg jo juauiiedsg

‘83TITTTO8] pue £Basug Jo Jogfaxadng

Spiepuels Teuofjlouny
*(9r1qnd) s8ugpring fooyag

S6%7£-99¢ (£0L)

Z10%Z VA ‘9oueoy

TTBH SpeOxSso0a)

SurprIng 1e3eOYy] somiia]

LS06-182 (%08)
622EC VA ‘puowyoTy
u—..__.m.m E.mp_.umm

BATIQ pueldiey ¢z9g

0£89-T9% (%08)

Z0SEZ VA ‘ATojaoN

12JUa) aArIndaxyg 123oy

€T "oN °3prg yoouueyeddey ‘E¥T @31ng

(*3uod) s921330 asouysug I9TIISTQ

(*3u02) sBuyprrng oyIqng

IDANOS uoljIeWIOJU]

"~ adodg {pejendoy sIUTpIIng

=y
o



ADDENDUM 4

95ez-98L (%08)

6TZE€Z VA ‘puomyory

3992135 peoag ised 171

uorielredsuea] pue sAemy3fH jo juswliwvdaqg
‘UOTSTATQ

AJfTEN]) TRPIUBUUOITAUY ‘I0JEUTPLOC)

udysap TeuofiIOUNg -
f3uystiaoaape 1o0pinoe 103j sudig

98€0-£62 (%08)
0EZEZ VA ‘puowyaty

393115 Uolfrwey YixoN [TiZ-601c
paeog T0I13U0) aDIeM

auTTI0H

1013U0D UOTINTTO4

tsweails pue

§19ATa ‘123em punoad ‘sayirfioe)
juswleaal I1alepM pue juswieanl 28emag

@DT3J0 YITESY OTTqRd TEI07

(poD 3uTprINg waocjTun jo 3ITIIO wWoly
3TqeTTeAR Juaweaily Jo umpueiowsy)
uorjEjfUERS

‘siuel or3idas’ pue Juswiear] oa8emog

821Nnog uollemWIOJU]

ado2g !pajernday sTuTpTINg

100



USBC 1984

$879-98L (%08)
Joqe] jo juawlaedag

SJ3X10M
UOTIDONIISUOD 103 SITITTIDR] ID[TO]

957330 YITEaH 2ITqng Te0T

2po) JurpITNg wioyjun jo LITIJO woly

aTqeITeAR Judwedaly jo umpueioudy)

uorjejyues pue ulysap TeuofIoung
{L1ddns 133em oyyqnd ‘syaomiajem

£€262-98L (%08)

6TCET VA ‘puounoty

129135 peoad 1Isex Tzl
uotiejaodsueaj

pue sfemy3ty jo juawiiedaq

19autduy Aeyq jo Y31y Juelsyssy

udiseop TruUOTIOUNG
fuUcTIINIISUOD
femy3ty Aq pejdazye seTITITIN

0ree-e2z (y08)

61Z€Z VA ‘puowyoTy
199115 Ylua3linogd yixoN 101

A3110yIny Tooyds aarIeITTIqERYaY
s§1ooydg jo Juspuajuriadng

udysap TeUOTIOUNG
{ejTnpe puwr
safTuaan( 103 stooyos Jujupeayl

20an0g uorjewIo U]

adoog fpajendey sBurpring

01

Lo}



ADDLNDUH 5

PREVIOUS ADQPTIONS AND AMENDMENTS

The Virginia Uniform Statewide Building Code (USBC)
was first adopted in 1973 by the State Board of
Housing. Responsibility for the USBC passed to the
State Board of Housing and Community Development on
July 1, 1978. The initial adoption and subsequent
amendments by these Boards are indicated below:

® Initial Adoption
Adoption date: January 29, 1973
Effective date: September I, 1973
Title: Virginia Uniform Statewide Building Code,
Administrative Amendments, 1973 Edition
Major reference standards:
BOCA Basic Building Code/1970, with 1972
Accumulative Supplement
BOCA Basic Mechanical Code/1971
BOCA Basic Plumbing Code/1970, with 1972
Accumulative Supplement
NFPA National Electric Code/1971
One and Two Family Dwelling Code/1971

First Amendment

Adoption date: November 26,1973
Effective date: April 1, 1974
Title: 1974 Accumulative Supplement to Virginia
Uniform Statewide Building Code
Major reference standards:
BOCA Basic Building Code/1970 with 1972
Accumulative Supplement
BOCA Basic Mechanical Code/1971
BOCA Plumbing Code/1970, with 1972
Accumulative Supplement
NFPA National Electrical Code/1971
One and Two Family Dwelling Code/1971,
with 1973 Accumulative Supplement



USBC 1984

-]

Second Amendment

Adoption date: November 17, 1975
Effective date: February 7, 1976
Title: 1975 Accumulative Supplement to Virginia
Uniform Statewide Building Code
Major reference standards:
BOCA Basic Building Code/1975
BOCA Basic Mechanical Code/1975
BOCA Basic Plumbing Code/1975
NFPA National Electrical Code/1975
One and Two Family Dwelling Code/1975

Third Amendment

Adoption date: June 19, 1978
Effective date: August 1, 1978
Title: 1978 Accumulative Supplement to Virginia
Uniform Statewide Building Code
Major reference standards:
BOCA Basic Building Code/1978
BOCA Basic Mechanical Code/1978
BOCA Basic Plumbing Code/1978
NFPA National Electrical Code/1978
One and Two Family Dwelling Code/1975

Fourth Amendment

Adoption date: November 17, 1980

Effective date: January 1, 1981

Note: The 1978 Accumulative Supplement to Virginia
Uniform Statewide Building Code was comtinued, but
with a few changes to the previously referenced
BOCA Basic Building Code/1978

103



ADDENDUM 5

° Fifth amendment

Adoption date: March 15, 1982
Effective date: July 16, 1982
Title: 1981 Edition, Virginia Uniform Statewide
Building Code
Major reference standards:
BOCA Basic Building Code/1981
BOCA Basic Mechanical Code/1981
BOCA Basic Plumbing Code/1981
NFPA National Electrical Code/1981
One and Two Family Dwelling Code/1979 with 1980
Amendments

° Sixth amendment:

Adoption date: March 19, 1984

Effective date: June 20, 1984

Title: Sections 515.4 and 515.5 of Article 5 of the
1981 Edition, Virginia Uniform Statewide Building
Code

Seventh amendment:

Adoption date: November 18, 1984

Effective date: April 1, 1986

Title: 1984 Edition, Virginia Uniform Statewide
Building Code, Volume I - New Construction Code

BOCA Basic/National Building Code/1984

BOCA Basic/National Mechanical Code/1984

BOCA BAsic/National Plumbing Code/1984

NFPA National Electrical Code/1984

CABO One and Two Family Dwelling Code/1983 with
1984 amendments

104



ADDENDUM 6

BOARD OF HOUSING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT

Chairman

Robert T. Gates

3020 Hamaker Court, #301
Fairfax, VA 22031

Vice Chairman

Celeste R. Rakes
P. 0. Box 238
Floyd, VA 24091

Evelyn T. Butts
6801 Silverwood Court
Norfolk, VA 23513

William T. Clements
Box 248
Norton, VA 24273

Douglas R. Fahl
8401 Arlington Blvd.
Fairfax, VA 22031

Francis H. Fife

P, 0. Box 557
Charlottesville 22902

iJ5

J. B. Hall, Jr.
Suite 700
Planatation House
1108 East Main St.
Richmond, VA 23219

James W. Roncaglione
9807 Bridleridge Court
Vienna, VA 22180

Marion P. Whitehurst
209 Hall Drive
Chesapeake, VA 23320

Secretary (Non-member)

Neal J. Barber, Director

Department of Housing
and Community
Development

205 North Fourth St.

Richmond, VA 23219



AVDiNDUM 7

STATE BUILDING CODE TECHNICAL REVIEW BOARD

Chairman

Curtis R, Jennings, Jr.
6835 Sugar Rum Ridge, SW
Roanoke, RA 24018

Vice Chairman

Lec J. Cantor
4501 Cutshaw Ave,
Richmond, VA 23230

Stanley C. Harris
4210 South Haven Rd.
Richmond, VA 23235

Peter V. Henderson
117 South Stockard Ct.
Williamsburg, VA 23185

James E. Hicks
616 Putnam Place
Alexandria, VA 22301

Terrell D. Moseley
P. 0. Box 3085
Lynchburg, VA 24503

Ronald E. Ponzo
4 Frances Street
Newport News, VA 23601

Secretary (Non-member)

Jack A. Proctor
Deputy Director
Division of Building
Regulatory Services
205 North Fourth St.
Richmond, VA 23219

106



ADDENDUM 8

FORMS AVAILABLE

The Office of Uniform Building Code has prepared cer-
tain forms for the assistance of users of the Uniform
Statewide Building Code. Their use is optional and is
not required by the Code. Copies of the forms may be
obtained free~of-charge in reasonable quantities from:

Office of Uniform Building Code

Department of Housing and Community Development
205 North Fourth Street - Fourth Floor
Richmond, Virginia 23219

Forms available at this time include:

Request for Interpretation to the State Building
Code Technical Review Board

Application for Appeal to the State Building
Code Technical Review Board

Proposed Changes to the Uniform Statewide
Building Code

107



ADDENDUM 9

239ed 1x°9u uo panurjucH

Bay - 83y @9} - - - S pPayseaay Aqjuwey zyp £-d
Bap - gay 83} - = = - TerIuapysay A1jwed~faTnH -4
825, Ba), 83} €I} 893 892 LB LED Y A1031010Q° (930K (210} -y
sa) - 89} - - 8a) 82} - CRRSLLEEEIT] H
§31L BO9X 83fF 89} 8a) g3y gaj LE} Teuoranagasuj] 1
83] B3} e3% BB} LED Y B3} 83} 89} paezey yIFyy H
ua) - 83, - - EE) - - *pul 3 L1030e3 F|
(53813U9) aivd Leq
B3, 83% B3I} EO} [T} 4 83k LY CETY ‘6{o0Yyag) jeuUOfIEINpy »i
LTy - 83} - - 83} 833 - "gauiEng q
625 s8] B3} Hay s9) LEJY s3x 834 A1quasey 4
oy 889 £ € 8827  000°ST  Q00°CI dapupn § uojadiidsag  dnoay @sp
1eag 10 0y 33 1o L7 1380 100°S 000's
("33) ay¥ien (82720318) 14813y a3wi00g aienbg

“({J ¥ € 53392 399) [ea@ 3fv ue a1pnbas S2InION119 WIS uf SWITAE feojueydam 10 (9If13
=3812 Y3 J9INYA 03 ev A[dde sausmaagnbaa ajeredeg *sug[d aya uo 1vsujBus 10 33931yo1e uw
jo [¥ee aya eaaynbaa ,ee), peniew eajiodsien ayl yo Aue oauj BII9] qITyYm @an3onaie pasodold v

NOL153d TVHINID -- ¥V IMVHD

(2re18a1a Jo @pod ‘1 (e §)
Ael efuiBags aapun Juswazjnbay
(1was 8, 3a3upBuz a0 1391yyaay traty)
YANDIS3Q Q3ISN3DI1

(Jan) -apo) Burpiing oyl 3sadiaru} o3 Lapsoyane ay3 1o asaupfus o 123354229 ue Aq PIfJiIIR]
2q eBuparap 19y1 a1pnbsax o3 [v3373jo Buppring a3 Jo A3zacyine ayi 151136881 jou evOp PPyl

*uo313n11euod pavodoxd 303 eBupavap
U0 pespnbai o1 Twas sissuiBu? a0 813311y2ae ue 31 PTuiBajp jo Ipo) Y3 Jo |*zg-9§ UOJIDES
Y3t IJURPI0IDT UF FUTWIFINP 03 S9udAzjaa yIInb B Jog ef ey ay) jo seodand ayl *e3293
~1421¥ JO INITIeu] usdjiaay PYI Jo A3aydag ejupFijy 3y Aq poiwdazd sen mojaq 3awyd wyy

SON1 NO T¥3S 3/V

108



USBC 1584

*g dnoag aep
ST PITIISSELY aq [T®Ys QS ueyl esa] peo| juednddo [FI0I B Y} Easn ady 1eUCIIEINPT  :DIONy

*gajidde
eS[e | 230§ (°2312 'RUOTITIaed lojaeIul ‘-a°}) a3en ayjfoeds do/pur 231€ 01 uojiel
~-depe 10) sueid sya uo pergnbai s} [eas @/® 2IBIG-U] UP 13YII|A JUFWIIIAP 01 PISN

99 pInoys 1aeyd aa0qF Y1 ‘Iydyey 30 2z jo eseypiedea ‘ainjoniys Jya jo uojaied
paisautBue-aad oy 10) [wes 9/8 91w316-ul ue 3ijnbaa jou op 1aaujfus ic 3393Yy2ae
3juis-jo.In0 ue jo 1vds 3yl Bujawaq eaanionias {ulysap paepuels) paisaujfua-aiy

‘UOTIRITITIILD Yons a1ynbaa sueyd a3yl jo iapujswaa
242 30u 1o IIYIIYA jo sEaTpiwBaa ‘issurBus 10 3oBIjydle ue Jo tfeas aya Eaapnbaa
BUOTIEpUNO) 10 '@JO01 ‘BI[EA “S100[J 10j BIUBWATD [EINIINIIV jJo uBjsap anbpun Auy

*A1dde {1338 7 puw | eaiou YBnoyire ‘vani1anais jo Iydjay o azys

jo esajpaedaa apo) sy jo y i-ug § jo sjuawaiinbar 1828 2/v 2y) woay idmaxa sy
8101383 983yl Jo Aue aafoaul J5U §a0p YIrym uBfsap Jojaa3ul 20 ‘Suylepowsa ‘suuj)
~IPPY  "PAWITY 3113 uy 8sPaadu} a0 ‘suipiwd I1xa 1o ESI0IE uj afueyd ‘wazeds
TEINIINIIE JYI jo tofIedFiipow * (Adusdnide ayqeacy(e UJ @sezaouj **2°'y) peoy
Aouednaou * (dnoi8 aen ‘*@°7) Aouedndso up sBueyd e saafoAu] yITYA uBieap 101193
-ui 1o ‘Fuyropoms1 ‘sucyijppe 03 pue uOT3IINIISUCD ABU 03 sajidde 1iey> saoge oyl

‘sgaippe pue uoyiednado
aay/sry Burpniaty ‘ulysap aya aoj s1qysuodsar (Luedmod Jou) tenpjajpuj ayi 4q
pouBie aq isnm surid sy ‘juasaid jou E] 1Pa6 3/e ue aiaya ‘Ivyl saipnbai ae] ay]

*32eYy2 8Tyl £q o9 op 03
PSIInBal J0u 31 ueas 309foid v uo 1?8 © aitnbaa Xvd [eiagjgo Buypyrng [eooy ¥

*281K ¢ L3p(Ian
(wawg-uoy) adriroag
(maeg) afeaolg
payorIag £iyusy zyi

(2po) Uy passaippy oK)
(17} CEYY - - 83y - "

0wy - g9} 83y - - = -

‘s

't

°z

‘T iS310N

n

g
-4

109

0y seaq 3 £ 9837 000'ST  000°Si  29pun § uotadjaossg

I3ng do gy 3eAD 10 &7 13A0 100°'¢ 000°¢

{°33) IUTIaH (991303C) Sudzan A g

dnoig as



ADDENDUM ¢

Bay ¥ sag ¥ ¥ ¥ aa3 ¥ 3L ¥ *I8TH ¥ K311 n
sa) ¥ §a) M ¥ ¥ sa) ¥ 83} y {(miej-uou) afreioas

= - = - - - - - - - {maeg) =8caoag S
sap L] 83} L ¥ ¥ L) » 83 » [gjuapleay L
62} v B3) » » » 83) » a9} ¥ [ fIuedIal H
LET Y say, s8} (I} 8ajp 83} Ba) say B3} 834  *3I%u] aayje [V T

*6A8 Jloddns @)y 5
sap ¥ 63 » . ¥ Baj v 83y L noYIIs BIFUTLD "
B3} ¥ Baj . ¥ » Baj » s} » 8ajaesany Aeq -1
83} 89} 69} [T} LE) Y sa} 3% 83y 83} B3} Eyper 1-1
sa) sap 83} L)Y a9} sa) 83) sa) s3) B3} paezey ydy H
83), ¥ 83} ¥ ¥ . Bay ¥ LT ¥ "pul ¥ Lioidey a
§123ua) aae)
B9} #9] 83y (1) sag g3} 83} 83} 83) 83} Aeqg § sjooyag k|
83} M L1 » » " 83} ¥ gaf " 883U} ENg q
63) ¥ say v ¥ v 69} » B3} ¢ "219 °‘Spueispueay G-v
sa) v 83 " » v sa) . 893 »  (XTuy) seyoanyy  y-y
89} . gag ¥ " " o3y v 83} » 212 ‘Blueanelsay £-v
23} ¥ 8aj L ¥ ¥ 824 ¥ saj} ¥ 811eH adueqg A 4
[ E) » gay . [T} Y ¥ B2} » B3} » LERRLLITAR 1-v
oY 65377 K¢ 1aaQ 9837 *dyradsag dnoay a8)
A3A0 10 QOB 19A0 10 (Q9Y isa0 1o QoI 19A0 10 (Y a0 %7 FEEL ]
aduy ‘104 ‘pROT ‘30 {"34) ‘I3 {°3018) *31dy
‘maleds (821119913 P23IEJ07] YOTUM U] BujplIng

‘(3 9 ¥V 912942 998) [was 2/¢ u¥ aijnbai saInIINIIE yons Jo uljeap [raaual a3yl a0 wmaInds
12 jueqaay ay3 1apeyn 03 er Afdde s3uamaajnbai aireswdag ‘(Y PUT_Z S8I0U 299) 1013WIJuUOD [¥D
~§132878 ¥ eRB1) Jo UVIDTLIIFS AisIeEm pasumdj| ¢ Aq pauljeap 31 X[uo juswaiynbaa (eas afw ay
Wolj 3dUaxs 34V Y]IIIGE u¥ yIja payism asoyy *oue(d ¥4I ue aveujlue 3o 3d33Fydiw um Jo (weE
*y3 sa1jnbea 025, payive sepic¥eren ey jo Tue 03U B1IT) YITYs Ee3eLs [WIT2308{0 pasodoid y

NDI93Q IVII¥LDZTA —— 8 IHVHD

110



USBC 1984

‘103303 Jo u0}3IIIITP 12Y/8TY 13pun 3ae ucjIL[jeIsU} puUC uSgsap yioy
usya Aquo ayqedjidde sae supjajrIve(s pue sloidesjucs 183113032 vy uoiadwaxa ayy

~ulysap iuja02u)
1o *Bujiapewsl ‘euojijppy o3 pu® uoj3INAIBUOD AU 01 Yi0q safidde ieyd daoqe Ayl

“ssaippe pue uojiednoao
Iayfery Suppniaug *uvlysep sy 103 @[qi6uodsas (Luedwod jou) Tenpiafpuy ayy £q
poulye aq isnm sueyd ayy *jJuseaid jou 8} (®a6 afe ue aiayn ‘Iwyl sa1jnbai aey ayy

"31vy> #7Ya £q os op 03 peijnbai
10U J} UBAT HI0A [PITAIIW[0 20) [¥I0 2/® O® axfnbes Kea 1®393330 Buppiing yeaog vy

't

A

tewjoy

111



ADDENDUM 9

g3} . ¥ ¥ sa) ¥ g9}, ¥ *38IH ¥ L3117 n
83) " ¥ ¥ 83y » 83} » (maej-uocu) 28eaoig
- - - - - - - - (wmaej) 28%wviogg S
a2} » » L L1 » 835 » TeJIuapisay |
82} " P ¥ 83y " B3} " EERELT-RBET H
83} CETY 89} 8a} §3) B3} Sap 8L ‘JISUl Jaylo Y “
*sA8 33oddne ajyy
a9} ¥ » » sa) » sap ] oyl SITUTTD "
#9) . ™ » 83y " 83} ¥ Baj19sIny Keg -1
s9} 9} 23} 89} 83} ea) B2) &3} syyer 1-1
83y ea} e} a9 §35 83} 83} 89} pavzey yBiy R
83) L) ] L] fay ¥ 8ax L *pul ¢ £1030wy a
8191U3) vy
EY a3} 93} 83} 82} s2}. 9a)  sa) Aeq g s1OoO0Yd5 g
a9 v ¥ ¥ 83) v sa) ¥ esaugsng q
23} ¥ » * B3} » sa) v 3213 ‘Fpurispuein -y
o3y ¥ ] . LI ¥ B3} ) (T1up) sayaanyy -V
83} ¥ ¥ » [EY ¥ a9} v "233 ‘siueinelsay t-v
23 v v ¥ 8ag . B3 ¥ 8lleH sdueg v
B3), » B3} ¥ sa) . B3} sa13vayy 1-v
1oyEaayg [JCIEEETTY 001 867 001 E897] HZ1aaQ S637 *dya1deaq dnoin asg
rACOY ([2A97) aolag  aaag 10 Qo) 1aA0 10 gy 10 %7 3ag1g
(1 @30y avg) peo ‘30 [V IREL] (035) 18y

@a3IBAS "YIIH Ao ‘qanig pPa3edo] yapyn uy esujpying

‘(8 ¥ ¥ e3awy)

a8) %98 af¢ ue wainbas eaznionizs Yyans jo ulijsap [esovall a3 10 merads 1e27a333713 ay3 o3 sw
Lpdde e3jusmaijnbay savandag ‘(g g [ ea300 239) ‘“uojasuleExd uUIIIjIA AQ BII){wjoade oYz uj
1022823003 ¥ e9w[) 10 *ionich Jujaerravan pue Bugucjagpuod e *Bujimay 12491 8 39182 ‘a2qunyd
12A8] »,332083 ¢ ow pesuadj| uosisd v 4q pauljsap 37 Ajuo jusmwerynbaz 1"98 af® ay1 mo1} idaexs

. ®IB REIIAIGY ur yIjA panava seoyy -eusyd ") uo 103ujBud to 3392)Y2aw uw Jo (wen Y3 maynbaa
w9k, Paniew 0912092180 ay3 jo Xuw 03Uy S1I¥) YI1ya =2304e Twdjueydsw io Jujqunid pesodoad y

RO1530 HAL1SAS TVDINVHIEH ¥ ONIDANTd -- 3 LuvHd

112



USBC 1984

*{oajuol 10

UOFIDIXIP Jay/STY lapun ¥ uolIMTwIEU] ‘Pue uBgsap yioq uaya Aquo @jqesjrdde
91¥ 1032811000 lEdjuEYdd@ pus ‘miayiom JYAH ‘sisqunid 103 suojiduaxa ayy

* *ufjesp 30tim3u} 1o
‘Sujrepomaa ‘SUOLITPPR O3 PUBR LUOTIINIISUOI AU 03 Yloq saj1dde JaBYD IAOQR IY]

*esaippe pur uojjednado lay/sty
Suipnyoug ‘uljeap syl aoj syqysuodsas (Suvwdwoo jJou) yenpiappui 3yl £q paudys
2q 3snm sue[d ayy ‘3juaeaad jou B8] [PIS /e UE axaym ‘Ieyd FIITndbaa AR[ Ayl

*31wya B3yl &q 08 op o) paijnbal Jou JT uIAP EWIIRAE
1votury2sw o Bujqunid oy [ees a/® ue 2ijnbaa Aew [eyayjjo Bujprng [edo[ v

"7 (2,061) 4,00f )Jo sed anyj uey: iayjo €a1n)

=wiedmaz 10 ‘uopivaefyajes ueyy 2ayjo *youj iwnbs asd spunod ¢z} jo wansesad
98unf poaoxs jou yreys smajzess [EdJuBYILm 263Y) oapod a(qeaprdde TIT yYiga
&1dwod yoyya ‘12an30ugnuEm 2yl Lq PaiNEI pus PEIRUTPICOD UIRQ WY YIJym uljsep
pavpueae pafiorrisd jo juamdinbs ew yans ‘Jusadinbe (Eajusydem pefieyowd Fujen
smaisde [EIjuwyddm pue Fujquniy,, se ART Syl up poujiap s} ,TEAS] proyeaayl, YL

g

4

‘1

sEe3ol

113



